Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 5:03 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; assignments; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC/021272 RE: Liability Status - Accident involving SLV4941A &
GY9097Y (LONPAC) on 28/12/2018

Attachments: GY9097Y 281218.PDF

Hi Shu Pei

Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January, 2019 2:52 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; assignments; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC/021272 RE: Liability Status - Accident involving SLV4941A & GY9097Y (LONPAC) on
28/12/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 11:51 AM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>; ‘MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC/021272 RE: Liability Status - Accident involving SLV4941A & GY9097Y (LONPAC) on
28/12/2018

Dear Li Li,

Thank you for your email.
Dear Shu Pei,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January, 2019 11:48 AM

To: Danny Ong <danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt claim@I|onpac.com>;
assignments@Ikkauto.com; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: stephanie.lin@mbmwheelpower.com.sg

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC/021272 RE: Liability Status - Accident involving SLV4941A & GY9097Y (LONPAC) on
28/12/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Danny

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.
Dear Catherine/Nivitha

Please handle urgently.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel

From: Danny Ong [mailto:danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 2 January, 2019 11:35 AM




To: ONG LI LI; MT_Claim_SG; assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)'

Cc: stephanie.lin@mbmwheelpower.com.sg

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC/021272 RE: Liability Status - Accident involving SLV4941A & GY9097Y (LONPAC) on
28/12/2018

Importance: High

Dear Ms Ong
Noted with thanks.
Kindly advise on the liability status urgently

Best regards,

Danny Ong | Claims Advisor
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Email: danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg
MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive « #06-02
Sin Ming AutoCity * Singapore 575722

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 31 December 2018 12:21 PM

To: Danny Ong <danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt claim@I|onpac.com>;
assignments@Ikkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: stephanie.lin@mbmwheelpower.com.sg

Subject: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC/021272 RE: Liability Status - Accident involving SLV4941A & GY9097Y (LONPAC) on
28/12/2018

Without Prejudice

Dear Danny

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and liability.
Dear Nivitha/Catherine

Please follow up.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706



The all TN |[onpac.com.sg

From: Danny Ong [mailto:danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 31 December, 2018 12:03 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: stephanie.lin@mbmwheelpower.com.sg

Subject: Liability Status - Accident involving SLV4941A & GY9097Y (LONPAC) on 28/12/2018

Dear All

Appreciate if you can advise us on the liability status first for the below loss and arrange a pre-survey.

Kindly refer to the attached GIA report & estimate.

Our Client’s Vehicle Number: | SLV4941A
LONPAC Vehicle Number: GY9097Y
Date/Time of Loss: 28/12/2018 1730hrs

Kindly arrange your surveyor to survey the vehicle at 160 Sin Ming Drive #06-03 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Please contact Danny 93288668 for the survey arrangement
Best regardes,

Danny Ong | Claims Advisor
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