Cecilia Chnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.coms

Sent: Wednesday, 20 March 2019 4:25 PM

To: Cecilia Chong [LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC05/021278 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN 6623 Y & GBC 2828 B

ON 29/12/2018 ALONG PIE TOWARDS TUAS AT ABOUT 1900 HOUR [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Cecilia

Pls proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all CM& ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 March, 2019 10:41 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC05/021278 RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN 6623 Y & GBC 2828 B ON 29/12/2018
ALONG PIE TOWARDS TUAS AT ABOUT 1900 HOUR

Lonpac Ref: 18/18/19/VC05/021278

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC19000035/Upb352
Dear Sirs/Madarm,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 04/01/2019 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a head-to-rear collision, Liability is not in our driver's favour,

summary to offer to third party repairer, “FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 18,038.22 $ 10,700.00




2. Loss of Rental (19days x $120.00) | § 2.280.00 $ 1.800.00 (18days x
$100.00]
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 31.00 $ 3100
4. Incidentals $ 88.00 $ -
Total | § 20,437.22 $12,531.00

**15days recommendation for repair + 2sundays + 1PH = 18days.

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CecilinChong @lkkaute.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: ONG LI Ll <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 11:41 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupel@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ikkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC05/021278 RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN 6623 ¥ & GBC 2828 B ON 29/12/2018
ALONG PIE TOWARDS TUAS AT ABOUT 1900 HOUR

Dear Shu Pei
Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
TELL__{ES}_EZSD 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

i

The all {#ew ) lonpac.com.sg

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 9:39 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/18/19/VC05/021278 RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN 6623 Y & GBC 2828 B ON 29/12/2018
ALONG PIE TOWARDS TUAS AT ABOUT 1900 HOUR

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



¢

~ Focus Auto Pte Ltd

" Business Reg. No. 201004495R

GST Reg. No. 201004495R

Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095

Email: focus.antopteltd@ vahoo.com.sg

Date 21/2/2019 BY E-MAIL

Your ref: GBC2828B
Qur ref; SLNGGB23Y
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
M/S Lonpac Insurance BHD
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07, The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : ( SLN6623Y 8 GBC2828B ) ALONG PIE TWDS TUAS
DOA: 29/12/2018 TIME: 1900 HOURS

We refer to the above matter and write an behalf of ONESTO CAR RENTALS | the registered owner of
SLN6623Y in respect of the above accident.

We are instructed that the above accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving/ or
management of your insured vehicle. Your insured’s vehicle GBC28288 collided onto the rear portion of
our client vehicle SLNG623Y, As a result of the accident, our client has been put to loss and expenses,
particulars of which are as follows:-

|. Costof Repair ({S10000 + 7% GST) 5 10,700.00
2. Loss of Rental (19 days = 5120) 5 2,280.00
3. Buy 3rd party's GIA report 5 29.00
4. GlA search 5 2.00
5. Incidentals 5 28.00
Total Amount: 5 13,099.00

Enclosed are the following documents for your perusal,

1) Driver's driving license/ Identity card

2) Certificate of Insurance

3) GIA report

4) GIA Search ( GBC28288B )

5) Original repair claim

&) Car Rental Agreement/ Receipt ( UL-3311 )

Our company is not the authorized workshop of any of the GIA member companies and we are writing
in purely for amicable sake.

The demand herein is in respect of our client’s for damages pertaining to his motar vehicle and any
settlement following or subsequent to this demand shall not prejudice any claim in respect of personal
injuries.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents within 7 days and your favourable reply is deeply

appreciated.
Yours faithfully,

(L

Bereza



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

DATE : .:_’)llf:‘., 3018

To

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE N0, 3 LA 6633Y X GBC IRIRR
avone . PIE Twds Tuas on 29/13 /2078
1/we_Onesto Cer fentalds of (NRIC/ROCNO) S33131397

oF 210 Turl Club Road #AS - The Grewlstcnc( % (2819493)

Crwimer of velucle no. .‘5 Ll 6 é a3 "]IﬂI in consideration of M/S FOCUS AUTO FTE LTD

Repairing my / our vehicle SN (;1{ -;’3_‘!_' al my / our instruction and hereby authonze

FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD 1o demand claim settle receive whatever amount settled / pavable

by the Insurance Company and / ar third party or to commence legal proceeding. If necessary, under
my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and / or loss of use, et and o their appointing Solicitor o
act for mé / us in respect of the said accident / claim and all claimed and / or settled shall belong to

them absolutely,

| further agree and undertake to indemmify them against the above mentiened claim cost which may

ansen therewith.

Signature of Ownier
{Company s chop — if any)

Name of Owner Oﬂfd‘.‘if‘{) Car Rﬂﬂi&ﬁ'
NRIC No . 523131397

P2/7




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : IB/18/19/VC05/021278
DATE : 25 MARCH 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

'We, Onesto Car Rentals confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of SLN6623Y the sum of Singapore Dollar Twelve Thousand
Five Hundred Thirty One Only ($12.531.00) in full and final satnsfaction. hquidation
and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustamed by me/us whether
now or hereaftter to become mamifest, ansing cither directly or indirectly from an
accident involving SLN6623Y and GBC2828B on 29 Dec 2018 along PIE TWDS
TUAS.

| 'We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ THAN CONSTRUCTION & ENGINEERING PTE LTD AND/OR
SUBBAIAH CHANDRAN) against all ¢claims and any claims whatsoever made by
any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to FOCUS
AUTO PTE LTD.

['We hereby acknowledged that this payment 1s made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date 3 |4/ 1]

Name of vehicle owner /Date 3f I|'.f "J



Focus Auto Pte Ltd

Business Reg. No: 2010044958
GST Reg, No: 201004495R
No | Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Autobay
#02-50 Smaapore 417883

Date:  21/02/2019

ONESTO CAR RENTALS

C/ONO 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
ALUTOBAY #02-48/30)
SINGAPORE 4178583

MOTOR VEHICLE NO: SLN6623Y TOYOTA COROLLA

EEPAIR CLAIM S 10L000.00
LUMP SUM Sub- total §  10,000.00
T% GST: 5 TO0.00

Total: $  10,700.00

TEN THOUSAND AND SEVEN HUNDRED DOLLARS
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: ONLY



Bill To #

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Tel No, : 6886 9897

Focus Auto Pte Ltd

No. | Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 AutoBay

#02-48 Singapore 417883

Business Reg No. 201004495R
(GST Reg No. : 201004495R)

Fax Mo, : 6844 4625

TAX INVOICE

300 BEACH ROAD o FA-INvIonnTe
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE Date : | 03/04/2019
SINGAPORE 199555 P/O Ref. : SLM6623Y
Terms : C.0.D.
SLN6623Y TOYOTA COROLLA
No. Code Description Oty Price Dise. Tax Amount
Code <%
| COR COST OF REPAIR 1 10,000.00 SE [0.000.00)
2 LOR LOST OF RENTAL | | 80000 ZR 1.800.00
3 olA THIRD PARTY GIA REPORT | 20.00 LR BRI
§ LTA LTA SEARCH I 2,00 ZR 2.00
SINGAPORE TWELVE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED THIRTY Subtotal (Excluding GST) 11.831.00
OMNE ONLY .
Discount 0,00
GST 7% on 10.000,00 00,00
Total 12.531.00
GST summary Amount (S} GST(Sh) Rounding Adj. 0.00
SR@ 7% 10.000.00 700.00)
2R @ 0% 1.831.00 (.00 Grand Total 12.531.00
Y i

FOR Focus Auto Pre Llld

CUSTOMER SIGNATURE & STAMP




i Vizd
ULTIMATE CAR RENTAL 1“0 Loficle

ltimate Bik 264 Tampines St 21 #01-106 Singapore 520264 — hWietks
Tel: 6844 4620 Fax: 6344 4625 . -
. Co. Reg. No. 531003810 -jf,l':'—)-}-ﬁl'? = f/fk.-!.‘_,"
C:ar Rental L
Joeus= SAnGEOZY . VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT  No. RA 3311
HIRER'S PARTICULARS ) Vehicie Ng%j\bﬂp_,m Replace Veh No:
Mame. 2 Rfﬂﬂ-@. Bin 3 M"T) S 0 Bl
; _ N ._rl E [ ileage Cut: ileage Out:
e Bk &3 Make & Made! Make & Model
=1 =] 24, - adel;
ol 14§ Gmﬂdpﬁﬂ{' \B&Dgg Aute ) Manual Auta / Manual
: OUT Date 3 m!ao OUT: Time [L.e% |7
ContactPerson. 5[5 35%]| - T L i C}g
DRIVER'S PARTICULARS HIRE EXPIRY KA4[1]1 TIME EXPIRY || (o O
T RENTAL CHARGES
Address DA ’lq&hhi @s |Q0 A% o5
- — Weskly J @E
----------- —— | Manthly @s
— Hours s
Tel No, HIP Mo | Cihers s
PP./1.c. No: S BT 3HGG b No: ey a@s
Date of Birth: =YMJ\QEL  Date of Issue ! Expiry. PAlL @S
Maticnality: S'be‘.ﬁ? « Pl O lesue: 19&"-‘ l%& Delivery Sarvice
Clecupation: o ___EI'Flwng Exp: SLIEI—TD-TALE mﬂ OD
Refundable Deposits: Noour IN
- ,4’_'!_“-&,_ __J'-'—'JF‘“J\
Sash/NetsiGhequeVISAMC Cards No.: CRT Ty "
(&) - ACCIDENTS (D) - DENTS (8] - SCRATCHES = Y F E F
FRONT EXTENSION
Collection Service
Mise
ESTIMATED TOTAL RENTAL §
Sales Person Code: B
LEFT : :
Hirer is responsible for the first § & EXCESE
for collision | damage to first party. (i.e) ULTIMATE CAR
RENTAL “ehicles (including windscreen) and elso first
g WwI00  oensfor collision/damage to third
party's Jehlﬂas ach and every a { { damage
ACCESSORIES CHECK A Adit E@ L2500
[ Ashirey [ Cig Lighiay [IsiTe HIRER's Signaturs
1570 Tooks [ dack [ Hub Cege
= facoicam [ 50/ Gantndges s rm Additional Driver's Signature

N sgres bo-The tarme and conditions above, ovenizal and that all nfariabon ghaeria sus and corect inall respect. MyQur Diiving Scenceds] kslsre cummant and nol disguelified from diving
Yo misy changs &1 amound dos on s reral 1o myloudr cred cand

MPORTANT
l.,,:E;.".;_LEH /NS ABOVE 22 YEARS OF AGE WATH MORE THAN 2 VEAUE OAnM EXPERIENCE. AUTHDRISED, LICENSED AND SIGHING THIZ AGREEMENT MAY DRIVE THE
£ WEHIOLES &5 STHICTLY FOR-SINGAPORE USE ONLY AND MAY NOT BE DRIVEN QUT OF SINGAPORE WITHOUT FRIOR CONSENT OF THE COMPANY ULTIMATE CAR RENTRL
M THE EVENT OF AN ACCTIENT. THE HIRER CR ALITHORISED DRIVER

(1} ahall repert 88 sccidents involving the said vehicls b= the Dwnar mmediatsty

(H) shall taks immodiate staps to complala and sign Form Mar 1 (Motor Accidant iepor fram ) and da sil sdlser acts required nosampliance with the “NON-INJURY MOTOR AGCIDENT
REPORT SCHEME" {tha form will ba mads available when tha accidsrt ks reporied 1o the owner

(i} shall repert 10 -the palice within 24 hows from the occuTencs, he faliowing lypes of aosdmiz.
(&) rpury case;
o) nen-njury case imvolving & Government vehicies or damage 1 Government propany;
iz} non-injury cess invalving @ fonsign vehicle (o obisn iheir medor msurance, poficy, Passpon MoJMams of the driver, Vehicle number, Log card and Viehicke mad tex nformations!);
[d) ran-injury case imvelving @ pedastrien or cyslisL

RETURN OF VEHICLE - THE HIRERDRIVER IS REQUIRED TO iGN IN THE COLUMN "SIGNATURE OF HIRERDRIVER® FAILING WHICH THE DAY AMD TIME INSERTED

EELOW SHALL BE DEEMED TG BE THE DAY AND TIME THE VEHICLE 15 RETURNED TC ULTIMATE CAR RENTAL AND THE SAME SHALL BE ACCEPRTED AS
CONCLUSIVE EVIDENCE OF THE SAME AND SHALL MOT BE CHALLENGED OR QUESTIONED OM ANY ACCOUNT WHATSOEVER.

DATE IN TIME 1M MILEAGE REMARKS DEPOSIT REFUND

a2t |1l.coom;

SIGNATURE IVER




Ultimate Car Rental

331003910
No. | Kaki Bukit Avenue &
#02-50
Smgapore 417883
Tel No. : 6636 3018 / 6844 4620 Fax No. ; 6844 4625

BT INVOICE
FOCUS AUTO PTE LTD . —
Mo. | Kaki Bukit Avenue b Wi g U037
#02-50 Autobay Date : 19/01:2019
Singapore 417883 P/O Ref. : SIVI93IR
Terms : 363 days
Attention - ZULKIFFLE BIN 5 SALIMS 7834790
lel | 6886 D097 Fax | 6481 9095 Page : |
RENTAL FEE 31/12/18 TO 19/01/19
TP - SLN6623Y RA.3311
No. Code Description Oty Price Discount Tax Amount
I SIVZO3 IR TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 A 19 120.00 2.280.00
RENTAL FEE
FROM 31/12/18 TG 19/01/19
SINGAPORE F'Wo THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED EIGHTY ONLY Subtotal 2. 280,00
Discount (1.00
Nett 2.280.00
Tax 0.00
Grand Total h 2.280.00

FOR Liltimate Car Bental CUSTOMER SIGNATURE & STAMP




Qur Ref No:
Date of Reguest:

Focus Auto Pte Lid
| Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-48/50 Autobay
Singapore 417683

Cear SirfMadam

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GR-19-000111
02/01/2019

Date of Accident:
Flace of Accident
Client Vehicle No:

DESCRIPTION

|E-File Search Fee (Public)

2801272018

FIE TWDS TUAS

SLNGGZ23Y

| GST Amount

I'I'ntal Amount Due (GST Inclusive)

Thank You,

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:

Date

[A] GIRG [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

TAX INVOICE
Your Ref No: MSME 18167684
- /AMOUNT (S8)
) ) 140
- - 0.98|
15.00]



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

WE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

COperating Hours: Monday to Friday 3am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400D017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-19-000128
Date of Request: n2/01/2019 Your Ref No: MSME18167684

Focus Auto Pie Lid
1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#02-48/50 Autobay
Singapore 417383

Dear SirMadam

Date of Accident: 2001272018
Vehicle No; SLNBB2IY
Place of Accident: PIE TWDS TUAS
Involving Vehicle No: GBCZEZ2EB

With reference o your apghcatmn for the accident report, we have atiached the fullow:ng accident reports as requested:

DOGUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION PERDOC(SS)  |QTY |AMOUNT (S8)

\GBC28288 |PIETWDS TUAS ~ 1a00[1 _ ~ 13.08]
'GST Amount o | 092/
|Totai Amount Due [GST Inclusive) | i -W{J_{J-_!

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank You

This is a compuler generated document and reguires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRC [] Cash [ ] Cheque



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
l & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
WE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 5224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Bam to 5pm
9ECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GET Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Chur Ref Mo: GR=18-200227

Date of Request; 31212018 Your Ref No Onlina Purchase
Focus Auto Ple Lid

i Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#02-48/50 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam

Enauiry Date IMM22018

Enguiry By Sin Lai Med

TR Vehicle No GBC2828B

Accident Date 29122018

[DESCRIPTION - B B AMOUNT (SS)

TP Insurer Enquiry B 1.87|
oSTAmowt e e 613
antaI _.ﬂmu_u_lj! Due l@lhﬂ:r_us_im_a_s - - . 2.00

Thank You

This is a computer generated documeant and requires no signature

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:

[%] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque



