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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 2 lanuary 2019 12:09 PM

'Jocelyn Ng'; SUR

RE: MV - FBN2B5BG; DOA: 21/12/2018

Dear Jocelyn,

The market value of FBN 2858G is $8.5K-$9K (Estimated) as at Dec 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue t,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Jocelyn Ng <jocelyn_ng@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Monday, 3L December 2018 12:19 PM

Subject: MV - FBN2858G; DOA: 2t/72/2OtB

Dear a[[,

Ptease h'etp to advise on the market vatue of the above mentioned vehicte.

Thank you

t+ave a gYeatweel" aheadl

Jocelyn Ng

Executive, Claims Services
D: +65 65942539 | F: +65 62257402 | iocetvn-ne@sq.msiq-asia.com
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Wednesday,2 January 2019 12:09 PM

'Jocelyn Ng'; SUR

RE: MV - FBN2B5BG; DOA: 21/12/2018

Dear Jocelyn,

The market value of FBN 2858G is $8.5K-$9K (Estimated) as at Dec 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Jocelyn Ng <jocelyn-ng@sg.tsig-asia.com>
Sent: Mond ay, 3t December 2078 t2:19 PM

Subject: MV - FBN2858G; DOA: 21,/12/2018

Dear att,

Please hetp to advise on the market vatue of the above mentioned vehicte.

Thank you

r+ave a gYeatweek, aheadt

Jocelyn Ng

Executive, Ctaims Services
D: +65 65942539 | F: +65 62257402 | iocetvn-ne@se.msiq-asia.com
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> Back to OneMotoring

Doh: >rlr>[tg

8.sK- q K

Original Registration Date: 0a Sen 29fB

Lifespan Expiry Date: -

CO Emission:

HC Emission:
t No* r-iJon 

'
PM Emission: -

Lat;ie;e;alfeeis)willbeimposedifroadtax/layuphasexpired.PleaseuseEnquireRoadTaxPayable forfee(s)payable.

Road tax, including Over Payment (if any), of a vehicle willfollow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownership is being transferred.

Amount Payaple (Fr9m 22Dec2O78 to l_!_{un 2OI9I
Amount Before GST

; Sub Total :

, Nett Road Tax Amount (After

r Offsetting Over Payment) :

Total Amount Payable :

Amou nt Paya b I e (Fro m 22 D ec 20 78 to 21 D:9c 2pt9l
Amount Before GST

(q$l

2s.o0 25.00

25.00

oi.oo

89.00

, Transfer of orn"ttnlplt not allowed for this vehicle.

' You may print this page for reference.

GSTAmount Amount After GST

i Transfer Fee:

Transfer Fee :

SubTotal:

, Nett Road Tax Amount (After

' Offsetting Oyer Payment) :

' Total Amount Payable:
^' Message

. 
(s$)

25.00

25.00

32.00

,54.00

32.00

= 
57.00

GSTAmount AmountAfterGST
(s$) (s$)
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