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e Consultanis
Bs R Pie Lig Company Registration Mo, 193607 198R
&1 UKL AVE 1, B02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX @ iD65) 62364315
Your ref: 219000093MFSH
Our ref; CS/FCI12000023/T1vb Date: 11/1/2019

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO_SKR 8(99M

We thank you for your instruction on 2/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
10/1/2019 at the premises of M/s MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §82,423.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 551,699.00
"Check” Items Amount : 5%
Total : 5%
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%
Nett Value 1 5%
nearside
Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the mr T e front
rear portion
offside

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAIL AMSAE-A
Automohile Assessor



MS @FirstCapital

& Raffies Quay i21.00 Singapore 048580
Tt (6516222 2911 Fax: (6516222 3547

Clabs & Mater Undwrweising Degr: 36 Robinson Road F16-01 City House Singapore 0GSH77

Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax |55) 6507 3840
wiww matirstcapital com.sg

M35 First Capital Insurance Limited Co.Reg. Mo, 1950000060 G5T Reg. o, M2 00016754

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number,

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

31-12-2018 Our Ref No,
26-12-2018 Claim Type.
SHCO0844X Third Party Vehicle.

BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08
NITHA

62723892/ 0 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA, Fax No.
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D19000093MFSH

Third Party

SKR8099M

62708314

68416315

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Ce : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE

Attention. NIL

LTD
MNA

SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,

S EAL N




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

TE———
From: Jacelyn <jacelyn@mova.comsg>
Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 4:23 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAUtD)
Ce: SUR
Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: SKRB099M - TR/FCI - VW JETTA 1.4 (DOA 26.12.2018)
Dear Veron,

Amount confirmed.

Best Regards,

Jacelyn Ooi

Estimator

Mowa Automotive Pte Lid

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Lid

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intanded recipient anly, If you have recaived this message in error, please do nol copy, disclose or use
its content. We would be grateful if you weuld notify us by email and delete the eriginal transmission and any attachment from your system

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasenable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulling from software viruses. Please carmy out your own virus checks bafera apening any attachment

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 12:43 PM

To: Jacelyn; Taufikh (LKKAuUto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: SKR8099M - TP/FCI - VW JETTA 1.4 (DOA 26.12.2018)

Dear Jacelyn,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer Lump Sum $1150 (@ 2 working days.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: lacelyn <jacelyn@mova.com. sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 11:17 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FINALIZATION: SKR8099M - TR/FCI - VW JETTA 1.4 (DOA 26.12.2018)

1



Hi Taufikh,
Please find the attached ‘Marking Estimate’ & After-Paint’ photographs for your reference.

We propose the finalize amount at Lumpsum $ 1,350.00 with 2 working days. Kindly revert.

Best Regards,
Jacelyn Ooi
Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ ©

Automolive Ple Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in eror, please do nal copy, disclose or use
its content, We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmissicn and any attachment from your system.

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk. we do not accept any liabllity resulting from software viruses. Please camy ouf your own virus chacks before opening any attachment.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 4:55 PM

To: 'Sithara”; Taufikh (LKKAuta); SUR

Subject: FW: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000093MFSH/1, SKR B099M
Attachments: SKR 8099M PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sithara,

Thank you for the email.

Will check and revert.

Gest Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 5:23 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000093MFSH/1, SKR 8099M

Dear Veron,

Our insured driver reported as below i.e. no damages to both vehicles.: as such, please verify the allegations made by
our insured driver.
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Thanks and regards,

Sithara G 5
Motor Claims

Change of email address
E har capital.com.s

M5 First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6507 3848 | Fax Mo.: 6507 3843 |
Company Regn. No. 195000106C

A Member of m INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Canfidentialicy Notice: This e-mail is confidential. 1t may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disciose or use any part of it.

If you have recelved this message in error, please delste the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immadiately by return e-mail.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, January 11, 2019 1:47 PM

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000093MFSH/1, SKR BO99M

Dear Sir/Madam,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKR 8099M

Date of survey: 10/1/19
Number of days : 2 days

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

8lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 12:08 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000093MF5SH/1

Dear 5ir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@1kkayto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [maiitﬂ:cwsmutorr:laim5@msfirstcapital.corn.ag]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January, 2019 12:00 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000093MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto) .

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 January 2019 1:47 PM

To: ‘CWSs Maotor Claims'

Cc: 'Sithara’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000093MFESH/1, SKR B099M
Attachments: SKR 8099M PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKR 8099M
Date of survey: 10/1/19
Number of days : 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 12:08 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara’ <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000093MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fux: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 S(a08933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January, 2019 12:00 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000093MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

1



Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.
Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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Automotive Pte Lid
Main Office:
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' FPage # = 4 Tal: (65) 64763333
mte Fax: (B5) 6271 5801
Veh# . SKRB8099M A
2811212018 Workahoe Bieph
Veh Model -+ VW JETTA Bt Morah Lans 3,
1-04/08/08/0
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Eetimatest - CKA18501 i
36 Robinson Road Tal: (65) 62723802
#16-01 City House Claim# - TW/oKi23L15 Fax: (65) 6270 8314
Singapore 068877. ACC. Date - 26/12/18 GST rag, T42-0086854 2
Terms . C.O0D Days
Altention - XA026 Remarks :- m¥Fh 10 Mar 2015 (014
No.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts 5%
LIST ITEMS :
1. REAR BUMPER 1 PC 127000 &< 1,370.00
2. REAR BUMPER LOWER 1 PC 650,00 7 660.00
3.  REAR BUMFER CLIPS 10 PC 4,00 “L£¢<7 40,00
LIST TOTAL S§ — 3,070.00
.10% DISCOUNT S$ -207.00
Mt = 126300 - 10— e
b =3 43000 edoy 1
LABOUR : $ | 699-00 ) B
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LABOUR TOTAL S5 me&m % 135000 N 56000
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e NON-TAX AMOUNT S _
AMOUNT S35 2,423.00
GST@ 7% 169.61
AMOUNT DUE 8% 2,582.61
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' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i IR BB 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 19960T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI9000023/T1vbn2
21601 GITY HgfsﬁE%!NGAFGRE 068877 ips SbeRaTd I”H””III”|||‘I||‘|
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHC 844X Veh. Inspected SKR 8039M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000093MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SITHARA Assign Date 02/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN JETTA c.c 1380
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. WAVWEZZZ16ZFMO02453 Colour BLACK
Odometer 58751 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Madification SPORTS RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55R16 GITI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55R16 GITI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 GITI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 GITI 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26112/2018 Ilnspactlon Date 10/01/2018
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08 |
SINGAPORE 159722
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIQD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




/ 4
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-96071598-R Paga No.:1 af 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKR B0%93M
: : Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty P Workshop ($)) $)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1,370.00 1,116.70
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER TO REPAIR SEE BE0.00 N
LABOUR
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @$4.00 MECESSARY 40,00 40.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -207.00 -115.67
1,863.00 1,041.03
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & TRANSFER REVERSE SENSOR. 60.00 30.00
TO REMOVE & REPLACE DAMAGED ITEMS. REALIGN 250.00 200.00
CONNECTION.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
BUMPER LOWER.
TO SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIRED AREAS. 250.00 200.00
560.00 430.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,423.00 1,471.03
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,150.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19000023/T1vbn2

g

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

K2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DHSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TG THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sobely for the use and berafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

Ha lability af respensibility whatsoe: v

on ihe Report wholly of

nparl. Any ihird party &




