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Pre Lid Campany Raglsiration Ko 1599607198/

!'i'/l"‘-rr Auto

S URLAVE 1, #0228 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 625035361 FAN : (063) 62364315

Your ref:  DI19000077MESH
Our ref: CS/FCI9000022/Kvb Date : 3/1/2019

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAFITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SMH 79C

We thank for your instruction on 2/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

2/1/2019  at the premises of M/s  OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5§523,378.29
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5519,811.29
"Check" Items Amount + 8%2.477.50
Market Value + 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear i
front n/s portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Y ours faithfully,

Kenneth Kong
Licensed Appraiser



1 M5 First Caplital Insurance Limited Co®eg bio 1950001060 G5T Reg e M2 00016764
MS‘ Flmtcapital B Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580

Tel (05} 622 2311 Fax: (B5) 0222 3547

Claims & Moior Undeneriting Depe: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel, (B5) 6307 3848 Fax (63) 6307 3843
wiana mstirsicapital com,sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 28-12-2018 Our Ref No. D15000077MFSH
Accident Date 27-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHD4619Z Third Party Vehicle. SMHT7SC
Survey Location 6 KUNG CHONG ROAD
Contact Person. LILY LOI
Contact No. 64811522/ 0 Fax No. 64811011

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: NO EST. COR PROVIDED (WE ADMIT LIABILITY

Survey T
Z QUANTUM TO BE AGREED)
Appointed
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop OPTIMA WERKZ FTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




- Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 2:18 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: '‘Serene Ler’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000077MFSH/1, SMH 79C
Attachments: SMH 79C PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMH 79C
Date of survey: 2/1/2019
Number of days : 6 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 9:46 AM

To: '"CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000077MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: pssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January, 2019 9:40 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LEKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18000077MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

1



* Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 12:50 FM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMHT79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018
Attachments: 03042019124221.pdf

Hi Kenneth,

TP CLAIMS = SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018
Please see attached.

Our calculation as per below:

S/P -518,547.65 (514,808.60 + 53,739.05)
S/N - 545.00

L - $2,060.00 ($1,900.00 + 5160.00)

Total - 520,652.65 - 20%

Lump sum - $16,500.00 instead of $16,400.00

Please check & revert.
Thank you very much.
Best Regards,

Chong Pui Theng (Ms.)
Estimator, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPT/MANERHKZ o

Head office: 8 Kung Chong Road Singapore 156143 Tel (+00) 0472 1313 Fax: (+06) 8472 EN12
Branch: 8A Serangoon North Ave 5§ Singapore 564500 Tel: (+85) 6484 9970  Fax: (+88) 8481 70N
Branch: 851 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574418 Tel: (+85) 0452 GB6A  Fax: (+08) 8482 0223

www.ow.sg | www. facebook.com/OptimaWerkz

Privileged/Confidential infarmation may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose,
nor disclose s contents to any other persan.
Please notify the sender if vou receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which.

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April 2019 9:24 AM

To: puitheng.chong@ow.sg

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Attach re-finalised for SMH 73C,

From: @ithgng,;hgug@gﬁtﬁg mailto:puitheng.chong@ow.sq]
Sent: Monday, 25 March, 2019 3:16 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)




Cc: hockkong.ong@ow.sg; 'Lily Lol OW'; sharon@ow.sg
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Hi Kenneth,
TP CLAIMS — SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018
Attached supplementary with marking for your reference.

Thank you very much,

Best Regards,

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms)
Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T:+65 64721313 F:+65 64722112
Branch : 9A Serangoon Morth Ave 5 Singapore 554500 T:+65 6484 9919  F: +65 6481 1011
Branch : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 T:+65 6452 6868  F: +65 6452 9223
WWW.0W.58

www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 March 2019 9:14 AM

To: puitheng.chong@ow.sg

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Attach finalised for SMH 79C. Kenneth

From: mgﬂggagng@mug
Sent: Wednesday, 20 March, 2019 6:02 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: hockkong.ong@ow.sq; sharon@ow.sqg; "Lily Loi OW'
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Hi Kenneth,

TP CLAIMS = SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018
Any status of the finalise?

Kindly revert.

Thank you very much.

Best Regards,

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms)

Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011



OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T:+656472 1313  F:+656472 2112
Branch : OA Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 T:+656484 9919  F:+65 6481 1011
Branch : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 T: +65 6452 6BAE  F: +#65 6452 9223
WWW.OW. 58

www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg <puitheng.chong@ow.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 2:24 PM
To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: "hockkong.ong@ow.sg’ <hockkong.ong@ow.sg>; 'sharon@ow.sg' <sharon@ow.sg>; "Lily Loi OW' <Lily.Loi@ow.sg>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH75C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Hi Kenneth,

TP CLAIMS = SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Please help finalise the case.

Thank you very much,

Best Regards,

Pui Theng, Chong {Ms)

Motor Claims Department

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T:+65 64721313 F: +65 6472 2112

Branch : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 T +65 6484 9919 F:+65 6481 1011
Branch : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 T:+65 6452 6B6B  F: +65 6452 9223

WWW.0OW.58
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg <puitheng.chong@ow.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 6:03 PM

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com=>

Cc: 'hockkong.ong@ow.sg' <hockkong.ong@ow.sg>; 'sharon@ow.sg' <sharon@ow.sg>; 'Lily Loi OW" <Lily.Loi@ow.sg>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Hi Kenneth,

TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Attached after paint photos for your reference.

Please help finalise and let us have your marked estimate.

Thank you very much.



Best Regards,

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms)
Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T:+65 6472 1313 F: +65 6472 2112
Branch 194 Serangoon Morth Ave 5§ Singapore 554500 T:+65 6484 9919  F: +65 6481 1011
Branch : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 T:+65 6452 6868 F: +65 64529223

WWW.OW.5
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 8:15 AM

To: puitheng.chong@ow.sg

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Thank you for your resurvey photos. Supplementary items 1,2 and 9 not payable.

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg ilto: puitheng.chong@ow.

Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 6:06 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: hockkong.ong@ow.sg; "Sharon'; "Lily.Loi'

Subject: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Hi Kenneth,

TP CLAIMS — SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018
Attached dismantle photos for your necessary action.

Thank you very much.

Best Regards,

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms)
Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T:4656472 1313 F:+65 6472 2112
Branch :9A Serangoon Morth Ave 5 Singapore 554500 T:+65 6484 9919  F: +65 6481 1011
Branch  :551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 T: 4656452 6B6E  F: 46564529223

WWW.OW.58
www.facebook.com/foptimawerkz




Euithena.chang@uw.sg

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 10:34 AM

Teo: 'hockkong.ong@ow.sg’

Subject: FW: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018
Tow,

FYl.

Best Regards,

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms)
Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 T:+65 64721313 F: 4656472 2112
Branch : 94 Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 T:+65 6484 9919  F: +65 6481 1011
Branch :551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 T:+65 6452 6B6B  F: +65 6452 9223

WWW,OW.5E
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 8:15 AM

To: puitheng.chong @ow.sg

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Thank you for your resurvey photos. Supplementary items 1,2 and 9 not payable.

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg [mailta: puitheng.chong@ow.sq]

Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 6:06 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: hockkong.ong@ow.sq; "Sharon'; "Lily. Lol

Subject: TP CLAIMS - SMH7SC PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Hi Kenneth,

TP CLAIMS — SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018
Attached dismantle photos for your necessary action.

Thank you very much.

Best Regards,

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms)

Mator Claims Department

D:+65 6481 1522 | F: 465 6481 1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTELTD
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Intended Deregistration Date:
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Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo
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Maxirmum Power Qutput
Open Market Vakue:

Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Artial ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
FARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Pariodears):

QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained hereinis correct as at 27 Dec 2018

PARE /T MIE B abata Enmisies

Singapore NRIC
JZBIH

SMHTYC

Mo

27 Dec 2018
PORSCHE
PANAMERA,

Sllver

2010

BO37T9E
WPOZZZFTIBLOG3152
I000KW (402 bha)
5107.440,00

19 lan 2011

19 Jan 2011

3

$107 66000

Yas
18 Jan 2021
5459400

18 Jan 2021

B - Car[1501cc & above]
10

$42/80100

$8.81300

$73.409.00
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OpTimA WERKZ PTELTD [/Cop 8 M focf <,

Head office  : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: +65 6472 1313 Fax: +65 6472 2112
Branch office : 94 Serangoon Morth Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011

Co. Reg. No. 201212455W

Date: 27 DECEMBER 2018 Third Party Insurer:
Vehicle No: SMH79C Third Party Veh No: SHD46192
Model: PORSCHE PANMERA Date of Accident: 27 DECEMBER 2018
Chassis: WP0ZZZ97ZBL003152 - 2011
ESTIMATE
NO. | DESCRIPTION QTY UNITSS = AMOUNT s§
"1 FRONT BONNET -~ ¢2 ¢y ; 1 Z7 $5,450.00 «—
2 FRONT BONNET EMBLEM LDGD 1 | B e, $170.00 —
3 FRONT HINGE LH 1 [ ' | /U $195.00 ¥
4 FRONT HINGE RH T3 [ i #1 519500 A
5 FRONTHEADLAMPLH 2§77 1 %4 $5,12000 —
6 FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKET ASSY LH 1 #y $32500 7~
7 FRONT HEADLAMP WASHER INJECTOR ASSY LH 1 | 77} $425.00 «—
'8 FRONTBUMPER i z.g'y";.a 1 _ A $3,25000 —
9 FRONT BUMPER CLIPS &l $14.00 Asg 5168.00 —
10 FRONT BUMPER NUMBER PLATE GARNISH [ 1 ] ' /2, $155.00 «—
11 FRONT BUMPER PARKING SENSOR 2 $190.00 Sher 538000 —
12 FRONT BUMPER SIGNAL WITH DAYLIGHT LH  J/Z2. 1 | Cpy  $900.00 —
13 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH COVER LH 1 ey §207.00 —
14 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH COVER CLIPS 3 $12.50 Az, $3750 —
15 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE 1 2y $310.00 —
16 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE CLIPS 8 $12.50 Ae, 510000 —
17 FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER BRACKET LH 1  p,r 57500 —
18 FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LH 1T a M7y 512500 2~
19 FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER GUIDE CENTER 1 A, 531000 «—
20 FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER SIDE GUIDE LH 1 27 $155.00 —
21 FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER SIDE GUIDE CLIPS 8 $8.20 e 56560 —
22 FRONT BUMPER INNERSPONGE 1 C/M $34000 —
23 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT /5o 1 N 4; $137500 2—
24 FRONT BUMPER LOWER BEAM  #/e. 1 A $650.00 Z—
25 FRONT UPPER PANEL COVER o 1 7h 525500
26 FRONT FENDER LH IELT Y 1 ' A 52,400.00 c—
27 FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS 1SET As $16000
SUBTOTAL $23,298.10
LESS 10% $2,329.81
PARTS TOTAL $20,968.29
NO. SPECIAL NETT . QTY  UNIT s$ AMOUNT 5%
1 FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING B 1 - H77 660.00 FSra-
S/NTOTAL $60.00

Page 1




OpTiMA WERKZ PTELTD

Head office : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel : +65 6472 1313 Fax : +65 6472 2112
Branch office : 9A Serangoon Morth Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201212435W

Date: 27 DECEMBER 2018 ' Third Party Insurer:
Vehicle No: SMH73C Third Party Veh No: SHD46192
Model: PORSCHE PANMERA Date of Accident: 27 DECEMBER 2018

Chassis: WP0ZZ297ZBL003152 - 2011

ESTIMATE Z
LABOUR CHARGES: e
LABOUR CHARGE FOR KNOCKING & PARTS REPLACEMENT SRO0.00
?ﬂg‘i/
LABOUR CHARGE FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS $1,000.00
TO TUFF KOTE / ANTI-RUST $80.00 =/
TO REMOVE & REPLACED FRONT BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR $120.00 oy
TO CHECK WIRING AND WATER LEAK TEST $100.00 Jo/
TO DIAGNOSTIC CHECK & RESET MEMORY TO IDENTIFICATION STANDARD £250.00 ffq/
LABOUR TOTAL $2,350.00
onG - ~ ToTAL $23,378.29
33, 03419

Page 2



Oprivin WERKZ PTELTD

Head office : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel : +65 6472 1313 Fax . +65 06472 2112
Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel ;: +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201212455W

Date: 27 DECEMEBER 2018 Third Party Insurer: MS FIRST CAPITAL
Vehicle No: SMH79C Third Party Veh No: SHD4619Z
Model: PORSCHE PANMERA Date of Accident: 27 DECEMBER 2018

Chassis: WP0Z2Z972BL003152 - 2011

ESTIMATE
| _NO. | DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT S5 | AMOUNT 55 |
1 |AIR CON CONDENSER 1 Jo $1,425.00 G_;*
2 'RADIATOR 1 S, $1,725.00 (‘-? ¥
! 3 RADIATOR SUPPORT PANEL 1 A  51,280.000 —
4 IRADIATOR AIR DUCT 1 P $538.00| —
5 |RADIATOR LOWER GUARD COVER 1 é,27 $1,050.00] —
6 AIR FILTER - 1 [H.Se)Jr~ [P-vy  $343.00 ‘_ﬂﬁ,zw
7 |AIR FILTER BOX 1 ¢/A  5985.00, -
8 AIR FILTER BOX AIR DUCT LH 1 Cpp $130.00
9 GEAR BOX OIL COOLER 1 Lo 51,775.00 &’
|
[ N BN N N . |
SUB TOTAL - “I_‘__I___SB,ZEI.IJG
LESS35% /0 | SaamaTs
PARTS TOTAL | $6,938.25|
LABOUR CHARGES:
LABOUR CHARGES TO CHANGE ABOVE MENTIONED ITEM $150.00 fgz
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACED AIRCON SYSTEM, VACUUM WITH FLUSHING/REFILL
AIRCON GAS/OIL $180.00 7&71
LABOUR TOTAL 5330.00
ONG TOTAL —57,268.25
265590

Page 1
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Op1imMA WERKZ PTE LTD //C 817, fw,( 6ot
Head office - 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel : +65 6472 1313 Fax: +65 6472 2112
granch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9319 Fax : +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201__112455W , o Ll
Date: 27 DECEMBER 2018 Third Party Insurer: |
Vehicle No:  SMH79C Third Party Veh No: SHD4619Z i
Model: PORSCHE PANMERA Date of Accident: 27 DECEMBER 2018
Chassis: WP022297ZBL003152 - 2011
ESTIMATE ) L
NO. " DESCRIPTION Qry | UNITSS  AMOUNT S5
"1 FRONTBONNET . . #2& 1| | % $545000 —
2 FRONTBONNETEMBLEMLOGO 1] 1 e, $170.
3 FRONTHINGELH B ) 1 _ - __ﬂ__s_gsmx-
4 FRONT HINGE RH 1 7 $195.00 4
5 FRONT HEADLAMP LH B 57 1 T %3 512000 —
& FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKET ASSYLH R - _ #r $32500 1
7 FRONT HEADLAMP WASHER INJECTOR ASSY LH _ 1 | cr} $82500 —
8 FRONTBUMPER _ 2i{tlte 1 ~ & 5325000 —
9 FRONT BUMPER CLIPS 12 $14.00 ﬂ-‘-:.\ SIESEH] e
" 10 FRONT BUMPER NUMBER PLATE GARNISH T . B, 515500 —
11 FRONT BUMPER PARKING SENSOR | 72 §19000  /4ey  $380.00 —
12 FRONT BUMPER SIGNAL WITH DAYLIGHT LH i B - Cm  $900.00 —
13 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH COVER LH 1Tx ] 1 Ay 3200100 —
14 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH COVERCLIPS 3 s12s0 A 53750 —
15 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE — 1A - Py $31000 —
16 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLECLIPS E S $12.50 A $10000 —
17 FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER BRACKETLH 1 ) 02,7 $7500 —
18 FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LH g = T 7 $12500 2
19 FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER GUIDE CENTER X - A, $31000 —
20 FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER SIDE GUIDELH 1| 27 515500 —
21 FRONTEUMF‘FRINNERRETAINERSIDEGUIDECLIPS 8 58.20| e, Sﬁﬁﬁl} i
22 FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE B | C/7 §34000 —
" 23 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 5o R A&, 51,37500 2~
24 FRONTBUMPER LOWER BEAM  #ife. 5 T | 3‘1' $650000 Z—
25 FRONT UPPER PANEL COVER - 1 | 5155}00’;{
26 |FRONT FENDER LH L. {13ze T | A $2,400000)
27 |FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS | ASET] A 5160100 ¥
o 'SUBTOTAL ~ §23,398[10 %
LESS10%  -52,329)81
PARTS TOTAL | §20,968[29' &
NO. ~ SPECIAL NETT QTY | UNIT 5§  AMOUNT s§
"1 FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING £ 1 ~7hr7 $60,00 B
B o - ~ §/NTOTAL T $60,00)& oo
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OpTimA WERKZ PTELTD |

Head office  : 6 Kung Cheng Road Singapore 159143 Tel : +65 6472 1313 Fax: +65 6472 2112
Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 5384 9919 Fax ; +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201212455W S == o
Date: 27 DECEMBER 2018 Third Party Insurer: |
Vehicle No: SMH79C Third Party Veh No: SHD4619Z
Model: PORSCHE PANMERA Date of Accident: 27 DECEMBER 2018
Chassis: WP0Z2297ZBL003152 - 2011
ESTIMATE z
LABOUR CHARGES: s d
LABOUR CHARGE FOR KNOCKING & PARTS REPLACEMENT $800.00
?:?;-‘/
LABOUR CHARGE FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURMNISHING MATERIALS 51,000.00
TO TUFF KOTE / ANTI-RUST $80.00 b=y
TO REMOVE & REPLACED FRONT BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR 5120.00 ﬁf—"/
TO CHECK WIRING AND WATER LEAK TEST $100.00 Joy
TO DIAGNOSTIC CHECK & RESET MEMORY TO IDENTIFICATION STANDARD £250.00 ?‘:ﬂ
LABOURTOTAL §2,350.00 40 ¢
R (-, S $23,378.29
LKK Aulo Consuitants hence notify '
the Repairer of the following: ’
» To rusurvay beloee'after goray 1 :_:.I.:-,_
» To dispkay damaged sari(s) dising ooy
» Parls p* a3 are subecl o confinmiation
:- [ % o3 | o has
""‘":'-"I'-:‘.l."':'-; 'J-I-'il-'-'«;"a:: " . " L E o
Acknowledgad by Repairar
Signature:
Date:
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' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

mln B = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
TEL® 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCH9000022/Kvbn2
:?ER—EBETTS‘? ESS;EDSMGAPGRE 068877 Duhey oaesanm mlmmwu"mm
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh,  SHD 46182 Veh. Inspected SMH 78C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000077MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SERENELER Assign Date 02/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model PORSCHE PANAMERA (A) C.C 3605
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. WPOZZZ97ZBL003152 Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer 104180 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
g Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RfH Front Tyre 245/50 ZR18 PIRELLI B mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/50 ZR18 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |275/45ZR18 PIRELLI g mm
L/H Rear Tyre |275/45 ZR18 FIRELLI & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE WEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT NS PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
b General Information
Accident Date  27/12/2018 Inspection Date 02/01/2019
Survey held at OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
g4 SERANGOON NORTH AVE 5
SINGAPORE 554500
5a. Remarks
ADAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BiTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
N ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days




g

1 /d 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

S me 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/__. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607T198-R Page Mo.:1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMH 79C
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | \~* ishiop: g}] ©)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BONNET BENT 5,450.00 4,200.00
1|FRONT BONNET EMBLEM LOGO NECESSARY 170.00 170.00
1|FRONT HINGE LH TO REPAIR SEE 195.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT HINGE RH TO REPAIR SEE 19500 .
LABOUR
1|FRONT HEADLAMP LH BROKEN 5,120.00 2,972.00
1|FRONT HEADLAMP BRAGKET ASSY LH BENT 325.00 325.00
1|FRONT HEADLAMP WASHER INJECTOR ASSY LH CRACKED 425.00 42500
1|FRONT BUMPER BENT 3,250.00 2 678.70
12|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS @3$14.00 NECESSARY 168.00 168.00
1|FRONT BUMPER NUMBER PLATE GARNISH BENT 155.00 155.00
2| FRONT BUMPER PARKING SENSOR @$190.00 SHORTED 380.00 380,00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIGNAL WITH DAYLIGHT LH CRACKED 900.00 812.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH COVER LH MISSING 207.00 207.00
3|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH COVER CLIPS NECESSARY 37.50 37.50
@512.50
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE DISTORTED 310.00 310.00
8|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE CLIPS @$12.50 NEGESSARY 100.00 100.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER BRACKET LH DISTORTED 75.00 75.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LH DISTORTED 125.00 125.00
1|FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER GUIDE CENTER BENT 310.00 310.00
1|FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER SIDE GUIDE LH DISTORTED 165,00 155.00
8|FRONT BUMPER INNER RETAINER SIDE GUIDE CLIPS  |NECESSARY 65.60 65.60
@$8.20
1|FRONT BUMPER INNER SPONGE CRACKED 340.00 340.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 1,375.00 850.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER BEAM BUCKLED 650.00 480.00
1|FRONT UPPER PANEL COVER SERVICEABLE 255.00 p
1|FRONT FENDER LH BUCKLED 2,400.00 1,113.20
1|SET FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 160.00
1|AIR CON CONDENSER (ADDITIONAL) SERVICEABLE 1,425.00 2

Report Ref No. CS/FC118000022/Kvbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R Page Mo.:2 of 3
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo ﬂuﬁnp?sy]} lji%l'
1|RADIATOR (ADDITIOMNAL) SERVICEABLE 1,725.00 -
1|RADIATOR SUPPORT PANEL (ADDITIONAL) BENT 1,280.00 1,280.00
1|RADIATOR AIR DUCT (ADDITIONAL) DENTED 538.00 538.00
1|RADIATOR LOWER GUARD COVER (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 1,050.00 1,050.00
1|AIR FILTER BOX (ADDITIOMAL) CRACKED 985.00 Q85.00
1]AIR FILTER BOX AIR DUCT LH (ADDITIOMNAL) CRACKED 130.00 130.00
1|GEAR BOX OIL COOLER (ADDITIONAL) SERVICEABLE 1,775.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -3,220.61 -2,043.70
28,885.49 18,383.30
1|AIR FILTER (50%)(SN)ADDITIONAL) DISTORTED 343.00 171.50
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -34.30 -
308.70 171.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING (SN) MISSING 60.00 45.00
60.00 45.00
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGE FOR KNOCKING & PARTS B00.00 700.00
REPLACEMENT.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT
HINGE LH AND FRONT HINGE RH.
LABOUR CHARGE FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & 1,000.00 900,00
FURMNISHING MATERIALS.
TO TUFF KOTE/ANTI-RUST 80.00 60.00
TO REMOVE & REPLACED FRONT BUMPER REVERSE 120.00 60.00
SENSOR
TO CHECK WIRING AND WATER LEAK TEST. 100.00 30.00
TO DIAGNOSTIC CHECK & RESET MEMORY TO 250.00 180.00
IDENTIFICATION STANDARD.
LABOUR CHARGES TO CHANGE ABOVE MENTIONED 150.00 60.00
ITEM. (ADDITIONAL).
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACED AIRCON SYSTEM,VACUUM 180.00 100.00
WITH FLUSHING/REFILL AIRCON GAS/OIL. (ADDITIONAL).
2,680.00 2,080.00
GRAND TOTAL 32,034.19 20,699.80

Report Ref No. CS/FC118000022/Kvbn2
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Page Mo, 3of 3
16,500.00

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No, CS/FC119000022/Kvbn2

Y iva

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely Tor the use and benefit of the Client namad on tha front page of this Repor.
| I g " L DRy pCRNg O




