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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 9 April 2019 12:37 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; sharon@ow.sg; angela.tan@ow.sg; 'hockkong.ong'; Lily.loi@ow.sg

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018

Hi Veron, 

 

TP CLAIMS – SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Confirmed the finalized lump sum amount of $16,500.00 & 6 days. 

 

Thank you very much. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Chong Pui Theng (Ms.) 
Estimator, Motor Claims Department 

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

 

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, 

nor disclose its contents to any other person.  

Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 
 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 9 April 2019 10:46 AM 

To: puitheng.chong@ow.sg; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Dear Pui Theng, 

 

Kindly check email on 4/4/2019. 

 

 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg <puitheng.chong@ow.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 9 April 2019 10:40 AM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Hi Morning Kenneth, 

 

TP CLAIMS – SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Please see attachment. 

 

Our calculation as per below: 

S/P - $18,547.65 ($14,808.60 + $3,739.05) 

S/N - $45.00 

L - $2,060.00 ($1,900.00 + $160.00) 

Total - $20,652.65 – 20% 

Lump sum - $16,500.00 instead of $16,400.00 

 

Please check & revert. 

 

Thank you very much. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Chong Pui Theng (Ms.) 
Estimator, Motor Claims Department 

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

 

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, 

nor disclose its contents to any other person.  

Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 
 

 

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg <puitheng.chong@ow.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 12:50 PM 

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Hi Kenneth, 

 

TP CLAIMS – SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Please see attached. 

 

Our calculation as per below: 

S/P - $18,547.65 ($14,808.60 + $3,739.05) 
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S/N - $45.00 

L - $2,060.00 ($1,900.00 + $160.00) 

Total - $20,652.65 – 20% 

Lump sum - $16,500.00 instead of $16,400.00 

 

Please check & revert. 

 

Thank you very much. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Chong Pui Theng (Ms.) 
Estimator, Motor Claims Department 

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

 

 
www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, 

nor disclose its contents to any other person.  

Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 
 

 

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April 2019 9:24 AM 

To: puitheng.chong@ow.sg 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Attach re-finalised for SMH 79C. 

 

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg [mailto:puitheng.chong@ow.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 25 March, 2019 3:16 PM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) 
Cc: hockkong.ong@ow.sg; 'Lily Loi OW'; sharon@ow.sg 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Hi Kenneth, 

 

TP CLAIMS – SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Attached supplementary with marking for your reference. 

 

Thank you very much. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms) 

Motor Claims Department 

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

 

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD 
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Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143                 T: +65 6472 1313      F: +65 6472 2112     

Branch        : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500    T: +65 6484 9919      F: +65 6481 1011     

Branch        : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415         T: +65 6452 6868      F: +65 6452 9223     

www.ow.sg 

www.facebook.com/optimawerkz 

 

 

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 25 March 2019 9:14 AM 

To: puitheng.chong@ow.sg 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Attach finalised for SMH 79C. Kenneth 

 

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg [mailto:puitheng.chong@ow.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 20 March, 2019 6:02 PM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) 
Cc: hockkong.ong@ow.sg; sharon@ow.sg; 'Lily Loi OW' 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Hi Kenneth, 

 

TP CLAIMS – SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Any status of the finalise? 

 

Kindly revert. 

 

Thank you very much. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms) 

Motor Claims Department 

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

 

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD 
Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143                 T: +65 6472 1313      F: +65 6472 2112     

Branch        : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500    T: +65 6484 9919      F: +65 6481 1011     

Branch        : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415         T: +65 6452 6868      F: +65 6452 9223     

www.ow.sg 

www.facebook.com/optimawerkz 

 

 

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg <puitheng.chong@ow.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 2:24 PM 

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'hockkong.ong@ow.sg' <hockkong.ong@ow.sg>; 'sharon@ow.sg' <sharon@ow.sg>; 'Lily Loi OW' <Lily.Loi@ow.sg> 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Hi Kenneth, 
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TP CLAIMS – SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Please help finalise the case. 

 

Thank you very much. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms) 

Motor Claims Department 

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

 

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD 
Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143                 T: +65 6472 1313      F: +65 6472 2112     

Branch        : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500    T: +65 6484 9919      F: +65 6481 1011     

Branch        : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415         T: +65 6452 6868      F: +65 6452 9223     

www.ow.sg 

www.facebook.com/optimawerkz 

 

 

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg <puitheng.chong@ow.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 6:03 PM 

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'hockkong.ong@ow.sg' <hockkong.ong@ow.sg>; 'sharon@ow.sg' <sharon@ow.sg>; 'Lily Loi OW' <Lily.Loi@ow.sg> 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Hi Kenneth, 

 

TP CLAIMS – SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Attached after paint photos for your reference. 

 

Please help finalise and let us have your marked estimate. 

 

Thank you very much. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms) 

Motor Claims Department 

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

 

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD 
Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143                 T: +65 6472 1313      F: +65 6472 2112     

Branch        : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500    T: +65 6484 9919      F: +65 6481 1011     

Branch        : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415         T: +65 6452 6868      F: +65 6452 9223     

www.ow.sg 

www.facebook.com/optimawerkz 

 

 

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 8:15 AM 
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To: puitheng.chong@ow.sg 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Thank you for your resurvey photos. Supplementary items 1,2 and 9 not payable. 

 

From: puitheng.chong@ow.sg [mailto:puitheng.chong@ow.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 6:06 PM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) 
Cc: hockkong.ong@ow.sg; 'Sharon'; 'Lily.Loi' 

Subject: TP CLAIMS - SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Hi Kenneth, 

 

TP CLAIMS – SMH79C PORSCHE PANAMERA DOA 27 DECEMBER 2018 

 

Attached dismantle photos for your necessary action. 

 

Thank you very much. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Pui Theng, Chong (Ms) 

Motor Claims Department 

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 

 

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD 
Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143                 T: +65 6472 1313      F: +65 6472 2112     

Branch        : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500    T: +65 6484 9919      F: +65 6481 1011     

Branch        : 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415         T: +65 6452 6868      F: +65 6452 9223     

www.ow.sg 

www.facebook.com/optimawerkz 

 

 


