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51 UBL AVE 1, #01-15 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19000073MFSH Date: 8/3/2019
Our Ref: CS/FCI19000019/Ktb

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital ance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO, SIR 1J

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
2/1/2019 at the premises of M/s Optima Werkz have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 34.314.86
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 16.793.10
“Check™ Items Amount 1 5% 0.00
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : S§%
Mett Value : 5%

Description of Damage: o
The vehicle sustained damages at the n/s body portion

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Kenneth
Automotive Assessor



H i M5 First Capital Insurance Limited co#eg ke 1950001088 CAT Reg Mo 20001865
MS . FI rStC‘a pltﬂl 6 Ralfles Quay 421-00 Singapore D4B5B0

Tel: (65)6222 2311 Fax {65) 6222 3547

Claims & Hater Underwrlting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore D6BET?
Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
wowwl mafirsteapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 28-12-2018 Qur Ref No. D19000073MFSH
Accident Date 26-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHDB&33U Third Party Vehicle. SJR1J
Survey Location 6 KUNG CHONG ROAD
Contact Person. SHARON TEM
Contact No. 64811522/ 0 Fax No. 64811011
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
A int

ppointed LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MA, Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number, MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
MNIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SITHARA,

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computar generated letter, no signature required.




Denise Ta: (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) 3
Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 5.02 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims’; assignments

Cc: 'Sithara’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12000073MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIR 11 on 2/1/2018
We are pending part prices.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 11:04 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara’ <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000073MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailtD:Cwsm0tcrrclaims@msﬂrstcapitai.mm.59,]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January, 2019 10:02 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000073M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

1



Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 8 March 2019 11:53 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments
Cc: ‘Sithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000073MFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SIR 1).pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIR 1J

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 5:02 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com=>; 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@misfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000073MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIR 1) on 2/1/2018
We are pending part prices.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408233)

From: Admin-D {LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 11:04 AM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000073MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |0 Type:

Chwner [D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo.

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Madel:

Primary Caolour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Ma.

Maxirmum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count;

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PA&RF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE PeriodiYears):
QOF Paid;

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Dec 2018

PARFICOF Rehate Frniiire

Singapore NRIC
04398

SIR1]

Mo

31Dec 2019

PORSCHE

CAYENNE SHYBRID 3.0 A
Erown

2011

CGE101353
WP1ZZZ92ZCLAROTOT
2450 kW (328 bhp)
$946277.00

07 lul 2012

07 Jul 2012

0

L57.767.00

Yes
04 Jul 2022
$34,660.00

06 Jul 2022

E - Open Category
10

£34,999.00
$20,704.00
$55,364.00

OK
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OpTiMA WERKZ PTELTD (00 8 185 dmp Ve,

Head office | & Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel:+656472 1313 Fax: +65 6472 2112
Branch office 94 Serangoon MNorth Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel ; +65 6484 9919 Fax : 465 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No.  201712455W

28 DECEMBER 2018 = Third Party Insurer:  MS FIRST CAPITAL
Venicle No:  SIR1J Third Party Veh No:  SHD8833U
Made! PORSCHE CAYENNE-3.0'S HYBRID (A) Date of Accident: 26 DECEMBER 2018

Chassis WP1ZZZ2927CLAS0707 - 2012

=
R

1T 1
| oa | ! vl wn | s e

el el A R
£ L Pl e D

ESTIMATE
DESCRIPTION ary  UNIT S§  AMOUNT §§
FRONT HEADLAMP ASSY LH 3 | CAF 4 s, l:'lu:ii
FRONT BUMPER T 1 | S 's_i'éuuucﬂn.-r-"‘
FRONT BUNPER SIGNAL LAMP LH R X 5 A& 514000 —
FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LH (RETAINER) ENE . ¢m  $125.00
FRONT BUMPER LOWER SIDE GUARD COVER LH (DIFFUSER)] 1 | | J~ 51,176.00 ?(
FRONT BUMPER CLIPS _ L[ s12s0 M_?iisﬂpl-.-f
FRONT FENDER LH tse 1 A 5244500
FRONT FENDER EXTENTION COVER LH (ARCH GARNISH) | 1 | | ey $675.00 —
FRONT FENDIR EXTENTION COVER CLIPS 8 | 51{}.5(:-: Ac.  584.00 «—
'FRONT FENDER INNER LINER LH (INNER SHIELD) 1 |  Pe 72000 ¥
FRONT FENDER INNER LINER CLIPS B 12512200 A $146.40 £
FRONT ALLOY BIM LH 22" 27 oo 1 et $3,800. DEII e
FRONT DOOR SIOF MIRROR LH a 1 . Pt/ by $1,460.00 2
FRONT O -;J'I» LH '2?_5'}; ' |1 o ’% SH_H?S 00
'm::wu:- DR OUTERHANDLELH | | 7 — ' A $458.00 X
'rf- NT DOOR WEATHER STRIP LH ' 1] T P %00
REAR DOOR LH f% R I O Ay 549?5;:00*-"’
REARDOOROUTERHANDLELH | 1 1 | % sasaunj X
REAR TAILLAMP LH /3w 1 Ga sigsaon -
IREAR ALLOY RIM LH 22" B _:_ 1_; - | Pn $3,800.00 2
REAR FENDER LH {1 REPMR
REAR BUMPER anenteidh o __1 ' 1 - REPMR
- SUBTOTAL | §31,705.40
LESS 10% | 83,17054,
PARTSTOTAL | 528534386
SPECIALNETT i . .QTY  UNITS$  AMOUNT s8¢ | 2{g1n
| 1 FRONT TYRE LH 285/35ZR22 106W - T ' G $35000 §ofin
|2 REAR TVRE [ 285/352R22 106W I Je. 535000 x
~ IREAR TYRE TUBE VALVE LH - 1 & 1 $5.00 e, 51000
) ~ snTotaL T $71000

LAK Auto Consultants hence nolify
f pairer of the ':I'uwmg
Ter remsiarve .rgﬁa.e,ilwr:m.umﬂq
= T dispiay B0 parts) duning resurvey
. -a15| IoEs pe suisect (o confirmation
= Thurd panty survey = 00 & "Yithout Prejudice” basia
* b diggal modifahons) is aliowsd
* Swppesnentary isms) a1 be fesurveyed gng
* Binect b fnad appeoval from Insurance Comgany

Pgge 1
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OPTivA WERKZ PTELTD

Head office & kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: +65 6472 1313 Fax : +656472 2113
Branch office - 94 Serangoan North Ave § Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax - +65 6481 1011
Co.Reg Na 201212455

Date: 28 DECEMBER 2018 ' Third Party Insurer:  MS FIRST CAPITAL
Vehicle No:  SIR 1Y Third Party Veh No:  SHD8833U
Mode PLURSCHE CAYENNE-3.0 S HYBRID (A) Date of Accident: 26 DECEMBER 2018
Chassis WE1ZZ2927CLAS0707 = 2012
ESTIMATE /
LABOUR CHARGES: ﬁ"‘f
LABOUR CHARGE FOR KNDCKING & PARTS REPLACEMENT $2,100.00
LABOUR CHARGE FUR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS $2,300.00 / Ffa{
TO TUFF KOTE / ANTI-RUST £100.00 ?Qf
TOREMOVE & REFIT FRONT DOOR LH INTERIOR TRIM, POWER WINDOW GLASS,
FRONT DOOR GLASS, DOOR CENTRAL LOCKING SYSTEM & ETC. TO EFFECT REPLACE
ON FRONT DOGH LH $180.00 «
TO CHECK WIRING, REPLACED WITH FOCUS HEADLAMP $60.00 g/
TOSEND VEHICLE FOR 3D COMPUTERISED CHECK & ADJUSTED ALL WHEEL ALIGNMENT $80.00 =
TO DIAGNOSTIC CHECK & RESET MEMORY TO IDENTIFICATION STANDARD $250.00 zp’ﬂ’
LABOUR TOTAL 3507000
ons B T TS T Y7V T

Page 2



¥y VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

A 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607196-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI19000019/Kthn2
36 ROBINSON ROAD R — OB TR

PoeScue  Capennes

RYRI(T

dabo o ¢f~»f*’v\
O n

Coacave w f\-'l&.f.'“ur -{'.g..‘-r B~ 'II'Lr-'\'.r“ﬂ.E"' -Ir"\""' : r}jﬂ'h.i\-b-; tiadow {"m '

é—-—‘? Trbe~ G loea - - Lﬂa&‘fr‘u( d':m.!fl-&.f l"b‘pﬂfdt.n < 2fe - Te LBELLf %1“ =

'frh-r Toe ., la . _r':

@ Tao (b i :_“;-.“__f ke Ta b'fr.Lr-'-L 4.--_1&'_ I -‘\.f:\m-pt o

{_'-_],.' Tu "'U-u d.m.{mmf . I‘i-‘-.é'nuu.ql_j /

(%) e vn Clopm f.,,,_ Lumf_,ﬂ w  Ponata Ag,r,LL_n_:_._._.;__.hf

O Leben e o Pudef x T Sopphy palat < frarislicg mafaila



:’,.J_l

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 180607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607T188-R Page Mo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJR 1J
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rk:hnp?;}} !:]}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT HEADLAMP ASSY LH CRACKED 1,850.00 1,850.00
1|FRONT BUMPER BUCKLED 1,940.00 1,840.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIGNAL LAMP LH BROKEN 140.00 140,00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LH (RETAINER) CRACKED 125.00 125.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER SIDE GUARD COVER LH SERVICEABLE 1,176.00 -
(DIFFUSER)
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS @$12 50 NECESSARY 125.00 125,00
1|FRONT FENDER LH BENT 244500 1.750.00
1|FRONT FENDER EXTENSION COVER LH (ARCH DISTORTED 675.00 E75.00
GARNISH)
B|FRONT FENDER EXTENSION COVER CLIPS @3$10.50 NECESSARY 84.00 B4.00
1|FRONT FENDER INMER LINER LH {INNER SHIELD) SERVICEABLE 720.00 -
12|FRONT FENDER INNER LINER CLIPS @$12.20 NOT MECESSARY 146 40 -
1|FRONT ALLOY RIM LH 22° DENTED 3,800.00 2,300.00
1|FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR LH DENTED / CUT 1,460.00 1,460.00
1|FRONT DOOR LH BENT 4.975.00 2,850.00
1|FRONT DOOR OUTER HAMDLE LH TO REPAIR SEE 458.00 =
LABOUR
1({FRONT DOOR WEATHER STRIP LH SERVICEABLE 675.00 -
1|REAR DOOR LH BENT 4.570.00 2.810.00
1|REAR DOOR QUTER HANDLE LH TO REPAIR SEE 458.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR TAILLAMP LH cuT 1,683.00 1,300.00
1|FRONT ALLOY RIM LH 22" SERVICEABLE 3,800.00 -
1|REAR FENDER LH (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER [(NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -3,170.54 -1,760.80
28,534 86 15,848.10
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT TYRE LH 285/35ZR22 106W (60%)(SN) cCuT 350.00 210.00

Report Ref Mo, CS/FCI19000019/Ktbn2




1 P4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

‘,_;(_. 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Rep. No. 18-8607198-R Page No,;2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | = serital {{“ {Sj]
1|REAR TYRE LH 2B5/352R22 106W (SN) SERVICEABLE 380.00
2|REAR TYRE TUBE VALVE LH @$5.00 (SN) NECESSARY (1 PC 10.00 5.00
OMLY)
710.00 215.00
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGE FOR KNOCKING & PARTS 2,100.00 1,400.00

REPLACEMENT.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT
DOOR QOUTER HANDLE LH,REAR DOOR OUTER HANDLE
LH,REAR FENDER LH AND REAR BUMPER.

LABOUR CHARGE FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & 2,300.00 1,750.00
FURNISHING MATERIALS

TO TUFF KOTE/ANTI-RUST. 100.00 80.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT DOOR LH INTERIOR 180.00 180.00

TRIM,POWER WINDOW GLASS FRONT DOOR
GLASS DOOR CENTRAL LOCKING SYSTEM & ETC.TO
EFFECT REPLACE ON FRONT DOOR LH.

TO CHECK WIRING REPLACED WITH FOCUS HEADLAMP. 60.00 30.00
TO SEND VEHICLE FOR 3D COMPUTERISED CHECK & 80.00 80.00
ADJUSTED ALL WHEEL ALIGNMENT
TO DIAGNOSTIC CHECK & RESET MEMORY TO 250.00 200.00
IDENTIFICATION STANDARD.

5,070.00 3,730.00
GRAND TOTAL 34,314.86 19,793.10
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 15,800.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19000019/Kibn2

ydve

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- Thia Reparl is mads aalaly for the usa and banafit of the Clant namead on the front page of this Report.
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OpTima WERKZ PTE LTD “,,
Head office  : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: +65 6472 1313 Fax : +65 6472 2112
Branch office : 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax - +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201212455W
Date: 28 DECEMBER 2018 Third Party Insurer:  MS FIRST CAPITAL
Vehicle No: SJR1) Third Party Veh No:  SHD8833U
Model: PORSCHE CAYENNE-3.0 S HYBRID (A) Date of Accident: 26 DECEMBER 2018

Chassis: WP1Z27927CLAS0707 - 2012

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify

the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey b@ﬂer spray painting

« To désplay damagad part{s) during resurvey

* Parts prices are subject 1o confirmation

* Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudics” basis
* No ilegal modification(s) is allowsd

- SWW i) musd ba resunvaped and
s subect i final approval from Insurance C DMpany

Page 1

Acknowiedged by Repairer
S-'_':.“--'I..lil?'.
~

ESTIMATE
NO. | DESCRIPTION Qry | UNIT s$ AMOUNT s$ |
| 1 FRONT HEADLAMP ASSY LH 1 ) €727 $1,850.00 —
' 2 |FRONT BUMPER |1 M. $1,940.00
3 |FRONT BUMPER SIGNAL LAMP LH 1 | 4+ 5140.00 —
4 [FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET LH (RETAINER] 1 em 512500 <
5 FRONTBUMPER LOWER SIDE GUARD COVER LH (DIFFUSER)| 1 | s~ $1,176.00 X
6 |FRONT BUMPER CLIPS ' ' 10 $12.50 A€ 512500 —
' 7 |FRONT FENDER LH 1 #;  52,44500 —
8 |FRONT FENDER EXTENTION COVER LH (ARCH GARNISH) 1 w2, 5675.00) —
| 9 FRONT FENDER EXTENTION COVER CLIPS 8 $10.50 Ae. 58400 —
10 FRONT FENDER INNER LINER LH (INNER SHIELD) 1 | ' $720.00 7
11 |FRONT FENDER INNER LINER CLIPS [ 12 $12.20 $146.40 7
12 [FRONT ALLOY RIM LH 22" 1 | Her $3,800.00 &«
13 FRONT DOOR SIDE MIRROR LH 1 Por/ by $1,460.00 =
14 FRONT DOOR LH 1| & 54,975.00 «—
15 |FRONT DOOR OUTER HANDLE LH 1 #1 $458.00 X
' 16 [FRONT DOOR WEATHER STRIP LH =S $675.000 7
17 [REAR DOOR LH ' 1 A, $4,970.00 —
18 REAR DOOR OUTER HANDLE LH 1 7T $458.00 7
19 |REAR TAILLAMP LH - 1 &1 $1,683.00
' 20 |REAR ALLOY RIM LH 22" 1 $3,800.00 7
21 [REAR FENDER LH ' 1 REPAIR
22 [REAR BUMPER 1 REPAIR
SUB TOTAL $31,705.40,
LESS 10% -$3,170.54|
[PARTS TOTAL $28,534.86)
NO. | SPECIAL NETT QTY |  UNIT s$ AMOUNT 55 |
1 |FRONT TYRE LH 285/35ZR22 106W 1| %7 $350.00 60{in
2 REAR TYRE LH 285/35ZR22 106W 1 ) N sasa.utﬂ X
3 |REAR TYRE TUBE VALVE LH 2 $5.00 1, 51000,
il ]
S/N TOTAL $710.00




Optima WERKZ PTELTD

Head office : 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel : +65 6472 1313 Fax : +65 6472 2112
Branch office ; 94 Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel : +65 6484 9919 Fax : +65 6481 1011
Co. Reg. No. 201212455W

Date: 28 DECEMBER 2018 Third Party Insurer; MS FIRST CAPITAL
Vehicle No: SJR1J Third Party Veh No: SHD8833U
Model: PORSCHE CAYENNE-3.0 S HYBRID (A) Date of Accident: 26 DECEMBER 2018

Chassis: WP1272927CLA90707 - 2012

ESTIMATE
LABOUR CHARGES: ¢ %e/
LABOUR CHARGE FOR KNOCKING & PARTS REPLACEMENT $2,100.00
LABOUR CHARGE FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS $2,300.00 / Ffa{
TO TUFF KOTE / ANTI-RUST $100.00 7/
TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT DOOR LH INTERIOR TRIM, POWER WINDOW GLASS,
FRONT DOOR GLASS, DOOR CENTRAL LOCKING SYSTEM & ETC. TO EFFECT REPLACE
ON FRONT DOOR LH $180.00 «
TO CHECK WIRING, REPLACED WITH FOCUS HEADLAMP $60.00 7z
TO SEND VEHICLE FOR 3D COMPUTERISED CHECK & ADJUSTED ALL WHEEL ALIGNMENT $80.00
TO DIAGNOSTIC CHECK & RESET MEMORY TO IDENTIFICATION STANDARD 525000 7
LABOUR TOTAL $5,070.00
ONG ) TOTAL $34,314.86

Page 2



LRl J PoR2Che  Chyenés

ot

C‘\.tf;j nee WPl zt};‘f’: zc;_.ﬁ?.;;.;(c.‘l
Pt ‘5"'1*-* J By —

Ft @‘*—T—- CL"JA '.’)FL.L J Ag. —

Fomt au._r* Sule Lnknf Ly Dr je—

feax - do (s

T A e Sule Gond Qv wn /) T
i I H"L"'T’ L‘w‘f “{; :J:' 'XE'M..-*

Pt Feadw iy Br "

Pt Peddi Citetion Covan iy o v 7

s s {27 Thwws daasy b o =

Tt Pl fme g G«’A,M R Q]"v
= Deer 91y, Mccrse Ly an—

Pt Bmer gy Dt f1vege

“‘f_"—‘f' Do - ﬂ«f.n. "’f-’\--—m J_q- e ﬂﬂ("“’

Lear. oo Ot Ml W/ Pel —

Raomer Tl Ly iy  Jen—
Aaa \ﬁjrl i J _J:.., k

Ko Tf-’é‘ Tvbe Wvedve Loy Ano X

Reas Dopr Ly / ﬁs/h‘_’_ S
¥ |
- the B |
Lo Mb:{ Crae L ﬂ..._,x -'_m :
{ i « T0 display damaged part{s) duting restniy
v byl rd *Fa jre gubject to confirmation |
: N » Third parly survey i on a “Without Prejudice” basis |
* Na lbegal modifications) i3 allowed
" E::;-:-..-;- 2ty iTy [Emis] must ba resunve 1_!?:-_.-!
issublect ta final appraval from Insurar -—(




