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MS@ FirstCapital

MS First Capital Insurance Limited coReg Mo 195000106C C5T Reg No. M2 00016769
6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax [B5) 6222 3547

Clakms & Motor Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

31-12-2018 Our Ref No. D19000095MFSH
27-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHB2969L Third Party Vehicle. SLG19592

NO.1, KRANJI LOOP
AINEE

63621776/ 0 Fax No. 63631250

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: NO EST. PROVIDED [QUANTUM TO BE AGREED)]

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop WORLD AUTO PTE LTD
Cc : TP Solicitor NA

Attention. NIL
TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Officer Incharge SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

A Membe IR v¢coumance GROuR




. Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

— —
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 10:37 AM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims'
Cc: ‘Serene Ler'; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000095MFSH/1, SLG 1959Z
Attachments: SLG 1959Z PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLG 1959Z
Date of survey: 2/1/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 11:02 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000095MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January, 2019 10:05 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000095MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



" . Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Consultants

! l { Auto

-V Pre Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R
S1 UBIAVE L. #02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62363361 FAX : (065) 62564315
Your ref: D19000095MFSH
Our ref: CS/FCI19000018/Nvb Date: 4/1/2019

The Motor Claims Department

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SLG 1959Z

We thank for your instruction on

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle on 2/1/2019  at the premises of M/s

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

Muhd Nazril
Technical Investigator

WORLD AUTO PTE LTD
: $$8,669.80
: §$3,496.40
: §$1,493.00
3F 04
: S§
: S§
rear




MWA118166817 / World Auto Pie Lid - HQ
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 28/12/2018 15:36
SUBMITTED BY; Gan Ping

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2, This Form must be completed by the Paolicyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.
3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies lo

repudiate policy liability.

4. The Issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee. be made available upon application by interested parties
7. By the lodgement of this report to the Insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to coples of the report being made avallable

aforesaid,

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

28/12/2018 15:36
27/12/2018 09:45

PIE & CHANGI AIRPORT
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SLG1959Z

LION CITY RENTALS PTELTD
201504621K
NOEMAIL

OFFICE-62414992

HONDA
VEZEL-1.5 HYBRID (A)

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE HIRE

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

YES

999995145

ONG KAY HONG
S7837332F

02/12/1978

OUTDOOR

28/09/2012

6 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-83326365

NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 24



Address NOADDRESS
Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured PAID DRIVER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle) 2
involved in the accident
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

NO
ambulance?
Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 2
Passenger 1 NAME: - UNKNOWN

GENDER: . FEMALE
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE SEE ATTACHED SKETCH

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number SHB2969L

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category TAXI
Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number
Address
Postcode
Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)
Page 2 of 24
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Sketch Plan #2
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Sketch Plan #3
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WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

AT Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED Estimate
80 ROBINSON RD #09-02/03
068898 Date
Vehicle Num.
Make/Model :

Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# :

Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547 Accident Date
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :

S/N Quantity Particular

Page1/2

: ES000453

: 29/12/2018
: SLG 1959Z (LCR)

HONDA VEZEL HYBRID

12711212018

Unit Price Amount S$

LIST ITEMS :
REAR BOOT LID

REAR BOOT HYBRID EMBLEM (VEZEL)
REAR BOOT VEZEL EMBLEM (VEZEL)
REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING
REAR BOOT LOCK ASSY

REAR BOOT HAND GRIP COVER

REAR BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP

REAR BUMPER 3.

REAR END PANEL— Y™ D

REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH

REAR BOOT WEATHER STRIP

e eNGo e LN

Ao
T S N J W S S S S §

List TotalS$ :
20.00% Discount S$ :

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :

REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT

REAR BUMPER CLIP

REVERSE SENSOR

REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS

N
PR

Special Nett Total S$ :

LABOUR :
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND ACCESSORIES

REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS

1,300.00 -
89.00
89.00

250.00 =~

300.00 ,
78.00 «

DE}

580.00 1,160.00 « =

900.00
680.00

260.00 7 -

180.00 1, ~ -

2% 5,286.00
1.057.20

T 6> 4,228.80

(02 821.00

180.00

180.00 /-

\ L&

CONTINUE / ...

)

oy



Page 2/2

WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

4T Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED Estimate : ES000453
80 ROBINSON RD #09-02/03
068898 Date : 29/12/2018

Vehicle Num. : SLG 1959Z (LCR)
Make/Model : HONDA VEZEL HYBRID

Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# :

Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547 Accident Date 27/12/2018
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
S/N Quantity  Particular Unit Price Amount S§
'TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING/ TUFFCOATING TREATMENT TO 180.00 — | ©

REPLACED PARTS.

i..ABDUR TO REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO 1,000.00 7o
REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL BEAT, CUT/WELD, STRAIGHTEN
PANEL WHERE NECESSARY & REPLACE ABOVE PARTS

PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS (INNER/ OUTER) 1,000:00 Yo
:I'O CHECK REAR WIRES, CONNECTORS, REPLACE DAMAGED LAMPS 180:.00 =
REVERSE SENSORS AND START/STOP UNIT CAPACITORS

iJEACTIVATE HV BATTERY SYSTEM IN ORDER TO FACILITATE 450.00 o7
REPAIRS AND REACTIVATE BACK SAME ‘ OO
(HV HYBRID SYSTEM SAFETY PROCEDURES)

i’ERFORM WHOLE VEHICLE DIAGNOSTICS INCLUDING CLEARING 450.00
FAULT CODES AND REINTIALISING HV HYBRID SYSTEM FOR POST ’ Q0
REPAIRS. (HV HYBRID SYSTEM SAFETY PROCEDURES)

Labour Total S$ : | 2o 3,620.00

{

E. & O.E. Total S$ : 8,669.80
YN T
NAL LK
for WORLD AUTO PTE LTD ot a0 LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
1/1/7104 < the Repairer of the following:
- i y » To resurvey before/afier spray painting
P&gﬁ $235%-09 (4 o To dispiay damaged paris) uring resurvey
LES\ N {b d1%3 6. \o 30ANS :mmsmxfﬁ&nmm
SINE { 30°-90 ' _ « No iliegal modification(s) is aliowed
SR - HEkep 1T Wi » Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
, ( 960 0O ' is subject 1o final approval from Insurance Company
Lp SANN ,b_._t.l——_—'—'-—‘ R e Faé e 4 fHo V3 Acknowlsgged by Repairer
TPTAL 7 - el ) Signature:
kﬁlfl{‘fi' qL/“’ DQ‘L?) Date:

———



. yeron Chen _(IEKKAuto)

= - — —
From: Naz (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 12:42 PM
To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: Re: SLG 19597 Finalization
Attachments: FINALIZATION.pdf
Dear Ms Tan,

Apologies for the late reply. Attached herewith is the amended marked estimate
following a check on the part prices. We will proceed to finalize if you are agreeable with
the amended COR;

PARTS -  $2358

LESS 20% - $1886.40
SPECIAL NET ITEMS - $300
LABOUR - $1250

TOTAL-  $3436.40 / 3 REPAIR DAYS

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Naz | Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg <tgttan@worldauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 18 January 2019 4:27 PM

To: Naz (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLG 1959Z Finalization



. Naz
No dismantle parts.

Rdgs
Sophia

From: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 6:13 PM

To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SLG 19597 Finalization

Dear Ms Sophia,

Before paint photos received. Kindly send me the dismantle photos as there are check
items.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Naz | Technical Investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg <tgttan@worldauto.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 1:31 PM

To: Naz (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SLG1959Z Our ref: TP/2394/18

Hi Naz
Attach b/f paint photos.

Rdgs
Sophia

From: ainee31@worldauto.com.sg <ainee31@worldauto.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 1:08 PM

To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg

Subject: SLG1959Z




Ainee

Thanks and Rgds,
World Auto Pte Ltd
Kranji: 63621776
Fax: 63631250
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RLD AUTO PTE LTD

@an Pemimpin #01-02/03

zyon 2, S'pore 577200

A No.: 04513933 Fax No.: 64557576
=-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg
Website : www.worldauto.com.sg
Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED

80 ROBINSON RD #08-02/03
068898

Attention : Motor Claim Department
Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547

Page1/2 ¢

Estimate : ES000453
Date : 29/12/2018

Vehicle Num. : SLG 1958Z (LCR)
Make/Model : HONDA VEZEL HYBRID

Chassis/Eng# :
Accident Date : 27/12/2018

Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
SIN Quantity  Particular Unit Price Amount S$
LISTITEMS : )
1 A REAR BOOT LID | |0V 1,300000 7 pEF
2, 1 REAR BOOT HYBRID EMBLEM (VEZEL) 89.00 w5,
3, 1 REAR BOOT VEZEL EMBLEM (VEZEL) 89,00 ~ v,
4, 1 REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING 250.00 2~y 5 *
5. 1 REAR BOOT LOCK ASSY 300.00 ; §vc
6. 1 REAR BOOT HAND GRIP COVER 78.00 ¢ 5w
7. 2 REAR BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP 580.00 1,160.00 x5
8. 1 REAR BUMPER N 900.00 < o0
9. 1 REAR END PANEL — YN =D §80.00 ~ ™~ -
10. 1 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH 260.00 7 /
1. 1 REAR BOOT WEATHER STRIP 180.00 -7, £ -
List TotalS$ : *°F 5,286.00
20.00% Discount S§$ : 1,057.20
| %0l vo4,228.80
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS e
1. 1 REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT 0.2 5"
2. 1 REAR BUMPER CLIP %eT00> /32
3 1 REVERSE SENSOR 2600 21200
4. 1 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS 40’56 L
cmnnennnnnnnn
Special Nett Total S§ : ‘L 821.00
LABOUR : =
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND ACCESSORIES 180000 IO
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS 180:00 Loe
\ e

CONTINUE /...
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FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED Estimate : ES000453
80 ROBINSON RD #09-02/03

068898

Attention : Motor Claim Department

Date : 29/12/2018

Vehicle Num. : S
Make/Model : H
Chassis/Eng# :

LG 1959Z (LCR)
ONDA VEZEL HYBRID

Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547 Accident Date : 27/12/2018
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
SIN Quantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount S§$
:I'O APPLY RUSTPROOFING/ TUFFCOATING TREATMENT TO 180;00— U o
REPLACED PARTS.
LABOUR TO REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO 1,000.00— do,
REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL BEAT, CUT/WELD, STRAIGHTEN
PANEL WHERE NECESSARY & REPLACE ABOVE PARTS
i’UTTY & SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS (INNER/ OUTER) 1,000:00 9’9 v
'-TO CHECK REAR WIRES, CONNECTORS, REPLACE DAMAGED LAMPS 180.60 3
REVERSE SENSORS AND START/STOP UNIT CAPACITORS
iJEACTIVATE HV BATTERY SYSTEM IN ORDER TO FACILITATE 45000 2=
REPAIRS AND REACTIVATE BACK SAME {OL\
(HV HYBRID SYSTEM SAFETY PROCEDURES)
i"ERFORM WHOLE VEHICLE DIAGNOSTICS INCLUDING CLEARING 45000 5
FAULT CODES AND REINTIALISING HV HYBRID SYSTEM FOR POST o0
REPAIRS. (HV HYBRID SYSTEM SAFETY PROCEDURES) ,
Labour Total S§ : y LN & 3,620.00
39
E. & O.E. Total S§$ : 8,669.80
\ s=z=======
NAL LK
for WORLD AUTO PTE LTD L/1 /1 ey LXK Auto Consultants hence notify
g 211 the Repairer of the following:
235K 00 0 « To resurvey before/afier spray painting
B"RT} ‘O {v » To display damaged pari(s) during resurvey
LesS 20 [a f1g86. Vo X « Parts pricas are subject 10 confirmation
30A%>5 « Third party survey is on a "Without Prejudice” basis
(N 30900 _ « No illogal modiication(s) is allowed
SINETT 4 3 cHEkep 1TEMD ;,7WTQ) « Supplementary flem(s) must be resurveyed gnd
on [ bl’lsd 20 ' i subject o fine! approval from Insurance Company
—t Acknowiedged by Raparer
1Tl L- 2 3 Sqnature:
{3zt . B/ D‘*W ore

e ——




' | V'/ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl s B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI19000018/Nvbe2
#1601 CITs HOUBESINGAPORE 068877 Date:  24-01-2019 ||||||||||"""|I||HI|"||
Code: FCI2
1% Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 2969L Veh. Inspected SLG 1959Z
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1900095MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From SERENE LER Assign Date 02/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA VEZEL 1.5X c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. RU31211058 Colour BLUE
Odometer 126401 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP 5mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 DUNLOP 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[215/60 R16 GITI 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 5mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  27/12/2018 Inspection Date 02/01/2019
Survey held at NO 1 KRANJI LOOP
Repairer WORLD AUTO PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 19592
{ - - s Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wﬁfﬁhéb‘?})j = _;-,‘s.]) -
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID DEFORMED 1,300.00 1,100.00
1|REAR BOOT HYBRID EMBLEM (VEZEL) NECESSARY 89.00 89.00
1|REAR BOOT VEZEL EMBLEM (VEZEL) NECESSARY 89.00 89.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
1|REAR BOOT LOCK ASSY SERVICEABLE 300.00 -
1|REAR BOOT HAND GRIP COVER SERVICEABLE 78.00 -
2|REAR BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP @$580.00 SERVICEABLE 1,160.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 900.00 900.00
1|REAR END PANEL SERVICEABLE 680.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH SERVICEABLE 260.00 -
1|REAR BOOT WEATHER STRIP DEFORMED 180.00 180.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,057.20 -471.60
4,228.80 1,886.40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 50.00
1|REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 401.00 30.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT WORKING 280.00 200.00
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 20.00
821.00 300.00
LABOUR
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND 180.00 50.00
ACCESSORIES
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS. 180.00 120.00
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING / TUFFCOATING 180.00 50.00
TREATMENT TO REPLACED PARTS.
LABOUR TO REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN 1,000.00 400.00
ORDER TO REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL BEAT, CUT/
WELD, STRAIGHTEN PANEL WHERE NECESSARY &
REPLACE ABOVE PARTS.
PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS (INNER / 1,000.00 400.00

OUTER)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19000018/Nvbe2




¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
A ey Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition S e S

Qy| P Workshop ($)) ($)

TO CHECK REAR WIRES, CONNECTORS, REPLACE 180.00 30.00

DAMAGED LAMPS REVERSE SENSORS AND START /

STOP UNIT CAPACITORS.

DEACTIVATE HV BATTERY SYSTEM IN ORDER TO 450.00 100.00

FACILITATE REPAIRS AND REACTIVATE BACK SAME (HV
HYBRID SYSTEM SAFETY PROCEDURES)

PERFORM WHOLE VEHICLE DIAGNOSTICS INCLUDING 450.00 100.00
CLEARING FAULT CODES AND REINTIALISING HV
HYBRID SYSTEM FOR POST REPAIRS. (HV HYBRID
SYSTEM SAFETY PROCEDURES)

3,620.00 1,250.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,669.80 3,436.40
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 3,436.40|
Report Ref No. CS/FCI119000018/Nvbe2
MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

bility of responsibility whatsoever, in conlact or Lor ccepled 10 any third party wWho m reply on the Report wholly or in part. Any third pa




