Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June, 2019 12:03 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto); Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Cheng Jo Jo; Coco Lu Ting; Admin
A

Subject: RE: Your Ref: CC4/1118023327/R1hb3 Our Ref: SLD3666X DOA: 27/12/2018

Attachments: SLD3666X - DVTP (INDIA).pdf; SLD3666X - TAX INVOICE.pdf

Dear Vic,

Pls. refer to attached files, signed DV and amended tax invoice.
| will post out the original copy by next week.
Looking forward in receiving your cheque payment.

Thank you so much.

Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service
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From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: 03 June 2019 09:26
To: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto); Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Cheng Jo Jo; Coco Lu Ting; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: CC4/11118023327/R1hb3 Our Ref: SLD3666X DOA: 27/12/2018
Without Prejudice
Dear Larry,

We refer further to the below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we have our principal’s mandate and we confirm acceptance of your offer of $9,289.47 (all in).

Kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward the original signed hard copy to us (LKK) together with the
amended Final Repair Invoice named to our principal instead of your client for payment processing.
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The above amount is to be made payable to CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos [mailto:lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 30 May, 2019 12:34 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto); Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Cheng Jo Jo; Coco Lu Ting
Subject: Your Ref: CC4/11118023327/R1hb3 Our Ref: SLD3666X DOA: 27/12/2018

Dear Vic,
We have submitted our LOD to your office on the 09*" April 2019.
Kindly let us have your offer so that we can close this case.

Our customer claim as follows:

Cost of repair S 8,689.47
Loss of use S 600.00 (S60.00x 10 days)
Total $9,289.47

Appreciate if we can have your offer of settlement the soonest.

Thank you so much.

Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: 08 February 2019 11:04

To: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Cheng Jo Jo; Coco Lu Ting; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SLD3666X (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM

Hi Lauro,

Finalised amount confirmed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos [mailto:lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sq]
Sent: Friday, 1 February, 2019 2:45 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Cheng Jo Jo; Coco Lu Ting

Subject: SLD3666X (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM

Dear Rasul,
Pls. refer to attached files and photos.
Kindly confirm finalized amount of $ 8,121.00 before Gst for SLD3666X.

Thank you so much.

Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service
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DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



