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Y Consultanis
B B E Fiw LIt Company Regisiration Mo, 109607T198R

! ,U Ao

S1UBLAYE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408913 TEL = (0651 61563561 FAX : (065) 615364315

Yourref: DI18008958MFSH

Our ref: CS/FC18023278/Avd3 Date : 29/3/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. 77688

We thank you for your instruction on 28/12/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
28/12/2018 at the premises of M/s KAIMOTOR TRADING
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 584.603.25

Revised Estimate Amount : 5%1.900.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount 1 5%

Market Value . 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Mett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADBIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIATE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Licensad Appraiser



MS@FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Ccfeg ko 155000008 oot Reg o ME- 00016759
B Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapone 048580
Tel: (G5} BELE 2311 Faw (65)6222 3547

{Raims & Mertor Undenwriting Depe: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel (65) 6507 3848 Fan. (65} 6507 3649
www.msfirstcapinaloom.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
19-12-2018 Our Ref No. D18008958MFSH
17-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC3865H Third Party Vehicle. GBF7768S

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-440
NA

6747 4008/ 0 Fax No. 6743 7591

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

A Fax No. 68416315
MNA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

KAI MOTOR TRADING Attention. NIL
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,

[sso g




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 2:00 PM

To: '‘CWS Motaor Claims'

Cc: 'Karen Tan’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008958MFSH/1, GBF 77685
Attachments: GBF 7768S PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBF 77685
Date of survey: 28/12/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent; Monday, 31 December 2018 8:55 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008558M FSH/1, GBF 77685

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBF 7768S on 28/12/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 11:43 AM



To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@mosfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008958M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | admin
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkk m | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4084933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 11:25 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008958MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail,




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Fram: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 31 December 2018 8:35 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008958MFSH/1, GBF 77685

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBF 77688 on 28/12/2015.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 11:43 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008958MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
. Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

From: CWS5 Motor Claims [mailto:c wsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 11:25 AM
To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM




O 3
o (® KAI MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-440, SINGAPORE 408701.
TEL: 6747 4006 FAX: 6743 7591 EMAIL: kaimotor@gmail.com
BUS. REG. NO: 44223100L .

SERH ALENRRBA HL ASSIARERS TTH T Rk

Specialist in: Accidents Insurance Claim, Towing Service, Motor Vehicle Repairing, Panel Beating, Spray Painting.

Date : 28/12/2018

Attn: The Motor Claims Department -pstC g WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SHC 3966 H

First Capital Insuranse Ltd \/,,r;!{ b T4 I (By Email Only)

36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House Tel : 6507 3848
Singapore 06BB77 Fax : 6507 3849

Dear 5ir / Madam

EUNELE:
Estimate Cost repair Bill To Toyota Dyna GBF 7768 S & SHC 3966 H on-28/12/2018.
To Supply =
QR
1pc Rear Boot Cover ?JL*-J‘“A 3 I‘T A0 5 120110 -~
1pc Rear Boot Cover "Toyota Sticker” ) (2. 57 5 226.30 -
1pc Rear Boot Cover "70km Sticker" A -' ' 5 58.30= A(s~) _
1pc Rear Boot Cover "13pax Sticker” Sepl 10 5 SB-.-Sﬁ“"fq,a’ s
2pcs Rear Lamp LH&RH EH o $298.20 $ 59640 27k
ipc Rear Number Plate Lamp #=t *— 5 251.10 &
1pc Rear Spare Tyre Bracket /v 5 278.60
1pc Rear Boot Cover "DYNA Sticker" A S 63.10
1pc Rear Boot Cover Side Lock Bracket RH $ 12860 <
Wpcs Rear Boot Exhaust Pipe 4~ ¢ 381451
5 3,243.25

. 1,‘;.I

To dismanite & replace damage parts,panel beat where Q Aﬂ'ﬁ,ﬂ. LA} ] 4§,D«Bﬁ' ‘f-t?

necessaey.

To putty,apply primer & spray paint on the affecte portion. “"‘l Q 2.9 /“‘/‘Q 5 i;{}-gjﬁ “g go

To check wiring functions.

oupp 6000 37

To remove and refix rear door aluminium Panel 5 120+ o
; S 4,353.25
970

mgany

1l|’° Reax Step Bf'agket Bk P— g
! and 7‘}6“! 27 Y7 ¥ 4603. 2¢




' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
el BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-3607196-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCIMB023278/Avd3n2
sorommsontond womoreosserr oo roee [N
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 3866H Veh. Inspected GBF 77685
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. D1800B9SEMFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  KARENT Assign Date 28/12/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA DYNA c.c 2882
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 207
Chassis No. JTFATASY10K207147 Colour SILVER
Odometer 97935 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN DRDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185R15C MAXKIS 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15C MAXKIS B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155R12 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |155 Ri2 DUNLOP & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/12/2018 Inspection Date 28122018
Survey held at KAl MOTOR TRADING
BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-434
SINGAPORE 408701
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REFORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ui Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 193607198R GST Reg. No. 15-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBF 77685
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ?g]} ﬂ!ll
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT COVER DENTED 1,201.104 1,201.10
1|REAR BOOT COVER "TOYOTA STICKER" NECESSARY 226.30 226,30
2|REAR LAMP LH & RH @%298.20 Qs CUT 556 40 298.20
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP NOT NECESSARY 251.10 B
1{REAR SPARE TYRE BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 278.80 -
1|REAR BOOT COVER "DYNA STICKER" MECESSARY 83.10 63.10
1|REAR BOOT COVER SIDE LOCK BRACKET RH BENT 128.60 128.60
1|REAR BOOT EXHAUST PIPE NOT HNECESSARY 381.45 -
1|REAR STEP BRACKET BENT 250.00 120.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - =478 33
3,376.65 1,657.97
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BOOT COVER "7T0KM STICKER" (SN) MNECESSARY 5810 10.00
1|REAR BOOT COVER "1 3PAX STICKER" (SN) NECESSARY 58.50 10.00
116.60 20.00
LABOUR
TO DISMAMNTLE & REPLACE DAMAGE PARTS PANEL 480.00 400.00
BEAT WHERE NECESSARY
TO PUTTY APPLY PRIMER & SPRAY PAINT OM THE 450 .00 380.00
AFFECTED PORTION,
TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTIONS. 60.00 30.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR DOOR ALUMINIUM 120.00 40,00
PANEL.
1,110.00 850.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,603.25 242797
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,900.00

{TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref Ne. CS/FCI18023278/Avd3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI|

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Clien named on the frond page of this Repon.
Mo liability of responsibility whatsooer, in contact or to i
Baperl, in vivole or in part, does S0 at his or her own sk,




