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Veron Chenﬁfl(KAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 2:56 PM

To: '‘Nor Azian Binte Noordin'; SUR

Subject: RE: MV for SCZ309M (DOA: 09/09/2018) - M/569819

Dear Noordin,

The market value of SCZ 309M is $110K-$111K (Estimated) as at Sept 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6255-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 11:29 AM

To: 'Nor Azian Binte Noordin' <NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject:. RE: MV for SCZ309M (DOA: 09/09/2018) - M/569819

Dear Sir/Midm,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Veron,

Kindly assist

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
31k 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Erom: Nor Azian Binte Noordin [mailto:NorAzian Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 11:27 AM




To: Undisclosed recipients:
Subject: MV for SCZ309M (DOA: 09/09/2018) - M/569819

Dear all,
Please let us have the market value for the above car. Details of the car make and model is as per below.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Nor Azian Binte Noordin
Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | NorAzian Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
& J‘#g‘,;; = N

O} 4 3

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg !

3 INSURARCE GROUP

A Member of

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type

Singapore NRIC

Owner 1D

4409A

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.

SCZ309M

Vehicle to be Exported
No

Intended Deregistration Date
29 Dec 2018

Vehicle Make

AUDI

Vehicle Model

A6 1.8 TFSI S TRONIC
Primary Colour

White ,
Manufacturing Year

2015

Engine No.

CYGO003388

Chassis No.
WAUZZZ4GOFN063309
Maximum Power Output
140.0 kW (187 bhp)
Open Market Value
$39,742.00

Original Registration Date



29 Apr 2015

First Registration Date

29 Apr 2015

Transfer Count

1

Actual ARF Paid

$37,639.00

intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility

Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date

28 Apr 2025

PARF Rebate Amount
$28,229.00

intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date

28 Apr 2025

COE Category

E - Open Category

COE Period(Years)

10

QP Paid

£79,500.00

COE Rebate Amount
$49,399.00

Total Rebate Amount
$77,628.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Dec 2018

- AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 11:29 AM

To: '‘Nor Azian Binte Noordin'; SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: MV for SCZ309M (DOA: 09/09/2018) - M/569819

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Veron,

Kindly assist

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nor Azian Binte Noordin [mailto:NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 11:27 AM

To: Undisclosed recipients:

Subject: MV for SCZ309M (DOA: 09/09/2018) - M/569819

Dear all,
Please let us have the market value for the above car. Details of the car make and model is as per below.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Nor Azian Binte Noordin
Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | NorAzian_Noordin@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Bu ore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg
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12/28/2018 Used Audi Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.CONM Login  Sign up

New Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

Become a Lalamove
Rider

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

GV Credit Pte Ltd viow sur ooy

Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling

I

| Sort by Date Posted .Y 1100 results/page ¥
11 vehicles Auding | 5 |
Price Depreciation Rag Datg Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
Search Selection Audi A6 Any Any 2015 Any Any Any All
Audi A6 2.0A TFSI MU $97,788 $12,530 fyr 27-Feb-2015 1,984 cc 88,100 km Luxury Available

100% Accident Free, 1 Careful Owner, Fully Serviced & Maintained By AUDI- Mint Interior. Major Servicing Done & All Undercarriage Arms, Bushes &
Mountings Replaced In Dec 2018, Complete With Glossy Ne...

Posted: 27-Dec-2018  Tags: 2015 Audi A6, 2015 audi a6, Audi A6, audi a6, Audi, AG, a6, Used Audi

Audi A6 2.0A TFSI MU $96,800 $12,230 fyr 26-Mar-2015 1,984 cc - Luxury Available

Full Loan Available! 1 Owner Only. Condition! Smooth, Sporty Yet Low In Consumption. Spacious And Quiet Cabin With Huge Boot Space For Your
Luggages. Visit Us Now For Further Details.

Posted: 26-Dec-2018  Tags: 2015 Audi A6, 2015 audi ab, Audi A6, audi a6, Audi, A6, a6, Used Audi

Audi A6 2,0A TFSI MU - N.A 26-Jan-2015 1,984 cc - Luxury SOLD
Graded B by STH

$10K Down Payment! From 2.18% Interest Rate! 1 Owner! Fully Maintained By Premium Automobiles! 120 Points STA Check And Accident-Free
Report For A Peace Of Mind! High Trade In And In-House Financing A...

Posted: 21-Dec-2018  Tags: 2015 Audi A6, 2015 audi ab, Audi A6, audi a6, Audi, A6, ab, Used Audi

Audi A6 2.0A TFSI MU $105,800 $13,500 /yr 24-Apr-2015 1,984 cc 72,000 km Luxury Available

Balloon Scheme Available! Monthly Instalment At Only $1436. 1 Careful Owner, Fuel Consumption Is Good! Luxury Comfort Feeling In The Driver
Seats As Well As In The Passenger Seats. Loan Up To 100% Wit...

Hua Yang Credit Pte Ltd
Posted: 20-Dec-2018  Tags: 2015 Audi A6, 2015 audi a6, Audi A6, audi ab, Audi, A, ab, Used Audi

Mirage Motorwerkz Pte Ltd - Repair & Servicing
Mirage Motorwerkz Pte Ltd is a one-stop car workshop which to provide friendly, reliable and prices competitive motoring services,

More info about this shop

Audi A6 1,8A TFSI Ultra S- $115,000 $14,290 /yr 24-Jun-2015 1,798 cc 84,000 km Luxury Avaitable
tronic

Facelifted Model. Fully Serviced By Premium Automobiles/Just Serviced 19 July. Original Matrix Headlights. Wooden Trims. Brown Leather. Original
Paint And Condition, Fold Down Back Seats. 100% Acciden...

Posted: 20-Dec-2018  Tags: 2015 Audi A6, 2015 audi a6, Audi A6, audi a6, Audi, A6, a6, Used Audi

Audi A6 1.8A TFST Ultra S- = N.A 31-Aug-2015 1,798 cc - Luxury SOLD
tronic ’

No Gimmicks! Price Negotiable, Low Mileage Done, 100% Beautiful Condition, Low Depreciation, Low Interest Rate, Most Worthy Buy, Call Now For
Viewing.

Posted: G1-Dec-2018  Tags: 2015 Audi A6, 2015 audi a6, Audi A6, audi a6, Audi, A6, a6, Used Audi

Audi A6 1.8A TFSI S-tronic = N.A 28-May-2015 1,798 cc - Luxury SOLD

300 Points Check, Fully Serviced And Maintained By Premium Automobiles. Warranty Up To 5 Years From Date Of Registration. For Selected Unit.
™==-= Arrange For Appointment For Viewing, Thank You!

n Automobiles
ssted: 15-Nov-2018  Tags: 2015 Audi A6, 2015 audi a6, Audi A6, aud: a6, Audi, A6, a6, Used Audi

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?MMO=A6&RPG=100&VEH=0&RGD=2015&MOD=Audi
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A Member of M 5&&9

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type

Singapore NRIC

Owner 1D

4409A

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.

SCZ309M

Vehicle to be Exported

No

Intended Deregistration Date
29 Dec 2018

Vehicle Make

AUDI

Vehicle Model

A6 1.8 TFSI S TRONIC
Primary Colour

White

Manufacturing Year

2015

Engine No.

CYG003388

Chassis No.
WAUZZZ4GOFN063309
Maximum Power Output
140.0 kW (187 bhp)

Open Market Value
$39,742.00

Original Registration Date
29 Apr 2015

First Registration Date

29 Apr 2015

Transfer Count

1

Actual ARF Paid
$37,639.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility

Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
28 Apr 2025

PARF Rebate Amount
$28,229.00

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date

28 Apr 2025

COE Category

" E - Open Category

COE Period(Years)
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10

QP Paid

$79,500.00

COE Rebate Amount

$49,399.00

Total Rebate Amount

$77,628.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Dec 2018
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