Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May, 2019 11:28 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 24/12/2018 involving SHC 4159P & SGG
169C (AIG's insured) Our Ref: TAX/12/18/2103/Ig

Attachments: TAX 12 18 2103.pdf; 12 18 2103 - PIR,jpg

URGENT

REMINDER

Dear Vic,

We attach the police investigation result for your perusal.
Please let us have your offer by 29 May 2019. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: 21/02/2019 19:31

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis)

Cc: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: FW: LOD Re: Accident on 24/12/2018 involving SHC 4159P & SGG 169C (AIG's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/12/18/2103/Ig

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC3/A1G18023243/Jhb3 Vic

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 12:06 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 24/12/2018 involving SHC 4159P & SGG 169C (AlG's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/12/18/2103/Ig

Dear All,

We quantify our own losses as follows:-

Cost of Repair $6300.00
Loss of Rental $2006.25 15 daysx $133.75 )
LTA Search Fee $7.00
Total $8313.25

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repairinvoice
2) Proof of rental rate
3) GlA report
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) LTA search

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE




