












 
 
Our Ref: CC4/AIG18023180/Dkb3 
 
 
30 AUGUST 2019 
 
 
FRESH CARS PTE LTD 
105 KAKI BUKIT AVE 1 
SHUNLI INDUSTRIAL PARK  
#03-03  
SINGAPORE 415987 
  
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X AND SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG / AT 
PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA LEBAR RD EXIT 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster 
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party 
claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SKT5775D against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your 
favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, 
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% 
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your 
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 

Khanchna 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841-2360 
FAX: 6741 4108 
Email: khanchna@lkkauto.com 
 
 
c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
 
 



1

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 8:31 AM
To: Lee, Ming-Yao
Subject: RE: Our Ref : 1694590537SG-003 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & 

SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA

Hi Ming Yao, 
 
For an update, we have settled the matter at a global sum of $8,000.00(all-in) with third party repairer. 
 
We will proceed to close file once DV received. Thanks. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 25 March 2021 3:13 PM 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref : 1694590537SG-003 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 
ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA 
 
Hi Ming Yao, 
 
Noted. 
We will proceed to negotiate settlement with third party repairer. 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 24 March 2021 10:24 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref : 1694590537SG-003 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 
ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
In view of insured not responding, please proceed to settle the claim at best. 
 
Regards, 
Lee Ming Yao, George 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 
Ming-Yao.Lee@AIG.com | www.AIG.sg 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 16 March 2021 10:45 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Our Ref : 1694590537SG-003 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 
12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Hi Ming Yao, 
 
Noted. 
 
We will liaise with third party workshop on this matter. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 March 2021 10:13 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Our Ref : 1694590537SG-003 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 
ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA 
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Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
I have sent final email to insured that we will settle at best.  
 
Can ask workshop to hold hands first and KIV for 3 days? If there is no response from insured, please proceed to 
settle at best. 
 
Regards, 
Lee Ming Yao, George 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 
Ming-Yao.Lee@AIG.com | www.AIG.sg 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 16 March 2021 08:52 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Our Ref : 1694590537SG-003 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 
12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Hi Ming Yao, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that third party is chasing for offer. 
 
Kindly let us have your instruction. Thanks. 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>  
Sent: Monday, 25 January 2021 3:58 PM 
To: atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; jasonfreshcars@gmail.com 
Subject: Our Ref : 1694590537SG-003 | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG 
PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA 
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Hi Russell, 
 
We refer to above mentioned accident where we act for our mutual client, owner of SJM5064X. 
 
We understand that insured’s counter claim against third party is currently in negotiation on liability. We wish to 
know if there are any updates on this matter? 
 
Appreciate to let us know soonest. Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Lee Ming Yao, George 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 
Ming-Yao.Lee@AIG.com | www.AIG.sg 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
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severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


