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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 December 2020 2:16 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG 

PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA LEBAR

 
 
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Pte Ltd A-Tec Automotive <atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: 18 November 2020 4:08 PM 
To: Russell <russellsg888@gmail.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jason Mar <jasonfreshcars@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA 
LEBAR 
 
Dear all, 
 
Case not settled. 
 
Our legal is currently negotiating on liability. 
 
Thanks 
 

 

A-Tec Automotive Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 

Premier #04-20 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6384-5206 

Fax: 6384-5205 

 
 
On Wednesday, 18 November 2020, 02:53:16 pm SGT, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
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Dear Russell, 

We refer to the above matter. 

Please  update (i.e. settle or not/ if settle, the liability percentage) of the counter claim against the third party promptly. 

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: 26 October 2020 4:39 PM 
To: Pte Ltd A-Tec Automotive <atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg>; Russell <russellsg888@gmail.com> 
Cc: Jason Mar <jasonfreshcars@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER 
PAYA LEBAR 

  

Dear Russell, 

We refer to the above matter. 

Please  update (i.e. settle or not/ if settle, the liability percentage) of the counter claim against the third party. 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Pte Ltd A-Tec Automotive <atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: 1 July 2020 3:44 PM 
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To: Russell <russellsg888@gmail.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jason Mar <jasonfreshcars@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER 
PAYA LEBAR 

  

Dear all, 

  

Not settle.  

  

Please hold hand. 

  

Will update soonest 

  

  

A-Tec Automotive Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 

Premier #04-20 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6384-5206 

Fax: 6384-5205 

  

  

On Tuesday, 30 June 2020, 03:56:08 pm GMT+8, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:  

  

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

We refer to the above matter. 

Please  update (i.e. settle or not/ if settle, the liability percentage) of the counter claim against the third party. 

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Russell <russellsg888@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 2 June 2020 2:46 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Pte Ltd A-Tec Automotive <atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg> 
Cc: Jason Mar <jasonfreshcars@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER 
PAYA LEBAR 

  

Hi ATEC, 

  

Can assist to help us update LKK if any updates so far? 

  

Thanks. 

  

On Tue, 2 Jun 2020 at 11:39, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Russell, 

Please  update (i.e. settle or not/ if settle, the liability percentage) of your counter claim against the third party. 

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Pte Ltd A-Tec Automotive <atec_automotive@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 12:10 PM 
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To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Russell <russellsg888@gmail.com> 
Cc: Jason Mar <jasonfreshcars@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; AIA <jeremychoy@aia.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) 
AFTER PAYA LEBAR 

  

Dear All, 

  

We are currently awaiting offer from Liberty. Will update if there is any outcome. 

  

Please do hold hand first. 

  

Thanks 

  

  

A-Tec Automotive Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 

Premier #04-20 

Singapore 415875 

Tel: 6384-5206 

Fax: 6384-5205 

  

  

On Thursday, 16 January 2020, 11:18:03 am GMT+8, Russell <russellsg888@gmail.com> wrote:  

  

  

Hi, 

  

The claim is still in progress. 

  

I have cc ATEC here in the email so they can respond directly as well. 
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I have also let ATEC know to let you know of the status of our third party claim. 

  

James/Peggy from ATEC: can assist? 

  

Thanks. 

  

On Thu, 16 Jan 2020 at 10:02, Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Russell, 

  

We are yet to hear from you and your workshop on the update (i.e. settle or not/ if settle, the liability percentage) of 
your counter claim against the third party. 

  

Your prompt reply is much appreciated as AIG wants to know the status. 

  

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Russell <russellsg888@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 2:58 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jason Mar <jasonfreshcars@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jayden 
<jaydenfreshcars@gmail.com> 
Subject: Fwd: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) 
AFTER PAYA LEBAR 

  

Hi, 
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The workshop handling our third party claim for this case is ATEC Automotive Pte Ltd. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 2:24 PM 
To: jaydenfreshcars@gmail.com; kimfreshcars@gmail.com; loyfreshcars@gmail.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X [AIG] & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER 
PAYA LEBAR 

  

FRESH CARS PTE LTD 

[POLICY HOLDER] 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJM5064X & SKT5775D ON 12/12/2018 ALONG PIE (CHANGI) AFTER PAYA LEBAR 

  

We are acting on behalf of your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim 
against your motor insurance policy. 

  

We noted that you are making a counter claim against Third party m/vehicle SKT5775D. 

  

Kindly let us have the  name of the workshop that was assisting you to make the claim and outcome/status of the 
said claim. 

  

If successful, please let us have a copy of the DV.  

  

Also, please let us have the accident video/scene photos (if any). 

  

Thank you. 



8

  

 

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

 
 

  

--  

Regards 

Russell 

  

 
 

  

--  

Regards 

Russell 

  

 
 

  

--  

Regards 

Russell 

  


