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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February, 2020 2:56 PM

To: barryong84@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: SJB 8662H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJB 8662H AND SHC 7042Y ON 

25/12/2018

Our Ref: CC4/AIG18023177/K1hs3                                                        

 

04 FEBRUARY 2020                                                                              

                                                                                                 

ONG BAOSHENG BARRY                                                               By Email Only 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJB 8662H AND SHC 7042Y ON 25/12/2018 

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against 

you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received and notified you previously for a Third Party claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf 

of the owner of SHC 7042Y against your motor insurance policy. 

                 

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other evidence and 

information  given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall 

proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 

within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
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RE: [Reminder 3] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018
invlg SHC7042Y & SJB8662H [AIG] -AIG Ref: 3491272485SG-003

Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>
Mon 8/24/2020 4:12 PM
To:  Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Dear Asher,
 
Noted. Thank you
 
 
Thank you
 
Kind regards
Norsiah
 
Norsiah Md Noor
AIG
Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419-1606
Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg
 
 
 

 
Follow us:

   
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:

 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have

received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email

and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility

of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

 
 
 
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com] 
Sent: Monday, August 24, 2020 4:08 PM
To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: [Reminder 3] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg
SHC7042Y & SJB8662H [AIG] -AIG Ref: 3491272485SG-003
 
This message is from an external sender; be cau�ous with links and a�achments.

Hi Norsiah,
 
We refer to our tele-conversa�on.
 
We have contacted insured to inform that we would to se�le the ma�er at best, insured agreed.
 
As per our discussion we proposed to offer and se�le the ma�er from 50% up to 80% max.
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

mailto:Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com
http://www.aig.com.sg/
https://www.100.aig/
http://www.facebook.com/AIGSG
https://www.linkedin.com/company/1760
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email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in
so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, August 24, 2020 3:38 PM
To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>
Subject: Re: [Reminder 3] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg SHC7042Y &
SJB8662H [AIG] -AIG Ref: 3491272485SG-003
 
Hi Norsiah,
 
We refer to the email below.
 
Based on both party video third party stop for no reason and rear ended by insured.
 
So far there is no PIR from both party.
 
Kindly call me at 9455 3745 to discuss on this case.
 
Thank You.
 
Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in
so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 

From: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>
Sent: Monday, August 24, 2020 3:30 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: [Reminder 3] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg SHC7042Y &
SJB8662H [AIG] -AIG Ref: 3491272485SG-003
 
Dear Asher,
 
Refer to the above.
 
Kindly assist to look into this ma�er.
 
 
Thank you
 
Kind regards
Norsiah
 
Norsiah Md Noor
AIG
Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419-1606
Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg
 
 
 

 

mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com
mailto:olivialau@lkkauto.com
mailto:Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com
mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com
mailto:Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-3A__www.aig.com.sg_&d=DwMGaQ&c=kn4_INW_mBCDHV_xJEVJkg&r=wLqNS3ER7zjiNSIgyOg7cwxuQDq2IMLOU2Qz6Sl4hH8&m=bAC0eT7wXl4c7TjKceQpSUqzZCKQOQj0DhtI8z2IY1k&s=xVNH_LUOWpz09qvDSFNQMcFDENmFoCuXfWwVWWUN6X8&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__www.100.aig_&d=DwMGaQ&c=kn4_INW_mBCDHV_xJEVJkg&r=wLqNS3ER7zjiNSIgyOg7cwxuQDq2IMLOU2Qz6Sl4hH8&m=bAC0eT7wXl4c7TjKceQpSUqzZCKQOQj0DhtI8z2IY1k&s=Jmjzgb4jtzfIX8vHQuwiu11GAZC8etvXa2iQi9uBxsM&e=
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Follow us:

   
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:

 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have

received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email

and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility

of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

 
 
 
 
From: Tan, Bennie-WZ 
Sent: Monday, August 24, 2020 3:01 PM
To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>
Cc: Khoo, Kay-Eng <Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com>
Subject: RE: [Reminder 3] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg SHC7042Y &
SJB8662H [AIG] -AIG Ref: 3491272485SG-003
 
Hi Norsiah
 
Received 3rd reminder from CDGE on your case.
 
Please advise any updates from LKK on said ma�er.
 
Best Regards
 
Bennie Tan
AIG
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
 
78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg
 
Advanced Leave No�fica�on:
 

From: Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, August 20, 2020 10:52 AM
To: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] [Reminder 3] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg SHC7042Y
& SJB8662H [AIG]
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 
Mr Bennie Tan
M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
 
We refer to subject ma�er res�ng with your email dated 19 June 2020.
 
This case has remained outstanding to-date.  Please let us have your early reply with offer to wrap up this long outstanding case.
 
We look forward to hearing from you.  Thank you.
 

Best Regards

Aileen Tan
Claims Department  l  ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8735  l  Fax: 6214 1843
 

https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-3A__www.facebook.com_AIGSG&d=DwMGaQ&c=kn4_INW_mBCDHV_xJEVJkg&r=wLqNS3ER7zjiNSIgyOg7cwxuQDq2IMLOU2Qz6Sl4hH8&m=bAC0eT7wXl4c7TjKceQpSUqzZCKQOQj0DhtI8z2IY1k&s=yfBpT_QXOxWoYh4zeFxYsScXRae5fDOBzoI5Z6unVTg&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=https-3A__www.linkedin.com_company_1760&d=DwMGaQ&c=kn4_INW_mBCDHV_xJEVJkg&r=wLqNS3ER7zjiNSIgyOg7cwxuQDq2IMLOU2Qz6Sl4hH8&m=bAC0eT7wXl4c7TjKceQpSUqzZCKQOQj0DhtI8z2IY1k&s=SziSK0UwD4N3OAoM4xtjhFK4YO8AWXypaKh6j0QZZEM&e=
mailto:Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com
mailto:Kay-Eng.Khoo@aig.com
mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-3A__www.aig.sg_&d=DwMGaQ&c=kn4_INW_mBCDHV_xJEVJkg&r=wLqNS3ER7zjiNSIgyOg7cwxuQDq2IMLOU2Qz6Sl4hH8&m=bAC0eT7wXl4c7TjKceQpSUqzZCKQOQj0DhtI8z2IY1k&s=WKaZl1B9TtiLfFeC7h9UcvqvrWesBNinFlUyE7xhrlM&e=
mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg
mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
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From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>
Sent: Friday, 19 June 2020 12:54
To: Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: RE: [Reminder 2] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg SHC7042Y &
SJB8662H [AIG]
 

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment unless
you know the sender.

 
Dear Aileen
 
 
Thank you for your email.
 
We have wri�en to our adjuster, LKK.
 
They will respond to you accordingly.
 
 
Best Regards
 
Bennie Tan
AIG
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
 
78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg
 
Advanced Leave No�fica�on:
 
From: Aileen Tan Lee Noi [mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg] 
Sent: Wednesday, June 10, 2020 3:15 PM
To: Tan, Bennie-WZ
Subject: [EXTERNAL] [Reminder 2] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg
SHC7042Y & SJB8662H [AIG]
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 
Mr Bennie Tan
M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
 
Please let us have your reply/offer to wrap up this long outstanding case.  Thank you. 
 

Best Regards

Aileen Tan
Claims Department  l  ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8735  l  Fax: 6214 1843
 

 
 

mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg
mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-3A__www.aig.sg_&d=DwMGaQ&c=kn4_INW_mBCDHV_xJEVJkg&r=uHP7j67os5G9n1vtlOs2ptKpp_t87cDtmenSTVWUPTM&m=RUAJFVUt15Q1u2G3bK2g-sLFBKlLTI_jAFJPGp2XO3A&s=5TPPRUPsYHcRWQYQXwEEqzaXzu38Qyhl5gNpVjePTfo&e=
mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg
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From: Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 May 2020 20:12
To: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>
Subject: Re: [Reminder] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg SHC7042Y &
SJB8662H [AIG]
 
Hi Bennie 
 
9.00 am to 10.00 am 👌
 
 

Best Regards

Aileen Tan
Claims Department  l  ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8735  l  Fax: 6214 1843
 

 

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 May 2020 17:54
To: Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: RE: [Reminder] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg SHC7042Y &
SJB8662H [AIG]
 

WARNING : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment unless
you know the sender.

 
Hi Aileen
 
 
I actually tried to call you earlier.
 
Sure, any preferred �ming?
 
 
Best Regards
 
Bennie Tan
AIG
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
 
78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg
 
Advanced Leave No�fica�on:
 
From: Aileen Tan Lee Noi [mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg] 
Sent: Tuesday, May 12, 2020 5:53 PM
To: Tan, Bennie-WZ
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: [Reminder] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg
SHC7042Y & SJB8662H [AIG]
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

 
HI Bennie
 
You may call me tomorrow morning at DID: 6214 8735? Thank you
 

mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg
mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg
mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-3A__www.aig.sg_&d=DwMGaQ&c=kn4_INW_mBCDHV_xJEVJkg&r=uHP7j67os5G9n1vtlOs2ptKpp_t87cDtmenSTVWUPTM&m=4zqr6J7gbZQwGXyAE1ntelXuKPKf2flX3v6LoxrlV-k&s=J-0sbQv-X7iFi3wQGpDBj86iXh9RqrgoVCSW0U0Olvc&e=
mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg
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Best Regards

Aileen Tan
Claims Department  l  ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8735  l  Fax: 6214 1843
 

 

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>
Sent: Friday, 8 May 2020 11:48
To: Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: RE: [Reminder] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg SHC7042Y &
SJB8662H [AIG]
 

WARNING : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment unless
you know the sender.

 
Hi Aileen
 
 
Hope you are all well and safe.
 
Am I able to have a chat with you over this ma�er.
 
Thanks.
 
 
Best Regards
 
Bennie Tan
AIG
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
 
78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg
 
Advanced Leave No�fica�on:
 
From: Aileen Tan Lee Noi [mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg] 
Sent: Wednesday, May 06, 2020 3:44 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)
Cc: Tan, Bennie-WZ
Subject: [EXTERNAL] [Reminder] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg
SHC7042Y & SJB8662H [AIG]
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 
Mr Vic Alpeh
M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 
We refer to subject ma�er res�ng with our email dated 20 March 2020.  
 
Please let us have your reply with offer to wrap up this long outstanding case.
 
Your early reply is awaited.  Thank you. 
 

Best Regards

mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg
mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-3A__www.aig.sg_&d=DwMGaQ&c=kn4_INW_mBCDHV_xJEVJkg&r=uHP7j67os5G9n1vtlOs2ptKpp_t87cDtmenSTVWUPTM&m=lilbwsybAsjb_Csco9QuNQcbl3Ppnd0l_RzGtF9ZMPk&s=hZymSvVF6Xn_RPi_OORwJH0KHH1F8Npoyyv14o_0Xvw&e=
mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg
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Aileen Tan
Claims Department  l  ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8735  l  Fax: 6214 1843
 

 
 

From: Aileen Tan Lee Noi <aileentan@cdge.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 20 March 2020 13:31
To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>
Subject: [To GIA] AIG/LKK Ref: SJB8662H CDGE Ref: CC18120708/SHC7042Y/AT >> Acc on 25.12.2018 invlg SHC7042Y & SJB8662H [AIG]
 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 
Mr Vic Alpeh
M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
 
We refer to subject ma�er res�ng with email dated 13 February 2020.
 
Taxi was hit from behind by SJB8662H and under BOLA S27, liability is 100% in taxi's favour.
 
This case has remained outstanding to-date.  Please be informed that if we are unable to resolve the ma�er by 27 March 2020, we shall
escalate the dispute to GIA for adjudica�on.  Thank you.
 

Best Regards

Aileen Tan
Claims Department  l  ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6214 8735  l  Fax: 6214 1843
 

 
From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 13 February 2020 4:50 PM
To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>
Subject: RE: SHC 7042Y and SJB 8662H on 25/12/2018 _ LKK REF CC4/AIG18023177/K1hb3
 

Without Prejudice

 

Dear Kazali,

 

We refer to your below email.

 

Kindly put on hold the matter as we are in the midst of clearing our Insured.

 

We will get back to you for an update as soon as possible.

 

Thank you.

 

mailto:aileentan@cdge.com.sg
mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
mailto:kazali@cdge.com.sg
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
mailto:Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com
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Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an unintended recipient
is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items.
Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and
any copies thereof. Thank you.

 

 

From: Kazali Haji Selahudin [mailto:kazali@cdge.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 13 February, 2020 11:23 AM
To: Tan, Bennie-WZ
Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SHC 7042Y and SJB 8662H on 25/12/2018 _ LKK REF CC4/AIG18023177/K1hb3
Importance: High

 

Dear Bennie,

 

Kindly assist to review and let us know if you are in favor to escalate this matter to GIA for DRM. Your prompt reply is
appreciated. Thank you.

 

Best Regards

Kazali Hj Selahudin

Claims Department / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

Off: 6214 8736 / Fax: 6214 1843

 

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 28 January 2020 11:15 AM
To: Kazali Haji Selahudin <kazali@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: Automatic reply: SHC 7042Y and SJB 8662H on 25/12/2018 _ LKK REF CC4/AIG18023177/K1hb3

 

mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com
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8/24/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/AAMkAGVlNDlkMTdjLTM3MDgtNDY5ZC1hZTdkLWQ3ZDMyNTE0MGFhMgAuAAAAAADlYOFhwsDxTrGjt1lk28c… 9/10

WARNING: This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Sender of this email could not be
validated and name in the "From" field may be forged.

 

Hi,

 

I am currently away from office & will be back on 04/02/2020. As I do not have access to my email and voicemail, do
expect a delay in responding to your email. For any urgent matters, you may wish to contact our Call Centre at 6419-3000
for assistance.

 

Thank you.

 

 
 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this
message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining
to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are
for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any
way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties. 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if
necessary. 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and
permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to
be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group,
Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this
message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining
to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are
for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any
way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties. 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if
necessary. 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]
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The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and
permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to
be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group,
Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this
message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining
to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are
for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any
way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties. 
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ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if
necessary. 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and
permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to
be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group,
Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
 

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this
message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining
to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are
for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any
way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties. 

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to print this only if
necessary. 

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The informa�on in this email (and any a�achments) is confiden�al. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or
disseminate the informa�on. If you have received this email in error, please immediately no�fy me by "Reply" command and
permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any a�achments are believed to be free of
any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the
recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American Interna�onal Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or
affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use
or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted
by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage
arising in any way from its use.


