Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 December, 2019 11:01 AM

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SKA 4652G ON 24.12.2018 AND SLQ 1291M - LKK REF CC4/AIG18023171/Khb3

Dear Ms Lee,
We refer further to our below email.
Our principal had further reviewed on the matter.

Unfortunately, the policy does not cover for this accident that occurred during the engagement of Motor Trade
activity.

As such, kindly redirect your claim towards the motor trade policy insurer (Car Empire).
We will now close the matter in our end.
Thank you.

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com [mailto:claim.autoworxhouse @gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 12 December, 2019 10:34 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SKA 4652G ON 24.12.2018 AND SLQ 1291M - LKK REF CC4/AIG18023171/Khb3

Dear Vic,
After a prolonged wait with no positive reply for settlement from your end, we shall proceed the claims without any
further reference to you.

Thank you.

Best regards,



Ms. Lee

Autoworx House

No0.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 87668115
Fax: 64517423

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 13, 2019 11:45 AM

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKA 4652G ON 24.12.2018 AND SLQ 1291M - LKK REF CC4/AIG18023171/Khb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Ms Lee,
We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Please be informed that we had highlighted your concern to our principal and we are pending for their further
instruction.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com [mailto:claim.autoworxhouse @gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November, 2019 3:55 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKA 4652G ON 24.12.2018 AND SLQ 1291M - LKK REF CC4/AIG18023171/Khb3

Dear Vic,

At the time of loss, the record from LTA search proofed the insurance coverage was by AlG.

Do note that your insured is still the legal owner of the vehicle at the time of loss.

The attached showed documents only proof that your insured had authorised Car Empire to drive the vehicle.
We have every rights to claim directly against your insured and his authorised driver.
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Shall there be any counter claim against any other insurer, please get your principle AlG to redirect their
counterclaim.

Kindly refer to our email dated 31/10/2019 for queries on some damaged items if we are proceeding with a direct
settlement with LKK Auto. Otherwise we shall handover the case to a lawyer to proceed with our claims against AlG
directly without further reference to you.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Ms. Lee

Autoworx House

No0.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 96725547 / 87668115
Fax: 64517423

From: Dylan Chew <autoworxhouse @hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 5, 2019 11:22 AM

To: claim.autoworxhouse@gmail.com

Subject: Fwd: SKA 4652G ON 24.12.2018 AND SLQ 1291M - LKK REF CC4/A1G18023171/Khb3
Importance: High

Best regards,

Dylan Chew

———————— Original message --------

From: "Vic (LKKAuto)" <vicalpeh@l|kkauto.com>

Date: 05/11/2019 10:50 (GMT+08:00)

To: autoworxhouse@hotmail.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>, "Vic (LKKAuto)" <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKA 4652G ON 24.12.2018 AND SLQ 1291M - LKK REF CC4/AIG18023171/Khb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Dylan,

We refer further to our below email.
Please advise.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 7:48 PM

To: 'Dylan Chew' <autoworxhouse @hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: SKA 4652G ON 24.12.2018 AND SLQ 1291M

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Dylan,
We refer to the subject.

Our principal M/s AIG confirmed with insured that vehicle SLQ 1291M was under consignment with M/s Car Empire
Automobiles Pte Ltd (“Car Empire”) for selling of vehicles.

Also at point of accident, M/s AIG also confirmed that driver was Mr. Tan Xin Fa, who was an employee of Car
Empire.

For insurance policy of SLQ 1291M, there is no policy coverage for Motor Trade activity.
As such, please be informed that you need to redirect your claim to the Motor Trade insurer of Car Empire.
Kindly advise if you are to purchase our survey report.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ikkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender



immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.



