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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 ot 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount;
Message

Singapore NRIC
2686l

51J490Y

No

26 Dec 2018
TOYOTA

WISH 1.8 AUTO
Grey

2008
17273128789
JTDER12W403000603
97.0 kW (130 bhp)
$18,803.00

31 Aug 2008

31 Aug 2008

2

$18,803.00

Forfeited

$0.00

30 Aug 2023

B -Car (1601cc & above)
5

$17,496.00

$16,367.00

$16,367.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle
must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Dec 2018

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/ta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By Public BeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION ID=F030... 26-Dec-18

OK
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cwner |D Type:

Cramer IDx

Vehicle Detalls

Wehicle No:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colodr:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No

Chassis Mo,

Maimiam Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Reglstration Date:
Tramsfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

POP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle

reaches its statutory lifespan (it applicable), whichever is earfler.
The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Feb 2019

OK

Bruslrgﬁ
B4ETK

SGW36015
MNa

22 Feb 2019
TOYOTA

WISH 18A

Grey

2007

1722933111
ZNE100372047
97.0kW (130 bhp)
$1474500

13 Jul 2007

13 Jul 2007

a

$18.420.00

Forfeited
$0.00

12 Jul 2022

B-Car|1601cc & above)

5

§26.237.00
$17.777.00
$17,777.00



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Jason Fastech Auto <jason@fastechauto.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 1:23 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. PA 9596T AND 511 490Y
ON 23.12.2018

Without Prejudice
Dear Poh Kin,
We are pleased to accept your offer of global sum of 54,240.00(all in),

Thank you.

Best Regards

Tang Jun Zhong

Choo Motor Spray Painter

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#01-39 AutoBay

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 8443
ChooMotorClaim@gmail.com

Please nate that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudica to any personal Injury claim (if any] of the ownar/
claimant

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mallto:pohkin@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, February 25, 2019 9:17 AM

To: jason@fastechauto.com.sg

Subject: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. PA 9598T AND 51 490Y ON 23.12.2018
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Ref: CCe/11118023123/Ufa3
Your Ref; 5J1 490y

Dear Jason,
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. PA 9596T AND 5JJ 490Y ON 23.12.2018
We refer to the above matter and your letter of demand dated 15" January 2019.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction to offer settlement at global sum of $4,240.00(all in) on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance.



- Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e ————————————————— e ——

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 9:18 AM

To: 'jason@fastechauto.com.sg’

Subject: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. PA 95967 AND 51) 490Y ON
23122018

Importance: High

w UT PREJUDICE

Our Ref; CC6/I1118023123/Ufa3
Your Ref: SJJ 490y
Dear Jason,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. PA 9596T AND S1J 490Y ON 23.12.2018
We refer to the above matter and your letter of demand dated 15" January 2019,

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction to offer settlement at global sum of $4,240.00(all in) on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred from this negotlation of terms/settlemant.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/inflluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

e

B 74 7
EERER == Sawe the Larth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unimended recipient is prohibiled, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you recelved this e-mall in emor, please do not
read this e-mall or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all altachments and any coples thereol. Thank you.



21252019 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*$JJ490Y (MC20183017)
[PAgSd6T)

NG CHEE KOON (HUANG ZHIQIN)
Dec 23 2018 8:00PM
[COMFORTDELGRO BUS PTE LTD]
Choo Molor Spray Painter

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (HI_SG), senl on 25/02/2019 08:55 AM.
To LKK_HGQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$4247.45) - 5JJ490Y - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishnan

Approved:4247.45:Please offer $120 for Loss of Rental

huplfmmm.mmm.mﬂmwﬂmumm_ﬁmcfMM%MW&E&H?&:M‘METM&F&.. n



22212018

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL
M. On Audlt Ramarks By
1 770222018 Cim vieh Modal Changed (201172) TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (A). e
27 Dec 2018 Reg No: SI490Y. Acct Date: 2018/12/23. Claim Type: TR, Insurer: India International 1 (., .,
2 1637 Cim Creatad nsurance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Lid (HQ). Wo cp) pey
' rikshop: Choo Motor Spray Painter (HGQ)
27 Dec 2018 X [A] Lau
2 1637 Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): A}l
4 27082018 gy Naxt Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Dus Date:2019/01/08 L)t
27 Dec 2018 : : (A] Lau
5 15:37 Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.ReinsprAd) decides. Shu Pel
27 Dec 2018 ; [A] Lau
g T Label Added (30653):Direct Settlement. ol e
7 37002018 ag) adjuster Assigned  [None] > MARCUS CHUA ol R
Al
15 Jan 2019 Cur-Req:0,00:PODS Liability: 100% Remarks: BOLA 15, OID collided into TP vehicle wh .|
8 1327 Adj Mandate Request . ooonoing jane, hons
in
g 161on2019 . next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/01/08
09:37 Krish
Man
{11
10 M6 102019 gy mandate Set Approved:0.00. Lalitha
: Krishnan
JOANNE
1 Jaies T Adj Rpt Initinted P
' KHANG
MIN
L))
12 31 1e0 2019 1oy put Modified 17 Reg. Date: -> 2008/08/31. LEE
: KHANG
MIN
(Al J
13 ié.‘;ﬁ' 2019 i Detalis Notified LEE
‘ KHANG
MIN
22 Feb 2019 CurReq:4267.45:PODS Uabllity: 100% Quantum: a)COR: $4,000,00 + b)LOR: $280.0 (Al
1 e Adj Mandate Request  (($140.00 x 2 days) + c) LTA: §7.45 = Total $4,287.45 Vehicle Model: Toyota Wish 1.8 Chong
e A (1794cc) For your approval Pah Kin
Date From (4F(»] pateTo (4] [®] Audit Type | Hone v|[G]
ACTIVITY
Ne record
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History
Bill Ref No Bill Date Act Type Acc Name fg'::cmh: Raf 1 Raef 2 Amount
LKK Auto LKK Auto
2064511 21/02/2019 Motor Consultants Pte | Consultants Pte |  S)1450Y PASS96T 10,70
16:58 e o ()

hnp-w-mwm.mmm.mmmmmmw_mmmnmm1mmm

112



111652019 Merimen a-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*S.J.J490Y (MC20183017)
[PASSSeT)

NG CHEE KOON (HUANG ZHIQIN})
Dec 23 2018 8:00PM
[COMFORTDELGRO BUS PTE LTD)
Choo Molor Spray Painter

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (lIl_SG). senl on 16/01/2019 09:37 AM.
To LKK_HO
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($50.00) - SJJ450Y - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishnan

Approved:0.00,

htips Hsingapore. manman.com/clamsfindex cimHusebox=SYCmall&fussaclion=dsp_PrnlACFID=470797 248 CFTOKEN=5a24a54475d031554-52860. ..

n



1Me019 Merimen a-Claims

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL
Mo an Audit Remarks By
1 125577918 cim veh Model Changed (201172) TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (4). o por
| _ 27 Dec 2018 Reg Mo: S13450Y. Acct Date: 2018/12/23, Claim Type: TP. Insurer: Indla International | [A] Lau
2 16:37 Cim Created nsurance Pte Ltd (HGQ). TP Insurer: NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ). Wo Shu Pei
‘ rkshop: Chao Motor Spray Painter (HQ)
17 Dec 2018 3 [A] Lou
[l e Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): oo
27 Dec 2018 ; : [A] Lau
4 16:37 Adj Next Rpt Changed Mext Rpt: Final Apt.Due Date: 2019/01/08 Shu Pel
27 Dec 2018 " i [A] Lau
5 16:37 Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Ad) decides. Shu Pei
27 Dec 2018 : [A] Lau
[ 16:37 Label Added (30653):Direct Settiemeant, Shu Pel
27 Dec 2018 : [A] Lau
7 16:37 Adj Adjuster Assigned [None] -> MARCUS CHUA Shu Pel
Al
15 Jan 2019 Cur.Req:0,00:PCDS Liability: 100% Remarks: BOLA 15, 01D coliided into TP vehicle wh [
B 13.37 Adj Mandate Request changing lane. P?::lgn
16 Jan 2019 ) (1]
9 poia7 Adj Next Rpt Changed  Next Apt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/01/08 Lalitha
. Krishnan
]
16 Jan 2019
10 m::.; Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00. Lalitha
Date From 4|=] »] pateTo A >] Audit Type | none v Ga]
ACTIVITY
|No record
Merimen Bllling for this case - Transaction Histary |
Bill Rt No Bl Dt Acs Tvoa At Nilmie ?::é'. :::.III:}:I:-! Ref 1 Rat 2 Afti o .
No billing items |

htips:/isingapore. marmen.comiclams/index cimusebox=MTRadjusterfuseaction=dsp_viewhistorybcaseid=7765568extid=28124BACFID=4707972... 12



225018 Marimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail 15 associated with ;

*SJJ490Y (MC20183017)
[PA9596T]
™

NG CHEE KOON (HUANG ZHIQIN)
Dec 23 2018 8:00PM
[COMFORTDELGRO BUS FTE LTD]
Choo Molor Spray Painter

From India international Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) (IlI_SG), sent on 25/02/2019 08:55 AM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$4247.45) - SJJ480Y - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishnan

Approved:4247.45:Please offer $120 for Loss of Rental

hitps://singapore. mariman comiciaims/index.cfim Musebox=SVCmailfuseaciion=dsp_PrintACFID=488851608CF TOKEMN=4 Tea0%20116fa7a0-5460F8.

n



212212019

Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL
Mo, on Audit Romarks By
1 f:';‘;': 2018 1 veh Model Changed (201172) TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (A). ,_[;.L":;
Reg No: SJM490Y. Acct Date: 2018/12/23. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India International 1
2 i:g;c —— Clm Created nsurance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer; NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ). Wo E_,.:“Lﬁ
: rikshop: Cheo Motor Spray Painter (HQ)
A] Lau
3 i;:g;': 2018 445 Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ): !J-hL s
4 i;g‘;‘ 2018 agj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rot.Due Date:2019/01/08 I
27 Dec 2018 i . [A] Lau
5 16:37 Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00 Aeinsp:Ad) decides. e
27 Dec 2018 : [A] Lau
§ 210e Label Added (30653):Direct Settlement. e
27 Dec 2018 [A] Lau
7 16:37 Adj Adjuster Assigned  [None] -> MARCUS CHUA e
: Al
15 Jan 2019 Cur-Req:0.00:PODS Liabllity: 100% Remarks: BOLA 15, OID collided inta TP vehicle wh !
|8 s3> Adj Mandate Request [ C00 Pi';”:ﬂi I
[1]
9 ;:.;T 2019 4 4) Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/01/08 Laliths
. ¥nshnan
m
16 Jan 2019
10 .5, Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00, Lalitha
09:37 o
JOANNE
NN
21 Feb 2019
s Adj Rpt Initiated LEE
MIN
mﬁus
12 31080 2019 iy o1t Modified IP) Reg. Date; -> 2008/08/31. LEE
; KHANG
MIN
| mﬁuq
|
13 1110 2009 oy petalls Notified LEE
: EHANG |
MIN
22 Feb 2019 Cur.Req:4287.45:PODS Liability: 100% Quantum: a)COR: $4,000.00 + b)LOR: $280.0  [A) ‘
14 Adj Mandate Request  0($140.00 x 2 days) + c) LTA: $7.45 = Total $4,287.45 Vehicle Model: Toyota Wish 1.8 Chong
: A (1794cx) For your approval Poh Kin |
Date From 4| »] oate To AT ! aAudit Type | None v 6o
|Mo record
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History
_ B3| Bal Mo 1 Bl Digte | Ace Tyne Are Name II:I-;;rLIr.'.rI_:':T Hast | Raf 2 Armodint
LEK Auto LKK Auto
2084511 21/03/201% Mator Consultants Pte | Cansultants Pte S1490Y PAGSIET 10.70
' 16:58 L1d Ltd (HQ)

hIlpr.H:irqnp-nru.mﬂmmwm:.mmzmmlmm_ﬂmmnm 124BACFID=4877800..

2



CHOO MOTOR SPRAY PAINTER
I Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-39 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 22736900M

Date : 15012019

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

#(4-05 [0B Building

Singapore 04971 |

Attn: Motor Claim Department

Dear Sin'Madam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES @ SJ11490Y / PA 9596T ON 23,12.2018

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: S0 490Y , which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no; PA 9596T . The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him mn presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage 1o the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant,

1} Cost of Repair 5 4,000,00

2)  Loss of Rental 5 360,00

3) LTA Search Fee 3 745
$ 4.367.45

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice b) Car Rental Invoice | Agreement

¢) LTA Search Result d ) Leter of Authorisation, etc...

¢) GIA Report f) 'C & Driving Licence

i) Insurance Certificate hi Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from yvou on the settlement of our customer's claims
s 500N as possible

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you

Yours faithfully, F
Jason Tang ( jﬂwnrg'z_‘rfasjlchauw,l:mn_igj
For Choo Motor Spray Painter



DATE : (.12 )0i8

TO :ha Thinatonal Wivianu P W

RE . ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENO. 10440y [ PA9S90 T

ALONG (U3 T-m'.g.,r.‘. . (e :hlf'”II‘.E (onfie

ON__ 13 11 Xie

I'We, b e hon

! i e | 'E‘\ i ? i
of (NRIC No/ROC No.) 1 0600 1
of Bt WIHC T ek W ¥ 1-35) Biempore Snp

B e | oy " " . I\

owner of vehicleno. 11 WY in consideration of M/s CHOO MOTOR SPRAY
PAINTER repairing my/our vehicle 11 410 at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s CHOO MOTOR SPRAY PAINTER to demand claim settlement whatever
amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal

proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
etc. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/'We turther agree and undertake 1o indemnify them againsi the above-mentioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner : =\

Name of Owner I"JL] L heée Koon




.
||'|Dlﬂ INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

In service simce 1987
EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
DISCHARGE VOUCHER
ll-Direct Sattlemant (PODS)

net: MC2UVEHE1F
::umn-r AR AT
W, t'hfﬂ lT'ﬂh'[ g“':lq P'lﬂ*‘-:'i ["the Workshoo") hareby confinm that wel have an ngresment
with the appoinind Surveyorof India Inlemational Insurance Pie Ui L Ste Lty PR LE g o
Surveyor) with respect 1o Ihe daimed for 58 "0 'V (repair cosD), 53 {loss of useirental), 5§
(soarch fes), vehice no. AT thet wes mmnmmm
on 1) 018 qsase an D210 faspites (e g (iocation)invaiving vehicie no. T grnaured

vehiicie). This is pursusnt 10 the inspeciion conducied on 2o ”ﬂ”‘vﬁ -:m}:mmw

mmmmmmwhmm@fkﬂm (he tird party claimant®) of vehicle no.
S0 T hmnm-mmmhmmw-ﬂmumh-ﬂ-hmmm
behall In @ manner that we'l deem L Wel enclase herein [he infler of sulhodly given by “the third party claimant™,

Wl further confirm that wall will indemnity India infemational Insursncs Ple Lid for sl demagos, loss andior mpense that
they will or have skeady ncured in the event thal “the third party clnimant® sfier the sbove said agreement lodges a
mucﬂnwmhn-ﬁ;r loes and mparses suffaned partaining to cost of repsirs and/or rental andfor loss
of use pursuant o the damage o 21 A (vehicke no.) 88 & msult of the accidant.

Wl confirm thal the agresmoent reached above is In full and final seflemert of all deims of “the third perty clairmant®
pusuant to the accident snd Mat further this seifiorment s reachod on & without prejudios and without admission of liability
basg.

This agresment s subject to the application ol Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have excusive jurtsdictlon over any

dispute arising oul of the same.
We/ authorize youto pay the total amountorss "'~ 1o chao Potot ?PI‘IH fantel

Cuiod this ...
— s Q“‘D] kS
Sigrasiure:
mwmw

Name CHoo MoToR  SPRAY PainTer _—
NRIC: ]fl:[ﬁﬁqﬂﬂm NRIC: LH..'\]' IOy (1 [H_[
Address | A Bup' T VG 6 o 51 Ubi Ave 'l't'll.

ﬂﬁi'}‘l AuTophy ;Ql}ﬂ} Smﬁ-ch 4Ju‘i‘333
Matonallty: ) Nustlonalily i
Occupation - Dcocupation.

INDLA INTERMATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

CO. REG. NO.: 1987037926
&4 CECIL STREET #04/#05/#06-02 108 BUILDING SINGAPORE 049711  TEL: 4347 4100  FAX: 4224 4174 » 62256 7743 WEB: www. il com.sg

POSTAL ADDRESS: ROBINSON ROAD P.O, BOX NO, 738 SINGAPCRE 201430



TAX INVOICE
CHOO MOTOR SPRAY PAINTER

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-39 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 22736900M

Tax Invoice - 20779
India International Insurance Pte Lid

64 Cecil Street Date 15.01.2019
#04-05 108 Building Vehicle No S 490Y
Singapare 049711 Make/Model - TOYOTA WISH
Chassis/Engh
Attn : Motor Claim Department Accident Daie - 23,12.20148
Claim No
Reference 1218 -20779
Policy No
Amount
F'o proceed on lump sum repair s$ 4000.00
E.&O. E. Total :_S$ 4000.00

for CHOO MOTOR SPRAY PAINTER



DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

| Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883
Tel No: 6741 7244 /6746 5405 Fax No: 6745 8520/ 6746 5786

Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: NG CHEE KOON Invoice : DCR-2018-12-19
Dae : 28.12.2018

Agreement No : 20357

Payment Term : LOD

. DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle :  SGW 36015 | 1218-20779 ) S 360.00
Rental Period from 26.12 2018 to 28.12.2018
E.& O.E. Total § 360.00

LINA PANG
for Dynamic Car Rental




Dynamic Car

Rental

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-46M850 AUTOBAY, SINGAFORE 417883

TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786

Co. Reg. No. 52928467K

No.203
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TRMFRNIR Hanrmin

> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 26 Dec 2018 / 13:56:02
Receipt Date/Time : 26 Dec 2018 / 13:56:02
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-181226-001853
Previous Receipt No. |

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S%) (5%) (S%)

sult of Insurance Enquiry - PA9596T
As at 23 Dec 2018/20:00:00
Insurance Co: INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - PAS586T

Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 748
20181226135508478428
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
20181226135519919 Eﬁr?;n::gs Ho0 7.45
Total 7.45
. Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settied by the payment service
provider | financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

Print Receipt OK Save as PDF

FONCEIS WY LS A U RS A T T MRS T LI BP0 T i



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settiement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING S |
Case | Motife Est Submttes | Ad] Assigned Ad) R Ad) Subrrined e Auth'ed | Status |
| |
|02 2010 I:::?;c 2018 $$4,000.00 | 594,000.00 ll-ulnn for Survey
| Edit Reo_| 5w Adj et | gt Estimates | | view Rpt | ] =' =y |

Reference Clalm Detalls

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS S |[Created by adjuster]
Insured:  COMFORTDELGRO BUS PTE LTD, Co Reg. Mo 199607256W

Main "
Claimant: NG CHEE XOON (HUANG ZHIQIN). 1D: S772268E6]

2Ar12/2018 20:00 - :59
[123 Months and 23 Days From LTA Rleg Date (Man ¥r)] |

e
|'rr J MC20183017 it uu'lcm.: | MEBSTA2/03

Polcy No.
(Claimant}!

Date of Loss:

51078241132

. . Exgess: [
Repairer: Choo Motor Spray Painter (HQ) 1 Eal Bukit Avenue B, #01-3% -Iulg_ﬂ_-r @ Kaki Bukit, 2178837 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 67453857

Handiing India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by Lalitha Krishnan - 6347 5139]

Ingurer:

f'l':m"‘ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Lid (HQ) - Tel: |
Adster:  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handled by MARCUS CHUA] . [Final Rpt due D8/01/2019] _
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED B view All |  Compose Case Mail |

« 111_5G (25/02/2015) Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$4247.45) - 5134907 - Claim Handler: Lalitha Kris...
e M1 SG(16/00/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (530.00) - 51J480Y - Cialm Handler: Lalitha Krishna...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | complete ||

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Complated On Created On Daone? l
Na resufts

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 27/2/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 3

Claim Documents

*511490Y (MC20183017)
[PA9596T]
TP
NG CHEE KOON (HUANG ZHIQIN)
Dec 23 2018 B:00PM
[COMFORTDELGRO BUS PTE LTD]
Choo Motor Spray Painter

|
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Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {Co Rsg Mo 185607 188R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email

 sur@lkkauto com;assignments@lkkauto com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our File No: CC&/MI18023123/UFA302
Date: 27/02/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Inlernational Insurance Pte Lid ~ Paolicy No: M485742/03
5;":'"’“" Vehicle ¢ ;ja00v Insured Vehicle No :  PAS596T
Date of Loss: 23122018 Nature of Claim: ™ Claim No: MC20183017
DESCRIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJJ490Y
Make & Model: TOYOTA WISH, 1.B (A) Engine No: 1273128789
Reg. Dale: 31/0B/2008 (Man. Year. 2008) Chassis No: JTDER12W403000803
Colour Silver Cdomeler 171832 km
Engine Capacity 1794 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (53): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition; Steering (Serviceable) Yes Footbrake (Serviceabls) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabls): Yes Engine Modification Mo  Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/85 R15
Front Lefi Side: Michelin 6 mm Rear Lefi Side Michelin & mm
Front Right Side: Michelin & mm Rear Right Side: Michelin & mm
The above virlues represent the remaming fyre resds depth
COST OF CLAIMS — - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Parts 11,184 .50 3,828.90 7.33560 65.70
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.530.00 1.180.00 1.350.00 53.38
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 13,694.50 5,008.90 8,685.60 63.42
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 4,000.00
Nett Amount (5§) 13,694.50 4,000.00 9,694.50 T70.79
+ Car Rental (2.0 x 5§120.00/day) (S%) 240.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 7.45
Nett Liability (S$) 424745
Global Sum Settlement (55) 4,240.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 26122018
Date Inspected: 26/12/2018 inspected Al Choo Motor Spray Painter (HQ)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_...

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue &, #01-39 AutoBay @
Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

27722019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: Chong Poh Kin

NOTE: This repart repressnts our findings af the lime and place of inspechion stated herin, Such inepection has been caried ouf fo the besf of our
hrowisdge and abilty but any ofbher Nty under any oifer cicumsiances is hereby expressly ercluded.

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 27/2/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

|Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 21 Feb 2019)

Parts: M1-MPV TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List) |

Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code for SJJ480Y)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimale pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: llems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT FENDER QIS Repair 981.10F “.FL
2 1 *FRONT FENDER INNERSHIELD O/S Tom 366 50F *24510FL
3 1 *SET FRONT FENDER INNERSHIELD CLIP OIS Necessary 50.00F “50.00FL
& 1 *FRONT FENDER INNER PANEL OIS Repair B95.10F *.FL
5 1 *HEADLAMP O/S Cracked 1.050.00F *845.10FL
6 1 *FRONT BUMPER Distortad TBB.20F “572.10FL
I 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER O/S Bent 80.50F *668.50 FL
B 1 *SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 50.00F *50.00FL
9 1 *FRONT BUMPER SPONGE Torn 200.50F *265.30FL
10 1 *FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Bent 811.20F *398.20 FL
1M1 1 *FRONT BUMPER BRACKET OIS Not Necessary 185.00F “.FL
12 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER OIS Mot Necessary 205.00F “FL
13 1 *FRONT SUPPORT PANEL Repair BB5.10F *-FL
14 1 *FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER O/8 Beni B20.10F *466.10FL
15 1 *FRONT KNUCKLE ARM O/S Bent B4A5.50F "488.20FL
165 1 *FRONT KNUCKLE ARM BEARING QIS5 Necassary 3BB 20F *328.50FL
17 1 *FRONT LOWER ARM O/S Bent 1,450 50F *588.10FL
1B 1 *FRONT SPORT RIM Q/S Bent [Dented O50.00FS “4B0.00FS
19 1 *FRONT TYRE QIS Mot Necessary 250.00F “FL

F=Franchizse pan. S=5SpcNet| L=ListitamDisc
Sub Total {SII' 11,164.50 4,945.20

- List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/25.00% (5%) 0.00 1,116.30

Total Parts (S§) 11,164.50 3,828.90

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thore are no new miscellansous itoms seiected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO CHECK WIRING New 50.00 20.00
2  TOREFILL AIR CON GAS New 120.00 0.00
3 TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT New 120.00 60.00
4  TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE New 280.00 120.00
5  TOSPRAY RUST PROOFING New 80.00 0.00
& LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS New 800.00 480.00
7 TOPUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING New 1,080.00 500.00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,530.00 1,180.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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