Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: survey@kkimhin.com.sg
Sent: Sunday, 7 April 2019 9:18 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SJU8184X OD-AXA FINALISATION
Hi Veron,

Noted

Thank you.

Regard

Meng Huat

K.Kim Hin Auto

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 3:30 PM

To: survey@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJU8184X OD-AXA FINALISATION

Dear Meng Huat,
Confirmed P/P $1,111.57 before GST @ 3 working days.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: survey@kkimhin.com.sg <survey@kkimhin.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2019 5:12 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SJU8184X OD-AXA FINALISATION

Hi Veron,

Enclosed your attention.
P/P=$1.111.57

Please confirm.

Thank you.

Regard
Meng Huat
K.Kim Hin Auto



