Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.cam>

Sent: Friday, 12 April 2019 9:57 AM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow

Subject: RE: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKN B4B6A

{Ol: SNM19D200009C02/6) and SHD 3519K (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTINB023082/K11b3) on 22/12/2018

LKK REF - CC3/CTI18023082/K1fb3
CTI REF - SNM19D200009C02/6 (SKNS486A)

Dear Poh Kin
We refer to your email of even date pertaining to the above matter.
You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $5,150.06.

We await your payment advice to enable Irene to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.comichinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A TF¥# Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may confain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, Is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkinf@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 11 April, 2019 7:17 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh(@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A
<admin-a(@lkkauto.com=>

Subjeet: <Urgent><Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKN B486A (OI:
SNM19D200009C02/6) and SHD 3519K (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18023082/K1fb3) on 22/12/2018
Importance: High

Your ref : TBA (Ol: SKN B486A)
Our ref : CC3/CT118023082/K1fb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN 8486A(0I), SHD 3519K (TP) AND OTHER ALONG PUNGGOL FIELD
ROAD ON 22/12/2018

We refer to the above matter.



Poh Kin {LKI{Autu!

From: Poh Kin [LEKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 717 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Ce: ‘Alfred Toh'; "lrene Tay', Admin A

Subject: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKN B486A (Ol :
CT| - TBA) and SHD 3519K (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI118023082/K1fb3) on 22/12/2018

Attachments: LKK Adjustment report.pdf; LKK Inspection report.pdf; LKK RESURVEY PHOTO.pdf;
LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; TP Estimate- Marked + supplementary.pdf; TP LOD_ SHD
3519K.pdf

Importance: High

Your ref : TBA (Ol: SKN 8486A)
Our ref : CC3/CT118023082/K1fb3

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN 8486A(0l), SHD 3519K (TP) AND OTHER ALONG PUNGGOL FIELD
ROAD ON 22/12/2018

We refer to the above matter.

Liability: Ol collided into other party vehicle and rear-ended TP vehicle. Liability is down against our
Insured.

Send letter to Ol via e-mail on 08.04.2019.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd" at
$ 5,150.06(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $4,696.82 S 4,432.11 (54,142.16 +7% gst)
2. Loss of Rental S 575.00 ($115.00 x 5 days) S  485.46 ($107.88 x 4.5 days)
3. Loss of Income S 400.00 ($80.00 x 5 days) S 225.00 ($50.00 x 4.5 days)
4, LTA search fee S 749 $ 749
Total | $5,679.31 5,150.06

**04 days recommendation for repair.
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
For your approval please.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciate.



COMFORIDELCRO

Dur Ref T 1218/ SHD3518K /MWT(st) ENGINE ERINC‘
Your Ref :
Date 14-Jan-19 COGE Tax Claims Dept
53 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508063
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 073909
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHD3518K YOUR INSURED SKNB84B6A
AND OTHER SJN 125G ON 22.12.18 e,

We are the authorised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Lid, the owner of motor
Vehicle No : SHD3519K which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concemed have requested and authonzed us to
assist them in presenting their claims agains! the party responsible for all applicable matters
arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SKN8486A
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXIOWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair § 44321

3] 5 dayslLossof Rental@ § 115.00 perday 3 57500

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 5 -

4 LTA Search Fees 3 7.49

5 GlA / Police Repart Fees $ -

5] Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees ] -
Sub Total: 3 5014 60

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 5 days Lossoflncome @ 5  B0O.00 perdays 3 400,00

TotalClaims : § 5414560

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Oniginal repair bill and photocopies of photographs : 4 pcs.
b)  LTA search slip/s of SKN8486A
¢) GlA/ Police repart/s of : SHD3519K

d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ ) Traffic Compound { ) Towing/Medical billreceipts ( ) Cerificate of Insurance
( X ) Photograph's of Accident Scene ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record [ x ) Rental Rale lstler

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
so0n as possible.

Please note that It is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver

Yours faithfully

TWillvam Tan

CDGE Claims Department

Tel: 6214 8737 Fax: 6214 1843 Emall : willlamtan@cdge.com.sg

This Is a computer generated letter. No signature Is required.

COMFORIDELGRO G



Poh Kin !I.KKAutn!

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 April 2019 3:44 PM

To: CGW1907@GMAILCOM

Cc Admin A

Subject: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SKN B436A AND SIN 125C

ALONG PUNGGOL FIELD ON 2212 2018.

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC3/CTI18023082/K1fb3
Your Veh: SKN B486A

CHEN GUOWEI
Policy Holder

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SKN B486A, SHD 3519K AND OTHERS ALONG
PUNGGOL FIELD ON 22.12.2018.

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pobkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408033)

H{H E.‘.."'"m Ehe Earth- Print only when necessary”

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve thal you received this e-mall in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Plaase delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachmenis and any copies thereol. Thank you.



CDG VARS. V. LettofAuthorisation Page 1 of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(MAF / PAFY
ACCIDENT INVOLVING | 40 SHD3519K , SHNBABGA , SIN125G ON 22-Dec-18 17:30
ALONG PUNGGOL FIELD RD.
1/ We AHMAD BIN TATI {Hiree) NRIC Na.: S12740893Z
andfor {Reliefl NRIC Na.

Taxi Mumber SHD3519K
haraby aulhorise ComfortDelGro Enginesting Pte LtolCDGE)

1. To submit my/fowr clalims for damages, costs and expense, including ess of incame, loss of rental,
medical fee end legal costs

2. Ta hiave absalute discration to agree Lo any ssttlement or compensation amount i respect of my/aur claim
agairst third party (except pérsanal injuries and medical daims),

3. To sign Discharge Voucher an myfour behalf
4. To accept any paymant (claim proceads) in respect of the claim against thirg pany and payment by heque

shall ba forward diractly toc COGE in accordance with COGE s instruction and made in favour of
*ComfortDelGro Enginearing Ple Ltd”,

Dare 24-Dec-2018
Mame of Hires AHMAD BIN TATI
Hirer NRIC 512740932 Signature ;
(‘},},\_:_bd_,,—_,___,
..-'-'—"'_-.
Ardress 162 TAMPINES STREET 12 206-243
521162
Corntact Mo 96349242

hitp://cdgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG.VAR...  24/12/2018



Folicy Wo i1 DMPCSH3I0EGITLIEQ0 Claim Ho : SHM19D200009/002/%
Claimant : COMPORT TRARSPORTATION PTE 1I0
Amount : 5%5,150.00

POLLARS FIVE THOUSAND OME HUNDREED FIFTY ONLY

I/We agres to accept the =bove mentioned amsunt to be pald to mafus in full £
final setrlesment of all claims, costs & disbursesents for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident invelving

Clalmant Vehicle Mo. © SHD 3519
Insured Yehicle Me. @ SEN B84EEA

fate of lo=s p 22/12/2018
Flace of Accident r PUNGEROL FIELD ROAD

tH COMSIDERATION of the payment mads to me/sus of the aforemantioned sum by
CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., [/We agree sbsclutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

tnsured Mame t CHEN GUOMEI
briver NHame : CHEN GUOWEI

#rom all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injuy of damage
sustained by melus arising out of the said sccident.

1 acknowledge that this paywent is made without admisaicn of 1iabilicy cn the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PIE. LTD.

{1} Glehal Sum 55 5,150.00

MHL - - - - - - - - - - * - - - - 55‘ 5" IED-DG

PR ———= = = = = = B s

COMF ORTTELERT Inces
M LOWANL TS
Claimanc Nam= 3 TRGAPCRE Lt BRIC N2 3

Bignature g /—f‘&i Data £ f—.‘r -1 F

[

Tne ronientd O Wi DR { DY 0 weie i!*di" ou Vicase forsaial yoir dhedgue

o

ple pajible 1o
COMFORTDELGRO ENGINE Fﬂlm“ PTE ITC

- o e axcs .

| oorserel niies and ;a;-_{sam‘i.h"élﬁ

ne amtit & apokoafion of e sreyment
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Kindly note that no receipt shall be ssued unless requasted
CUSTOMER'S COPY
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COMFO R]DELGRO ComfortDelGro Enginesring Pte Lid
ENGINEERING

& member of ComroetXLCRD

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE MPANY REG. NO.: 1949s

e

.

VEHCLE NO INV. NO/DATE
"HINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO (S)PTE LTI SHD351 9K
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. MAKE TOB NO
ANSON ROAD #16-00 HYUNDAT 30525374
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ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid
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ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road
Singupore 5THT01

Kindty note that no recaipt shall be issued uniess requested
CUSTOMER'S COPY




COMFORTDELGRQ ComfortDelGro Engineering Pie Lid
ENGINEERING

A mamper of COMPORTTELORD

Worsafaose

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE CMPANY EBEG. NO.: 199506048 I_‘

VEHCLE NO INV. NO/DATE
ING INSURANCE (S)PTE LTD SHDA519K 31419099 09.01.2019
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SINGAPORE SG 079909

MOLEL ODOMETER READING
INTACT NO: 62222366 1—4U
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& CHASSIS CODE

EMHLB411MGU093414

ComfortDellaro Engineering Pre Lid
A mamitier of COMPORICHLCED

ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road
Simgapore 579701

Kindly nota that no receipt shall be issued unless requestad : . M, g —
CUSTOMER'S COPY




OurRef CT18120664 ,\

Date: 09 January 2019

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 22/12/2018 @ 17:30 hrs
ALONG PUNGGOL FIELD RD.
INVOLVING SKNB486A, SIN125G

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHD3519K (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to AHMAD BIN TATI IC NO
$1274093Z a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate 5115.00 per day
{inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the matenal ime of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Tax arising from the said accident with a motor
warkshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settiement of claims with third party’s insurance company in respect of the said
accident

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safely

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 5TST17 Mainline +85 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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- Emiuire\fehide Insurer

‘Whh':h Mo, Imident DateTime  Sesrch Status insurance Company Code  Insurapce Comparyy Maime
GEMBABAN 22 Dec201B /7 17 30:00 Successiul L= ih] CHINATAIFING ML RANCE(SINGAPCORE) PTELTO
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