Asher 5I1= (LKKAuto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 4:26 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Cheng Boon Sen; Elaine Cheong

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLW2798E (O! :
SNM19D200108) and SHD3503E (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI18023079/K1pb3 ) on
22.12.2018

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $3,900.67.
Best Regards

Alfred

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, July 1, 2019 3:29:05 PM

To: Elaine Cheong; Chong Boon Sen

Cc: Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLW2798E (0! : SNM19D200108) and
SHD3503E (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118023079/ Kipb3 Jon 22.12.2018

Hi Boon Sen,

We refer to the email dated 18/06/2019.

Kindly let us have your approval as third party is chasing for settlement.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng @lkkauto.com<mailto:olivialau@Ikkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.coms>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 11:57 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Subject: FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLW2798E (O1 : SNM19D200108) and
SHD3503E (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118023079/K1pb3 ) on 22.12.2018
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Dear Boon Sen,

FYA, Thanks.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motor Claims)
Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6530

Fax: 6224 7478 / 6224 7175

Email: elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com<http://www.sg.cntaiping.com/>

From: Alfred Toh

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June, 2019 11:17 AM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com<maiito:elaine cheong @sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:alfred.toh @sg.cntaiping.com>>; Chee So Chow

<sochow.chee @sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:sochow.chee @sg.cntaiping.com>>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLW2798E (Ol : CAl - TBA) and SHD3503E (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/CT118023079/K1pb3 ) on 22.12.2018

Dear Elaine
Please assist to provide the claim reference number and authorise claim if in order.
Best Regards

Alfred

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com<mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com>>
Sent: Tuesday, June 18, 2019 10:26:24 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Alfred Toh; Elaine Cheong; Chee So Chow

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST) RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLW2798E (Ol : CAl - TBA) and SHD3S03E (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/CT118023079/K1pb3 ) on 22.12.2018

Your ref : TBA
Our ref : CC3/CTI18023079/K1eb3q2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.



* The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 27 is
applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured's favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" at $3,900,67 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed

Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST)
S 4,040.53

5 2,928.48

2. Loss of Rental (6days x $125.40)
S 75240

S 689.70 (5.5days x $125.40)

3. Loss of Income (6days x 580)

S 480.00

§  275.00 [5.5days x 550)

4. LTA Search Fee

s 7.49

S 7.49

Total
$5,280.42

$ 3,900.67



Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,
Far your approval please.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ikkauto.com<mailto:olivialau@Ikkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pej (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 December 2018 9:14 AM

To: 'claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>>

Cc: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:elaine.cheong@sg.cntalping.com>>; Lucas Lee
<lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com<mailto:lucas.lee @sg.cntaiping.com>>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com<mailto:admin-
a@lkkauto.com>>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com<mallto:chewht@Ikkauto.com>>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLW2798E (01 : CAl - TBA) and SHD3503E (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT118023079/K1pb3 ) on 22.12.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Elaine,
We refer to the above matter,

We have inspected TP vehicle SHD 3503E at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang) on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal Is:

- TP GlA report

- Estimated cost of repair

- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197,
Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ilkkauto.com<mailto:shupei@Ikkauto.com> | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi
Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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COMFORIDELCRO

OurRef - T 1218/ SHD3503E T (st ENGINEERING
Your Ref :
Date : 03-Jan-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept e ¥

59 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO LTD Singapore 508969
3 ANSON ROAD
#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER
SINGAPORE 079909 Workahop
Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE iy <o
Dear Sir -
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHD3503E YOUR INSURED SLW2738E
AND OTHER ON 22.12.18 Sin Ming

We are the autharised repair workshop for Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor ,
Vehicle No SHD3503E which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured ;
vehicle The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to

assist them in presenting their clsims against the party responsible for all applicable matters

arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SLW279BE
we are submitting these claims for your consideration an behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $§ 292848

6 6 days Lossof Rental@ § 125.40 perday $ 752.40

3  Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by Mis LKK) 3 =

4 LTA Search Fees S 7.49

5 GIA / Police Report Fees 5 -

3] Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees $ -

SubTotal: 3 368837

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 f days Lossof Income @ $  80.00 perdays $ 480.00
Total Claims: §  4,168.37

We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

d4)  Onaginal repair bill and photocopies of photographs : =] pcs

b) LTA search slip/s of SLW2738E

c) GlA | Police report/s of SHD3503E

d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ )} Traffic Compound ( ) Towing/Medical billlreceipts { ) Certificale of Insurance
{ X ) Photographis of Accident Scene ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record ( x ) Rental Rale letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of the said claims as
=zoon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiernent reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

William Tan
CDGE Claims Department
Tel: 6214 B737 Fax 6214 1B43 Email : willlamtan@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

Q /-
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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAX : (D65) 62564315

Our Ref: CC3/CT118023079/K1pb3
13 March 2019

Chen Jiajun

408C Fernvale Road
#11-06

Singapore 793408

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLW 2798E AND SHD 3503E ON 22/12/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.
Yours faithfully,

\

e

NNy A

Cecilia Chong

Case Handler

DID: 6749 4274

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com

¢.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)




© CDG.VARS.V Lettof Authorisation Page 1 of |

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING TOYOTA PRIUS SHD3503E , SLW279BE ON 22-Dec-18 10:30
ALONG CTE(CITY) BF BT TIMAH EXIT
| f We TAN KOK WENG (CHEN ... (Hirer) NRIC No.: S1789433A
and/or (Ralief) NRIC MNo.:

Taxi Number SHD3S503E
hereby authorise ComfortDelGra Engineering Pre Ltd{CDGE):

L. To submit myfour claime for damages, costs and expense, including loss of Income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs,

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
agalnst third party (except personal injuries and medical claims),

1. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behaif,
4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third panty and payment by chequs

srall e forward directly to CDGE in accordance with COGE's instruction and made n favour of
*ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd”.

Dat= 23-Dec-2018

Name of Hirer TAN KOK WENG (CHEN GUODRONG)

Hirer NRIC 517894334 Signature ;

Address 272C SENGKANG CENTRAL #02-347
543272

Contact No. 96330366

http:fedgek2sry: 82/ Runtime Runtime/Runtime Runtime/ View/CDG V... 23/12/2018
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MOTOR CLATMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Polley Mo bMPCEN3025061800 Clalm Mo : SMM15D200108

Claimant : CCOMFORT TAANSPORTATION PTE LTD

Amount 3 5§53,%00.87
DOLLARS THREE THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED AND CENTS SIXTY SEVEN
ONLY

I/ve agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be pald to me/us in full &
final settlement of all clalms, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident invelving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SHD 3503E
Insured Vehicle No. : SLW 2738E

22/12/2018
CTE (CITY) BF BT TIMAH EXIT

Gate of loas :
Flace of Accident $
[N CONSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPIMG INSUBRANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absclutely te
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/ar

Insured Nams : CHEN JIAJUN
Driver Name : CHEN JIAJUN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all less, injury or damage
sustained by me/uas arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on ths
part of CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) Genaral Damages 55
(1) Cost of Repalr/Exesss g5 2,928.48
{31} lLoas of Bs=/Rental/Earning 5% 964.70
{4) GIA/Police Reporta/

Investigation Hesults/Search Fees 5% T.49
{5) Medical Reports/Expenses 85
{6) Survey Fees/P.7. Fess -1
{7) Coat including Disbursement S5

TOTAL v & « s o 5 o o 5 & @ o % a0 BF 3,900.67

Claimant MWame : CCMECRT TRAMSPORIATION PTE LTD BRIC No :

Signaturs : / Jé#‘ Nate ‘;" ?-If

N '.:‘H- vin
."'_I.IJ.."."..|-'LI-_,.‘E ¥ .'_‘_ 1
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COMFORIDELGRO
- ENGINEERING

A mamber of COMMORDN LLRDY

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

BDI10D1Z

CHINA TAIFING
SPRTNGLEAF TIWHH

3 ANBON ROAD #16-00
SINGAPORE G 079909

CONTACT NO: b2Z272305

B/No Fart o,

Dascription : 3P 22.17

TAX INVOICE

IRSIIRARCE 0 (S)1PTE 1.TH

ComiortDelGro Engineering Pl Lid

n‘nrllln::p-t
CIMPANY HEG. NO. @ 199506045
Fage: 1

VEHCLE M) INV. RO/DATE
RHN3SNAK Q1a17TMT 31 .12,.24018
HAKF JOB WO,
TOYOTA 5253438
MOLEL ODNOMETER READING
PRIS HYBRID{GS )
NMATE [IF RKG IM'I'K;“I‘IHR IN
14.06. 2016 22.12.2M8 12:35

(HASSTE (TiNkK
JTOKBIFUNNZ529637

PART HBEQUISTTION

0001 0D4-01-0302-27R87
0002 04-01-D302-2287
0003 04-01-0302-2267
oh4 0d4-0-=-0D302-0796
0005 O4-D1-0307-2865
0008 04-01-D307-7788
0007 DA-01-D302-77649
ON0B D4-01-0302-2770
. 0008 (04-01-0302-22T1

0010 28-01-0302-2013
0011 28-01-0302-00606

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pre Lid

A member of COMPORIDE G

Head Office:

205 Braddell Road

Singapore ST9T01

Kindly note thal no receipt shall be issusd uniess equested

CUSTOMER'S COPY

FHIG4 COVER HEAR BUMPER
PRIGA RIARID-REAR BlMPER
PRIV RIMPRER P1KCR

FRIGE TERS AND RODY REAR
PHIGE FTLLEK-HKAK RUMPKK
FRIGA HEINFORCEMENT SUR-A
PRIGE OWNAMENT SiH-ASSY R
PRIGA PLATE-RACK
PRIGE FPLATK-RAUK
PRIV REAR RONNE
FRIVC REAR RO A5521111

IXXIR NAM
IXXIH NAM

APP ''AX

ACCOUNT No.

BO10012

INVOICE No

gry Imit Pricas  RDasc N&t
1 458, 61 25.00 43,96
i 552.60 25.00 414 .45
10 3. 25.00 16,50
1 S48, 40 25.00 411 .30
1 |48, 40) 25.00 117,30
i i18. & 25.100 439,10
1 47 .00 Z5.00 15.75
I AR 25.00 19. /7
| 2,490 25_00 19, /7
1 40, 00 0.00 40, oo
1 w40, (M) 0. 00 R, )

AMOUNT BANK/CHO No

Q1417017




-COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

" A mamber of COMRORDELCRD

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3

8010012

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO (S)PTE LTD

SPRTNGLEAP TOWER

i ANSON ROAD #1600
SINGAPOREE SG 079909

VERITTL R T ' f e b L B -
ONTACT NO: 212366

D017 D8-01-=-0302=-2005 PRTGA REVERSE SENSOE ABSY

0013 FNPH NO PLATRIS)

JOB NATIEE

ol 1. HEAK RIMMEHR MAT

0002 I PANEI, REATIN3-

0003 Z3-50 SPHAYFPATNT ON AFVECTED AHEA

oooa 17-

. onns 1.

ComfortDeltiro Engineering Pte Lid
A mermier of COMFORIOR LD

Head Office:
203 Braddell Road
Singapore STYT0)

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued uniass requesied

TAX INVOICE (YMPANY HEG. NO

CHECK ALT, LIGHTTING

REMUVE /REFI X REVERSE SENSOR

ACCOUNT No

AFTEHT

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

Wornshops

1 95/ 4 HW

Page:

VEH(ILE W) IRV. RO/IATE
SHNINIZK 91417MT 3N.12.20M8
MAKE JOR NO.
TIYOTA 5753438

MO KDL, (MM METER HEALTNCG
PRIUS HYRRTIM G4 )

DATE (OF WRG DATE/TIME IR

14.09,. 2015 72 17 MR8 17:35

CHASS1TS (X0
JTDERIFIS0 352967

gty Unit Prics  Disc Nat
| 135. 10 0. 00 135.70
| G0 (D) 0. 00 50, 00
SHB-TUTAI 1,936,490
a0, () 0. 00
00 . D0 100. 00
400, DN 400, DO
20,00 20,00
i, R A0, 00
SUBR-"TTITAI 00 .

INVOICE No BANK/CHOQ No

AMOUNT

CUSTOMER'S COPY



COMFOR‘]DELGRQ Cumh?lrtﬂwﬁm Enginearing Pla Lid
© ENGINEERING

S Ermber of COMAOINDELCRD "o
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE CIMPANY HRC NO 1 99 ENEN4AW
é-‘,‘-fg.r- 1
8010012
. N VEHCLE RO INV. RO/TIATE
CHINA TATPING ITNSURANCE CD (SYPTE LTD CONERTEL 91417017 31.17
SFHINGLEAF TUOWEH
2 - MAKH JOH K.
i ANSON ROAD #16-00 TOVFTA INE75 1418
INGAPORE SG (79909
= MOIRE, (HXMETER REAITING
ONTACT NO: 62222366 PRIUS HYBRID{G4)
DATE OF REXG DATR/TIME 1IN
14.09. 2016 ! 018 17-35
(HASHTS (XIDE
. JITRESFIIG03529637
tams total ty 136,90
Add GSI' @ 7.000 % 1491, 58
myvoice amoamt 2. 978,48
Issued hy KATHRRINETAN 31.12.2018 10:43:56
Hapair type : CLSOSST/HT
Payment Type/Temrm: /Credit 30 days
ComfortDelGGro Engineering Fre Lid
A member of COMPORDCRD ACCOUNT No INVOICE No AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

Head Office:
205 Braddel] Road
Singapore STUT0]

Kindly note that no recaipt shall be issusd unless requesied.
CUSTOMER'S COPY




Our Ref: CT18120641

comlort
Date: 31 December 2018 TR

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 22/12/2018 @ 10:30 hrs
ALONG CTE(CITY) BF BT TIMAH EXIT
INVOLVING SLW2798E

We refer to the above-menlioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration
number SHD3503E (the "Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to TAN KOK WENG (CHEN
GUORONG) IC NO S1789433A a registered hirer-operator of Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a
rental rate $125.40 per day (inclusive of GST),

Please be advised that the Taxl was Insured with India International Insurance Pte
Ltd on a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission o
undertake repairs for damage on the Tax arising from the said accident with a motor
warkshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

seltiement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. Mo signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 11848 Facsimile +65 68453 3183
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Enquire Vehicle Insurer

Vehicle Mo, incident Date/Time  Swearch Status lhaurance Company Cotde  lnsurance Comiparry Name

SLW2790E 22 Dec 2018/ 10:30:00 Successtu cot CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE] PTELTD
Previous QK



