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S1UBEAVE 1, #01-15 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18009007MFSH Date: 31 December 2018
Our Ref: CS/FC11802304%/Dad3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam.

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SLV 6346E

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 26/12/2018 at the premises of M/s KARZ WORK SOLUTIONS. and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$§  10.294.64
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 5,393.84
“Check” ltems Amount : 58 -
Market Value : S§ -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 -
Nett Value : S8 -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion.

Yours faithfully

Bryan Ang Tani
Motor Surveyor / Investigator



MS @ FirstCapital

M35 First Capital Insurbnge Limited Comeg b 1950000060 C3E e Mo H2-O0016T6-5
B Ratfies Quay 421-00 Singapose D4R580
Teh (656222 2311 Faw [B5) 6222 3547

Chaims & bartor Undewriting Dept: 36 Aobinson Road #16-01 City House Singapere 058877
Tel (BE) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) RS0T 3849
www.mﬂlrilcaﬂltal Cam.Lg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
24-12-2018 Our Ref No. D18008007MFSH
17-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHAT308G Third Party Vehicle. SLVE346E

53 UBI AVENUE 1 #02-24 PAYA UB] INDUSTRIAL PARK
DARREN NG

68445938/ 0 Fax No. 68442474

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: NO EST. COR (WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO
BE AGREED)

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Ce : Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

KARZ WORK SOLUTIONS Attention. NIL
MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.
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PRI Header Details

Claimant
Claim No D18009007MFSH Policy No D-18088936MFSH S.No & 1 & KARZ WO
Name
Survey
TS KARZ WORK SOLUTIONS facation 53 UBI AVENUE 1 #02-24 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
Name || (Contact Person : DARREN | 073 % | Mobile: 0, Phone: 68445938 , Fax: 68442474
NG) Det:;:‘ Emailld: KARZWORKS.SG@GMAIL.COM
Our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions | WITHOUT PREJUDICE: NO EST. COR (WE ADMIT LIABIL]
Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor | AGREED)
COMFORT TP
I d
N":m"': TRANSPORTATION PTE i':':;r:m SHA7398G Vehicle | SLV6346E
LTD Mo
| PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 24-12-2018 04:59:56 PM Appointed 26-12-2018 08:33:13 AM Accept 26-12-2018 0
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Survey Report Upload
Surveyor [ i :Phad
urveyor urvey =
I i -12-
nﬂsPe::.t ON | g Rebort Dk 26-12-2018 Report Choose File
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Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents
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Save |




Date Job Remarks Action

FINAL SUMMARY

Surveyor

Fm.al Surveyor | | i
Adjusted Fees '

Amount

{ Submit Assessment

Copyright © 2015 MS First Capital Insurance Limited (http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/). All rights reserved.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 31 December 2018 11:05 AM

To: 'CWS Maotor Claims'; assignments

Cc: 'Eileen Lee’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18009007MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18023049Dqd3.pdf

Dear Eileen,
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of 5LV 6346E.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6ba56-3561 | email: siewse@kkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December 2018 9:10 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18009007MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)
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From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmatorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December 2018 8:34 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKEAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims < wsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <Eileenlee msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18009007M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owener 10

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Ne.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
|ntended Deregistration Date:
‘ehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis No.:

M zcimum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid;

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date;
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PGP Paid;

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Transfer of swnership or deregistration is not allowed for this vehicle.
The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Dec 2018

Singapore NRIC
&442F

SLVA346E

Yes

28 Dec 2018
HONDA

CIVIC SIR 4M
Black

1997
B16A412000592
JHMEK4550WS001344
$21.185.00

23 Apr 1998

23 Apr 1998

&

$29.4659.00

Forfeited

$0.00

22 Apr 2028

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

£38,455.00

$36,023.00

$36,023.00



" KARZ

WORKS PTE LTD

53 UBI AVENUE 1 #01-23, PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
SINGAPORE 408934
(TEL)6 8445934 (FAX)68442474- (E-MAIL) KARZWORKSSG@GMAIL.COM

3RD PARTY CLAIM ESTIMATION

M/s First Capital Insurance Limited Vehicle number  SLV6346E
30 Robinson Road Make / Model HONDA CIVIC
#10-01/02 Robinson Towers Chassis number  JHMEK4550W5001344
Singapore 048546 Accident date 17-12-18

Reference KM1812-31
Qty Particulars Unit Price - SGD $

T S N N — T N —— T T T R N

1 SET
1 5E]
1 5ET]

5/MHao

PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS

FRONT BUMPER UPPER =histevarAl
FRONT BUMPER LOWER <A1 s A

FRONT LH SIDE RETAINER  Sv'e

FRONT BUMPER LH PROTECTOR Ci4
FRONT LH HEADLAMP S&r it | € sk
FRONT LH HEADLAMP BRACKET 3

FRONT REINFORCEMENT st

FRONT LH FENDER Daahr A

FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD o7\ et
FRONT GRILLE Wied

BONNET M

BONNET HINGE it

FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM s stwg

FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM BEARING D.vn.

FRONT LH LOWER ARM ol stvAs A 420 Lt 40
53@‘5‘%* Less 20%
Subtotal
Balance C/F
PARTS REPLACEMENT - SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
Balance B/F
SHOCK ABSORBER (AFTER MARKET) oftatwndsh
FRONT BUMPER CLIP W
FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP M 565 Jo
TYRE it
RIM fep —
BRAKE FUILD 4,y
Subtotal

Balance C/F
LABOUR AND MISCELLANEQOUS CHARGES
Balance B/F

CHECK FRONT WIRING AND LIGHTNING SYSTEM

856.90 —
798.50 —
102.00 #
223.30—
569.00 —
104.50 »
334.50 #
665.50 —
13400~
220.00 #
880.00 #
110.00 #
430.10 «
220.40 v
310.10 v—

5955.80
1191.16

4764.64
4764.64

Sve |~
1586-00
66-00 ':‘mll,-
60-00 20 |-
600.00 %
800.00 £
150.00 ¥

3170.00

7934.64

6Q.80 30|~
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2 |CHECK FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT
3 |REMOVE AND REPLACE FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS 200-68 150 |-
4 |PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS 100080 400 |~
5 |SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS Uf%ﬁ -bB 800-66 (oo |-
6 |APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS 156-60 40|~
Subtotal 2360.00
Grand total 10294.64
26 k‘VAFv/\"& CRLT AW, 53-;! 3 ‘3"{'
NA AhanA
lSan_ L|§ %200 [,-—




' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

EE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internaticnale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref ; CS/FCI18023049/Dgd3n2
01 YT HOUSESINGARORE 068677 ale ITeTeERG N”””“mmmmm
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHA 7398G Veh. Inspected 5LV 6346E
Policy No. D-1808B936MFSH Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D18003007MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 26/12/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CIVIC SIR c.c 1595
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Rea. 1998
Chassis No. JHMEK4550WS001344 Colour YELLOWY
Odometer 371868 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre 215/45 R16 GOODYEAR 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/45R16 GOODYEAR 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |21545R16 GOODYEAR 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/45R16 GOODYEAR 5mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/12/2018 [Inspection Date 26/12/2018
Survey held at KARZ WORK SOLUTIONS
53 UBI AVE 1 #02-24
PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
SINGAPORE 408934
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLV 6346E

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Req. Mo 190607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-8607198-R

Page No.:1of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition ‘E::Lr:::‘:?:n Our ﬁ;lj}untu-d
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER UPPER DISTORTED 856.90 B56.90
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER DISTCRTED 798.50 798.50
1|FRONT LH SIDE RETAINER SERVICEABLE 102.00 .
1|FRONT BUMPER LH PROTECTOR cuT 223.30 223.30
1|FRONT LH HEADLAMP SCRATCHED / CUT 568.00 569.00
1|FRONT LH HEADLAMP BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 104.50 -
1|FRONT REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 334,50 -
1|FRONT LH FENDER DENTED 665.50 665.50
1|FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD DEFORMED 131.00 131.00
1|FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 220.00 |
1|BONNET NOT NECESSARY 880.00 2
1|BONNET HINGE NOT NECESSARY 110.00 &
1|FRONT LH KNUCKLE ARM DISTORTED 430.10 430.10
1|FRONT LH KNMUCKLE ARM BEARING DAMAGED 22040 220.40
1|FRONT LH LOWER ARM DISTORTED 310.10 310.10
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,191.16 -840.96
4,764.64 3,363.84
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET SHOCK ABSORBER (AFTER MARKET}SN) DISTORTED 1.500.00 500.00
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIP (SN} NECESSARY 60.00 30.00
1|SET FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP (SN} NECESSARY 60.00 20.00
1|TYRE (SM) NOT NECESSARY G600.00 -
1|RIM {SN) TO REPAIR SEE B00.00 -
LABOUR
1|BRAKE FUILD (SN} NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
3.170.00 550.00
LABOUR
CHECK FRONT WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM. 60.00 30.00
CHECHK FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 150.00 60.00
EEE_?;E AND REPLACE FRONT UNDERCARRIAGE 200.00 150.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI8023049/Dgd3n2




TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. MNo. 19-9607198-R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page Mo .2 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF 1,000.00 600.00
THE REPAIR OF RIM.
SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS. 800.00 500.00
APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS. 150.00 40.00
2,360.00 1,480.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,294.64 5,393.84
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18023049/Dgd3n2

MARKET VALUE: $60,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $36,023.00=NETT VALUE: $23,977.00

ANG BRYAN TANI

Automotive Assessor [ Investigator

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made sobsly for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report,

Mo liability of respensibility whatsoever, in contact o tart, 15 accepted 1o any third party whe may reely on the Recor who
Report. in whols or in part, doos so b his of her own risk.

iy thard Doty

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI




