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Consultants

778"

.I.-_n‘ = : Pte Lid Company Registration No 199607 198R
S1UREAVE | #0225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (065) 625635361 FAX 1 (065) 62564315
Your ref: D1800899EMEFSH

Our ref: CS/FCLHIB022982/Uvd3 DATE: 4/1/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.S]JA 8579X
We thank for your instruction on 29/12/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle on 24/12/2018 at the premises of M/s ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5512,462.48

Revised Estimate Amount : §$6,000.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check"” Items Amount 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value i

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear

rear portion,

Comments/Present Status:;
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



MS‘ FirstCapital -

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580
Tel: (B5) 6222 311 Far (65) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited ce heg o, 1550001060 05T Beg Re. M2-0001676-9

Cladms & Hater Urderariting Cept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel (B5) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
wiw.mstirsteapital. comosg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person,
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

21-12-2018 Our Ref No
21-12-2018 Claim Type
SHB3232Y Third Party Vehicle

130 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD#08-1338
ELIN CAl

94507920/ 94507920 Fax MNo.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

. D18008988MFSH

. Third Party

. SJABSTOX

. 68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE

LTD Attention
MA TP Solicitor Fax No
SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

. NIL

. NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Job Sheet (/ClaimW5/Surveyor/JobSheet/247101) .:E- PRI Documents g.l Close b4

PRI Header Details

Claimant
Claim No D1B8008998MFSH Policy No D-1B088937MFSH S.No & 18& Z200M AU
Name
Z00M AUTOWERKS F
R e S a e Ko 130 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD#08-1339
NaME P (Contact Person : ELIN & Contact Mobile: 94507920 , Phone: 94507920 , Fax: 0
* : Emailld: ZOOMAUTOWERKS@GMAIL.COM
CAI Details
Our LKK AUTO CONSLULTANTS Instructions
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor
Insured Insured L
Name CITYCAB PTE LTD Vehicle No SHB3232Y :zhlt:l& SJIABSTO9X
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 21-12-2018 10:44:22 PM Appointed 24-12-2018 11:15:02 AM Accept 24-12-2018 0
Date Date Date
Survey Report Upload
Survayor Surveyor :E:::: e
1 cti 4-12-20 h i
nspection .__. Raport Data 24-12-2018 Repart Choose File
Date *: e ¥
Vehicle Particulars
Make Please Select Make Model Please Select Model Year Select Year
Chasis No | | Engine No || Mileage
Cubic
Solor ! Capacity I
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

Save




Date Job Remarks Action

FINAL SUMMARY
Surveyor ) B
Final Surveyor | |
Adjusted ] Fees | | Remarks
Amount

‘ Submit Assessment

Copyright © 2015 MS First Capital Insurance Limited (http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg/). All rights reserved.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

—=— ]
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 11:10 AM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims’
Cc 'Sithara’; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008998MFSH/1, SJA B579X
Attachments: SJA B579X PREL! ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJA 8579X
Date of survey: 24/12/2018
Number of days : 8 days

Best Regards,

Veran Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December 2018 8:53 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.comz>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008998MFSH/1, SJA 8579X

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJA 8579X on 24/12/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 December 2018 11:22 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@l|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008998MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gesignments@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
sent: Monday, 24 December 2018 11:15 AM
To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Molor_EIéims <cwsmotorclaims@mosfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008398M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Repards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AUG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December 2018 B:53 AM b
To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Sithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008938MFSH/, SJA B579X

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle STA 8579X on 24/12/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 December 2018 11:22 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmeotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara’ <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008998MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone; 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5{408933)

B L T L 3-"'*" ‘ T

MERRY & .ty £ = PEY e 5
32, CHR!E?&MAS.' BW YEAR'

T

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 24 December 2018 11:15 AM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM




Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirsteapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008398M FSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; - WWw.ave.com



12/26/2018

Used Toyota Coralla Car for Sale in Singapore, Prime Motar & Leasing - sgCarMart

sgC ARMART.COMM

New Cars

Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance

LOOKING FOR AN %.

L S
INDEPENDENT SPECIALIST? A

Articles

Login ¢

Find the specialty Works

altis

Home = Used Cars.» Frime Mot

Resources

Car Buying

Car Selling

Car Ownership

Car Aftermarket

On The Move

Lifestyle

Il

I
s e

. lpﬁtﬂEﬂQE .

Ing » Toyeta Corolla Altis 1,64 (D0E 4l 12/2021)

Toyota Corolla Altis 1.6A (COE till 12/2021)

Financial Accessories Similar Research

* PRIME CAR RENTAL & TAXI SERVICES PTE LTD » SE

Add to Shortlist
Car Detalls
Price
Depreciation

Reg Date

Manufactured
Mileage
Transmission
Engine Cap
Road Tax

Power

Curb Weight

Features

Accessories

Description

COE
oMV
ARF
Dereg Value

MNo. of Owners

Type of Veh

v | Depreciation ¥ | | > 10 year(: ¥ | -‘u"f:hic!e' Type ¥

Photos

Map

. PRIME MOTOR & LEASING g

ICHENG YONG CREDIT ENTERPRISES PTE LTD GROUP OF COMPANIES)

Add te Compare Add a Nate Report Error
520,500
$6,900 fyr o
15-Dec-2006

(2yrs 11mths 1Bdays COE left)

2006

Auto
1,508 cc
£890 fyr

81.0 kW (108 bhp)
View specs of the Toyota Corolla Altis (2000-2007)

1,115 kg

3RS Airbags, ABS, Reliable And Fuel Efficient 1,6L VWTI
Engire, Climate Cantrol Aircon, Multi Function Steering,

Leather Seats, Sports Rims, Audio System.

Elegant Toyota Altis, Low Fuel Consumption, Low
Maintenance Cost, Very Well Maintained, Drive away
With Minimum Dawn Payment, Flexible In-house Loan
Packages Avallable,

$25,636

515,498

517,048

£15,227 as of today {change)
2

Fhd-5Sized Sadan

hitps:/iwww.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=754628400L=1292

QOO0 OO

Location Map

Company

Address

Location

Office No

Contact Person(s)

CTION CREDIT & MOTOR LEASING PTE LTD « BEST PETROL AND DIESEL SUPPLY PTE LTD »

Prime
w Jaale
» 105y
dvallabl

31 Wes
Search

West G
67782,

Danny
Roy
1/3
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Used Toyota Corolla Car for Sale in Singapora, Heng Wei Mators Pte Ltd - sgCarMart

SGCARMART.CONM

New Cars

altis
Home » Used Cars » Heng Wei
Resources
Car Buying

Car Selling
Car Ownership
Car Aftermarket

On The Move

Lifestyle

Car Tyres

Sell My Car

Motors Ple Lid'» Toyota Corgl

Price Range v

Directory

Products

Insurance

sl

e e i B e o el o

Articles

Login ¢

Find the unique car number pfaté that

Ha Altks 1,64 (COE till 042022

Toyota Corolla Altis 1.6A (COE till 04/2022)

Financial

Add to Shortlist

Price
Depreciation

Reg Date

Manufactured
Mileage
Transmission
Engine Cap
Road Tax

Power

Curb Weight

Features

Accessories

Description

COE

oMV

ARF

Dereg Value
Mo. of Owners
Type of Veh
Category

Availability

Add to Compare

£21,800
£6,520 fyr

02-May-2007

Accessories

T
Depreciation ¥ = 10 year(: ¥
Similar Research
Add a Mote Report Error

(3yrs 4mths 4days COE left)

2007

148,000 km (12.7k fyr)

Auto
1,598 cc
$B16 Jyr

81.0 kW (108 bhg)

View specs of the Toyota Corolla Alts (2000-2007)

1,115 kg

Toyota 16V DOHC Vvti Engine, Smoath Auto ECT
Transmission, Dual SRS Airbags, ABS, Digital Climate

Contral Aircon, Etc,

All Original, Sports Rims, Leather Seats, Toyota Audio
System Cfw Woofer, Retractable Side Mirrors, Solar
Film, Reverse Sensor, Steering Control,

£ Owiners, Best Excellent Altis In Town! All Major Parts
Incleding New Paint, Suspension, Fan Belt, Compressor,
Etc Are Changed During COE Renewal. Trade-
infBank/In-house Loan Available. View Now, Thanks!

$25,115
£14,924

$16,417

516,803 as of today (change)

2
Mid-5ized Sedan
{COE Car

Available

hitps:fwww.sgearmart com/used_cars/info php?ID=784506400L=3233

P00 00O

Photos

Vehicle Type YN

Map

More Actions

Click here to start the hunt

Shart

ler Information

Company

Address

Location

Contact Person(s)

Useful Services

Heng
» feale
» 5oyt

15 Coar
>earch

Commg

Mr Ong
Tony

= Afraid of ler

WS i LA ey

gﬁ this car eval

12



12/26/2018 Used altis Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COM Login ¢
New Cars g Ca Sell My Car Directary Products Insurance Articles F
- SELL
L _—
Post an Advertisement 2017 M/Benz CLALSO @ $108,800 Only! 1.98%: Int Rate! F’/AE

Ag Mipradian |

Sall it yourself! Advertise it at just

£58 until it's SOLD!

Auta Zoom Enterprise

Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Salling
|Browse by Category 7| «Back (123456 ) Next » Sort by Date Posted
115 vehicles attis o - B ] : N
Madel Price Depreciation Eng Cap Mileage "
Search Selection  altis Adly Any > ‘“cﬁ‘"f‘} Any Any
Toyota Corolla Altis 1.6A (New 539,888 £7,970 fyr 15-Dec-2008 1,598 cc 160,000 km

S-yr COE)

Vehicle Well Maintained! Original Paintwork And Interior! Refiable Engine! No Major Repairs Needed! Low Depreciation! Na Chligations!
Bank Loans Available! Kindly Contact Our Sales Advisor ...

Tags: 2008 Toyata Corolla, 2008 toyota corodla, Toyota Carclia, toyeta corolla, Toyota, Corclia, corolta, Used

Posted: 30-Nov-2018 o
= fees-201 Toyota

Toyota Corolla Altis 1.6A (COE 515,998 §8,750 Jyr 24-0ct-2005 1,598 cc -
till 10/2020)

Be Our Next Lucky Client To Own This Quality Pre-Omed Vehicle At Most Reasonable And Affordable Price. Rock Solid Altis! Fuel Consu
1akm/L. Very High Paper Valug! Minimum Controlled Lost! 5T...

Pustod: 28-Nov-2018 Tags: 2003 Toyota Corolla, 2005 toyota corolla, Toyota Corolla, tovots corolla, Tayota, Carolla, coralla, Used
sted: S

Toyota Corolla Altis 1.64 (New 529,800 $5,960 fyr 10-5ep-2008 1,598 cc 126,000 km
S5-yr COE)

52K Down Payment On Top OF Asking Price. 100% Flexible Loan Options Available! Lowest Price With Lowest Depreciation At $6K Per ¥
0, No Gimmicks! We Only Put Up The Gaod Condition Unit ...

Tags: 2008 Toyota Corolla, 2008 toyota corolly, Tayeta Corolls, tovota coroia, Toyota, Corolla, corolla, Used

Posted: 259-Nov-2018 Toyota

Toyota Corolla Altis 1.64A $47,900 85,130 fyr 29-Apr-2008 1,598 cc 75,000 km
Elegance {OPC) (COE till
04/2028)

1 Owner Only, Low Mileage For A 10 Years Old Car, Recently Just Serviced. Superb Car For Dally Usage. Super Reliable Toyota Corolla #
Immaculate Condition Inside Out. Conslgnment Unit, Sefling Wi...

Prem Roy Motoring

Tags: 2008 Toyota Corolla, 2008 toyota corolla, Toyeta Corolla, toyota corolia, Toyota, Corolla, corolla, Used

Posted: 26-Nov-2013 Theta

GETYOUR Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

COE Getting your COE renewed is easy, fast and affordable. We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it. Get the cheapest loan in toy
RENEWAL approval in 2 days withaut effort! Enquire today.
LOAN

Compars ta Corolla Altis 1.6A (COE =~ $29,888 56,300 fyr 24-Sep-2008 1,598 cc 123,352 km

hitps:/fwww.sgcarman. com/used _cars/listing.php?BRSR=1008MOD=altisARP G=208A\V1L=28VEH=08RGD=10 113



1212RI201A PARFIMME Rahala Frmiing

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID;
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Cutput;
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

FARF Eligihility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Singapore NRIC
3468E

SJABS579X

No

26 Dec 2018

TOYOTA

COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 AUTO
Silver

2007

3274697564
MRO53ZEC107155259
81.0kW (108 bhp)
$14,757.00

26 Dec 2007

26 Dec 2007

2

$16,233.00

Forfeited

$0.00

25 Dec 2022

A - Car (1600cc & below)
5

$21,349.00

$17,057.00

$17,057.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-
registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever
is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Dec 2018

OK

NIIRS./VEL I gov.eg/itanT racuon'enguirg Kenpane By FUDICEeTorBLereginpul LN 1IN IU=Fugdusuudn i



ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD

— e 130 Bedok Reservoir Road
== == Ei== #08-1339 Singapore 470130
= " = Tel: 9450 7920
AUTD * zoomautowerks@gmall.com
02 January 2019
D.OA: 21 December 2018 o # M VA i
OWNER : CHEW PENG SAN At A
REG NO. : SJA B579 X 71
MAKE/MODEL: TOYOTA ALTIS i
ESTIMATED REPAIR COST FOR THE VEHICLE MENTIONED ABOVE )
ory DESCRIPTION AMT(SS)
LIST ITEMS _
1 Rear windscreen moulding g - 89.50
1 Rear boot lid $ KA T33.80 -
2 Rear boot hinges L Y, 13380 >
2 Rear boot lamps s g 379.30 .
1 Rear boot lock 5 126.70
i Rear boot lock catch $ 66.90
1 Rear boot logo 5 M 3850 <
1 Rear boot "COROLLA" emblem % LA 4740~
i Rear boot "ALTIS" emblem $ AU 38.60
1 Rear boot "1.6" emblem : AL 32.40
i Rear boot "E" emblem $ LA 31.50
1 Rear boot "VWWT-" emblem $ g.AL 3650
1 Rear boot outer chrome moulding % i 158.50
1 Rear boot number plate garnish $ o7 16590 o
2 Rear boot number plate lamps § A A 84.40 ¥
2 Rear talllamps -3 €A 72190
2 Rear taillamp panels $ P/t C g9790c
2 Rear apron panels $ Lery 179.90-
1 Rear end panel 62e./0 $ 0D 77730 —
1 Rear end panel inner garnish $: Ze 89.80
1 Rear bumper _ % I 486.60.
2 Rear bumper brackets §q4T $p/Chey  117.00 (2
2 Rear bumper side retainers $ A 73.80_
1 Rear floor panel $'f"-,a«~'__«,:m‘f itd. §47.20 .-
1 Rear floor board $ “Tira 186.90.
i Rear exhaust silencer s ro 589.70
2 Rear exhaust mountings 3 4 58.40 -
2 Rear fenders $ /' 157520
2 Rear fender air gates 5 of 175.00
2 Rear fender inner shields $ "1 11120 ¥
2 Rear fender inner trims LES.9 5 r.,_"'; Ts:4 BTABO (A
: $ 9.431.30
Less 25% % 2,357.83
$ 7,073.48
0
PAGE10OF2 : 1
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SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

Rear windscreen sealant
Rear apron panel reverts
Rear bumper clip {1 set)

Rear reverse sensor (1 set)

LABOUR CHARGES

To remove, replaced damaged lamps and check up rear wiring.

To remove and refit inner garnishes.

To rermove and refit rear reverse sensor.

To transfer boot lid mechanism and wiring assembly.

To remove and refit rear windscreen glass.

To remove, refit and replace exhaust silencer and mountings.
To apply undercoating.

Panel beating.

To re-spray painting on the affected areas.

GRAND TOTAL :

PAGE 2 0F 2

c/f:

7.073.48

80.00 "

34.00 °

4500
350.00 ) )

W P BB

509.00

80.00 ©.
150.00 /7
150.00 (7
120.00 /,
180.00 .
150.00 -
250.00,C

2,000.00 /¢,
1,800.00 /.

Wl o B B B B W B

4,880.00




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315

Reg. Mo 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Autemobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref . CS/FCI18022982/Uvd3n2
416,01 1T HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 e Srenae Nl‘l‘”mwmmm
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHE 3232Y Veh. Inspected SJA B5T9X
Policy No. D-18088937MFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18008998MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SITHARA Assign Date 24/12/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA COROLLAALTIS(A) |e.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. MRO53ZEC 107155259 Colour GREY
Odometer 229631 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R1S BFGOODRICH 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 BEFGOODRICH & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[195/65R15 BFGOODRICH & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[195/65R15 BFGOODRICH & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  21/12/2018 [Inspection Date 24/12/2018
Survey held at 15 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4# 01-53
Repairer ZOOM AUTOWERKS PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS GONDUGCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTH"-'1P-TED NORMAL FERIOD FOR REPAIR:

8 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
£4 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJA B579X
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |/ Chop {gj} {SJ}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR WINDSCREEM MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 89.50 5
1|REAR BOOT LID RENT / BUCKLED 733.80 733.80
2|REAR BOOT HINGES TO REPAIR SEE 133.80 z
LABOUR
2|REAR BOOT LAMPS CRACKED 379.30 379.30
1|REAR BOOT LOCK TWISTED 126.70 126.70
1|REAR BOOT LOCK CATCH NOT MNECESSARY B85.90 -
1|REAR BOOT LOGO NOT NECESSARY 38.50 =
1|REAR BOOT "COROLLA" EMBLEM MECESSARY 47 .40 47 .40
1|REAR BOOT "ALTIS* EMBLEM NECESSARY 38.60 3860
1|REAR BOOT "1 6" EMBLEM NECESSARY 32,40 32 40
1|REAR BOOT "E" EMBLEM MECESSARY 31.50 31.50
1|REAR BOOT "WT-I" EMBLEM NECESSARY 36 50 36.50
1|REAR BODT OUTER CHROME MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 158.50 -
1|REAR BOOT NUMBER PLATE GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 165.90 .
2|REAR BOOT NUMBER PLATE LAMPS NOT NECESSARY 84,40
2|REAR TAILLAMPS CRACKED 72180 721.90
Z|REAR TAILLAMP PANELS DENTED / 847 90 B97.90
BUCKLED
Z|REAR APRON PAMELS BENT 179.90 178.90
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED 777.30 620.10
1|REAR END PANEL INNER GARNISH TWISTED 89.80 89.80
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 486.60 48660
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKETS M/S BENT 117.00 5B8.50
2|REAR EUMPER SIDE RETAINERS BENT 73.80 73.80
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL CRUMPLED / 647.20 B47.20
BUCKLED
1|REAR FLOOR BOARD TORN 186.90 186.90
1|REAR EXHAUST SILENCER TO REPAIR SEE 588.70 -
LABOUR
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS NOT NEGESSARY 58.40 ;
2|REAR FENDERS TO REPAIR SEE 1,575.20 .
LABOUR

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18022982/Uvd3n2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

el mm m 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =8 rkshop?;}} t_,’l}
2|REAR FENDER AIR GATES NOT NECESSARY 175.00 -
2|REAR. FENDER INNER SHIELDS NOT NECESSARY 111.20 -
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIMS N/S TORN 579.80 289.90
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 2,357.82 1,419.67
7,073.48 4,258.03
ETTIT
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
4|REAR APRON PANEL REVERTS (SN) NECESSARY 34.00 34.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 45.00 45.00
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 350.00 200.00
509.00 279.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,REPLACED DAMAGED LAMPS AND CHECK 80.00 30.00
UP REAR WIRING.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INNER GARNISHES. 150.00 80.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR REVERSE SENSOR 150.00 50.00
TO TRANSFER BOOT LID MECHANISM AND WIRING 120.00 60.00
ASSEMBLY
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS NOT NECESSARY 180.00
TO REMOVE REFIT AND REPLACE EXHAUST SILENCER 150.00 60,00
AND MOUNTINGS.
TO APPLY UNDERCOATING 250.00 100.00
PANEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 2,000.00 1,400.00
BOOT HINGES,REAR EXHAUST SILENCER AND REAR
FENDERS.
TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE AFFECTED AREAS. 1,800.00 1,200.00
4 880.00 2.980.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,462.48 7,518.03
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18022982/Uvd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $24,500.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $17,057.00=NETT VALUE: $7,443.00

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER GF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

Mo liab#ity of responsibility whatsoever, bn contact of torl |s accented to any third pany whom
Repert. in wivobe or in par, does S0 at his or her own risk.

ri. Ay third party




