Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 July, 2019 8:24 AM

To: Claims Dept

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K

DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG18022965/Gha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Tony,
We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that Joy is no longer with LKK and we are currently in the midst of seeking for mandate approval
to our principal.

We will expedite and will get back to you for an update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F EFE” =

RERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 25 July, 2019 8:00 PM

To: 'Claims Dept'; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Dear Joy,
Our client is chasing the payment. Kindly advise payment ASAP.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong



Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699
p- +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

The all-new Audi Q8

Welcome to the 8th Dimension:

Learn more

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 6:53 PM

To: 'Claims Dept'; 'Joy Irene (LKKAuto)'; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Admin A'; 'CS A Team'; 'Claims Dept'

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 ***
LKK REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Importance: High

Dear Joy,
Any update on the payment?
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699
p- +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223



The all-new Audi Q

Welcome to the 8th Dimension.

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 8:37 AM

To: 'Claims'; 'Joy Irene (LKKAuto)'; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Admin A'; 'CS A Team'; 'Claims Dept'

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 ***
LKK REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Dear Irene,
Kindly assist follow up on approval from AIG.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Tony Foong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699
p. +65 6366 2323, d. +65 67689911

e.mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 AIexanc_Ira Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

The all-new Audi Q

Welcome to the th Dimension.

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 9:09 PM

To: 'Joy Irene (LKKAuto)'; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'
Cc: 'Admin A'; 'CS A Team'; 'Claims'




Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 ***
LKK REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Dear Irene,
Above attachment is for your perusal. We will pass the LOD to Adrian by hand shortly.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Your closes
on the roa
The new Aud

Find out more

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 11:25 AM

To: NORA ; 'Claims Dept’; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Nora,
With reference to the subject.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by parties involved, the liability is
clear.

The final repair cost is subject to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident
and approval of the insurer.

The days for losses(use and/or rental) will be based on the number of days of repair recommended by our
surveyor.



Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis and does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client’s vehicle. Contents herein should not be construed as an admission of any liability,
confirmation of damages whatsoever to the insured/insurer’s part.

Furthermore, this e-mail should not be regarded as a waiver by AlG of their rights to repudiate the claim
should there be future discovery of any breach of policy terms and conditions committed by their driver or
insured.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: NORA [mailto:nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 8:59 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Mei Kwan
(LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Importance: High

Dear Joy,

Please update status. Our client called up your insured on Friday evening and was informed that the report has been
done.
Appreciate if you can check the system again.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Norah Khai
Claims Manager

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (regNo 199902271w)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9827 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims @premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223



11D

I he all=-new Audi Q2

#untaggable

http://www.audi.com.sg/sea/brand/sg/audi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-q2-
2017.html

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 2:42 PM

To: NORA ; 'Claims Dept’; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Hi Nora,

No GIA available yet.

Our insured did not answer my call earlier to follow-up.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: NORA [mailto:nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 12:56 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Mei Kwan
(LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G18022965/JA3

Hi Joy,



Can | have the follow up on this case please. Any good news on your side.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Norah Khai
Claims Manager

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p- +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9827 f. +65 6841 1183
e. claims @ premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Smgapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

11D

e all=-new Audi Q.2

ﬁuntaggable

http://www.audi.com.sg/sea/brand/sqg/audi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-q2-
2017.html

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 1:55 PM

To: NORA ; 'Claims Dept'; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** | KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Nora,

Status is pending insured’s GIA report.

We just called our insured where he confirmed reversing. However, there is no GIA report yet.

According to him, due to the wiped out details of his Driving Licence(DL) front portion , he was required by the
reporting centre for a clear copy in which he is unable to provide right away.

He is still waiting for the release of his new DL. Hence, pending GIA report.

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: NORA [mailto:nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 1:34 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Mei Kwan
(LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Hi Joy,
Please update status urgently.
Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Norah Khai
Claims Manager

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9827 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims @premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Smgapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Qoo

The all-new Audi Q2

#untaggable

http://www.audi.com.sqg/sea/brand/sg/audi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-q2-
2017.html

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 10 January 2019 1:22 PM
To: NORA ; 'Claims Dept’; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)




Cc: Admin A; CS A Team
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** | KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Hi Nora,
No insured GIA available as per checking.
We will follow-up.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: NORA [mailto:nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 10 January 2019 12:36 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Mei Kwan
(LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Importance: High

Hi Joy,
Please advise liability clearance please. Has your insured file the accident report ?

Kind Regards,

Norah Khai
Claims Manager

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p- +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9827 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims @ premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223




11D
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#untaggable

http://www.audi.com.sg/sea/brand/sg/audi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-q2-
2017.html

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: NORA [mailto:nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sq]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 5:21 PM

To: 'Joy Irene (LKKAuto)'; 'Claims Dept’; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Admin A'"; 'CS A Team'

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/]A3

HI Joy,

Our client call up your insured and he mentioned that he has done the accident report. Kindly check and revert back
urgently.

Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Norah Khai
Claims Manager

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd regNo 199902271w)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9827 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims @premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

11D

I he all=-new Audi| QZ2

#untaggable

http://www.audi.com.sg/sea/brand/sg/audi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-q2-
2017.html

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
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If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 10:20 AM

To: Claims Dept; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kee,
To date, no GIA available or being shared for our reference.
We are to follow-up if reporting was done.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 7 January 2019 7:03 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene
(LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/A1G18022965/JA3

Dear all,
Kindly assist to check if your insured have filed the report urgently.

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (regNo 199902271w)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e._claims @premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

11
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#untaggable

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 10:08 AM

To: Claims Dept

Cc: SUR; Admin A; CS A Team; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** | KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Norah,
We tried to call Ol. The phone was switched off.

We will try later.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 8:50 AM

To: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has yet to report the accident till date.

12



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 3 January, 2019 9:20 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Importance: High

Dear Joy,
Any update of liability clearance? Owner had chasing us and she is very unhappy on it.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Justin Ee
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p- +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183
e. claims @ premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Qoo

The all-new Audi Q2

#untaggable

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 9:08 AM

To: Claims Dept

Cc: SUR; Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** | KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

13



Dear Kee Siang,

Please be informed that we are pending copy of AlG insured’s GIA report.
We will check if insured has reported.

Kindly hold.

Thank you.

Happy New Year!

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 7:55 AM

To: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Dear all,
Kindly assist to check liability clearance status. We need an update urgently.
Thank you and Happy New Year,

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg No 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p- +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims @ premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

14
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Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sq]

Sent: Monday, 31 December 2018 2:53 PM

To: 'Joy Irene (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'SUR'; 'Admin A'; 'Claims Dept'; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** | KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Importance: High

Dear Joy,

Good day.

Any update of this case? Owner is chasing us. Please kindly assist.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Justin Ee

Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (regNo 199902271w)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p- +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims @ premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

11D

The all=new Audi Q

#untaggable

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you
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From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sq]

Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 9:40 AM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'; 'Joy Irene (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'SUR'; 'Admin A'

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

Dear Mei Kwan,

Kindly refer to our attach file with Guo Xiang marking.
Thank you.

Dear Joy,

Please kindly advice us the liability clearance of this case.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Justin Ee
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd regNo 199902271w)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims @premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Smaore 159938 p- +65 6836 2223

11D

I he all=-new Audi Q2

#untaggable

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 24 December 2018 1:19 PM

To: Claims

Cc: SUR; Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018 *** | KK
REF: CC3/AIG18022965/JA3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
No attachment found. Kindly resend.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 24 December, 2018 12:46 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 2502 M AND YOUR INSURED SKL 42 K DATED ON 22/12/2018

Good afternoon all,

Here is the correct estimate attached for your kind reference .
Kindly ignore the previous email estimate .

Thank you .

Best Regards,
Phua
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd reg No 199902271w)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +
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I he all-new Audi Q.2 |

Huntaggable

223

0 AL

65 6836 2

| & |

http://www.audi.com.sg/sea/brand/sg/audi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-q2-

2017.html

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you
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