5/20/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

FW: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK
REF: CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3q2

Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Wed 5/20/2020 4:06 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

0 10 attachments (276 KB)

image005.emz; image009.emz; image013.emz; image014.emz; image017.emz; image018.emz; image021.emz; image022.emz; image024.wmz;
AAD1403-003-lod.pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Asher

As spoken, enclosed is the LOD for your action.

Please take note that we already pass over to our solicitors Joseph Gay & Co to handle this case.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 22 November, 2019 4:23 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'claims@transcab.com.sg' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3q2

Importance: High

WITHOUT PPREJUDICE

Dear Vic
Please refer to the above subject matter, are there any offer making to us?

Your insured vehicle was involving an accident hit onto the railings, after the accident your client tyre had rolled into our taxi
lane and our driver’s immediately applied brake to avoid but not available and run over the tyre that causing damage in front
of our taxi.

Hope you can review this matter and let us have your best offer.

Circumstances of Accident

On 01.03.2014 at about 0330hrs, | was traveling straight at the 3rd lane along PIE towards Airport (13.2km) when suddenly a
tyre rolled into my lane. | immediately applied brake to avoid the collision but to no avail, the tyre hit onto my taxi's front portion
and | run over into it. Upon alighted, the tyre belong to Vehicle B (SKF&6400C) which was invalved in an accident that hit onto
the railings. Vehicle A: 1 passenger Vehicle B: 1 passenger /rc
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5/20/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 23 August, 2019 5:40 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'jasminetan’ <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team'
<cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3qg2

Without Prejudice
Dear Vic
Please refer to above mention case.

May we have an update on the latest claim settlement for this case?

Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS CAB SERVICES PTELTD
MNo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg /'-wcag
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This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its
contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines.
The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July, 2019 5:11 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; jasminetan@transcab.com.sg;
claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3q2

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

Please refer to above mention case.

May we have an update on the latest claim settlement for this case?
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD

MNo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.iranscab.com.sg ﬂcag

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its
contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines.
The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 3:14 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3q2

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

Please refer to above mention case.

Are there any offer given to us for this case?
Attached LOD and GIA report for your easy reference.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307
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*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 43, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg ﬂcag

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its
contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines.
The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May, 2019 5:54 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3qg2

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

Please refer to the above mention case.

May we have an update on the latest claim settlement for this case?
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapors SH 111

rF

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg /"‘C“g

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its
contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines.
The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 25 March, 2019 10:23 AM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team'
<cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3q2

Without Prejudice
Dear Vic
Please refer to the above mention case.

Any offer given to us for this case?

Thank You
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Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
MNo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Cingapora 569111
Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg /—..C“g

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its
contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines.
The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 February, 2019 10:28 AM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3q2

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic

Please refer to the preceding email

May we have an update on the latest claim settlement for this case?
Attached LOD and GIA report for your reference.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

NQTF LL LS L9087 77

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg ﬁcag

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its
contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines.
The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 20 December, 2018 4:42 PM

To: 'Vic (LKKAuto)' <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; ‘claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0O019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3qg2

Without Prejudice

Dear Vic
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Please refer to the above mention case.

Any updates on this case?

Attached LOD and GIA report for your reference.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
MNo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
Main Line: (65) 6287 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg /-scag

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have

received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its
contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines.
The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November, 2018 2:37 PM

To: calvin.er <calvin.er@transcab.com.sg>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3q2

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3q2 Vic - 6841 2096

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: calvin.er <calvin.er@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 19 November, 2018 11:28 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3q2
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Without Prejudice

Dear Mei

We are making a claim against the owner of SKF6400C

Enclose is our GIA report and LOD for your perusal and action.
Original hard copy to be mailed to you by post.

We hope you can review this case and let us have your best offer.
Thank You

Best Regards,

Calvin Er

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.307

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
MNo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg /“cai

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its
contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines.
The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 5 April, 2018 1:33 PM

To: jonas.ong <jonas.ong@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg; CS A Team <cs-a@l|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0019G on 1/3/2014 *** LKK REF:
CC3/CAI14004145/Kha3qg2

Dear Jonas,
Thank you for your email.

Please provide us LOD.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jonas.ong [mailto:jonas.ong@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 4 April, 2018 1:48 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: TCS REF: AAD1403-003-- Pending settlement with vehicle SHD0O019G on 1/3/2014

Dear Sir/Madam,

May | know what is the latest settlement regarding the case mentioned above?
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Kindly update as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jonas Ong

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, \Jingapora 569111
Main Line: (65) 6287 646466 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.franscab.com.sg /ﬁcag

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its

contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened for response deadlines
The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWWw.avg.com
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