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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 June 2020 3:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: [Request for Re-open Case & Seek Mandate] AXA Ref: P1385770 //LKK REF: 

CC3/AXA14013995/Kpa3-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ4349H(OI) AND SHF505J 

ON 17/07/2014]

Attachments: EMAIL TO AXA.pdf; AAD1407-208 - LOD.pdf; LKK Survey Report.pdf

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

 

Please proceed.  

 

Thanks 

 
Regards 

  
___________________________________________________ 

Stacey Ng | Manager, Motor Claims Department 

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg 

Email:stacey.ng@axa.com.sg  

Customer Care No. 1800 8804888 

 

We remain available to serve you during the circuit breaker period. For AXA’s COVID-19 updates & initiatives, 

please visit https://www.axa.com.sg/covid-19-updates. 

       

 

Please consider the environment before printing this message 

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is 

prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately. 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, June 12, 2020 4:17 PM 

To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] [Request for Re-open Case & Seek Mandate] AXA Ref: P1385770 //LKK REF: 

CC3/AXA14013995/Kpa3-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGJ4349H(OI) AND SHF505J ON 17/07/2014] 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We have temporary close our file on year 2015 due to no submission of LOD/documents from third party. 

 

Now, third party had submitted the LOD and documents as attached. 

 

In view of this, kindly assist to re-open the case and let us have you mandate to settle the matter at $ (all-in). 

Breakdown as follows: - 

 

Liability: 50% (Conflicting Version) 

 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,636.15 
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2. Loss of Rental (5days x $133.75) $    668.75 

3. Loss of Income (5days x $50.00) $    250.00 

 $ 7,554.90 

@ 50% $ 3,777.45 

3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $         6.00 

Total $ 3,783.45 

 

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction. 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 

 

-----Disclaimer----- 

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are 

not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have 

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this 

message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other 

entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  

-----Disclaimer----- 

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are 

not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have 

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this 

message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other 

entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by  

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any  

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is  

prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify  

the sender immediately. 





Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd 
 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63    
 

Tel No.: 6287 6666   Fax No. 6281 1400 
 

Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K 
 

       

Authorization To Act 

       

We, Trans-cab Services Pte Ltd of Company Registration No. 200303878K hereby authorize 

Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd to act on behalf to claim for all losses incurred for the 

accident involving SHF0505J and SGJ4349H along Scotts Road on 17/07/14 07:40 PM. 

       

In addition, we also hereby authorize the above payment to be made in favour of Trans-cab 

Auto Services Pte Ltd upon settlement. 

       

Dated this 16 (day) of June 2020 

       

 
 

 



17/06/2020

20,5119.91

Token Sum 5 50.00

5 133.75

505050








