Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 July 2019 1:07 PM

To: Jia Le (LEK Auto)

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR7569S & SJQ5647T ON 20.12.2018 [External
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Jia Le,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:Jiale@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 July, 2015 11:02 AM

To: MT_Claim_5SG

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIR75695 & SIQ5647T ON 20.12.2018

Dear Sirs/Madam,
Kindly let us have your approval/instruction as third party Is chasing,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Jia Le [LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 19 July 2019 12:16 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR75695 & SJQ5647T ON 20.12.2018



Lonpac Ref: 18/1 8/18/VP05/021247
LKK Ref; CC4/LPC18022932/Udb3
Dear Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

we have highlighted to your good office on 27/12/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This Is @ head-ta-rear collision. Liabllity is not in our driver's favour,

summary fo offer to third party repairer, “PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD" is s follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair $3.931.23 $ 2.100.00
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $180.00) | § 540.00 $ 380.00 (3days x $120.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $§ 745 $ 7.45
Total | § 4,478.68 $2467.45

**0D4days recommendation for repair,
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

f val

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 January 2015 10:56 AM

To: Shu Pej (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_5SG <mt_claim®lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIR7569S & SJQ5647T ON 20.12.2018

Dear Shu Pej,

Attached copy of insured 's GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent:; Friday, 11 January, 2019 10:20 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIR7569S & S1Q5647T ON 20.12.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@(kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, ¥02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shu Pel [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 December 2018 8:26 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Ce: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR75695 & SJQ5647T ON 20.12.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle S)Q 5647T at M/s Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP estimated cost of repair
. Preliminary advice
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Fhone: 6366-0055 | emall: chupel@lkkautp.com | fax; 6741-2108

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LEKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 December 2018 12:52 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh{@lanpac.com>; assignments <assignments®@lkkauto.com>
Cec: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIR75695 & 5)05647T ON 20.12.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS.
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Aulo Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gasignments@ kkouto.com | fox: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Friday, 21 December 2018 12:49 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@|kkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_56G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Aun Teng <aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIR75695 & 5)Q5647T ON 20.12.2018

Our Ref :18/18/18/VP05/021247

Dear Catherine,

Please see attached and proceed with the survey.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all { ¥ | lonpac.com.sg
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Date oz2i01.2019

Your Ref : SIRT5695
Our Ref : D356/5JQ5647T/TR/PC/1218

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
300 Beach Road

#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Attn : Motor Claims Depr.

Dear SirMadam

A INVOLVIN 7 7
QUAY

We refer 10 the above acadent

The accident was caused solely by the neghigence of vour msured and as a result. we had
mcurred the following Cosis and Losses: -

Costs of Repair (Lump Sum) $ 2,100 00
Rental Fee (3 dayvs a1 S180/day) £ S4000
LTA TP Search Fee $§ 745
Claimed Amoum £2.64745

Enclosed are the supporting documents for your perusal
Invoice (356

Rental Agreement/Receipt

LTA Tax Invoice/Receipt

GIA Repon for 8JQS647T

Cernficate of Insurance

Sansfaction Voucher

Letter of Authority and Indemnity

Letter of Authority

B0 ~1 O A e W —

Please let us hear from vou within the next 14 days

Yours faithfully

PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD



—

Premium Carz

Services Pre Lid

Co. Reg. No.: 201418720C
1 Kaki Bukit Ava B #0180 Aulobay@Kaki Bukil Singapors 417683
Tel | 8838 9100 Fax - 68369113

LETTER OF AUTHORITY AND INDEMNITY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. 5 06 5647+ T anp = W TSLEAS
AT/ALONG _CLawy auvay

ON

1> pay PEZeEMONTH 291%  YEAR

i}

hj

€)

dl

e)

L]

I'We. the owner of vehicle no._2 W SEMHT hereby instruce and suthorize you 1o commence
repair 10 the said vehicles.

You are further suthorized to sppoint solicitors on my/our behall and give the solicitors full
instructions as if the appointment are given by me/us with respect 10 the conduct of my/our claims
against third party driver and/or his insurers including if necessary, to commence legal proceedings in
Court in my/our name against the third party,

You have my/our [ull suthority to instruct my/our solicitors 1 negotiste s settlement with the third
party and/or his insurers on such terms as you deem fit Upon settlement of my claim, vou are
suthorized to sign any Discharge Youcher or any document 10 confirm my scceptance of the settlement
as full and final discharge of my claim, on my behalf.

Lipon resolving my/our ¢laim, you are authorized 10 agree with my/our solicitors on the amount of their
professional cost and disbursements for scting for me/us and to relieve payment of the balance of the
settlement sum on myfour behalf directly into your account.

In the event that, l/'we am/are reguired to attend at my/our solicitors® office or to attend court in
connection to my/our claim, lwe shall render full co-operation,

In the event that my/our elaim against the third party and/or his insurers Is Not successful or cunnot be
proceeded with, I/we authorized you 1o make o claim against my/our own insurers for the cost of
repains and any other losses recoverable under mylour policy of insurance. In this respects, lwe
understand and sccept that the excess amount applicable under the policy of insurance shall be bome
by me/us. I/we shall also be persanally lisble to bear all legal cost incurred by you in claiming hack for
the repair cost by your Solicitors.

If for whatever reasons, my/our insurers reject my/our claim for indemnity for the cost of repuirs and/or
any bmmvmﬂ:wmm:wﬂqarimwmk:mynmtmp}- less than the amount
claimed by you, I'we agree 10 undertake to pay the full amoant of your repair bill and survey fees snd
any nl.h:r::pmm reasanably incurred on my/our behalf or 1o pay you the difference in amounL as the
chse may

I'we have read and understand the shove statement and agreed.

Dated this 2O gay PCcem W ponn FO\S yeur

Signature : ‘{,4/

Name . ‘Hq Zhi ¢, Company Stamp
NRIC/ROC No. : Y3 ETeT1e0E /
Address Bk 5738 huuds &

I 401664 5732573
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' Premium Carz
T P |

Co Reg Mo 2014167200
1 Kk Bukh Ave 8 201-90 Autobay@=aki Buk® Singapors 417883
Tel - 638 3100 Fuw . SB36 3173

Letter of Authority

Date. jﬁ}llhﬂﬂk

ACCIDENT invoLving  2JUSLYZT anp S8 1SL45 ow LD"LIE'%'
ALONG __ CLdey Guday

To Whom It May Concemn:

This is to centify that |. H‘} th & {Owner), NRIC/Passport No:

‘"It':l B‘HL’I*E Contact No. q'[:'% ‘?L?n) the owner of Vehicle No:
SISk _hereby authorize me, Phaw Je, 22 (driver). NRIC/Passport
No: “_"ﬁ?‘lg 3511 , o

i) Drive the above stated vehicle

i) Coliect the vehicle upon completion of repair
The authority given herein shall be irrevocable unless notice of revocation is given to us.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely,

7/%“ |

[Owner's Signature)




3 LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

W
CLAIMNO : I8/IR/IR/VPO5/021247
DATE - 23 JULY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, NG ZHI QI confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
and/or owner of SJR 75698 the sum of Singapore Dollur Two Thousand Four
Hundred Only ($2,400.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of
all property losses competent to me/us upon the smd M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD in respect of all propenty losses sustmned by me/us whether now or hereafter to
become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving SJQ
5647T and SJR 75695 on 20 December 2018 along CLARK QUAY.

| ‘We hercby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ TAN PO HWA AND/OR REUBEN TAN JING EN) against all ¢laims and
any clmms whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the
said accident.

I'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to PREMIUM
CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD.

I'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admssion of
linbility basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
msured's recovery action.

7 2e(¥leu

val g ML s snnssuisrnpsnnspnasragsnn
Signature of vehicle owner/Date
Ng 2W 68 6|2

Nmm’:.nf vehicle -'EIWI‘I'EI‘ -'Ijnte

settlemant herein Is strictly in relation to 3 party

property damage clalm and ls withoul prejudica
to personal injurias claim
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Proemmuaam O ar s [ INVOICE: 0356 ]

Co. Reg No.. 201416720C
1 eaky Buidt Ave §#01-80 Aulobay@ e Bul Singapore 417563
Tel BEM QI00 Fax AE3E 0113

Date 2122018

Bill Ta
Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road
# | 7-04/017 The Comcourse

Singapore 199555

Our Costomer

Name Ng Zhi Qi Vehicle No - SJQ5647T

IC No SROOG(NE Date of Accident : 20/1272018

Address Blk 373B Woodlands D 16 Model - Chevrolet Optra
#0004

Singapore732573

No. Qtv_ |Unit Price] Amount

I |To supply labour and materals to repair the above-mentioned i - $2, 100, 00
vehicle to its pre-accident condition (Lump Sum)

TOTAL| $2,100.00

For Premium Carz Services Pre Lid

* All cheque should be crossed and make payable to “Premium Carz Services Pre Lid”




Wby Cave

‘ DAWN ENTERPRISES
[ [ ]

21 SELETAR WEST FARMWAY 1
SINGAPORE 798125
TELL 6383 2661 FAX: 6484 2836
S No. 13612
OFFICIAL RECEIPT pate. P\ \"’} \&

et o I Mlﬁi Tw

the sum of Dollars H’h\‘]l‘“ “ﬂﬂ ﬁ{a q m;'“\\\

being Pavment Of EL& mﬁu : ; ! lT‘E fﬁﬁ_\‘l‘l] IE[J ] -
s_ﬂ\l A

Cash Thegioe No. R
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DAWN ENTERPRISES

21 Saietar West Farmway 1
Singapore 798125

[”(}T_MUM
LA 5EUFT
Ne 362830

Tel: 63832661 Fax: 64842836
Reg No.430058/000

RENTAL AGREEMENT

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

R OATUTA AL
LSk wmmw 'ng\ O

Name

}L\uﬂ'\ﬁ

DRIVER'S PARTICULARS

CKEE Wudiwe WG

& 0S50 \ A 04-60 5
L 5 S Wof 14 N ’}L’J__tﬁ
VT or Pasaport No. f%\" Eg’i"\\‘l—m lﬂwwuua.}lﬂ%l' Country
. Dcoupstaen
Datn o Sinth Age Dase: of @it A
Diiwing Licerts Mo Dot Passes Cirhving Licence Mo, Dt Passed
tete _JEL SYEO  (Rescence) Tat: (CMfca) [Pwscercs)

ANT NOTES: CHARGES
e et o
i :-::*H:-:-:::;tmmﬂmtl-&mﬂt Do $ ichuaces
et e e LU
Rl udnie evmtenia
e Serve on Pusiic Moides end Sy X . TOTAL AMODUNT i% uD _

SCHEDULE ik S—— S 00
BALANCE DUE
Date Time Milsage Days Extanson From To
2e/-)\¥ | 1C TTAMN
% v \% ﬁ.iigrﬁ. Amount Deposlt [refundabis] §
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