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Triple H Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10

#01-398 CASH SALE
Singapore 539195 Invoice Date: 12/12/18
H/P:97718731/90545425 [[.\; Vehicle No: GBH2574G
Ema#lW@thiil.cnm Make/Model: Toyota Dyna
Business Registration : 2018180872 Chassis No:
Mileage:
To: 3™ Party Claim
S/N | QUANTITY PARTICULARS UNIT | AMOUNT
i PRICE (S$)
01 [Front Right Head Lamp ./~ o] a5 s 7] $1650.00
02 [Front Bumper .~ (/| ANA | $650.00
03 [Front Bumper Barrier $280.00
s
2 5:2{
01 bour For Panel Beating Zo¢ 0 | $580.00
02 ray Painting For Accident Area oo | $650.00
Total: | $3810.00
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Hsiao Tnna {LHKAuto!

From:; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 12:00 PM

To: Jh G; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; C5 A Team

Subject: RE: Vehicle Accident Claim Against Vehicle Number: SLH12G, GIA Report & Invoices
Attached *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG18022899/Gpa3

Attachments: Finalisation Invoice for (GBH2574G).pdf; Idac Report (GBH2574G) pdf; Invoice For

Rental GBH2574G.PDF; Quotation for GBH2574G).pdf; After Paint Frt.jpg; After Paint
RHS Frtjpg; After Paint RHSJPG; Before Paint Frt RH5 2 jpg: Before Paint Frt
RHS.PG; Before Paint Frt View.jpg

WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LEK ref Officer in charge
CC6/AIG18022899/Gpa3 Hsiao Tong - 6742 3197

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan @ [kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408931)

From: Jh G <gjh-wjh@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 11:34 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Vehicle Accident Claim Against Vehicle Number: SLH12G, GIA Report & Invoices Attached
Hi,

Please refer to attached for the GIA report & invoices.

Please proceed on your side.

Anything i missed out, you can call me at: 9771 8731 (Mr Hui)

Hope to hear from you soon.

Thank You.



Best Regards,
Mr Hui



Hsiao Tona {LKKAutu!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 23 February 2019 11:31 AM

To: IhG

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: GBH2574G - Authorized to act & Rental Agreement. (Missed out Documents)

*** LKK REF: CCB/AIG18022899/Gpa3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above malier,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $1,780.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, elther party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indostrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 February 2019 1:26 PM

To: Jh G <gjh-wjh@hotmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBH2574G - Authorized to act & Rental Agreement. (Missed out Documents) *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG18022899/Gpa3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/A1G18022899/Gpa3 Hsiao Tong - 6742 3197

1



Hsiao Tr.ma (LKKAuto)

From: Jh G <gjh-wjh@hotmail com>

Sent: Saturday, 23 February 2019 2:43 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: Re: GBH2574G - Authorized to act 8 Rental Agreement. (Missed out Documents)
*** LKK REF: CCB/AIG18022899/Gpa3

Attachments: Satifaction & DV.pdf

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Confirmed with acceptance.

Please refer to attached for the signed Discharge Voucher.

Please proceed payment on your side.

If i missed out anything you can contact me at: 9771 8731 (Mr Hui)
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Mr Huli

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Saturday, February 23, 2019 11:31 AM

To:Jh G

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: GBH2574G - Authorized to act & Rental Agreement. (Missed out Documents) *** LKK REF:
CCB/AIG18022899/Gpa3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer fo the above matter.

We propose setllement at a global sum of §1,780.00{all-in).
Please confim acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlemant.”



TRIPLE H AUTO PTE LTD

14 Defu Lane 10,

#01-398 Invoice Date: 28/12/18
Singapore 539195 Vehicle No: GU2193U
H/P: 9771 B731 / 9054 5425

Email: gilh-wih@hotmail.com

Business Registration : 2018180872

INVOICE

Bill To : 3™ Party Claim

S/N DESCRIPTION D/W/M DEPOSIT AMOUNT
01 Rental Of Vehicle For Lost Of Use 3 Days 5360.00
Per Day @ 5120
(CASH / NETS / BANK TRANSFER) TOTAL £ 360.00
REMARKS ;

"**THIS IS A COMPUTERIZED GENERATED ***
*** NO AUTHORISED SIGNATURE IS REQUIRED ***
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JHAUTO TRADING

Bik 4023 S -
HP: mf" ,?._"‘fj Kl Industrial Park 1 #01-52 Singapore 569840 RENTAL OF VANS & LORRIES
ROC: 83240778, | | 2409 7968 / 8054 5425

HE: MEERERERE

. Iwe _SET-vACS genures e LD
:P;m'mm"} of Bl ¢ Dffula€ io
Mmm -n Oy = m 5 quw
Mobile: Office:

Home:; ;
mhnmd “the Hirer hereby confirm haviag agreed 10 hire this duy from JHAUTO TRADING hereinafier called “the Owner™ the
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2e Emum ONLY MOTOR VEHICLE COVERAGE
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D!'lel.huhuﬂummlnududpmmduﬁhﬂhmn bl i >

Vehicle Regn No. BWZMYME L1, 2193 U Rental Agreement & FWE No.E
Sectlon . i
@ Hirer's And/Or Driver's Particulars 0% / NERMAER BHERARE 25 |2y

g4 SRANERR
;n;u:: Set-vact gevtes P LT2 D;i%ﬁ,‘,ﬁ ‘:1||‘1[.E"
Address: R 1% Dgfu LiaG 'O hacy Chargeable |Rates  Amount
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#‘I:E‘Hlllil £ !uﬂ
icle Must He Returned To Owner's Oifice By: Total Charge
e

| UNDERTAKE NOT TO USE OR LET OTHERS USE THE VEHICLE .
TO CARRY OUT ANY ILLEGAL OR CRIMINAL ACTS INCLUDING :‘;’*‘”’“ i
CARRYING DUTY UNPAID GOODS ESPECIALLY CIGARETTES. | T Bhyable

Name Of Signuture of Wirer: | IR
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Address &ﬂ"iﬁm
N g § - )

IC No s Mabile ; Comtﬁun Fees / Misc

iR f e
Home : Mobile : Elﬁ Hn!g'?

. Date / Signnture of
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B 2 [
Grand Total $360
} F

] HIRER AND/OR DRIVER IS LIABLE FOR ALL PARKING, TRAFFIC AND SMOKY EXHAUST VIOLATION.
HEETEMPERR Important: It s essental that e vehicle be iwharmed 1o us not ater tnan Me dale and tme stated above, On e
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EEEEE / ‘E“

-

7 E
Signature of Hirer; 5 ;
ALL VEMICLES PARTS SUCH AS NUMBER PLATE, LAMP/LAMP COVER & PAX STICKER WAS MISSING, BROKEN, BENDED, DIRTY AND) TYRE BALD WHICH THE HIREREDRIVER
D0 KOT INFORM US TO REPLACE, THE FINE CHARGES WILL BE BEAR BY THE HIRERIDRNER

Scanned with CamScanner
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51 UL AVE 1, 201-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL © (065) 62563561 FAX : |065) 62564315
Our Ref: CC6/AIG18022899/Gpal
01 FEB 2019

YEO SIEW SONG

BLK 188C RIVERVALE DRIVE
#09-1056

SINGAPORE 543188

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH 12G & GBH 2574G ALONG/AT 3 SOON LEE
STREET PIONEER JUNCTION OSCP ON 11/12/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third
party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from GBH 2574G against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in vour driver’s favour
as your vehicle was reversing into a parking lot and collided with third party. Under Motor
Accident Guide, vehicle reversing in/out or moving in/out of parking lot should exercise
greater caution. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the
Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim,
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAO TONG
Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197
FAX:674] 4108

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

ce.  AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Depr)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

l, ST ~vua
o \ = ::%sgnuxm PE <o (‘the third party claimant) of
GOH 251un e oty i

(vehicle no.) hereby authorise

Ef:sﬂﬁ R Avie P Ly (‘the workshop') to act for me
respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (‘claim’) for

My vehicle no. G8R2ST1wh  that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on l‘?“—l'l.nla' (date) along
MO, 3 aoord GG < (locatlon) involving vehicle no/s

SN g (‘the accident’).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner
that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment
further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of

the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is
on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the

driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Datedthis_ 28 (day) of _DECETBER (month) 20_\ & (year)

b

Signed by ‘the third party claimant’

Signed h{r ‘the workshop’

Scanned with CamScanner



RELEASE \FQECHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“Well, mwm “the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/I have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO

CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (namec of surveyur) witl respect w the amount claimed for
S$51,780.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. GBH 2574G that was damaged pursuant to the accident

which occurred on 11/12/2018 (date) along NO. 3 SOON LEE STREET involving vehicle no/s
SLH 12G.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 19/12/2018 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner JET-VACS SERVICE PTE LTD (“the
third party claimant™) of vehicle no. GBH 2574G make the claim as set out in the above paragraph
and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit.
We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to GBH 2574G (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a

without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this O (day) of _™MPReY  (month) 20_ 9(year)

r/.\{\*
L
= ¥ak Vi

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)

Scanned with CamScanner



Triple H Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 14 Defu Lane 10

#01-368 CASH SALE
Singapore 539195 Invoice Date: 28/12/18
H/P: 9771 8731 / 9054 5425 Vehicle No: GBH2574G
Email: gjh-wjh@hotmail.com Make/Model: Toyota Dyna
Business Registration : 2018180872 Chassis No:

Mileage:

To: 3 Party Claim

S/N | QUANTITY PARTICULARS UNIT AMOUNT
PRICE (s5)

ll Parts Im:luding Labour

LumpSum Finalization @ 51,486.10

Total: | $1,486.10




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

.+.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Notified IEm: Subrmitted Adj Assigned Adj Apt Ag) Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
| |17 03019 joDecI018  lsg148610  |5$1,486.10 il
Elit Rog som adj gt | -Eﬂtﬂ.lh'nllnl wiew mpt | Canecet Casa |

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [[Created by adjuster]

Insured: YEO SIEW SONG, [D: SII26613A

Main .
Claimant: :m'uﬁﬂ SERVICE PTELTD. Co. Reg. No.: 200205569N

Vahicle Rag. | . [11/12/2018 12:00 - :58
No.: GBH25746 Date of Logs: | o' nths and 8 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Y]]

_ | Policy/Cover | 2100495591 (Comprehensive)
Claim Type: | TP / 903530859556 Mote Mo.: | Coverage: 10/01/2018 - 08/01/2019

Palicy Mo.
{Craimant}:

Excess:
Tripla H Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) BLK 14 DEFU LANE 10 #011-398, 535195 Defu Lane - Tel:

AIG Azia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid, [(Express) - Tel: 85-5419-3000 ... [Handléd by Syed-Yusolf, Sallha] Saling Syeqd-
r:____ Yusoff@haig.com ———

MSIG Insurance (Singapors) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7888
LKK Auto Consultants Pe Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 __ [Handled by XING GUO QIANG) .. |Final Rpt dus 25/01/2015]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Compose Case Mai |

Theere are no manl for this case.

SLH12G AZBDTTTOTMKC] COMP)

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | Complete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp c... 6/3/2019



Menmen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*GBH2574G (90353085955G)
[SLH12G]
TP
JET-VACS SERVICE PTE LTD
Dec 11 2018 12:00PM

Uplowd Documents | _upiosd Protos | _Compose hew Letter | _upiosd video | _upied ausio |

[YEO SIEW SONG]
Triple H Auto Pte Ltd

Letters/Correspondences 1perpage (V]| (A
Mo |Finalized On LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |(Oraft) Third Party Express Settlemant - Payment Breakdown 0 Edit
Photos/Images 3 per page E )
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnail Print
1 [3y01/1917:58 | General View D | wwows | 4
2 [31/01/19 17:58 | General View D | aces | 4
1 (31/01/1917:58 | General View 0 wews | 2
4 [31/01/1917:58 | General View 0 | caows | A
5 (310119 17:58 | General View D | toacwec | A |
6 [31/01/19 17:58 | General View D | teaws | A
7 310119 17:58 | Ganeral View 0 | wows | 4
8 (3101719 17:58 | General View O iwows | @
9 310119 17:58 | Genersl View 0 | tcawc | A
10 (30119 17:58 | General View 0| tssdws |
11 [301/19 1758 | Genersl View 0| eiws | A
112 (310119 17:58 | General View l-l Load G | B4
13 |31/01/19 17:58 | General View O | Losaws | B2
14 |31/01/1917:58 | General View 0 | tosaws |
15 |3401/1917:58 | Genaral View _i oad PG | B4
16 [11/01/19 17:58 | General View 0| s | A
17 |1/01/1917:58 | General View O o | &
18 [31/01/19 17:58 | Genersl View O wwwrs | A
19 (3100719 17:58 | General View @ | Losdvg m'"
20 |1401/18 1758 | Odometer Reading 0 | s | B
21 (3401719 17:58 | Chassis Number O ws | A
22 |01/02/19 08:15 | Reinspaction Photo ﬁ Load G | BA
23 |01/02/19 0B:15 | Rainspection Pheto O eivs | B
14 | 04/02/19 0B:15 | Relnspection Phets D | weiws | A
25 |01/02/19 08:15 Reinspection Photo D | weaws | B
26 |01/02/19 0A:15 | Reinspection Photo D | edws | A
27 |01/02/15 08:15 | Reinspection Photo 0 | wears | B
Documentation 1 per page ]| B
No | Mslabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 |16/01/15 11155 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
7 |16/01/19 11:55 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
3 U6/0Y/1609:58 | WORKSHOP INVOICE § Load POF
4 DR/03/19 09:58 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM 8 Load POF
|5 |06/03/10 09:58 | Release Voucher Load POF
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Preview Page 1 of 1

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLH12G (Insd veh) Model: OYOTA DYNA 150 3.0 D
GBH2574G (TP veh) MT (M)
| Date of Accident: |11/12/2018

Global Sum Settiement |- | [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate $ 3,810.00
Final Repair Cost - 1,780.00
Loss of Use :$ 3.00 days at $100.00 per day
Rental (if any) :§ days
LTA [ GIA Search Fea '8
Others: '8
-1
Final Setllemant Sum (Glabal Sum) '3 1,780.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ | YES [X ] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
B) For GIA Registersd Workshop: BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (") (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apoly.
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) | Triple H Auto Ple Lid - 1,780.00
2) %
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN oo
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill, Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill {if any)
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Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 1sseor1ser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: BB44-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto. com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCE/AIG18022888/GPA302

Date: 06/03/2018
BREFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Ltd.  Policy No: 2100485881
Claimant Vehicle Gpias74G Insured Vehicle No : SLH12G
Date of Loss: 11122018 Nature of Claim: LI Claim No: 803530858556
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GBH257T4G
Make & Modal: TOYOTA DYNA 150, 3.0 D 5MT (M) Engine No: 1KD2793028
Reg. Date: 03/04/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: JTFAT3ISYX0K210130
Colour: Silver Ddomeler: 25575 km
Engine Capacity 2982 cc
Marke! Valus/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (5§) Market Value/New Car Price
[Tl E I AT THE TI
Ganaral Condition: Steering (Serviceable)! Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/75 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 155 R12
Front Left Side Bridgesione 7 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 7 mm
Front Right Side Bridgestone 7 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone ¥ mm
The above values represent fhe remaning (e reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS -~ Repairers  Adjuster's Difference _Diff %
Parts 2,580.00 806.10 1.773.80 68.76
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.230.00 680.00 550.00 44.72
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 D.00
Nett Amount (S§) 3,810.00 1,486.10 2,323.90 60.99
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x $5100.00/day) (S5) 300.00
Nett Liability (58) 1,786.10
Global Sum Settlement (55) 1,780.00
IM |
Date of Assignment: 181212018
Date Inspected 191122018  Inspected At Triple H Auto Pte Lid (HQ)
BLK 14 DEFU LANE 10 #01-388
Singapore 539185
Eslimaled Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager; CHEW HSIAD TONG
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NOTE: This rporf represants our findings af the lime and place of inspechion stated herein, Such inspection hax been carmed out fo the beaf of our
knowledge and abllity but any ofher fallity undar amy athar crcumstances is Aeredy sxpressly erciuded
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Oty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT RIGHT HEAD LAMP Cut 1,650.00F *503 20 FL
| *FRONT BUMPER Cracked 650.00F *481.60FL
| 1 *FRONT BUMPER BARRIER Mot Necessary 280.00F *FL

F=Francrise pan. L=Lintlemsc

Sub Total (S5) 2,580.00 1,074.80

- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/25.00% (5§) 0.00 268.70

Total Parts (5§) 2,580.00 B06.10

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Adjuster Repon

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellanecus Htems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING New 580.00 280,00

2 SPRAY PAINTING FOR ACCIDENT AREA New 650.00 400.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1.230.00 680.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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