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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

[ 5

&f FE
i J0P ool o 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-9607196-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC4/ASM18022866/eh3
A TONERSGARORE ot e | 111111
Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. #D 518588 Veh. Inspected SKB 48589Y
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 20M12f2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 1]
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No, Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/12/2018 |inspection Date

Survey held at VIN'S MOTOR FTE LTD

160 SIN MING DRIVE #03-03
SIN MING AUTO CITY
SINGAPORE 575722

Ea. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,




fing Autocit

A Sin Ming Autocity -
d ’ 160 S5in Ming Drive #03-03
n Singapore 375722
&A53 2121 (4 lines) £ 4458 1111 (24 hrs)

5757

HA5Y 9795 /6457 0433
AUTOMOTIVE GROUP e P AL
WWW.INSautogroup. com.sg
Owur Ref : TP/122018/3720 Invoice No:
Accident date : 17/12/2018
Your Ref : xD5189B Date : 18/12/2018

MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT
AXA INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD
8 Shenton Way

#27-01 AXA Tower

Singapore (068811

Estimate cost of repairs to Mercedes Benz C180 SKB4859Y

1 pc RearRHdoor , (e $ ~1,100.00 -

1 pc Rear RH door outer handle -~ A s ./ 110.00

1 pc Rear RH door outer moulding x - ##C . $ 7 100.00~

1  pc Rear RH door rubber , J£C $ 5., 180:00-

1 pc Rear RH door regulator X Pl 5T $ ' 580.00

1  pc Rear RH door regulator motor W{/ Mas S/ 490.00 ~

1 pc Rear windscreen moulding x $ . 100.00 X

1  pc Rear windscreen gum X S Ay $ X 6000 X

1  pc Rear RH fender?(m RLpo)y $ X 1,253{}.ﬂ0 X

1  pc Rear bumper $ .~ 910.00~

1 pc Rear bumper RH retalner s 2 - $ .~ 30.00-

1 pc Rear RH wheel sport rim et - /B 1,380.00/

1 pc Rear RH wheel tyre X Ww $ X 480000 X

1 pc Rear RH shock absorber g - $ ~ 39000 -

1 pc Rear RH lower arm 6 pY A 55[ ¢ 390.00 ~

1 pc Rear RH knuckle arm o $  1,300000 .~

1 pc Rear RH knuckle arm bearlng S M S -~ 210.00°

1 pc RearRHtoparmnol A 4 AT S - 140.00 7~

1 pc RearRHtoparmno2 X \ AN $ /130000 X

1 pc RearRHsidearmnol @ Yo / 41 $ ~170.00 ~

1  pc Rear RHsidearmno2 X NN . % X 1§Eﬁ}[] X
Balance c/f 315 ¢ $  9,600.00

VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD | REGISTRATION & GST NO: 199906067G
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AUTOMOTIVE GROUP

Our Ref : TP/122018/3720 Date :

Balance b/f

To remove and refix rear glass

To remove and refix rear seat cushion & roof lining
To remove and refix rear undercarriage

To check wheel alignment — AJ_’I.«}M I-C{lopf’ <

To repair rear damage C Luqid 2 A{'{-M-)

To spray painting

VIN'S MOTOR PTELTD

ot './.,-?-"'- : e
;/ /L :

Glans -

l\"““réhm bpoly -
ey wep iy phetos.

Sin Ming Autocity,

160 Sin Ming Drive #03-03

Singapore 575722

G453 2121 14 lines) F a458 11717 (24 hrs)
4459 9795 / 5459 0433
adminBhinsaulogroup.com.sg

WWWLVINSAUROGrou R COrm. S

18/12/2018

uT}

9,660.00

150.00 ® KAMN
180.00 bo

380.00 ‘X932
150.00 6o
880.00 e

980.00 &= Jas
12,380.00

| I.".I rf |'F|‘

Hi:l“iﬁﬁrﬂ'.rtﬂfzﬁrﬂ‘:‘ﬂ%

L%

VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD | REGISTRATION & GST NO: 1999060676



Taufikh (LKK Auto)

From: Vincent Seah [vincent.seah@cyclecarriage.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 11:43 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuta)

Subject: RE: PART PRICE

FYA

----- Original Message-----

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) [mailto:Taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2819 11:22 AM

To: Vincent Seah <wvincent.seahficyclecarriage.com.sg>
Subject: FART PRICE

Hi Vincent,
Can help me check part price for these items?

SKB 4859Y CHASSIS:WDDZ284p452A533295 ‘;{O\’L"’-
..-'l -
REAR RH DOOR REGULATOR -2047202579 $678.87 (part number) W/§ #&”5’0 {’35'(‘,/ &7

REAR RH DOOR REGULATOR MOTOR - 2048200242 $615.35 w[é Go

REAR RH SPORT RIM - 2044816282 $597,.84 PARTS NO. WRONG W{; 590

REAR RH KNUCKLE ARM - 2843328201 $787.36 "{5 4 _zb

0 i'?’ 9,05'

Thank you in advance. fl# 1 Los.o £ 5’ :
Regards

Taufikh

LKK Auto

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the
use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by
return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the
individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
and/or any of its related corporations.



1211972018

& Service Request Details

Claim
SAMO1T2M

Reference

None ¢

Loss Date
17 December 2018

Request Date
19 December 2018

Due Date
27 December 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TF)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

MNext Step
Agree to perform service

Claim Partal

LKK AUTQ CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) - Menu

Drecline Work

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SKB4B59X

Make
TPVD MERCEDES-BENZ

https:ﬂvp.smnclaims.axa.l::aum.sgn’|::Iaim-par‘talfhtmln'lr|dex-'u'endnr—sanl'icavrﬂquests.htm-1#Fsami{:a-r&quasls.f‘?aewicaﬂﬂquestN umbear=88544

1/2



12/19/2018 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

service Aqaress

Primary Contact/Insured

TONG HENG MOTOR WORK

& KRANJI LOOP, #01-26, 739542, Singapore
63380083
JEUNMESSE@VIRTUALINVEST.BIZ

Claim Handler

KHOR Saw Theng
6568804754
sawtheng khor@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions
1. Virtual case. 2. TP Excess $3.000.

Messages Invoices History Daocuments Assessment Metrics MNotes

hitps:/ivp smarnclaims axa.com.sg/claim-portalhtmlindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-requests/7Tservice RequestNumber=88944



Catherine Ehonﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Admin @ VAuG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 18 December, 2018 4:05 PM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA 5GP - Motor Survey
Subject: Request For TP Survey SKB4859Y ; ¥r Insured XD51858B
Attachments: SAS52522311.pdf; 20181218154339.pdf

Categories: Pragati

Good afternoon,

Please help us to arrange for survey ASAP
DOA: 17/12/2018

Location:

Sin Ming Autocity

160 Sin Ming Drive #08-09

Singapore 575722

Thanks!

Best Regards

Raymond Teo

g

Sin Ming AutoCity

160 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575722

Showroom/Office: #03-03
Workshops: #08-08/09

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines)

Fax: 64599795

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg

Email: admin@vinsautoqroup.com.sg

Follow us on :

agﬂjagagag

** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! **
*=* w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! *#*
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MANDATE IA (S8M0172M)

Type
© Question

Message
Please kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any. Thank you - Asher Sng (06/03/201%)
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Re:MANDATE |A (S8M0172M)
Type
@ Question

Message
Please proceed.




Sin Ming Autocity,

£ " 760 Sin Ming Drive #03.03
L n | Singapore 575722
o
P 6453 2121 (4 lines}/ 6458 1117 (24 hrs)
M £ A4S9OTES S 6455 0433
admin@vinsautograup.com.sg

AUTOMOTIVE GROUP

WL Vinsautogroup.com.sg
Our Rel: TPA22018/3720

Your ref: XD51359B

AXA INSURANCE (5) PTELTD
8 Shenton Way

#27-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Anention: Motor Claims Department
Dear Sirvidm,

Accident Inveolving Vehicles :  SKB4859Y & XD5189B
Along : BKE TWDS Woodlands
DOA ¢+ 112018

We are the authorized repair warkshop for the owner of motor vehiele no: SKB4859Y .« = which was involved in the
captioned accident with your insured vehicle: XD318%B. The vehicle owner has requested and authorized us to
assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

01)  Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) 5 1.971.50
02y  GlA Search fees b 2.00
03) Loss of Rental_wait for surveyor 2 day x S180/- ] 360,00
04  Loss of Rental_| davs (Sunday) x 3180/~ i 180.00
051  Loss of Rental_6 days x $180/- b3 1,080.00

3 9,593.50

We enclosed herewith the following documents 1w support the claims:-

a)  Lener of Authorisation / GIA report(s) / Insurance Certificate, ete...
b}  Final Repair Bill
¢} GIA search! Car Rental Bill & Invoice

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from vou on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any
personal injury claim (if any) of the ownerfclaimant.

Thank you

Yours faithfully

YIN'S MOLOR PTE LTD Please issue Chegue to: Vin's Motor Pre Lid
Flease transfer to: Vin's Motor Pte Ltd
UOB Current Account
ASC MNo: 451-307-638-4

Vincent Khong

(it

/IN'S MOTOR PTE LTD | REGISTRATION & GS 99060

2056067

e
N S A T




THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

Vehicle No: XD 5189B (Insd veh) Model: ERCEDES BENZ C 180
SKB 4859Y (TP veh)
Date of Accident: |17M12/2018

Global Sum Settlement | : | [ ] Yes | [X] Mo

Repair Estimate - 13,246.60)

Final Repair Cost - 7.971.50

Loss of Use o5 days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) - 900.00 9 days

LTA f GIA Search Fee 5 2.00

Others: |: $|

Final Settlement Sum o 8,873.50

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X]1] ¥YES [ 1] NO {Kindly indicate

bielow)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ Me BOLA Scenario No:
B} For GIA Registered Workshop: 15
BOLA Liability: 100 (%) Assessed Liability (™) (%)

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) [VIN'S AUTOMOTIVE GROUP - B,873.50
MUR SHAQILAH BTE ABDOL
WAHAB 31/05/2019
Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill {if any)




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC4/ASM18022866/Gebls2

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01

[N

AXATOWERSINGAPORE 068811 Baja: STAR2RI8
ATTHN: SAW THENG Code : ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. XD 51898 Veh. Inspected SKB 4859Y
Policy No. GA376461/1 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SBMO172M Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  SAWTHENG Assign Date 20/12/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ C 180 c.c 1597
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2011
Chassis No. WDD2040452A533295 Colour BLACK
Odometer 283535 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 GOODYEAR 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 GOODYEAR 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45R17 GOODYEAR 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45R17 GOODYEAR 5 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/12/2018 Inspection Date 201212018
Survey held at VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #03-03
SIN MING AUTO CITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

SlE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park. Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607 198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKB 4859Y
' Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition W uﬂmhop?;}] (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR RH DOOR (WCP) (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 1,100.00 1.100.00
1|REAR RH DOOR OUTER HANDLE (WCP) (CONSISTENT) [CUT 110.00 110.00
1|REAR RH DOOR OUTER MOULDING (WCP) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR RH DOOR RUBBER (WCP) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 180.00 88.60
1|REAR RH DOOR REGULATOR (WCP) (CONSISTENT) BENT 580.00 580.00
1|REAR RH DOOR REGULATOR MOTOR (WCP) NOT WORKING 490.00 490,00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING (WGP) (CONSISTENT)  |NOT NECESSARY 100.00 I
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GUM (WCP) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 i
1|REAR RH FENDER (WCP) (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 1,250.00 "
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER (WCP) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 910.00 910.00
1|REAR BUMPER RH RETAINER (WCP) (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 30.00 30.00
1|REAR RH WHEEL TYRE (WCP) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 480.00 !
1|REAR RH SHOCK ABSORBER (WCP) (CONSISTENT) BENT 380.00 380.00
1|REAR RH LOWER ARM (WCP) (CONSISTENT) BENT 390.00 390.00
1|REAR RH KNUCKLE ARM (WCP) (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,300.00 700.00
1|REAR RH KNUCKLE ARM BEARING (WCP) (CONSISTENT) [NECESSARY 210.00 210.00
1|REAR RH TOP ARM NO 1 (WCP) (CONSISTENT) BENT 140.00 140.00
1|REAR RH TOP ARM NO 2 (WCP) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 130.00 4
1|REAR RH SIDE ARM NO 1 (WCP) (CONSISTENT) BENT 170.00 170.00
1|REAR RH SIDE ARM NO 2 (WCP) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 160.00 .
COST PLUS 15% . 811.44
8,280.00 6,221.04
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR RH WHEEL SPORT RIM (SN) (CONSISTENT) cuT 1,380.00 1,380.00
1,380.00 1,380.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR GLASS. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR SEAT CUSHION & ROOF L 180.00 60.00

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18022866/Geb3s2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BA B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607188R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Q Description of Parts Condition Estimate, By Qur Adidsisd
i B Workshop ($)) ($)
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR UNDERCARRIAGE. 380,00 320.00
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT 150.00 60.00
TO REPAIR REAR DAMAGE. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR 880.00 600.00
OF REAR RH FENDER,
TO SPRAY PAINTING. 980.00 700.00
2,720.00 1,740.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,380.00 9,341.04
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 7,450.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18022866/Geb3s2
il
P =
I|
XING GUO QIANG HO LEONG CHUAN

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor




