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SMAT Accidant Vehicle Ropair Estimatas
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Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek [Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Maonday, 11 March 2019 2:16 PM

To: Poh Kin (LEKAuUtD)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident on 17/12/2018 involving SHC 4404G & SLK 2086P (AIG's insured) Our

Ref TAX/12/18/2074/lg *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG18022852/)fa3

Dear Poh Kin,

We accept your global offer of $4,070.00 (all in). Please let us have your DV. Thanks for your prompt
settlement.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@.mmr

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto: pohkin@lkkauto.com]
Sent: 09/03/2019 13:47

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & [A/Claims & 1A/ Taxis)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident on 17/12/2018 involving SHC 4404G & SLK 2086P (AlG's insured) Our Ref: TAX/12/18/2074/Ig
*=* | KK REF: CC3/A1G18022852/fa3

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC3/AIG18022852/)fa3
Your Ref: TAX/12/18/2074/Ig

Dear Lee Gek,
We refer to above matter.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement at global sum of $4,070.00(all in) on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.



B
‘Poh Kin (LKKAuto) —

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Saturday, @ March 2019 1:47 PM

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & |A/Claims & |A/Taxis)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident on 17/12/2018 involving SHC 4404G & SLK 2086P (AIG's insured) Our

Ref: TAX/12/18/2074/lg *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG18022852/)fa3

Importance; High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC3/AIG18022852/)fa3
Your Ref: TAX/12/18/2074/Ig

Dear Lee Gek,
We refer to above matter.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured's part, we offer
settlement at global sum of $4,070.00(all in} on this matter.

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabifity,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5{408933)

LI 55 500 the arth Prine only when mecessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unimended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mall or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereal. and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thareof. Thank you



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear All,

We quantify our claim as follows:-

Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims 8 IA/Claims & |1A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Thursday, 7 March 2019 11:03 AM

CS A Team; Admin A

Re: Accident on 17/12/2018 involving SHC 4404G & SLK 2086P (AIG's insured) Qur
Ref: TAX/12/18/2074/1g

TAX 12 18 2074 pdf; 20190102_175131 jpg

Cost of Repair 52750.00 .
Loss of Rental $864.56 | 8 daysx 5108.07 ) g ¥« -
Loss of Income 570136 | B dayx SB7.67 )

LTA Search Fee 57.00

Total $4322.92

We enclose the following documents:

1] Repair invoice

2] Proof of rental rate
3] police/GIA reports
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report

5] LTAsearch

6] Hirer's current income tax assessment

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks,

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)

Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

& SmRT

AUTOMOTIVE
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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563261 FAX : 165) 67414108

Our Rel: CCYAIGI8022852/1fa3

19" February 2019

CHIN KIMPAT

512 Bedok North Avenue 2,
#06-283,

Singapore 460512,

Attn: Mr Chin Zhen Xing

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. SLK 2086F AND SHC 4404G ALONG
PIE ON 17.12.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asin Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken
up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due 1o this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

|'f" '. "
Poh Kin, Chong
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkin/@Ikkauto.com

cc.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
{Moror Claims Depi)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I/We, SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party claimant”) of BLK 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 (S) 757705 (address), owner of SHC 4404G (vehicle no.) hereby
authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me

with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my
vehicle no, SHC 4404G that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on
17/12/2018 (date) along PIE (location) involving vehicle no/s SLK 2086P (“the accidemt™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my
claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/ownerfinsurers of the
other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this | \ (day) of _Mav e, (month) 20}4_(year)

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/]
have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$84.070.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SHC 4404G that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on 17/12/2018 (date) along PIE (location) involving vehicle no/s SLK 2086P.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 19/12/2018 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no, SHC 4404G make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™,

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that *the third party claimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SHC
4404G (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis,

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Counts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this | I (day) of Mﬂ: d.h. (month) Iﬂ_ﬁ_ (year)}

n {7
@D 'i{ LKK )

Signed by sppointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)



SIMNRT

AUTOMOTIVE

BET Autcssotive Services Pre Ltd
281 Borth Eridge Bosd Singepoce 179102
Tal: 65 3311000 Fax: &5 S3I0247

Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000063 GST Reg No. : MR-B8500001-7

CHN : 1950042802
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice No. + IV1S0200103

Date : 14.02.2019
Block Unit vaehicle Ho. : SHC4404G

Your Ref No. : TAX/12/18/2074
60 WOODLAMDS INDUSTRIAL PARK Ed Qur Ref No. : 24099310
SINGAPORE 757705 Terms : 30 Days
Description Add { {(Discount) Amount

L Amount

LUMP 5UM AMOUNT FOR REPARIR
AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENCATION

Remark

Make/Model : TOYOTR PRIUS
Accident Date : 17.12.2018

H.B. Paysant by cheque should be crossed and

mads payable bto 'EMAT Automobive Sarvices Pte Ltd'.

Fo receipt will be issusd unless requested.

Page 1/1

5 2,750.00

GRAND TOTAL H 2,1750.00

,J%@
— ~

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Autamotive Services Pte Ltd

E. & 0.E




@ smrr

SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept OurRef:  TAX/12/1872074
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 27/1272018

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 4404G & SLK 2086P ON 17/12/2018 ALONG PIE
TOWARDS CHANGI AIRPORT

This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHC 4404G is $108.07 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours sincerely
RT TAXIS PTELTD

for Manager
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Enguire Transaction History
Transaction History Detalls

Log Date/Time: 18 Dec 2016/ 15:52:34
Assat Tvpe: Vehicke Transaction Amount: T4y
Asset D SLK20BAP
Transaction Type: 18,32 Insurance Enquiry [GIRD Payment) Channel: External Agency
ESASBAHO - BALQISH BINTE ABDUL Birsinaas Transaction 5
User ID: HALIL Ref Na: 2018121815523426827.
Search Date / Time: 17 Dec 2018 18:25:00
Insurance Company: ATG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD.
Information displayed Is cormect as at the jog date and time.
Enguire Related Logs Back to List

MDA LR GOV SR VT CTION TIUDSENCY | ML OGLAI FFLmL | RN _IUST 1ou Tvuse |
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Merimen e-Claims

Page | of |

..«CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Eapress
|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING -
Case | Notifed |Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Adj Rpt | maj Submitted | Ins Authied Status
i 19 Dec 2018 i $$2,750.00 $$2,750.00 Pansing for Burvey
1141 t
£t Heg | £ Adj At | Edit Estimates | | View Rt Cancel Caee |

Hain Reference

Claim Datails

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Insured: | CHIN KIMPAT, ID: 525683400

Mairn | ;
Claimant SMAT TAXIS PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.. 198905360k

et | SHC4404G
Claim Type: | TP / 491835881856

| [Created by adjuster]

- 47122018 18:00 - ;59
Date of Loss: | og wonths and 11 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r}] |
Policy/Cover
Mote No.: | (Comprehensive]

Policy MNo.
(Claimant):

| D= 180902 1IMFSH

Excess: -
| SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) 60 Woodiands Industrinl Park B4, 757705 Woodlands - Tel: 68662628

AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel: 65-8419-3000 ... [Mandled by Ler, Bernard-3Q]
Barnard Kijian, Lari@aig, com

| MS First Capltal Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 52227311
| LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handied by ONG WWEE JIE] ... [Final Rpt due 02/01/2019)

Clamant's
Insurer:
Adjuster:
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

» AIG_SG (Z1/12/2018); TP GIA REPORT

view Al | Compose Case Mail |

"ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS—
Due Date  Priority Type
Mo resubts.

View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |
Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

Task Group

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 14/3/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SHC4404G (49183588185G)
[SLK2086P]
T

SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Dec 17 2018 6:00PM
[CHIN KIMPAT]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Videa - - 1 per pags E )|
No_|Finalised On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (SG) Thumbnall | Print
& .?_z.mmu 15:24 M"m!t_ w‘wmim, © | Losd mpe
Letters/Correspondences 1perpage | ~] B
Mo [Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnaii| Print
3 |(Draft) Third Party Express Settiament - Payment Breakdown 0 Edfit
lmm o IHF;_H =} BA
[ho |Fnalzed On AlG Asia Facific Insurance Ple. Lid. (5G] Thumbrail | Print
[: 28/12/18 15:24 m_m o O | Load HTM
inm;ulmgu Sperpoge | v)| BA
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |211121810:26 | Genersl View O wurs B
2 (211218 10:26 | General View D | Losa G | A
3 (211218 30:26 | Genersl View O | osawe | B |
4 (2110181025 | Ganeral View '@ | weaws | B |
S 2112181026 | General View | @ | saws | B
6 (21118 10:26 | General View | | oeaws | BB
7 21218 10:26 | General View D | aiwc | A
B 211218 10:26 | General View D | waws | A
% (211318 10:26 | Genaral View D | aws | F
0 |21/16 10:26 | Genersl View D | Ladirc | B
11 12112/18 10:26 Ganeral View 0 | e | (A
12 2112161026 General View O | s | B2
13 |21/1/16 10:26 | Genersl View - O | wsaws | @A
14 |21/12/1810:26 | General View B O aws | &
15 |20/12/18 10:26 | Ganeral View - O  wowrs M ]
16 (21/12/18 10:26 | General View O | cwrs | F
i:ff 2112/1811:35 | Dismantied Parts a O  icedws | M
1B 2112/18 1135 | Dlsmantied Parts o D! lesdirs | B
19 211218 11:35 | Dismantied Parts B 0  carws | &
20 |21/12/1811:35 | Glsmantied Parts 0 | waawc | M
21 2112181135 | Dismantled Parts D siwc | &
|23 21/12/18 11:35 Dismantied Parts D | iceaires | A
23 [21/12/18 11:35 | Dismantied Parts o D | wwars || A
124 |21/12/16 11:35 | Dismantied Parts O | loedwc | &
25 [2112/18 11:35 | Dismantied parts D | losdirc | B
16 |21/12/18 11:35 | Dismantied Parts D | aaws |

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc...

14/3/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 0f 2
Video [iperpoge  [~] B2 |
Mo Fnalzed On | AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) [ [ Thumbnail | print.
27 |21/12/18 11135 | Dismantied Parts O icsarws [ 4
38 |21/12/1B 11:35 | Dismantied Parts 0 | urs | &
39 |21/12/1811:35 | Dismantied Parts o O | owrs | A
36 |28/12/18 11:10 | Photo After Spray ) | Losd G
31 (28/12/1B1110 | Photo After Spray | @y | Loedies | B
32 |26/12/1B 11110 | Photo After Spray 1 © | aews M
Documeantation = 1 per page E A
Ho |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print
1 |23/13/1B 16:10 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Loat POE
2 |23112/18 16:10 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
3 |20/02/19 16:51 LETTER TO 01 Load POF
4 [1403/18 15:51 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Lowt! POF
5 [14/03/19 15:53 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
6 | 14/03/19 15:5] | Release Voucher Load POF
7 |14jU3/1% 15:53 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF
B [14/03/19 15:53 RENTAL MILEAGE Load PO
9 |14/03/19 15:53 LTA SEARCH Load POF
10 |14/03/19 15:57 | INCOME TAX Load POF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST
There are no document checkiists configured.

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
Nobe. Bamarey 6 QrivEte Uhiss poy shew It D Siner perbaes
https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 14/3/2019



NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLK2086P (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI 1.8 (A)
SHC4404G (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |17/12/2018

Global Sum Settiement |- | [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate '8 10,042.30
Final Repair Cost 4 4 070.00
Loss of Use $ 7.00 days at $80.00 per day
Rental (if any) b T days
LTA ! GIA Search Fee -
Others: b
-
Final Settlament Sum (Glabal Sum) 'S 4,070.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate

below)
A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: A
BOLA Liability: (%) Assessad Liability (%) (%)
* Assessed Liabillty 1o be filled anly for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd ' § 4,070.00
2) -
3) o
4) 3
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN ‘;u':‘;*
LEK Auto Consullants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report! Bill {if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 14/3/2019




Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg ne 1essorisar;
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@/kkauto com;assignments@ikkauto com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CCHAIG1B022852/0FA302

Date: 14/03/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, Palicy No:
maimant Vehicle shcaa0sc Insured Vehicle No :  SLK2086P
Date of Loss: 1711212018 Mature of Claim: ™ Clalim No: 481B3588185G
RIPTION & IDENTIFICATION I
Reg No SHC4404G
Make & Model: TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI, 1.8 (A) Engine No. 2ZR5889242
Reg. Date: 08/01/2014 (Man, Year: 2013) Chassis No. JTDKN3BUX05721063
Colour: Maroon Odometer; 524699 km
Engine Capacity 1798 cc
Market Value/Mew Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S3) Markel Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Sieering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabls): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condilion;
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/MB5 R15
Front Left Side: Falken & mm Rear Left Side: Falken 6 mm
Front Right Side: Falken & mm Rear Right Side: Falken & mm
The above values represen! the emaning e reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s  Difference  Diff %
Parts 6,642.30 1,882 82 4,759 48 71.65
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3.400.00 1.220.00 2,180.00 64.12
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5§) 10,042.30 3.102.82 6,939.48 69.10
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 2,750.00
Nett Amount (S§) 10,042.30 2,750.00 7,292.30 T2.62
+ Loss of Use (7.0 x 5580.00/day) (S$) 5680.00
+ Car Rental (7.0 x S5108.07/day) (S3) 756.49
+ Doc/Search Fee (5§) 7.00
Nett Liability (S$) 4,073.49
Global Sum Settlament (S§) 4,070.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 18/12/2018
Date Inspected: 1801212018 Inspected At SMRT Automolive Services Pte Lid

(Woodlands)

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/3/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days

Adjuster: ONG HWEE JIE Manager: Chong Poh Kin

NOTE: This report represevts our findings af (he tme and place of inspection gtated hensin, Such inspection has been camed ouf o the best of our
knowledge and abilfy but any other Nahiity under any oftar circumatances (i hereby oxpressly exciuded,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 14/3/2019



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
K *TAIL GATE DOOR GLASS MOULDING ,RH (DISC 25%)  Necessary 2940F *2205F
2 1 “TAIL GATE DOOR GLASS MOULDING ,LH (DISC 25%) Necessary 2840F *22.05F
3 1 *NAME PLATE (HYBRID) (DISC 25%) Nacessary 5180F "3883F
4 1 *“MOULDING BACK WINDOW LOWER NO.1 [DISC 25%) Necessary 2840F *22.05F
5 1 'BUF:SPER CLIPS (DISC 25%) MNecessary 16.10F *12.08F

(10 PCS)
-] 1 *BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RR/LH (DISC 25%) Cracked 84 80F *T1.10F
7 1 *BUMPER REAR (DISC 25%) Deformed 458 60F *343.85F
8 1 *"TAILGATE ASY (DISC 25%) Dentad 1,007 80F *75583F
8 2 “PIXEL STICKER (SN) Necessary 120.00F *120.00F
10 3 *SEALANT WISCREEN (SN) Necessary 111.00F *111.00F
o1 *ARM SUB,ASSY ,RR BUMPER RH Nol Mecessary 139.60F *F
12 1 *BUMPER LIP COVER RR/LH Nol Necessary T220F *-F
13 1 *BUMPER SEAL .RR LH Not Necessary BB.90F *-F
L “TAILGATE DOOR WEATHER STRIP Not Necessary 35340F “F
15 1 *TAILGATE LOCK ,COVER Not Necessary 15.70F e
16 1 “SEALANT SIKAFLEX Not Necessary 37.00F *F
17 1 *UNDER COVER SUBASSY RR FLOOR Nol Necessary 514 50F *~F
18 1 *BUMPER REINFORCEMENT REAR Not Necessary 205.70F *-F
19 1 *BUMPER SEAL ,RR RH Notl Necessary B5.70F *F
20 1 *STRIKER ,BACK DOOR Mot Necessary 4B90F *F
21 1 *SPARE TYRE PANEL Not Necessary B667.70F *-F
2 1 *ARM SUB-ASSY RR BUMPER ,LH Not Necessary 13960F “.F
23 1 *SENSOR REVERSE Mot Necessary 180.00F *-F
24 1 *REINFORCEMENT ,RR Mot Necessary 34 60F *-F
25 1 *BUMPER LIP COVER RRURH Nol Necessary 11B10F *-F
28 1 *BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RR/RH Nol Necessary 84 BOF *F
2T 1 *BUMPER LIP REAR Not Necessary 228.90F *-F
28 1 *ANTENNA ELECTRICAL LOWER REAR Not Necessary 157 40F *F
29 1 “TAILGATE DOOR LOCK Not Necessary 444 10F =F
o 1 *END PANEL Not Necessary 602.10F *F
311 ‘BUMPER REINFORCEMENT REAR (DISC 25%) Dented 205.70F "15428F
2 1 “ARM SUB-ASSY ,RR BUMPER LH [DISC 25%) Bent 138.60F *1D4.7OF
3 1 "ARM 5UB-ASSY ,RR BUMPER RH (DISC 25%) Bent 138.60F =104.70F
FaFranchise pan

Total Parts (S§) 6,642.30 1,882.82

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/3/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new misceilaneous items selectied.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK New 1,264.00 500.00
2 SPRAY PAINT New 1,296.00 500.00
3  TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION New B0.0O 20.00
4 TO REMOVE AND INSTALL LUGGAGE COMPARTMENT TRIM New 120.00 0.00
TO FACILITATE REPAIR
5 TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN New 240,00 120.00
6 TO REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS New 100.00 0.00
7 TO TEST AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR SYSTEM New 120.00 30.00
8 TO TRANSFER REAR TAILGATE MECHANISM New 120.00 50.00
8  TOWASH AND VACUUM New 60.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 3,400.00 1,220.00
I Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
hitps:/singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ... 14/3/2019



