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!‘I’/I’/ Auto

gl Consuftants
Bk BAE B Pa Ltd Company Registration No, 1996071%6R

51 LRI AYE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDLUST RIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL & ((65) 62563561 FAX ¢ (%) 62564515

Your ref: D1R800BRBSMESH

Our Ref: CS/FCI18022819/R1vd2 Date :19/12/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO_SLC 24384

We thank you for your instruction on 19/12/3018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
21/12/2018 at the premises of M/s CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §51,817.20
Revised Estimate Amount 1 551,348.73
"Check” ltems Amount : 5544.18
Market Value b

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%

Nett Value 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear ofs portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMMED RASUL
Automotive Assessor



H 1 M5 First Capital Insurance Limited ccmeg no 1950000060 G4T Reg Ko, M2-0001675-9
MS‘ FirstCapital 6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580

Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fac (656222 3547
Cladma & Hotes Ussrwriting Dept 35 Robinson Road #LE-O1 City House Singapore 0BE877

Tel; (65) 6507 3848 Fax (65| 6507 3849
wiwivi msfirstcapital com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 17-12-2018 Qur Ref No. D1800BBBSMFEH
Accident Date 13-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHA1108Y Third Party Vehicle. SLC2438A
Survey Location BLK 1010 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-105
Contact Person. SHARON LEE
Contact No. 62717054/ 62733304 Fax No. 627368676
Survey Type DIRECT SETTLEMENT:
A inted

PpoInia LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. BB416315
Contact Number. MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

CHARN'S :
Cc: Workshop CUSTOMCRAET Attention. MNIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA
Officer Incharge KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 29 January 2019 11:12 AM
To: Charn's Customcraft; SUR

Subject: RE: SLC 2438A-DOA: 13/12/2018
Dear Sharon,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed $1348.72 before GST @ 3 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 January 2019 10:56 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLC 2438A-DOA: 13/12/2018

Importance: High

Hi Veron
kindly find attached for finalization,

Parts: $508.72
SIN: $200.00
[ab: $640.00

Fotal: 51348.72
Please confirm

Thanks & Regards.

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customeraft

Tel: 6272 3429 Fax: 6273 6676
Fmail: charns(@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 15 January, 2019 2:08 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft; SUR

Subject: 5L.C 2438A-DOA: 13/12/2018




Dear Sharon,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-431%

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Veron Chen (LKKAuto) :

From: WVeron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 24 December 2018 11:28 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: 'Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008885MFSH/1, S5LC 2438A
Attachments: SLC 2438A PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SL.C 2438A
Date of survey: 21/12/2018
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 December 2018 9:33 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008885MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

N -
HE
BEST REGARDS, LS

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 5:43 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LEKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008885MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

' AVG_ This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WWW.aVE.COIMm



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crwner 1D Type:

Owner D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Na:

Yehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Yehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.;

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

POP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Page 1 of 1

Business
2796C

SLC242B4

Yes

14 Dec 2018
TOYOTA

WISH 18 A
Gray

2006
1772576021
ZME100307320
7.0kW (130 bhp)
£13.477.00

22 May 2004
22 May 2006

2

£21.425.00

Forfeited

$0.00

21May 2021

E - Open Category
5

$23,024.00
$11,214.00
$11,214.00

Please note that the S-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan [if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Dec 2018

hitps:/vil.lta.gov.se/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNC TION_[D=F03...

OK

14/12/2018
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& diffa=ng

Certificate of Insurance

MOTORVEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT [CHAPTER 133)
WIOTOR VEHICLES | THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION] RULES, 1353

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 (MALAYSIA)

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD PARTY RISHS) RULES, 1955 [MALAYSIA}

Certificate Number; 5100440485 Cover : drivo CLASSIC
Index mask.and Roaistration Number 5F Vehicke SLC243BA
ChassisMumber INEIDDINTI2D

7. Nameaf Policyholder DUBER

| 3. Effective Date of Insurance 22 May 2018

4. Expiry Date of Insurance + 21 May 2019

5. Persons or Classes of Persons entitled to drives

(3l The Policyholdar.
(b) Any othar parson who is driving on tha Policyholder's ardar or with his/her permission.

Pravided that the person driving is permitted in accordance with the licensing or gther laws or regulations to drive
| the Motar Vaehicle or has been 50 permitted and is not disqualified by arder of a Court of Law or by reason of any
1 enactmeEnt ar regulation in that behalf from driving the Matar Vehicle.

&, Lmitations as to Usal

la] Use for social domestic and pleasure purposes and in cannection with the Policyhplder's or Hirer's business.
This Policy does not cover

(a} Use for racing, pace-making, reliability trial or speed-testing.

(k) Use for the carriage of goods (other than samples] in conngction with any trade or Business.

{c] Use for any purpose in connection with the Motor Trade,

# Lirnitations rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Mator Vehicle (Third Party Risks and Compensation)
Act (Chapter 183} and Section 35 of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysial, are not to be included under thase

headings.
EXCESS {SECTION 1) ¢ 822000
EXCESS (3ECTION 2) ;551,500
WINDSCREEM EXCESS 1 85100
ADDITIOMAL EXCESS BT
LNMNAMED DRIVER EXCESS - PLEASE REFER OVERLEAF
REPAIR AT DWMNER'S PREFERRED WORKSHOP - N0
INSURE WiTH COE LYES
| NCD PROTECTION | ND
TRANSPORAT ALLOWANCE T NG
£XCESS WAIVER : NO
PRIMARY DRIVER TR
MAMED DRIVER (1) T ONSA
MAMED DRIVER (2) L NSA
HIRE PLIRCHASE COMPANY SWEE SENG CREDIT PTELTD
SUN INSURED © MARKET WALLIE OF INSURED WEHICLE AT TIME OF LO5%

[/we hereby Certify that the Policy to which this Certificate relates is issued n accordance with the provisians of the Maotar
wvehicles |Third Party-Risks and Compensation| Act {Chapter 185} and Part IV of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia)

L]

Agency ©OWW INSURAMNCE AGENCY PTE. LTD. (QO000614578)
Date of lssue 03 May 2018 09:58 hrs

For NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-QPERATIVE LIMITED

Countersigned By:

nuthaﬁsedEffi:er Chief Eie'n:u.itiwe
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TAN WE! HIANG JACKY
(CHEN WEIXIANG)

B & A

CHINESE

Oatte af tuirtn £ TR
18-05-1977 M

oy af Bink

o SINGAPORE




Dated: lj' DE_C EmR &R '101 ¢ c/o Charn’s Customcraft
] Blk 1010 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-105
Singapore 159724
]CL"' 1 Capant Tel: 6271 7054
Fax: 6273 6676

Motor clawa P<pt

By Fax:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,
PR——— - - L ol Y

A Alont olip Vot  FLELAnDEA  KOAD

I, the owner of motor vehicle no: SLC 24R Q f  wish to inform you that my
vehicle was involved in the above said accident which was caused by the carelessness of
the driver of your insured vehicleno: __ SHA- (L0 4 Y

The details of how the accident occurred are stated in the Singapore Accident Statement
and a copy of which is enclosed for your attention.

I shall be most grateful if you could kindly arrange your appointed surveyor {0 survey my
vehicle at CHARN’S CUSTOMCRAFT of BLK 1010, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-105,
Singapore 159724 within TWO working days from the date of this letter, failing which
I have no alternative but to instruct the workshop to proceed with the independence
survey, necessary repair and send you the total bill for payment.

As per MCF, kindly revert the liability within 14 working days after the survey was
done by vour appointed surveyor.

Your immediate attention to the above matter is greatly appreciated.

( Youlé. faithfully,
L #

CHARN'S 0/ )a
Bin “USTOMCRAF
SI0CK 1010 204 FT
Bkt e 04105
4 =ran L ana-a
N annr S
T o Frgn o o
ki S B3739m
= ¥ = 3304
= 18rnsg
SINENEt.cam o



Accident Clatm Repatr, Cornosion Wl

Bus. Reg. Mo. 25151300M

NTUC/FC (SHA 1106 Y
DOA: 13/12/2018 @21.25

| pc
| pe

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

ATTN: THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

Spray-Painting, Mechanic Bopiie And Cstomizing of Co

aLOCK 1010, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-105, SINGAPORE 15t 724
BLOGHK 1009, BUKIT MERAH LAME 3, ¥01-B2, SINGAPORE 3
TEL: 62717054, BE7E3304 FAX: 62736676 EMAIL: charns@aingnal com.Sg

THIRD PARTY CLAIM

ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO:
SLC 2438 A - TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (A)

CHASIS NO: ZNE 10-0307320

CLAIM REF NO: (D18008885MFSH)

ding, Body Dent Repairs

rs

3

17/12/201%8

Rear bumper PE~ = $  616.30
Rear bumper reflector-RH  ~ ik $ 58.90
Rear bumper retainer RH A~ -~ $ 62.00

$ 737.20
LESS 25% $ 184.48

$ 552.72
Check wiring function S 40.0(
Rear sensor $ 200.00 A~
Remove/reinstall/replace the necessary parts: jacking. panel
beating the above and other affected areas.

$ 4{4,971{ 10U
Respray rear end panel, rear bumper and other affected \V-x?
areas, i A $ T0 oV

g2 L S w

ADD 7% GST 5 2726 43{.(!_

S —t 4 LLF Qoo ¥

Note: The above is an estimate only. IF other parts requested
during the course of repair. we will inform you accordingly.

All parts are subject to availability. C)

CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT

.

2 Ay
3
:l[\{L{Lh@ ”%

eyt

oV



Accident Claim Repair, Corrosion Welding, Body Dent Repairs,
Spray-Painting, Mechanical Repair And Customizing of Cars

BLOCK 1003, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-82, SINGAFORE 159723

TEL: B2717054, 62733304 FAX:E2736576 EMAIL: chams@singnet.com.sg
Bus. Reg. No. 251513/00M

” Qi 20°

NTUC/FC (SHA 1106 Y
DOA: 13/12/2018 @21.25

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE PTE LTD 17/12/2018

ATTN: THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

THIRD PARTY CLAIM

ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO:
SLC 2438 A -TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (A)

CHASIS NO: ZNE 10-0307320

CLAIM REF NO: (D18008885MFSH)

BLOCK 1010, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #01-105, SINGAPORE 159724 % AV

2,0

b0 9%

1 pe Rear bumper PE~ " $ 61630
—pe———Rear-bumper-reflector-RH—= $ 58:00
Rear bumper retainer RH *~**~ b 62.00
$ 737.20 L%
LESS 25% 5 184.48
S s 552.?/@71
Check wiring function 5 40.0
Rear sensor $ 200.00 A~ —
Remove/reinstall/replace the necessary parts: jacking, panel
beating the above and other affected areas.
s 4geh 30U

Respray rear end panel, rear bumper and other affected
areas. $ ﬂD_EEG 30

$ 1,817.20

ADD 7% GST $  127.20 L
§  1,044.40 gf; Qoutoob¥

L]
Note: The above is an estimate only. IF other parts requested
during the course of repair, we will inform you accordingly.
LKK Auto Consultants hence natify
All parts are subject to availability the Repairer of the foilowing:

= To resurvay beforefilef spray painting
« To display damageMrin(s) during resurvey :1 [
FN'S CUSTOMCRAFT = Paris pricag are subject 1o confirmation

* Third party susvey is on 2 “Wilhout Frojudics” basig &‘\A’
® o [llegal medification]s] & 3'lowed =
* Suppiementary item{s) must be resurayr 4 and

P — = Sl o o ooV

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signaluie:
Datar




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. MNo. 18-2607188-R

§ i e

i, F W

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURAMNCE LTD Raf CS/IFCI18022819/R 1vwd3n2
srommeoneord oewsser o =aroe | [THHNNN
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 1108Y Veh. Inspected SLC 2438A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18008885MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  KARENT Assign Date 19M12/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAWISH1.6A c.c 1794
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2006
Chassis No. ZNE100307320 Colour GREY
Odometer 291799 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
X Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre 205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  13/12/2018 [inspection Date 21/1212018
Survey held at CHARN'S CUSTOMCRAFT
BLK 1010 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-105
SINGAPORE 158724
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




I B Fdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
"'_’; ; . 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
"'_'_L! TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 109607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R Page No. 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. S5LC 2438A
P Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qry Pt Workshop ()| (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 516,30 616.30
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR-RH NOT NECESSARY 58.90 .
1|REAR BUMPER RETAINER RH NECESSARY 62.00 62.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -184.30 -169.58
552.90 508.72
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR SENSOR (SN) NOT WORKING 200.00 200.00
200.00 200.00
LABOUR
CHECK WIRING FUNCTION 40.00 40.00
REMOVE/REINSTALL/REPLACE THE NECESSARY 440.00 300.00
PARTS,JACKING, PANEL BEATING THE ABOVE AND
OTHER AFFECTED AREAS.
RESPRAY REAR END PANEL REAR BUMPER AND 400.00 300.00
OTHER AFFECTED AREAS
880.00 540.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,632.90 1,348.72
I RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | I 1,348.72|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18022819/R1vd3n2
MARKET VALUE: $15,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $11,214.00=NETT VALUE: $3,786.00

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solaly for tha use and benefit of the Client named on the frond page of this Report.

Bo liabilty of resgonaiifity whalscevar, in contact or ten,
Bepor, inwtiole of in part, does 5031 his or her own risk.




