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PAREF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |ID Type:
Owner |ID:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Business
8271A

GBF2645X

No

20 Dec 2018

TOYOTA

TOYOTA DYNA 150 MANUAL
Silver

2016

1KD2633872
JTFAT35YX0K206739
$24,946.00

15 Aug 2016

15 Aug 2016

1

$1,248.00

No

$0.00

14 Aug 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$9,657.00

$7,388.00

$7,388.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Dec 2018

OK

https://vrl lta.gov.sg/la/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION_ID=F030...

Page | of 1
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- Fre rapair inspection request - GBFZE45X VS GBAITTTT (O) DDA 1TH212018

From  Azlan, Syazairdina

T admin-aiauta.com, assignmantsdixkauto com

Ceo Fang, Andy-3Y, Chin, Lea-Ying, Abu Kasaim, Noar Managa. Md lenak. Mand mran Lim, Sheng Yang, Milhposingh, Asstwaenjsetksur, Her, Yinrul, Chan, Yeike Shi, Kaur, Baljt
Sank  TRA22018 43810 PM

Atscnmants. 7L §1165 (ol gl Y1008 - Notice L Ascidentioel

Hi,
Plaase refar to the enclosad request from Cheonghoh Law Corporation.

Claim no : BO206%465 150003
Case Ownar  : CHEE HEMNG LOH

If you have any quaries/concems, please let us know,
Kindiy pesist to assign Marews Chuo os Single Jalnt Expert os requested.

Thanks and regards,

Syaza lrding Azlan

G

Express Claimg Adjusier ||

%03 Claima Oparations | AlD Shared Senicas

From: Cheorghoh Law [mailto: mail@cheonghch.sgl

Sent; Wednesday, December 19, 2018 .30 PM

To: Azlan, Syazairding

Cet Fang, Andy-57; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Md Ishak, Mohd Imran; Lim, Sheng 'Yarg; Mithoosingh, Aastwesnjestkaur; Hor, Yinrul; Chan, Yoke Shi;
Kaur, Baljit; Kai Liang Kal Liang

Subject: Re: Qur ref: LCH, jp/2KB03-81 145.18 Your ref- BI206946515G003 - Accident mvoiving GBF 2645 X/ GBAITI? T [AIG) on 17/12/18 along slip road of AYE
towards West Coast Way - Pre-repair survey ("PRS™) of GBF 2545 X

Dear Sirs
We refer o the above matter and vour e-mail of even date below.

We write to confirm our client nominates Marcus Chua from LKE Auto Consultants Pre Lud to conduct the pre-repair survey of the damages to GBF 2645
X and he be appointed as the Single Joint Expert.

Regards,

Jennifer

Cheonghoh Law Corporation
Blk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05
Singapore 160053

Tel: G33TETO0

Fax: 63373700

On 19 Dec 2018, at 16:23, Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com> wrote:

Hi Jennifer,

Please confirm that you are nominating Marcus Chua from LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd named in the list of surveyors to conduct the pre-repair survey
and appointed as the “Single Joint Expert™.

Thanks and regards,

Syaza lrdina Azlan

AlG

Express Claims Adpisher 1l

55 Claams Operabions | AIG Shared Semvices

From: Cheonghoh Law [mailsemalicheonghob sg]
Sent: Wednesday, December 19, 2018 4:13 PM
To: Azlan, Syazairdina

Ce: Fong, Andy-5Y; Chin, Lea-¥ing; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Md [shak, Mohd Imsan; Lim, Sneng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; Hor, Yinrul;
Chan, Yoxe Shi; Kaur, Baljit; Kal Liang Kai Liang

Subject: Re: Our ref: LCHjn/ZKR03-81145.18 Your ref: BO2069465 156003 - Aocikdent invalving GBF 2645 X/ GBA 3777 T (AIG) on 17/12/18 glong slip road
of BYE towards West Coast Way - Pre-repair survey ("PRS") of GEF 2645 X

LURGENT
Drear Sirs
We refer to the above matter and your e-mail of even date below.

Our elient hereby nominates Marcus Chua from LKK Auto Consultants Pue Lid 2s listed in your aforesaid e-mail 1o conduct the pre-repair
survey ("PRS™) of the damages 1o our client’s vehicle no, GBEF 2645 X arising out of the above mentioned accident

Kindly liaise with our client’s repair workshop for the PRS of aur elient’s vehicle, the details are as follows :-



Kai Liang Motor Service
Autobay @@ Kaki Bukit

| Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-101
Singapore 417883

Person to contact ; Annie/Mr Tan {contact ro. 67474189)

Kindly acknowledge.
Thank you

Regards,

Jennifer

Cheongnoh Law Corporation
Blk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05
Singapore 160053

Tel: 63378700

Fax: 63373700

On 19 Dec 2018, at 15:21, Azlan, Syazairding <Syazairdina Azlan@aig.com= wrote:

<lopo. jpeg= <lock.gif>

This is a secure, encrypled message. To read it, open the
attachment.

EETsiEED, NEARLER, FFENH.

fAsmsirermsaoeduorueaiasy Wwodnohdiits
e Ausuan

ojz{e gtEsin YEelE HAR YU 23E Hed
Hye mys guct

[ni adalah pesan, aman terenknipsi. Untuk membacanya,
membuka attachment.

Click berp by 2018-12-26 15:21 +08 10 read your message.

After that, open the attachment

bl rde
Disschaimor: This emml und its conten ane cosfidetibal and mpendisd sodely for tha e of the
sldrexese Pleave wollfy the sesder if vou lisve 1eeaved thes 2emmil ot or amply deleie
it
Saisgral bn Prosdpoint eeryphes, Copy gl ©r200462017 Proofpoi, ke All nghs
rervetl
=SecureMessage Att himl=

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The informatian in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
infarmation. If you have received this email in arror, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any
coples or printcuts theses!. Although this email and any attachments are believed to e free of any virus or ather defect that might affect any
computer systerm into which it is received and opened, it is tha responsitdity of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepied by Amarican International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates sither jointly of severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way
from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The infermalion i this email (and any stachments) is conndantial If you are net the imerded reckpient, you musi nol uss of daseminate tha infarmaticn. If you have recaived this ama in
grrar, please immedistaly rolify me by "Reghy” command and parmanently delese the original and arry copeas or printeuts thereol, ARhcugh tis email and any attachmants are balioved to
ba frea of ary virus or other dafect that might alect any compuler system inlo which (€ is received and apened, it s 1he reaspansiblity of the recipient Lo ensure that it i virus fae and no
resparaibility is accapled by American Infernational Group, Inc. or is subsidiaries or afiiates ethar jointly of sevarally, Tor any 1055 or damage arising in 8ny way from &5 use
From: Syazairdina AzlangBaig. com

To: mail@cheangheh 5

Ce; Andy-BY Fengieig.com Lee-

Ying Chini@aig.com MoorMariesa AbukassimDalg com bmran. ishakGaig.com Shangang LimEaig.com Amshweenjsetkaur Mitheasingh@ag.com Yinrd HonGaw, com yokeshichan
{@aig com BaiiL Kaunfaig.com

Subject: RE: AIGENCRYPT - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING QUR INSLRED VEHICLE GBAITTTT AND CEF2545% ON 1722018

Date: Wad, 19 Dac 2018 O7:21:51 «0000

Dear SinMadam,

Reminder far pre-repair survey.
Kindly respanse ta the email below whether agree to the appointment of any of these moter surveyors below as a single jint expen

Thanks and ragards,

Syaza Irdina Azlan
AlG



Express Claims Adjuster 11

5G Glaims Operations | AIG Shaved Sendces

Fram: Azlan, Syazairdina

Sent: Tuesday, December 18, 2018 4:05 PM

Tae: mailcheanghoh,sg

Cc: Fong, Andy-5Y; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Neor Mariesa; Md [shak, Mohd Imean; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; Hor, Yinrul, Chan, Yoke Shi;

Kaur, Baljit

Subject: AIGENCAYFT - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE GBAJTTTT AND GBRFIZGAIX ON 17/12/2018

Without Prejudice

Your Reference

CLOH 2K RO3-21 145 18
; BO20694651 5G003

Our Reference
Dear SinMadam,
We refer to vour Notice of Accident of even date.

We intend 1o conduct a presrepair survey of the damage 0 your client™s'your customer’s vehicle jointly with vour client'your motor workshop, We propose o use ong of
the motor surveyors named in the attached list 1o conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expeart:

Name ol Survevor
Al In Howse Surveyor

Company Name
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid

Lawrence Ng Chun Kee

Priority Services

Jeffrey Ong Leng Kial

Priority Services

Jimmy Lee Priority Services
EC Looi Automobile Inspection Services Ple Lid
Pang Kiah Keen (Frankie) Formteam Adjusters Pte Lid
| Ng You Han Formteam Adjusiers Pre Lid
Soon HanXin {Gary) Formteamn Adjusters Pre Lud
Chow Bo Xiong Formteam Adjusters Pre Lid

Chua Soo Teck [Benamin)

Formteam Adjusters Pie Lid

Kalvin Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

| Xing Guo Chang LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Marcus Chua LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Mohamad Taufikh LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
Adrian Ling LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Maohammed Rasul LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Kenneth Kong LEK Awto Consultants Ple Lid

Please bet us know within two (2) working days whither you agree 10 the appointment of any of Uhese motor surveyars as a single joint expert. You may select one
of more of the listed motor surveyors, We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carmed out by the single joint expert.

Thanks and regards,

Syaza Irdina Azlan

AlG

Exprazs Clams Adjusiar i

5G Claims Dperations | AIG Shared Saervicas

From; Lim, Sheng Yang

Sent: Tuesday, December 18, 2018 3:41 PM

Toe Azlan, Syazairding

Subject: FW: Qur ref LCH, jp/2KB03-81145.18 Your ref: GBA 3777 T - Accident involving GBF 2645 X | GEA 3777 T (AIG) on 17/12/18 along slip road of AYE towards
West Coast Way - Notioe of Accident

From: Cheangheh Law [mailto:mail@cheonghaoh.sg)

Sent: Tuesday, December 18, 2018 3:37 PM

To: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Tan, Lily (AlG); Fong, Andy-5Y, Kaur, Baljit; Chin, Lee-Ying; Lim, Sheng Yang;, Md Ishak, Mahd Imran; Chan, Yoke Shi; Supramaniam,
Darsheng

Subject: Re: Our ref: LCH.jp/2KB03-B1145.18 Your ref: GBA 3777 T - Accident irvalving GBF 2645 X / GBA 3777 T (AIG) on 17/12/18 along slip road of AYE towards
West Coast Way - Notice of Accident

URGENT
Dhear Sirs
Kindly see sttached our letter dated 18 December 2018 - Motice of Accident and enclosing a copy of our client’s accident report for your attention,
Regards,
Jennifer

Cheaanghoh Law Corporation
Elk 53 Chin Swee Road #03-05



Singapore 160053
Tel; 63376700
Fax: 63373700



MLAS |81 EZ2E8-01 | Jin Auio Bendces Ple Lid - Delu
ENTRY D JE & TIME: 17122018 15:59
SUBMTTED BY: Sch Wah Jin

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Picase report cormectly the details of the accidant to spasd up the claims process.

2. This Form must bs completed by the Palicyholder and/or the Authorised Driver

4. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wiltul misnepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow Insurance companias o
repudiate policy labdity.

&, The isaus and acoeptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy lkahdlity on the part of the insurance comp:anes.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

. This report will ¢ forwardesd by the ingurers of the GIA Records Managemant Cenire established by the Ganaral Insurance Assoclation of Singapors {GIA) for
archiving and that copées of this report will, for a fee, be made svadable upon application by interested partias.

7. By the lodgament of this report to the insurers, you herety consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and 10 copies of the report being made available
aforesad

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 17/12/2018 15:59

Date Of Accident 17272018 11:45

Exact Location Of Accident SLIP ROAD OF AYE TOWARDS WEST COACH WAY
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number GBF2645X

Insured/Policyholder

Mame Of Registered Cwner CSM DESIGN

Co Reg No 5304827 1A

Email Address KELVIN.CSMDESIGN@GMAIL. COM
Mobile Phone Mo

Alternative Phone No QOFFICE-69096481

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer TOYOTA

Model TOYOTA DYNA 150 MANUAL

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy -
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy ND

Policy Number DMCVSMN3047951800
Cover Note Number

Driver

Mame of Driver LEE KOK CHAW

MRIC No S1803139F

Date Of Birth 12/04/1967

Oecupation QUTDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 18/07/1584

Driving Experience 34 YEARS AND 4 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Mobile Number +65-00282380

Fax Mumber

Contact Mumbsar
EMail Address KELVIN.CSMDESIGN@E@GMAIL.COM

Page 1.of 25



Address BLK 128 PENDING ROAD #10-310
Postcode 670128

Was driver an employee of the Insured’s Company YES

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -

Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type OF Accident CHAIN COLLISION
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown person(s)

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. NO
Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes.Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? MO

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

| WAS TRAVELLING ALONG AYE TOWARDS WEST COACH WAY WHEN THE FRONT VEHICLE C:¥YN8515J BRAKE , | ALSO
BRAKE AND STOPPED COMPLETELY ,SUDDENLY | FELT AN IMAPCY FROM MY VEHICLE REAR PORTION . THE IMPACT
WAS SO STRONG AND PUSHED MY VEHICLE FORWARD AND HAD HIT ONTO THE FRONT VEHICLE , UPON CHECKING ,
THE REAR VEHICLE B :GBA3777T HAD COLIDED ONTO MY VEHICLE REAR PORTION , NO ONE WAS INJURED.

Attachment(s)
Are accident pholos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? WO
Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number GBA3TTTT

Vehicle MakeModel/Colour TOYOTA

Details OFf Properties

Vehicle Calegory COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Mame of Driver CHIN VUI KIEN
MRIC/Passport Number 406485773

Contact Number 83458143

Addrass

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 25



DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 2

\ehicle Registration Number
Vahicle Make/Model/Calour
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
MRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

YNB515J
IsUZU

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
MR HUANG

87092655

Page 3 of 25



KAl LIANG MOTOR SERVICE
BLK1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-101 AUTOBAY

SINGAPORE 417883
VEHICLE NO:GBF 264X
ary PARTICULAR
1PCS TAILGATE
1PCS TAILGATE LOWER MEMBER
1PCS TAILGATE LOCK HINGES O/S
1PCS TAILA) OIS
1PCS FRONT PANEL
1PCS FRONT GRILLE
1PCS FRONT BUMPER
1PCS HEADLAMP N/S
1PCS FRONT VIEW MIRROR BRACKET N/S
SNETT
1SET TAILGATE CORPORATE STICKER
1PCS TAILGATE 70 KM/H & 6 PAX STICKER
1PCS REAR REVERSE SENSOR
LABOUR CHARGES:
TO CHECK WIRING

TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING

# r
~1
=\
oo Fiaf ]
el
7 ¢ (o
¥/ ild

V2 [henf $1,455.10_—
~  $878.10 %/
Ha~ $14850_—
{Ac $26650 —
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Cinea_ 6T = .
) Lo~ $455.10 —
$6,333.02

AL $300.00_—
A

FLtE $20.00 —
=3 “
E,su/lﬁ $250.00 ;)

$50.00 S 0

$80.00._ 1)

$80.00 ()
$680.00 (¢ 0
$1,080.00  ,

TO $887302 /Y
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Adjuster Reporl

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg no19s607198R;)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-2561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page | of 3

Our File No:  CS/AIG18022785/USD3N2
Date: 16/01/2019
REFERENCE
r"'""""fg AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.  Policy No: 0999994530
NSUrer:
Claimant .
Vehicle No : GBF2645X Insured Vehicle No : GBA37TTTT
Date of Loss: 17M2/2018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 802069485130
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reqg No: GBF2645X
Make & Model: TOYOTA DYNA 150, 3.0 D (M) Engine No: 1KD2833872
Reg. Date: 18/08/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: JTFAT3SYX0K206739
Colour: Silver Odometer: 80200 km
Engine Capacity: 2882 cc
Market Value/Mew Car N/A

Price:
Sum Insured (S%):

Market Value/MNew Car Price

E ICL T ¥
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION RES
Front Tyre Size: 185R15 Rear Tyre Size: 186R12(D)
Front Left Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Left Side: Bridgesione 6/6 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6/6 mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 6,903.02 2 768.88 413414 5989
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,970.00 1,630.00 340.00 17.26
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 8,873.02 4,398.688 4,474.14 50.42
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 3,500.00
Nett Amount (S5) 8,873.02 3,500.00 5,373.02 60.55
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 19/12/2018
Date Inspected: 20/12/2018 Inspected At: K:i Liang Motor Service - Kaki Bukit
Q
I:EILF‘{}I1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #01-101
AUTOBAY
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA

Manager: Hiew May Fung

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the time and place of inspection stated heren Such inspection has been camad oul o the best of our
knowiedge and ability but any otfer liability urider any other circumatances is heraby expressly excluded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claim s/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g...

16/1/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *TAILGATE Dented/Bent 1,45510F  *1,455.10FL
2 1 *TAILGATE LOWER MEMEBER Repair BTB.10F “FL
3 1 *TAILGATE LOCK HINGES OIS Bent 148.50F *148.50 FL
4 1 *TAILLAMP OIS Cracked 266.50F *266.50FL
5 1 *FRONT PANEL Repair 1,219.30F *-FL
6 1 “*FRONT GRILLE Repair 671.01F *-FL
T 1 *FRONT BUMPER Repair 566 10F “.FL
8 1 *HEADLAMP N/S Cracked 673.31F "6873.31FL
2] 1 *FRONT VIEW MIRROR BRACKET NIS Bent 455.10F *455.10FL
110 1 *SET TAILGATE CORPORATE STICKER Mecessary 3D0.00FS  *300.00FS
11 1 *TAILGATE 70KM/H & 6 PAX STICKER MNecessary 20.00F3 “20.00FS
12 1 *REAR REVERSE SENSOR Shorted 250.00FS  *200.00F3
F=Franchise part. S=Spchett L=ListhemDise. -
Sub Total (58) £,903.02 3,518.51
- List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/25.00% (S%) 0.00 749.63
Total Parts (55) 6,903.02 2,768.88
r Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. J
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type

Labour ltems

1 TO CHECK WIRING MNew
2 TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING Mew
3 TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR Mew
4 LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS New
5 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING New

Gross Labour Cost (S%)

Page 3 of 3

Repairer's Amount
50.00 30.00
BO.00 50.00
80.00 50.00

B80.00 600.00
1,080.00 800.00
1,870.00 1,630.00

|_ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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