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" Case Details
Cass Reforence Number : TAX121072068  Company Type : SMAT Taxis Pte Lid Insurance Company Name : AIG Asia Pacilic Insurance Pte Lid
Type of Repair : Accident Repai Estimation ID : EST-4A85-10 Accident Dabte and Tirme : 15122078 0655 AM

Vehicle Registration Number : SHB1335Y Assigned By : Taw Claims Manager Team  Vehicle Age(in Montha) : 57

Documents / Photographs

View Documents / Photographs | Tatal Documsnis: 1
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One  Main SENEOR 1 TH0.00 18000 Q.00 1840041 RApplace Chec
Tima REVERSE ! ¢ il
Koy
In
Cne  Main PINEL STICKER 2 50.00 13000 Q.00 120000 Aeplace =
ning, ) 130.08 Rapdnce
oy
I
One  Main BUMPER LIP 1 T1.20 TiEI0 2800 2418 Feplers
Tima COVER RRLM ’ ° ool
Kay
I
Taotsl Spare Part Cost  2.000.84 Burveyor 13208
Tatsl
Lump Sum Discount (%) 20.00 Lump .,
Sum Ois
=)
Final Spare Pari Cost  1,802.07 Fimal Bur 10566
Total

hitps./vacsweb.smr. com sg/Estimation. sspx 13



(FIAT. TRR T hitps.ivacsweb. smt. com sg/Estimation.aspx
BMAT Aeoommendation
BOM Costing Portion Material Part Narms Gty  List Price  Lisi Diwi®) Final Repairf
Tipe Type My Per Price{t) Pricel}]  Replace
Unit(¥)
One  Main BUMPER LIP a0 110 3S00 EAsT Hwplaces
Tirne COVER RTH
Ky
tn
One  Maln BUMPER LiP bl R0 90 2500 17T1.68 Aeplace
Time REAR
Wey
In
O blain BUMPER SiDE 4,00 ona 500 H.10 Raplace
Tirre RETAINER RR/LH
Kay
In
Cvam  Main BUMPER SI0E G 4 80 25,00 T Faglaca
Time RETAINER RR/AH
Ky
In
Gne  Main UNDER COVER S14.50 S50 2500 L LN Aeplace
Time SUBASSY, AR
Kay FLOOR
I
Totsl Bpars Pari Cost 2,003 84
Lump Bum Discount (%) 20,00
Final Bpare Part Cost  1.802.07
Labours Cost Detail
EHo  Job Gcape SMAT Surveyor Adlustment(S]  Ramers
PRecommendation ¥
1 TO REPAIN REAR POATION 23800 200
Totai: 33800 200.00
Suray.Cost Detail
S.Na. Job Scope GMAT Surveyor Adjustment(S] Remares
Recommenitainn(§)
] TO REFSAAY AEAR BUMPER 7R.00 200
2 TD RESPRAY BUMPER BE&M 180,00 a
Totalk SEA.00 0000
Qiher Cost Detall
SMo,  Job Scope BURAT Surveyor Adjustment(§)  Ramars
Recommendation§)
1 TOWANG CHARGE i B0 0
2 TOCHECK WIRING AND 5YSTEM 8000 0
FUNCTION
Tatal 484.00 .00

hitps:/ivacsweb smrt com sg/Estimation aspx

Barveyor
Crumnitity

Total

Sum Dis

Finnl Bus
Total

Burveyor Approval

Surveyor Final  Aopair/Repiace

Pricei§}

132.00

L]

Hot Giw

ot Ghe



(AR =R ]-

ENo.  Job Beope

3 TE) TEET AMO REFIX REVERSE SENSOA
EYETEM

] T REMOVE AND REFIT WIRE HARDESS

& TOWASH AND VACULIK

Tatal:

Summary

Totsl Spare Part Datad
Total Labour Cogl

Tetal Bpryy Pairming

Crumall Toknl

Luerp Sum Raper Optan

Lump Sum Teal

He of Regair Dap”

Aamarks

Surveyor Name

Sgrture

hitps:/ivacsweb.smrt.com.sg/Estimation. aspx

hitps./ivacsweb, smm.com.sg/Estimation, aspx

SMAT Surveyor Adpustmentis)  Remarks
Ancommandstion{s)
120.00 40
12000 w0
000 a
400 #0.00
Estimator Avsasment(§) Surveyor Asssamani{§]
1.600.07 108 68
3IR00 20000
s 20000
i 00 000
Zsaaor —
-
288300 80000
000.00
. 2
L/E phate uiter ropeir. supphe mamnry Sem send -msil e
@ kkawito.com (FTROD181)
Hwes jo
B0
LKK Auto Consullanty hence nobty
the Repairer of the following:
» Ta resureny Deforeafier sprey patng
o T chagptey anmaged nans | during resurvry
» Party prces e Sutect i confirmation.

» Thieg party survey is on & “Withoul Preyudice” basa
» Ko fiagal moctficaticed 1| if sowsd

» Supplesrsiary SO i | Mut! Do MesLrvered el
i subyect 15 heal soproval bom insurance Campary

Acxromheded by Raparer

Sigrarsr
"




Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 27 December 2019 10:17 AM

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & 14/Claims 8¢ 1A/Tauis)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 15/12/2018 involving SHE 1335Y & 5LH

6658D (your insured) Our Ref: TAX/12/18/2069/1g

Without Prejudice
(save os to cosis)
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose seftlerent on a global sum for §1,058.00{all in),

Please confirm occeplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without partles resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liahility, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
Hability/damages, either party ks not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmos & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards.

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna ¢ lkkauto.com Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & [A/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday. 19 September 2019 12:22 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com=>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a/alkkauto.com>

Subject: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 15/12/2018 involving SHB 1335Y & SLH 6638D (your
insured) Our Ref: TAX/12/1872069/1g

URGENT
REMINDER

Dear Khanchna,
Please let us know by 26™ September 2019 if your principal is prepared 1o settle our clwim. otherwise we will

pursue accordingly. Thanks.
1



* Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc

Subject:

Tracking:

Dear Sir'Madam,

Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Monday, 16 December 2019 11:35 AM

Farduas Barween

Admin A: LCR Insurance Team

RE: MVA BETWEEN SLH 66580 OM 15/12/18 / SHB 1335Y

Reciplent Delivery
Farduas Barween
Admin &

LLR insurance Team

Melkwan@kkauto.com Defivered: 16/12/2018 11:35 AM
shupeii@lkkauto.com Delvered: 16/12/2015 11:35 AM
olnalaui@®lkkauto com Delivered: 16/12/201% 11:35 AM

We refer 1o the above matter and e-mail as trailed.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter.

Based on the accident report and accident scenano, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will

therefore proceed (o negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim. kindly let us have them
in writing within the next 7 days i.e. by 23/12/2019, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party
claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by vouw'your

driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Thank you.

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnoa Ikkauto.com Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Farduas Barween <barweenialioncityrentals.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 5:4]1 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna/@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a/@lkkauto.com=>; LCR Insurance Team <insurance/@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Subject: Re: MVA BETWEEN SLH 6658D ON 15/12/18 / SHB 1335Y

Hi Khanchna,



. ‘I{hi;-nnh na (LKK Auto)

———— e ———— e e———————————

From: Gan, Angiegeokling <Angiegeokling Gan@aig.com>

Sent: Monday. 16 December 2019 11:16 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Seeking approval to do DS - AlG REF.TP / 48305022105G - Accident between SHB

1335Y & SLH 6658D [AIG] on 15/12/2018

Dear Khanchna,
We have reviewed and noted the following salient paints

TP's damages appeared to be consistent with circumstances of the alleged accident.

- Our insured driver admitted that he was travelling behind TP’'s vehicle and he tried to brake upon seeing TP's
sudden braking — there is a likelihood that he might not be able to stop in time without hitting since he
mentioned that it was a sudden action,

Our insured driver did not have video evidence to prove that there was no contact between both vehicles,

We opined that liability Is not in OI's favor and it would be an uphill task to defend the case in the event of litigation. In
order to mitigate losses, we would agree to settie at best

Prior to settling the claim, please inform Ol an the above and request that thay respond within 7 days if they would like
to discuss further, failing which we shall proceed to settle the claim without further notice.

Please keep us posted in due course.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Angie Gan

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

AlG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 078120
Tel +(65) 6419 1013

Angiegeokling Gan@aig.com | www aig sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. Click
here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The wformation in this amaid (and any attachments) is configentinl I you are ool the infended ecpient. you mus! fol use or dlseminals the
nformatan. T you have ecenid s emal i arror. please immediately natify me by Feply " command and permanenily delste e ooginal and any
copees ar prinfouts thereol  Although i emad and any attachmants g Balisved fo he fres of any virus or ather defect fhal might affect any campuler
aystam info winch i (s recanad and apaned. i (& the respodsiDity of the reciomnt o ensuré thal it & virus fes and no responsibilily is sccepled by AIG
for any loss or damage ansing in any way fom s use

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, December 16, 2019 10:42 AM



To: Gan, Anglegeokling <Angiegeokling.Gan@aig.com>

. “Ce: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Seeking approval to do DS - AIG REF:TP / 483050221056 - Accident between SHB 1335Y & SLH
66580 |AIG] on 15/12/2018

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Ms. Angie,

Our Insured replied (as attached) that there is no video for the accident.

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: §741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Gan, Angiegeokling <Angiegeokling Gan@aig com>

Sent: Monday, 16 December 2019 10:35 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@|kkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Seeking approval to do DS - AIG REF:TP / 48305022105G - Accident between SHB 1335Y & SLH 66580 [AIG)
on 15/12/2018

Forward attachment

Best Regards,

Angie Gan

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

AllG Bullding, 78 Shenton Way #08-18&, Singapore 079120
Tel +(B5) 64189 1013

Angiegeckling Gan@aig.com | www aig.5a

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. Click
here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The informanon i fhis amald (a0 any amacomenia) g confosnial F Fou ane nof INe N0eT il you must nor ise oF dasemmans (he
mformation. ¥ pou have recedved this emal i error pledse smmadialely noldy me by "Reply* coimmand and pesmanently delsle e ongrad and ary
copis of prinlouts thessof. Ahough this email and any altachmenis ar beliead jo bo froa of any wius or othor defect thal might affect any compate:
sysmem o wihch it is recanmd and opened & (e espansiiiity of e recioea [0 engure thal 1 18 virus free and Mo esponsibily & accepled by AlG
v ity KRS OF cTnace AILSng il STy Wiy It {18 pise

From: Gan, Angiegeokling

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2019 10:38 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a@ikkauto.com>




Subject: RE: Seeking approval to do DS - AIG REF:TP / 48305022105G - Accident between SHB 1335Y & SLH 6658D [AIG]
‘on 15/12/2018

Dear Khanchna,
We note that you have written to Ol on 7 August 2019, copy of your email enclosed for easy reference.
Please advise if Ol or hirer responded after this email?

Best Regards,

Angie Gan

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16. Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1013
Angiegeokling Gan@aig com | www aig sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. Click
here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The mformahon v this emad (and dany attachmants! o confrgental I your are nod e infended fecipsent, you musl nof e or digseminale he

inforrmabicn. If pow hsve mecsived this ermod ih groe. please mmediahely nofify me By "Raply* command and parmaneafty delete the onginal and amy
oS oF prwouts themneal  SRTOLGN e emal ind any atachmends ane beeved m e fee of any vitus oF other cefect that maght affect any compinar

syslen oo wiveh o o recewed a! cosned! 1 G ihe responainlly of e recomnl o ataces thal & (8 vuns Bes and mo reponstaily & accapied by AIG

for iy kas or domaos areing in sty way Fom s wss

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2019 10:19 AM

To: Gan, Angiegeokling <Angiegeok|ing Gan@alg com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@ikkauto.coms

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Seeking approval to do DS - AIG REF:TP / 483050221056 - Accident between SHB 1335Y & SLH
6658D [AIG] on 15/12/2018

This message Is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments
Dear Ms. Angie,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our Insured driver (hirer) disputes the collision and alleged in his GIA that he was able to brake
in time and there was no impact.

There is no video provided and only scene photo of the accident from third party repairer,

Based on the damage profile, we noted that there is misalignment at the rear bumper of third party vehicle and we
opine that it is consistent with the accident version and opine that BOLA 27 is applicable.

Please advice us accordingly if we may proceed to do DS.

Thank you.



“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Khanchna | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna® lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Meitified Egt Submittad Ad) Asunigned Ad) Apt A Submitied Ins Auth'ed Status
19 Dec 2018 38 Bc-30iR $$650.00 $$650.00 P or Sy
HMain S0t Reo ba:00 e Estenates | | view mce | ospart
; Edit &d) Rpt _] Cancel Cose I

Main

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

| [Created by adjuster]

Insured: |LCRF Pte Ltd, Co. Reg. oo 301634557K

ain | )
Claimant: SHMAT TAXIS PTE LTD, Co Reg, Mo 198505366

:".Idl Rep- |SHB1335Y Date of Leas:

15/12/2018 17:00 - :59
|58 Manths and 19 Days From LTA Reg Oate [Man Yr)]

Clhim Type: |TP / 4830502210SG :";’ﬁ“" 0F959994621 {Camprehansive)
Vehlcle Reg.
o SLH6658D Ty . |p-1s000213mMPsH
(Insured): :
Excess:
Repairer: SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd {Woodlanda) 80 Woodiands Industrial Park B4, 757705 woodiands - Tel: 68662628
‘I*:;"‘"'f“ AIG Asis Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, (Express) - Tal: £5-6419-3000 .__ [Mandled by Gan, Angle-GL] Angiegeokling. Gan@uig.com
CIamanEs | pg pirst Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tal: 62222311
| Adjuster| LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [MQ) - Tel: 6256-3581 .. [Hondles by ONG HWEE JIE] . [ﬁiml Rpt due 31/12/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All | Compose Case Muil |

» AlG_5G (20/11/2018): Mo O1 GIA Raport
+ AIG_SG (20/12/2018): Request to upload TP GIA Report

ALL ASSDCIATED TASKS-

View All | Sesrch Tasks | Croate New Tosk | comprete |

Due Date Prigrity Type Task Group Subject

No results.
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Claim Documents

*SHB1335Y (48305022105G)
[SLHE658D]
™
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Dec 15 2018 5:00PM
[LCRF Pte Ltd]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
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upisad Documants | Uplosd Protos |  Composs New Letier | Usioss viees | upissa susio | Wiaw [Vimw in Srowser| |
o | Faaiaed On LXK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |(orah) Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Breakdown Eait
Photos/Images M %)
to | Rolabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |20/12/18 09:36 | Ganaral View 0| wedws | M
7 |20/121809:36 | General View Q| curc | ¥
3 |20/12/18 D936 General View 0| varc | H
¢ |20/12/1800:36 | Ganaral View B oarws |
& |20012/18 09:36 | Genersl View 0| tadrc | A
6 |20/12/1809:35 | Genaral View @ | wws | A
7 |20/12/18 09:36 | Genersl View 0| weews | A
B |20/12/1809:36 | Genaral View O | waaws | B4
9 |20/12/1808:36 | General View @) | wawc | A
10 |20012/18 09:35 | Genersl View @ | wadwc | B
11 |20/12/18 0536 | General View Q! waewc | A
12 |20/12/1805:36 | Genernl View Q| sews | B
13 |20/12/1809:36 | General View Q| wwows | &
14 | 20/12/1809:36 | General View Q| weaws | &
15 |20/12/1809:36 | Genersl View © i | B
16 | 20/12/1809:36 | Gensral View ! Lead e | P
17 |21/12/18 0558 | Photo After Spray @ | wearws | A
18 |21/12/1809:58 | Photo After Spray Q| wsws | M
19 |21/12/1809:58 | Pheto Atter Spray 0| oaaws | B
20 |21121809:58 | Photo After Spray @ | Lsedc | B
Documentation 1perpage  [~]| B4
fo | Relabel/Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |20/12/1809:23 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF
7 |mj1218098:23 | TP GIA REPORT Losd POF
3 |owoane 1329 |oIdlA i Load POF
la |o7/0B/19 13:32 | EMAIL TO O1 Load POF
5 |07/0B/1% 13:56 | EMAIL TO OI Lowd POF
& |16/12/19 10:04 | TP VEMICLE PHOTO 0 | wesies | M
7 |16/12/19 10/04 | ACCIDENT SCENE PHOTO FROM THIRD PARTY 0| adipc | A
8 |16/12/1911:38 | EMAIL FROM AIG APPROVAL TO DS @ | Loss PoF
% |16/12/1911:3% | EMAIL TO OT dd 16122019 s Lowd POF
10 | 04/03/20 09:09 | WORKSHOP TNVOICE Load PDF
11 |04/00/20 05:06 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF
12 |04/00/20 09:00 | Relasse Voucher Losd POF
13 |p4/03/20 09:40 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load POF
14 |D4/00/20 0910 | RENTAL MILEAGE | | Losd POF
15 |04/03/2009:10 | LTA SEARCH Load POF
16 | D4/03/20 09:10 Loo - Losd POF
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Our Checkiist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)
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https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/imdex.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d... 4/3/2020



Preview Page 1 of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLHG658D (Insd veh) Model; TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI 1.8 (A)
SHB1335Y (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |15/12/2018
Global Sum Settiement| (| [X] Yes | [ ]| No
Repair Estimate ] 3.900.30
Final Repair Cost 5 1,058.00
Loss of Use 5 days at 50.00 per day
Rental {if any) 5 3 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee -
Dthers -5
$
Final Sattiemant Sum (Global Sum) S 1.058.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Reglstered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicale
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenano No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: _(") Assassed Liability (*}: (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain callisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd - 5| 1,058.00
2) -
3) - §|
04 Mar
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2020
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report! Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg no 1sseo71s8m)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax; B844-8805 Email: sur@lkkaulo.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3/LCR18022757/JKS30Q2

Date: 04/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, Palicy No: 0899904821
Claimant i
Vehicle No : SHBE1335Y Insured Vehicle No : SLHBE58D
Date of Loss 151272018 Mature of Claim; TP Claim No: 483050221086
Reg No: SHB1335Y
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI, 1.8 (A) Engine No: 27R1342058
Reg. Date; 26/03/2014 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis No: JTOKN3BUTO5737446
Colour Maroon Odomeler: 573413 km
Engine Capacity: 1798 cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (SS$); Market Value/New Car Price
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification. No Pre-accident Condition;
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 1856/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size; 195/85 R15
Front Left Side; Falken 6 mm Rear Left Side: Falken & mm
Front Right Side: Falken & mm Rear Right Side: Falken 6 mm
The above values regresant the memaming e reads depth
|COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 2,540.30 132.08 240822 a4 BO
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.360.00 550.00 810.00 59.56
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 D.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 3,900.30 682.08 3,218.22 82.51
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 850.00
MNett Amount (5§) 3,900.30 650.00 3,250.30 83.33
+ Car Rental (3.0 x 55133.75/day) (S%) 401.25
+ Doc/Search Fee (5%) 7.00
Nett Liability (S§) 1,058.25
Global Sum Settlement (55) 1,058.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 18122018
Date Inspected 18/12/2018 Inspected At SMRAT Automotive Services Pte Lid
(Woodlands)
B0 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimated Period of Repair. 2.0days
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Adjuster: ONG HWEE JIE Manager: Khanchna Pothura)

NOTE: This report represents our findings &t the time and piace of inspection sialed herein. Such inapection has been camied ouf fo the bast of our
knowindge and sbilify bul any offr Tntity under amy offier crcumatences i hemby expressly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repalrer’'s  Amounl
1 1 'E;.;:ISPER CLIPS (DISC 25%) Necessary 16.10F  *12.08F
i1 }

2 2 *PIXEL STICKER (SN) Necessary 120.00F *120.00F
3 1 *‘BUMPER REAR Repair 458 BOF “F
4 1 *BUMPER REINFORCEMENT REAR Mot Necessary 205.70F *F
5 1 *ARM SUB-ASSY .RR BUMPER LH Not Necessary 139.60F *.F
B 1 *ARM SUB-ASSY ,RR BUMPER RH Not Necessary 139.60F ~F
T 1 *ANTENMNA ELECTRICAL LOWER REAR Mol Necessary 157 40F *F
B 1 *SENSOR REVERSE Not Necessary 180.00F “F
a9 1 *BUMPER LIP COVER RRILH Mol Necessary 7T2.20F *-F
10 1 *BUMPER LIP COVER RR/RH Not Necessary 118.10F “~F
1 1 *BUMPER LIP REAR Mot Necessary 228.90F ~F
12 1 *‘BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RR/LH Mot Necessary 94 BOF *F
13 1 *BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RR/RH Mot Necessary 94 BOF ..
14 1 *UNDER COVER SUBASSY ,RR FLOOR Mot Necessary 514.50F "
FaFranchisa part.

Total Parts (S$%) 2,540.30 132.08

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems
Thare are no new miscellanscus ilems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK MNew 338.00 20000
2  SPRAY PAINT New 558.00 200.00
3  TOWING CHARGE MNew 84.00 60,00
4 TOCHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION MNew 80.00 30.00
5 TOTEST AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR SYSTEM MNew 120.00 30.00
8  TO REMOVE AND REFIT WIRE HARDESS Mew 120,00 30.00
7 TOWASH AND VACUUM Mew 60.00 D.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,360.00 550.00

Repon was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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