Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 5:11 PM

To: Pila Ng

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD - Accident involving SLG9687E & SKG7109H ( AXA ) DOA : 14/12/2018 LKK

REF CC4/ASM18022702/T1hb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Pila,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are currently seeking for mandate approval to our principal.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Pila Ng [mailto:pila@vermogen-group.com]

Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 2:34 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: LOD - Accident involving SLG9687E & SKG7109H ( AXA ) DOA : 14/12/2018
Without Prejudice

Dear officer,

Refer to the above mentioned matter, we would like to check for the claim status.

LOD have been mail out to your department on 12 Feb 2019.

Kindly check and revert to us as soon as possible.



Thanks & Regards,
Pila

On Tue, Feb 12,2019 at 11:16 AM <pila@vermogen-group.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear officer in-charge,

Above attach with LOD, could we settle as below:

COR -$ 3,424.00
LOU -S 900.00 ( $100 x 9 days )
LTA -$ 2.00

$4,326.00

Kindly check and revert to us as soon as possible.

Thanks & regards,

Pila

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd
1 Bukit Batok Crescent
#05-23 Wcega Plaza
Singapore 658064

Tel: 6904 4596



