Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April, 2019 2:12 PM

To: YT(HQ); 'YT(KB)'; Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR; Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A
Cc: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FD7P STATUS - URGENT!!HHIN

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear May,
With reference to the subject.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by parties involved, the liability is
clear.

The final repair cost is subject to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident
and approval of our principal insurer.

The days for losses(use/income/rental) will be based on the number of days of repair recommended by
our surveyor and our principal’s approval.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis and does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client’s vehicle. Contents herein should not be construed as an admission of any liability,
confirmation of damages whatsoever to the insured/insurer’s part.

Furthermore, this e-mail should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate the claim
should there be future discovery of any breach of policy terms and conditions committed by their driver or
insured.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | In-behalf of Case Handler Vic

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.Ilt may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: YT(HQ) [mailto:utauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 12:26 PM

To: 'YT(KB)' <info@yewteegroup.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>



Cc: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com>

Kindly get back liability soonest.
Thank you.

Best Regards

—_—
TOLE ToiTin pay iy

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy @KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2 @singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(KB) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Friday, 1 March, 2019 4:24 PM

To: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@I|kkauto.com>; 'Vic (LKKAuto)'
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Yew Tee (HQ)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; '‘Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)' <MarcusChua@Ikkauto.com>; YT(HQ)
<info@yewteegroup.com>

Subject: RE: FD7P STATUS

Any update?

Best Regards

—_—
TOLE ToiTin pay iy

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy @KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2 @singnet.com.sg




b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(KB) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 February 2019 1:11 PM

To: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Vic (LKKAuto)'
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Yew Tee (HQ)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; '‘Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)' <MarcusChua@Ikkauto.com>; YT(HQ)
<info@yewteegroup.com>

Subject: RE: FD7P STATUS

REMINDER!!!

Hi,

Any update on the liability?

It seem takes too long for reply.

Best Regards

——
TOLE: TertTio paafsga

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy @KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2 @singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 11:22 AM

To: YT(KB) <info@yewteegroup.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team
<cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Yew Tee (HQ)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FD7P STATUS

Dear Vic,

FYNA-CC4/ASM18022705/Uhb3

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: YT(KB) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Friday, 1 February 2019 11:18 AM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Yew Tee (HQ)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@Ikkauto.com>; YT(HQ)
<info@yewteegroup.com>

Subject: RE: FD7P STATUS

Dear Veron / Marcus,
Kindly update on the liability.
Thank you.

Best Regards

——
TOLE: TertTio paafsga

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy @KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2 @singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(KB) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Saturday, 19 January 2019 1:16 PM

To: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Yew Tee (HQ)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; marcuschua@|kkauto.com; YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>
Subject: RE: FD7P STATUS

Hi Marcus,
Kindly let us have the liability soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards
May



—_—
TOLE ToiTin pay iy

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy @KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2 @singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(KB) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Saturday, 19 January 2019 11:34 AM

To: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Yew Tee (HQ) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; marcuschua@Ikkauto.com; YT(HQ) <info@yewteegroup.com>
Subject: FD7P STATUS

Hi,
Any update on the status of this case?
Thank you.

Best Regards

—_—
TOLE ToiTin pay iy

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy @KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2 @singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.



