Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Charles <charles@charleslinllc.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 3:50 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: junellyeap@gmail.com

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC 3127D & SLP 2423Z ON 12.12.2018 ALONG/AT

ADAM ROAD JUNCTION OF DUNEARN ROAD

BY EMAIL AND BY POST

51, UBIAVENUE 1,
#01-25

PAYA UBI IND. PARK
SINGAPORE 408933

Dear Sir,
We act for Ms June Yeap Lay Leng who has handed us a copy of your letter of 18 December 2018.

We are instructed that our client had not reported the accident as the damage to motor vehicle no. SLP 24237 was
very minor and the driver of the said vehicle had offered our client an option of a private settlement when she had
an estimate of the costs of repair. However, our client did not admit liability.

We are further instructed that the driver of our client’s vehicle at the material time is presently outstation and will
only return to Singapore after 21 January 2019. He will then provide you with his statement, photographs and video
footage of the accident. Our interim instructions are that the two vehicles had stopped at a slip road from Adam
Road turning into Dunearn Road, just outside Adam Road Food Centre. Upon checking that there were no vehicles
on the right, our client’s driver moved forward slowly. However, the driver of motor vehicle no. SLP 2423Z for
reasons best known to herself and it seems that she was on her mobile phone, failed / neglected to move despite
the road being clear.

As stated above, when our client’s driver returned to Singapore, we will provide you with his statement,
photographs and video footage.

Kindly direct all future correspondence to us.

Best regards,
Charles Lin

Charles Lin LLC

Advocates & Solicitors, Notary Public and Commissioner for Oaths

111, North Bridge Road #27-02 Peninsula Plaza, Singapore 179098

T: +65 6778 7000 | F: +65 6665 7000 | Email: charles(@charleslinllc.com.sg

This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and contains information that is privileged and confidential. If you, the reader
of this message, are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this communication. If you have received this communication in error,
please notify us immediately by telephone and return the original message to us at the above address at our expense. Thank you.



