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Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

From: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 11:24 AM

To: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: OUR REF : CC4/ASM18022702/Kea3 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 394J AND SLP 

4058G ALONG WHITLEY ROAD ON 15/12/2018

Dear Jimmy, 

 

We refer to email on 9th July. 

 

We accept the offer. Kindly send us the DV for above-mentioned claim. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Vronica LawVronica LawVronica LawVronica Law    

City Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, 

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road, 

Singapore 575643 

Tel  : 6453 1235 

Fax : 6453 7944 

 

From: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto) [mailto:jimmychen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 9 July, 2019 1:49 PM 

To: City Auto 
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Subject: OUR REF : CC4/ASM18022702/Kea3 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 394J AND SLP 4058G ALONG WHITLEY 
ROAD ON 15/12/2018 

 

Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We propose settlement as follows: - 

 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 11,127.40 

2. Loss of Rental (8days x $100.00)(w/GST) $      856.00 

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00 

TOTAL $ 11,985.40 

 

Please confirm acceptance. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Jimmy Chen| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jimmychen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


