Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims) <Janice_Goh@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 3 January, 2019 10:04 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; assignments; motorsurvey; Desmond Lee Ker Wen (ECICS, Claims)

Subject: RE: DOA.16.12.18 SHA2967Y with your insured SKD8670L - ECICS / DOL: 16.12.18
Hi Catherine

Our claim no. DMPC1800469H/]G and | am the case handler for this case.

Thank you.
Janice Goh

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, January 03, 2019 9:12 AM

To: motorsurvey

Cc: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims); SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: DOA.16.12.18 SHA2967Y with your insured SKD8670L - ECICS / DOL: 16.12.18

Dear Desmond,
Kindly assist provide us the claim number.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 18 December, 2018 2:00 PM

To: motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg

Cc: 'Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims)' <Janice Goh@ecics.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assighments
<assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DOA.16.12.18 SHA2967Y with your insured SKD8670L - ECICS / DOL: 16.12.18

Dear Desmond,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 4:29 PM

To: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>; motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>




