Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>
Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 8:31 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Ce: Tee, Chee-Wah

Subject: RE: 57739446795G-003

Hi Asher,

MNoted and thanks.

Best regards,

Loh Chee Heng

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 18861
Chee-Heng Loh({@aig.com | www. aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE.

The infarmation in this emall {and any attachmenis) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof, Although this email and any aftachmenis are believed o be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which if is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibilify is accepled by AIG
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use,

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com)]

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 5:55 PM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com=
Cc: Tee, Chee-Wah <Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: 57739446795G-003

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Hi Chee Heng,

We refer to the email below.



' Third party have submitted the case to solicitor to handler as the liability unclear.

Clarify with A.5. Phoon Pte Ltd is not under ARC of Auto & General Insurance for more than a year.

In view on above, we shall submit our w/p report and closed case at our end.

Hi Khanchna,

Kindly take note and assist on the above matter.

Thank You.

Best Regords,

Asher 5ng | Cose Hondler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-4051 | email: ashersno@lkkauto.com | fax: 4741-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 4:51 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@ lkkauto.com>
Cc: Tee, Chee-Wah <Chee-Wah.Tee@aig.com>
Subject: 57735446795G-003

Dear Asher,

We have received PD & Bl LOD from TP solicitors.

Kindly advise if TP workshop withdrew from direct settlement. Noted that TP workshop, A.A. Phoon Pte Ltd is an ARC of
Auto & General Insurance. Kindly let workshop know that an ARC cannot engage solicitors for PD claim.

Please let us know the outcome soonest,

Dear Tee,

Fyi.

1 Car Service Pte Lid Twa Jalan Singa 418088 [To
13t Awto [Premium) Pre Lid |G 10 Admiralty Street, #01-06 [Horth Link Building 757695 [t
1st Awto (Woodlands) Pte Lid | |10 Admirality Street 201-06 |Northink Budding 757695 [1ne
15t Autoworks Pte Lid [Hg 3 Kald Bukit Ave 4 2#04-01 415933 [eC
15t Autoworks Pre Lid | B Kaka Bukit Ave 4 #04-01 415933 [nT
2 Automobile Pie Lbd [Hg 120 Lower Delta Road 202-15, Cendex Centre 169208

34 Automcbie Pte Ltd [HQ 120 Lower Delta Road #02-15, Cendex Cenire 165208
A.5, Phoon PLe Ltd freh Guan |Bik 36 Toh Guan Road |East Enterpnse Hub #01-35 |s08580 E-li




Best regards,

Loh Chee Heng

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6410 1881

Chee-Hena.Loh@aig.com | www.aig sg

100 C+e|ebrqring 100 Years: o,

Visit 1o learn more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have recelved fhis email in error, please immediately notify me by *Reply” command and permanently delote the original and any
copies or printouts thereof, Although this emall and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the reciplent fo ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information, If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply”
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



