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V35 Singapore, 247, 159934 Singapore

WANG HAOMING

f‘mﬁ‘ty ‘[}me

ﬂ.

VGS Singapore
247

Alexandra Road
159934 Singapore

Phone Mo.  +65 6305 7299
Fax No. +65 6474 3643
E-Mail service@vw.com.sg

VAT Registration No. M20098505-2

296A BUKIT BATOK STREET 22 Tax No 1991014947
#31-‘&51:1 . G @ im""’“ i
Singapore, 651296 .
Singapore f:) y(‘.&‘) SENICE Ql.lﬂte
Customer No CV028369
Cluote No. SER/QUOMB02136
QuoteDate 12/12M18
Salesperson Grace Sng
Page 1
J  MITMER INFRMED ALIGNMENT oMY  ARTER_ THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
ACADENT . ¥
Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor
Volkswagen Passeng Passat 1.8 TSI Comfortline 17 Kong Charmaine
License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SMG530Y WVWZZZICZKED19294 3011118 Grace Sng
Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code
1P CJS 298031 3G247
MNo. Description Qty. UcM Unit Price Amount
P B&P ALEX LABOUR LABOUR 4 Labor (6§o 3,360 .00
P B&P ALEX PAINT SPRAY PAINT 4 Labor /4> 320000
P B&P WHEEL ALIGNMENT B&P WHEEL ALIGNMENT -NETT 1 < 360.00
P B&P DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION 1 Time Un ~~ 480.00
COMPULSORY TO DO AFTER AC
F B&P MECH CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, 5 1 Time Un ~ 280.00
Nett
Sum Labor 7,680.00
P 3G08059120Q WHEEL HOUSE RH 1 Pieces Esar0
F 3G0B0SL70F WHEEL HOUS RH 1 Pieces .\f«“‘ 108 14
P 2GE0807050 BUMPER BRACKET RH 1 Pieces T 4591
P 3G0B07178 BUMPER GUIDE RH 1 Pieces ¥ 7969
P 3G0807217K GRU FRT BUMPER COVER 1 Pieces R 1,44573
P 3G0821022A RHF FENDER 1 Pieces Hf*‘ém.da
Predecessor 3G0821022
P 3G0853245 222 CHROME MOLDING CENTER 1 Pieces ? 230,02
F 3G0853253 277 CHROME MOLDING LH 1 Pieces _ - 117.97
P 3G0853254 227 CHROME MOLDING RH 1 Pieces ‘f;‘ 7 10502
P 3G0998493 SENSOR BRACKET 1 Pieces . 7 70.01
P D 180KU2A1 2KADHESIVE 1 Pieces 7 8984
P D 822150A1 BONDAGENT 1 Pieces 7 427
Sum carried forward 10,791.73
Payments to - BBN: - Acc.-No..:



WiES Singapore. 247, 159834 Singapors

WANG HADMING
296A BUKIT BATOK STREET 22

#31-60
Singapore, 651296
Singapore
Make Model Description
Volkswagen Passeng Passat 1.8 TS| Comfortiine
License No. VIN
SMG5a0Y WVWZZZ3CZKEN19294
Engine Code Labor Type

1P

Sum ltem
Explanations
F = Proportionately Charged
Payment Terms No Credit
Paymenis to: - BBN: - Ace.-No.

VGS Singapore

247

Alexandra Road

158834 Singapore

Phone No. +65 6305 7299

Fax No. +65 6474 3643
E-Mail service@vw.com.sg

VAT Registration No. M20098505-2
Tax Mo 1991014047

Service Quote

Customer No. CVD28369

Cluote No. SER/QUOMB02136
CuoteDate 12112/18
Salesperson Grace Sng

Page 2

THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE

Mileage Service Advisor

17 Kong Charmaine

Initial Registration Sales Advisor

30M11/18 Grace Sng

Engine No. Model Code

CJS 298031 3G24J2
Continued 10,791.73

3111.73

Sum Labor 7.680.00
Sum Item 3,111.73
Total SGD 10,791.73
% GST 10,791.73 75542
Total SGD Incl. GST 11,547.15

LKK Auto Consultants
the Repairer of the fall

® T fsgan

fence notify
. .G\‘p‘lﬂg.'
irvey beforefafier spra ¥ paining

} during résuryay

HTVEY 1500 3 “Withaur B ’
@ Wilhou! Prejudics basis




!' U"/ Auto

e Consultants
S A Pte Lid Company Registration No. 199607 198R

S1URIAVE L #0225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAFORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX { (M65) 62564315

Y our ref: TBA
Our ref: CC4/EQI18022633/T1fa3 Date: 2411272018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SMG 590Y
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 19/12/2018
at the premises of M/s Volkswagen Centre Singapore - Alexandra have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 10,791.73

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 5,070.43

"Check" Items Amount : 5% 095.57

Total (Including Check Items) 1 8% 6,066.00

Market Value ;8% -

LTA Reimbursement Value <55 -

Nett Value : §% -

Description of Damage: b

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear : B
Front O/S Portion : —

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 5.0  days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appraiser



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.coms>
Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 9:37 AM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: PRS FOR SMG590Y (EQ: SGGS711C)

Attachments: 14122018134822-0001.pdf 2-62md 1 \ia e

Chopmeing.
unNl

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupe|@|kkaut | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408833)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 9:36 AM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) <charmaine. kong@vw.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRS FOR SMG590Y (EQ: SGG9711C)

Without Prejudice

Dear Charmaine

Thank you for your attachments.
We welcome direct settlement for this accident and will assign LKK to handle this matter.

Dear LKK
Please assist on the following DS.

Best Regards,

Joel Goh

..
eqﬁsumrzc@
EQ Insurance Company Limited
did 56 tel-:-. 223 9433 ext 77: .fa:;- 5 €

N
~" A Member of Cityatate

Privileged/Confidential infarmation may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t}



From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) [mailto:charmaine kona@vw.com.sq]
Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 5:58 PM

To: Joel Goh
Subject: RE: PRS FOR SMG590Y (EQ: SGG9711C)

Dear Joel,

Clearer Screenshots FY...
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Thanks

i"Hl.'r]r'I;"l.'-" SE'F".- ce -'.j-r:'..'i‘-f._'_‘-'

Aftersales

VolkKswagen Lroup oingapore Fie

Alexandra Road

Back with a
bold new look.

The new Polo.

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Sent: Friday, 14 December, 2018 4:32 PM

To: 'Joel Goh'

Subject: RE: PRS FOR SMG590Y (EQ: SGG9711C)

Ledar Joei,

Scene video ( rear view ) for your perusal. Please revert an liahility

Best Regards

Charmaine Kong

Insurance Service Advisor

Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Lid
247 Alexandra Road

Singapore 158934

Direct line
Main Line
Main Fax




Back with a
bold new look.

The new Polo.

From: Joel Goh [mailk goh@eqinsu
Sent: Friday, 14 December, 2018 1:58 PM
To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)
Subject: PRS FOR SMG590Y (EQ: 5GG9711C)
Without Prejudice

Dear Charmaine

We refer to your attached fax.

Kindly assist to forward your client’s video footage in order for us to review on liability.

Best Regards,

loel Goh

-

SR P L'(fl(*{. “w Trereol

EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax
J\ A Member of Crtystate
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended r



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

———————————————————————————————————

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 December, 2018 9:29 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A; assignments; CS A Team; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PRS FOR SMGS90Y (EQ: SGG9711C) *** LKK REF: CC4/EQI18022633/fa3
Attachments: SGGI711C (12.12.18).pdf;, SMG590Y.PDF

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan
Attached accident reports for your attention.
Best Regards,

loel Goh

Executive | Claims

eéinsuronc

L o AL S .f.?i[- o Vil

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 65006772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4130

WIWW. e insurance.com 58 Q‘\“
‘.‘ﬁMr‘-thnrf-::.I\'..Ht' @'_ — -

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, December 17, 2018 8:03 PM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: Admin A; assignments; CS A Team; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PRS FOR SMG590Y (EQ: SGG9711C) *** LKK REF: CC4/ EQI18022633/fa3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

EQI ref: TBA
LKK REF: CC4/EQI18022633/fa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2132.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.



EQ Insurance Company Limited
rell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 62235 419(

a3
B Amember ol Cliystate @ —

Privileged/Canfidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) [mailto:charmaine.kong@vw.com.sq]
Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 5:58 PM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: RE: PRS FOR SMGS90Y (EQ: SGGY711C)

Dear Joel,

Clearer Screenshots FYI...

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Ple Lid
247 Alexandra Foad
Singapore 159934

Direct line: +65 6305 7176
Main Line: +65 6305 7293
Main Fax: +65 6474 3643
charmaine. kong@vw.com.sq
hitpfwaw . vW.com.sq

Back witha
bold new look. |

The new Polo. ; I-\
\

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore}

Sent: Friday, 14 December, 2018 4:32 PM

To: "Joel Goh'

Subject: RE: PRS FOR SMGEA0Y (EQ: SGG9711C)



'EQ Insurance Company Limited
L Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Black MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
WIAW.BQINSLIFANCE. COm. 58

“'. & Mennber of Citystate @-_3

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWWw.avg.com




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore) <mely wong@vw.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 January 2019 1:16 PM

To: Poh Kin (LEKAuto)

Ce: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapaore); Kong, Charmaine
(VWG Singapore); Admin A

Subject: RE: RTA involving vehicle nos. SGG 9711C and SMG O0Y on 12/12/2018

Dear Poh Kin,

Offer accepted. Please forward us DV, if any, and kindly process payment.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Meiy
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

olkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line:  +685 8305 7216
Main Line: +65 6305 7299
Main Fax,  +65 6474 3643
meiy. wong@vw.com.sg
http:fweww, v, COm.5q

Back with a
bold new look.

The new Polo.

It's not e-mail, if you print it. Think Blue.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, January 28, 2019 1:04 PM

To: Wong, Mely (VWG Singapore)

Cc: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapore); Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); Admin A
Subject: RE: RTA involving vehicle nos. SGG 9711C and SMG 590Y on 12/12/2018

Importance: High

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE A5 TO COSTS



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

#

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 28 January 2019 1:04 PM
To: Waong, Meiy (VWG Singapore)
Cc: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapore); Kong, Charmaine
(VWG Singapore); Admin A
Subject: RE: RTA involving vehicle nos. SGG 9711C and SMG 530Y on 12/12/2018
Importance: High
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/EQI18022633/T1fa3
Your Ref: SMG 590Y

Dear Meiy,

We refer to above matter.

Purely towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we revise
offer settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair (w/gst) $55,425.36

2. Loss of Use ($90.00 x 7days) S$  630.00

3. GIA search fee 5 2.00
55605736

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥ KK =

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged malerial, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not

1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
#

From: Waong, Meiy (VWG Singapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 January 2019 12:56 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuUto)

Cc Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapore); Kong, Charmaine
(VWG Singapore); Admin A

Subject: RE: RTA involving vehicle nos, SGG 9711C and SMG 590Y on 12/12/2018

Categories: clear

Dear Poh Kin,

Thanks your offer ,please re-consider LOU from $80 to $100 per days at least based on benchmark rate settlement
56127.36, Thanks.

Thanks and Best Regards,

M eiy
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line: +65 6305 7216
Main Line; +65 6305 7299
Main Fax;  +65 68474 3643
iy Wong@vw.com.sg
hitp/iwww.vw.com.sg

Back with a
bold new look.

The new Polo.

It's not e-mail, if you print it. Think Blue.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, January 28, 2019 11:05 AM

To: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Ong, Germaine (VWG Singapore)

Cc: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapore); Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); Admin A
Subject: RTA involving vehicle nos. SGG 9711C and SMG 590Y on 12/12/2018

Importance: High

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e e e ——— R —

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 January 2019 11:05 AM

To: "Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore)’; Ong, Germaine (VWG Singapere)

Ce: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG Singapore); Kong, Charmaine
(VWG Singapore); Admin A

Subject: RTA involving vehicle nos. SGG 9711C and SMG 590Y on 12/12/2018

Importance: High

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/EQI18022633/T1fa3
Your Ref: SMG 590Y

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to above matter and your letter of demand.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair (w/gst) S$ 5,425.36
2. Loss of Use ($80.00 x 7days) SS 560.00
3. GlA search fee 5 2.00

§55,987.36

Kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥ ESES e
SeSRER  mw Sgve the Earth FPrint only when necessary”



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

#

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuUto)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 January 2019 2:00 PM
To: Ong, Germaine (VWG Singapore; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Cc Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore; Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore; Foo, John (VWG
Singapore; Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore; Admin A
Subject: RE: SMG530Y - FINALISE
Importance: High
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Our Ref: CC4/EQI18022633/T1fa3

Your Ref: SMG 590Y
Dear Germaine,
We refer to the above matter,

For COR, our surveyor had recommended amount at P/P $5,070.43 (before GST) with 5 repair days.

Please no : All finalisation is subject to our Principal insurer’s approv
In the meantime, kindly furnish us a copy of the before paint photo for our file record.

*** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt)
to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
¥ LSES L
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Biz Hag. Mo S310306FE
ST Ma. M20098505-1

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/ We WaNkL  HAO A (Passport No. S33H61 T ) the

owner of vehicle number __ 5™Mb 590 hereby accept from

(Insurance Company) the sum of

(total repair cost) in full and final settlement for the cost of repairs

arising from the loss damage of property as a result of the accident involving

SMGSad g SaRATNC  along Wiy LAVD )

on

Please pay to Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd who is authorized to receive

only on the total cost of repair on my/our behalf,

The lost of use (transport allowance / rental receipts) to be payable to

Dated this on @fvt| 20t (DD/MM/YYYY)

4

=~

(Signature of owner / Company stamp)
MName Y \f ey L= .' g frmav

J v - .
NR'E ;Nl].r{:

Date M
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. MNo: 19%607198R GET Reg, No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

5 MAXWELL ROAD

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Ref : CC4/EQI1B022633/T1falds2

M

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date: 29-01-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 088110
Code: EQI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. 5GG 9711C Veh. Inspected SMG 580Y
Policy No. DMPPHQ18-003030 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOEL Assign Date 17/12/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN PASSAT c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. VWAVWEZZZICZKED19294 Colour BLUE
Odometer 1381 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[215/55R17 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[215/55R17 PIRELLI 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/55R17 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 215/55R17 PIRELLI & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 12/12/2018 Inspection Date 19/12/2018
Survey held at VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE
247 ALEXANDRA RDAD
SINGAPORE 159834
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R Page No..1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMG 590Y
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE:ﬂIm ?g” Our ﬁ:{usted
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|WHEEL HOUSE RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 84.70 -
1|WHEEL HOUS RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 108.14 -
1|BUMPER BRACKET RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 45 91
1|BUMPER GUIDE RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 7968 -
1|FRT BUMPER COVER (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 1,445.73 -
LABOUR
1|RHF FENDER (SN) BENT 67043 670,43
1|GHROME MOLDING CENTER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 230.02 ;
1|CHROME MOLDING LH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 117.97 .
1|CHROME MOLDING RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 105.02 <
1|SENSOR BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 70.01 .
1|2KADHESIVE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 89.84 -
1|BONDAGENT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 64.27
3,111.73 670.43
LABOUR
LABOUR. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRT BUMPER 3,360.00 1,680.00
COVER.
SPRAY PAINT 3,200.00 1,600.00
B&P WHEEL ALIGNMENT 360.00 360.00
PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION COMPULSORY TO DO 480.00 480.00
AFTER AC
CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU. §. 280.00 280.00
7,680.00 4,400.00
GRAND TOTAL 10,791.73 5,070.43

RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS

[

5,070.43|

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18022633/T1fa3s2
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MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor




