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Auto
! .'_ !{ Consultants
i B

Pie Lid Company Registration Mo. 109607198R

51 UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 61563561 FAX : (065) 62504315

Your ref: D1800BRTIMESH

Qur ref; CS/FCI18022588/T1vh Date: 19/12/2018

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO SJX 1259U

We thank you for your instruction on 1771272018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

18/12/2018 at the premises of M/s LI SHENG AUTOMOBILE TRADING
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 557 487.83
Revised Estimate Amount : 552.655.12
"Check” Items Amount : 5%
Total : 8%
Market Value . 53
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%
Nett Value ;5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear front
rear nfs portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAL AMSAE-A
Automohile Assessor



i I M5 First Capital Insutance Limited o feg e 195c00106c o Teg Ko M2 -DOGLENS-g
Ms ‘ Flmtcaplta I & Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580

Tel (656222 2311 Fao [65) G222 3547

Lhaims & Metor Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robingan Road #16-01 City Heuse Singapore 0GBRTT
Tek [65) G507 3A48 Fhoc (55 6507 3849

wwew.msfirstcapital.comsg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 17-12-2018 Our Ref No. D18008871MFSH
Accident Date 13-12-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHDB557S Third Party Vehicle. SJX12590U
Sunmy Location BLK K #01-18 PANDAN LOOP

Contact Person, TOH KHAR KIAN

Contact No. 83987469/ 0 Fax No. 57744885
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

Appoinied LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor

Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number, MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

LI SHENG AUTOMORBILE

. ksh tt g
Cc : Workshop TRADING Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No., NA
Officer Incharge JOANMNEY
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,

of RREERANE (S R ANEE GROLS




Veron Chen !LI{KAutu!

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 12:04 PM

To: Veran Chen (LKKAuta); SUR

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Richard Toh Chin Huat

Subject: RE: Finalize for vehicle 5JX1259U lumpsum $2124.00 with 5 repair days
Hi Veron,

Confirm the offer Lump Sum as 52100,

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Toh Khar Kian

Li Sheng Automobile Trading

18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K)
Mobile: (65) B3987469 | Fax: 67744885

Email ; tohkk_20@hotmail.com

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 3 January, 2019 4:06 PM

To: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com=; Richard Toh Chin Huat <lishengauto@yahoo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Finalize for vehicle 5JX1259U lumpsum 52124.00 with 5 repair days

Dear Khar Kian,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer Lump Sum 352100 (@ 5 working days.

Please check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk 90&@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 4:20 PM
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>




Ce: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@|kkauto.com>; Richard Toh Chin Huat <lishengauto@yahoo.com.sg>
Subject: Finalize for vehicle SJX1259U lumpsum $2124.00 with 5 repair days

Dear Sir/Madam,

The above attachment is the after paint photo, and finalize estimate.
Kindly Assist to Finalize for vehicle 51X1259U lump sum 52124.00 with 5 repair days.

Please check and revert.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Toh Khar Kian

Li Sheng Automobile Trading

18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (BIk K)
Mobile: (65) B3987468 | Fax: 67744885

Email : tohkk_80@hotmail.com




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAutD)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 1:26 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Joanne Yong Lai fong’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1800B871MF5H/1, 51X 125%U
Attachments: SJX 1259U PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJIX 1259U
Date of survey: 18/12/2018
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 3:55 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong Lai fong' <loanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008871MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that repairer agreed survey on 18.12.2018.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkanto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

From: CW5 Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 December, 2018 3:38 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong Lai fong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18008871MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

1



Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Estimate

b

Li Sheng Automabile Trading

Please arrange ko survey at
Blk K. Mandan Loop #01-18 5(123236)

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Diate:| 14/12/2018
Velrida Nz eXiImy
NModal: TOYOTA VIOS E
Drate 0f loss: 13/12/2018
Your Ref Vehicle No: Our ref: L5A276T]S
{ SHD8557S-TP) Year:| 2010
Qty  Description List Price Remarks
100  REARTOYOTA ENBLEM & | 453 ar—
1.00 REAR "VIOS" ENBLEM s 45.66 4
100  REAR "E" ENBLEM $ 40.82 v+
1.00 REAR LHS FENDER REPAIR
1.00 REAR RHS FENDER REPAIR
100  REAR TAILGATE $ s88.69 A
1.00  REAR TAILGATE CENTER GARNISH $ 256.60 % &
100  REAR TATIGATE LOCK < MY ¥ | N
100  REAR TAILGATE WEATHER STRIP 5 228.60 % A 35
200  REARTAIL LAMP s inksn LR By WP
1.00  REAR BUMPER 5 39731 A0~
4.00 REAR BUMPER RETAINER § 259,06 A~
1000 REAR BUMPER CLIP $ 50.00 A~
1.00  REAR END PANEL 3 539.23 £7
160  REAR LEFT REFECTCR Fnor P62 (7
100  REAR TYRE BAY _ b (2 /ﬁg;h
Kemr LH | TOTAL: 305044 [ T4 1%
LESS 25%: $ 762.61 §76. 20-
$ 2,287.83
S/NET
Iy i S e LT et
2.00 REWVERSE SENSOR % 209 agp.00 -
100 END PANEL SEALANT $ 15000 X m1 g
TOTAL: 430,00
LABOURE AND PAINT
Qty Description Unit Pice Resmarks
L LABOIUR A0 REPAIR ON AFFECTED AREA 5 L5000 feo f" =
1.00 SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA g 1,30000 &0 go o
1.00 CHECK WIRING g 120,00 %5
L0 APPLY RUST PROOF ON AFFECTED PANEL 4 180,00 Ao~
100 TOREMOVE AND REFIT REVERSE SENSOR $ 100,00 Lo
100 SUNDARIFS el $ 50,00 2o (S0
3 3,250.00
MOTAL: § 4,770.00 Vb Lo
SUBTOTAL: § 7.487.83 & [31 2|0 D‘H’
Estimate prepared by; TOH KHAR KIAN 506182

G0'B R0



Estimate

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Your Ref Vehicle WNo:
| SHD85575-TP)
Telephone : 83987469

lohks S0Ehormail.com

a8,

Li SII\g Automobile Trading
Please arrange Lo curvey al

Blk K, Bandan Loop #01-18 ${128235)

Date: 14/12/2018
Ve igde Na: SX 1250
Modal: TOYOTA VIOS E
Date Jﬁf loss: 13/12/2018
Our i f: LSA276T]S
Yea :r 2010

\‘N‘j\ $

Tond~ AP AHKY
dwﬁf
[ehz}t&(ﬂ “w

C«v«f@m

RM >
A

G [k anfouco
<

LKK Agto Consultants hence nolify

the Repairer of the following:

» To respirvey belorsiafier spray painting

«To dusiﬂy damaged part{s) during resurvey

» Parts frices are subject to confirmation

= Third garty survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis
+ No illegal modificationis) is allowed

= Supplementary itemis) must be resunveyed and
is subject ta final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowjedged by Repaires
Signatupe:
Datg:
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Li Sheng Automaobile Trading
Meass preange to arvey at
Bik K, Pandan Loop #U1-18 5{128236)
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Date: 1471272018
Ve'icls Nz spiasmo
I'll'lﬂdfi: TOYOTA VIOS B
Date of loss: 13122018
Your Ref Vehicle No: Chur ref: LSAZ76T]S
{ SHD85375-TP) Year 2010
Oty Description List Price Remarks
100  REAR TOYOTA ENBLEM < e T
1.00  REAR "VIOS® ENBLEM s i5.66 W
1.00 REAR "E" ENBLEM $ QOB v
1.00 REAR LHS FENDER REPAIR
1.00 REAR RHS FENDER REPAIR
1.0 REAR TAILGATE 3 588,69 f{‘r"'
1.00 REAR TAILGATE CENTER GARNISH 5 256,60 *
100  REAR TATIGATE LOCK < L e T
100  REAR TAILGATE WEATHER STRIP [ 228.60 X
200  REAR TAIL LAMP $ 42450 £4—cr1” RH ¥
100  REAR BUMPER 3 397.31 A2
400  REAR BUMPER RETAINER 5 259,06 Al
1000 REAR BUMPER CLIP % 50.00 A%
1.00  REAR END PANEL 5 53923 £¥
160  REAR LEFTREFECTOR 5 642 0°7
LM REAR TYRE BAY REPAIR
TOTAL: § 3,050.44 52623
LES525%: § 76261 wshd 381 3D
E 2,297.83 $BUS 13
S/NET
Ty o T LT T f’.‘%ne e TIP3
200  REVERSE SENSOR s 209 28000 M.
.00  END PANEL SEALANT 5 150.00 %
TOTAL: S 430.00 3300
LABOUR AND PAINT 1
Qty Drescription Unit Frice Remarks
L0 LABOUR FOR REPAIR CON AFFECTED ARTA s ispw L£To 30°
1.00 SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 5 1,300.00 60 pgov
1.00 CHECK WIRING 3 120.00 %3+
L APPLY RUST PROCF ON AFFECTED PANEL (3 180.00 30"
100 TO REMOVE AND REFIT REVERSE SENSOR $ 100.00 T,
1.00 SUNDARIES £ 000 L&
4 225000
TOTAL: % 8,770.00 0o
SUBTOTAL: § 7,487.83

Estimate prepared by: TOH KHAR KIAN
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Estimate
Li Sheng Automobile Trading
Plense afrange to survey at
3k K, Paidan Loop #01-18 S{125256)
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Pate: 14122018
Ve™ic't Nz S
Model! TOYOTA VIOS E
Dﬂtet&itrsﬁ 13/12/2018
Your Ref Vehicle No: Cur ref: LSA2?6TIS
( SHD83575-TP} Year | 2010
Telephone : 83967469
P = $105.82
less >3t - $ 28\ Ao % 1M 4317
i f
d8u5.13 w(’?
S Net = $ 200.00 [!hil]t& ey

$10u5.12 &,_‘f:;%
Labauwe & 161000 f"wo ,‘47‘,- Tf

4 2655.13 oo (bl anfSin s

3ovon. o0 § ?'j




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No./ 19-9607 198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En :{mmuhna

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref CS/FCIMB02258B/T1vbn2

#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 e i ““N‘”l"ll“"ll‘ll“
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CFLAIHI
Insured Veh. SHD 85575 Veh. Inspected SJX 1259V
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18008B71MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANME YONG Assign Date 1711212018
2. Vehicle Particulars & conditinri
Make & Model TOYOTAWVIOS c.c 1497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. MROS3HYS305161649 Colour BLACK
Odometer 157358 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres |
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |1B5/80R15 BRIDGESTONE 8 rmm
L/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R15 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/60R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4. Description of Damages |
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information |
Accident Date 131272018 Inspection Date 1871272018
Survey held at LI SHENG AUTOMOBILE TRADING
ELK 1, PANDAN LOOP,
#01-16
SINGAPORE 128219
5a. Remarks |
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair |

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uk Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No. 199607196R GST Reg. No, 19-95607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJX 1258U

Page No.:1 of 2

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Eulvdltlan Workshop (§)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TOYOTA EMBLEM NECESSARY 4531 4531
1|REAR "VIOS" EMBLEM NECESSARY 45.66 45 66
1|REAR "E" EMBLEM NECESSARY 40.82 40.62
1|REAR LHS FENDER (NPA) TO REPAIR SEE - g
LABOUR
1|REAR RHS FENDER (NPA) TO REFAIR SEE - .
LABOUR
1|REAR TAILGATE TO REPAIR SEE 588.69 -
LABOUR
1|REAR TAILGATE CENTER GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 256.60 .
1|REAR TAILGATE LOCK NOT NECESSARY 98 .24 é
1|REAR TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP NOT NECESSARY 228.60 .
2|REAR TAILLAMP N/S CRACKED / O/S 424 .50 21225
NOT NECESSARY
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 397 31 397.31
4|REAR BUMPER RETAINER MECESSARY 25906 259.06
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 539.23 Z
LABOUR
1|REAR LEFT REFLECTOR TORN 76.42 76.42
1|REAR TYRE BAY (NFA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
1|REAR LH FENDER INNER SHIELD TORMN 68.10 6810
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -779.64 -288.73
2,338.90 896.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
2|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) TORN 280.00 200.00
1|END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
1|SUNDARIES (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 20.00
480.00 220.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18022588/T 1vbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 190607198R G5T Reg. No. 19-96071 98-R Page No..2 of 2
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts 6o|'hdltlon e rﬁshnp?:}} :s%
LABOUR
LABOUR FOR REPAIR ON AFFECTED AREA INCLUSIVE 1.500.00 G00.00
OF THE REPAIR OF REAR LHS FENDER, REAR RHS
FENMDER,REAR TAILGATE REAR EMD PANEL AND REAR
TYRE BAY
SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREA. 1,300.00 800.00
CHECK WIRING 120.00 30,00
APPLY RUST PROOF OM AFFECTED PAMEL. 180.00 30.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 30.00
3,200.00 1,490.00

GRAND TOTAL 6,018.90 2,606.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,100.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18022588/T1vbn2

M .

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solely for the use and bensf of the Cllant named on the front page of this Repo.

Beport, in wiohe or In part, does w0 at his or her ewn sk

K2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




