Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 4 June 2019 11:15 AM
To: PBSP
Cc: Chua Kee Sin
Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLL2008K & XB5156G ON 14/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18022585/ea3
Attachments: Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client cut into our insured
lane and collided with our insured vehicle.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 2:29 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chua Kee Sin <chua.kee.sin@simedarby.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLL2008K & XB5156G ON 14/12/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022585/ea3

Dear Catherine

ok, 3pm appointment.



Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 2:10 PM

To: PBSP; assignments

Cc: Chua Kee Sin; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLL2008K & XB5156G ON 14/12/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022585/ea3

Dear Caroline,
Kindly assist arrange survey at 3pm.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 3 January, 2019 2:01 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chua Kee Sin <chua.kee.sin@simedarby.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKK Auto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLL2008K & XB5156G ON 14/12/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18022585/ea3

Dear Sirs

Please assist to arrange survey tomorrow at 2pm.

***Owner waiting.

Thank you.

Regards,



Caroline

C/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 11:59 AM

To: PBSP

Cc: BIE O; assignments

Subject: RE: REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLL2008K & XB5156G ON 14/12/2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18022585/ea3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Caroline,

We refer to our tele-conversation.

Please kindly assist to arrange your client to survey first.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

T 7 7 _H 2
-H_,__,___..--"*//’-.J-FI*?‘.:;‘ _f_,)/f;f;} Lk ered

& HAPPY NEW YEAR



