Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 3 July 2020 5:40 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: <REJECTION> PRI of SLW3566B LKK REF CC4/ASM18022582/Apa3

Greetings Hsiao ,
| understand the liability thru BOLA & it states that there must be a safe distance.

Based on the video , my client had maintained a safe distance all the while he was travelling.
Therefore liability should be placed on your insured & the BOLA situation does not apply.

Kindly reply.
Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq

On Fri, Aug 9, 2019 at 9:32 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Based on all the available information on hand, we are of the view that BOLA 27(a) is applicable.
Therefore, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to
look info your client claim. Thanks.
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 5:32 PM

To: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PRI of SLW3566B LKK REF CC4/ASM18022582/Apa3




Without Prejudice

Dear Ms Thana,

We refer to the below email.

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by Ms Hsiao Tong, and she will get back to you for an update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

wE Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram [mailto:thana@jackcars.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 26 July, 2019 5:22 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: PRI of SLW3566B LKK REF CC4/ASM18022582/Aha3

Greetings Mr. Vic,



Kindly update on the outcome .

Kindly revert.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq

On Fri, May 17, 2019 at 4:07 PM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Ms Thana,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that BOLA 27(a) may be applicable for this scenario as below:
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Meanwhile, we are currently pending for further instructions from our principal.

We will get back to you for an update in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

W Saye the Earth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram [mailto:thana@jackcars.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 18 December, 2018 1:53 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A; assignments

Subject: Re: PRI of SLW3566B

Greetings ,

Attached as requested for your kind perusal.

Kindly revert on the liability.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq

On Mon, Dec 17, 2018 at 3:34 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



Please be informed that OI has yet to report the accident and we are currently pending verification for
direct settlement.

Please provide us the following and arrange for TP survey.

o evidence i.e. video/ scene photo
o estimated cost of repair
e GlAreport

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 December, 2018 4:11 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>; SG AXA Insurance SM Claims
Service Team <cst@axa.com.sg>

Subject: PRI of SLW3566B

Greetings ,

Attached would be the PRI of SLW3566B for your kind perusal.



Kindly revert.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax : 67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq




