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Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

Ofice 50 Bukil Batok S123, #01.00 Midview Bulding, Singapore 859578
Workshop: 50 Bukit Balok 5123, #31.06 Midview Bullding, Singapore 650578
Tel 6318 1131 HP. 97302017 Fax: 8318 7050
42, Sungei Kadul Ave, Singapore 726060 Tel - B2268523

( Email Adress - woonmeng (@singnet com sg )
Co Reg No. 200603678M GST Reg No. 20-06036T8M

Estimate

TP CLAIM

To  : FWD Singapore Pte Ltd

Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sirs :

ACCIDENT INVOLVIN 784L, SME248Y & SGKB8148P

Date : 21 Jan 20189

Fax : 6727 5700
RE : ESTIMATE COST FOR KIA CERATO 1.6A - SKEB784L

ITEMS DESCRIPTION QTy RIC

1 Rear bumper -nett. 1pc $ 598,009

2  Rear bumper side retainer @$35ea -natt. 2pcs § 70.00 s~

3 Rear sensor @226ea-nett 2pcs § 452.00 4~~~ 200 SN

4  Rear bumper lower garnish -nett pc $ 187.00d1—~

S Rear bumper reforcement- nett 1pc §$ 579.00

6  Rear end panel -nett pc $ 3s54.00 A» 1631

7 Rear bumper sponge -neft pc § 197,00 O10%- 1467.90

PART DISCOUNT 10% $ 243700 SN-200
Labour Charge & Misc 1667.90
To remove, repair, replace & install } $ 800.00 G o
damaged parts. }
To R & R sensor wiring. $ 80.00 LV
To putty & spray painting. $ 100000 f[i°
1230

Lot 5___ 98000 1ora2807.90
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m Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50 Bukil Batok Strest 23 #01-06 Midview Buslding. Singopore 650578
Tl +B563181131 / +65831681151 FAX +6563167080
mn" HEHE Workshop 42, Sunger Kadut Ave Singapore TIDE55 Tel; +6563628523

Emml woonmengsngnet com. sg)
Co Reg No 2008036T8M GST Reg No. 20-0603678M

TAX INVOICE NO: WM2019/C04282/may/TP
Date : 04 May 2019

FWD Singapore Pte Lid

B Temasek Boulevard

# 18- 01 Suntec Tower Four
Singapore 038886

Attn  Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs
RE : REPAIR COST FOR kia cerato 1.6A - SKEB784L
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKEB784L, SME248Y & SGK8148P ON 12.11.2018
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE
1 Lump sum repair cost $ 2,300.00
""" 5 2,300.00
ADDGST7% § 18100
TOTAL AMOUNTSsS § 2,461.00

S/D : Two Thousand Four Hundred And Sixty One Only.

This is a computer-generated document. No signature is required



Involce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raflles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE rone <65 5224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Oparaling Hours: Monday 1o Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Dur Ref No: GR-18-193122

Data of Reguesl; 14/12/2018 Your Ref No. Online Purchase

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50 Bukit Batok Street 23,

#0106 Midview Building

Singapore 653578
| Dear Sir/Madam,

Enguiry Dale 1411272018

Engquiry By Heng Sew Sow

TP Vahicla MNo. SMEZ248Y

Accidant Data 121172018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (58%)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
| GST Amount 0.13

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is & computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Officlal usa:
Data:

[¥] GIRO [] Cash [ | Cheque

htipa:/singapore. madman. comiclaimafindex.cim?uassboxsM TRaasEusasction=dsp_gonlnvip&mefid=200310TACFID=454034408CFTOKEN=f)... 22



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

. - — — ———,——  —— ——————————= ——
From: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com
Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 3:15 PM
Te: assignments@|kkauto.com; sur@Ilkkauto.com
Cc: AsherSng@lkkauto.com
Subject: FW: Accident involving SKEB784L, SME248Y (FWD ) & SGK8148P on 12.11.18
Attachments: 20181214104104.pdf
5-ten@ 14112 e
Hi
| d to below PRS N “1
Please attend to below request. W
)

Kindly indicate our claim number 1201800014871 in Merimen,

Regards,
Lionel

——0Original Message-——

From: Heng Sew Sow [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 11:11 AM

To: Motor Claims 5G - SG Common

Subject: Accident involving SKEB784L, SME248Y (FWD ) 8 5GKB148P on 12.11.18

Dear Sir/madam
We refer to the above accident
Kindly be advised that we will be assisting our client, owner of vehicle no:
SKEB784L, to submit a third party claim against your insured vehicle. We would like to proceed with direct
settlement.
Please arrange for your surveyor to liaise with us for an inspection on our client's Vehicle at your earliest
convenience.
Attached video for your reference.
Location : 50, Bukit Batok 5t 23 # 01- 06 Midview Building ( 5 ) 659578
Thank you.
Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 63161131
Fax : 63167050



Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAUto)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 January 2019 5:33 PM
To: ‘woanmengi@singnet com sg'
Cea Admin A
Subject: RE: Accident involving SKEB7B4L, SME248Y (FWD ) & SGKB148P on 12.11.18
'WITHOUT PREJUDICE'
SAVE A5 TD COSTS
Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement] and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail Is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client's vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In arder to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email; ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | 5/408933)

From: Heng Sew Sow [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com sg|

Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 11:11 AM

To: Motor Claims 5G - 5G Common

Subject: Accident involving SKES784L, SME248Y (FWD ) & SGKB148P on 12.11.18

Dear Sir/madam
We refer to the above accident
Kindly be advised that we will be assisting our client, owner of vehicle no:

SKES734L, to submit a third party claim against your Insured vehicle, We would like to proceed with direct settlement.
Please arrange for your surveyor to liaise with us for an inspection on our client's Vehicle at your earliest convenience.

I



Attached video for your reference.
Location : 50, Bukit Batok St 23 # 01- 06 Midview Bullding | 5 ) 659578
Thank you.

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
Tel : 63161131
Fax : 63167050

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link
attachments:

20181214104104

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent sending or recelving certain types of file
attachments. Check your e-mail security settings to determine how attachments are handled.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are privatz and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
Individual ar entity to whom they are addressed. Ifyou have recelved this email in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been
scanned for viruses by our mall domain, Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.
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Claim

Marnmen e-Claims

Audit

5 AUDIT TRAIL
Mo, On Audit Remaris By
[A]
1 170652018 c1m viah Model Changed (201525) KIA CERATO FORTE 1.6 SX (A). oot
KWAN
17 Dec 2018 Reg No: SKEB784L, Acct Date: 2018/11/12. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: FWD Singapore Pt ngal
2 15:23 €im Created e. Ltd, (HQ). TP Insurer; QBE Insurance [Singapore) Pte Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Woon Me MEL
: ng Mator Pte Ltd (Bukit Batok) AN
[A]
17 Dec 2018 LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (MQ):; AR Reglon: PWD - Ext Auto Adj Assignment. Sugg HOW
3 1523 Adj Co Assigned ested Adj. : VICOM Ltd. MEI
KWAaN
[A]
4 ;;';';‘ 2018 445 Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2018/12/27 *:E'E":‘
KWAN
[A]
5 120557018 adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00, Reinsp: Adj decides. o)
KWAN
17 Dec 2018 H[;Eu
8 ey Label Added {20005):Direct Settlement . T
KWAN
7 2018 (N
7 1e03 2% Adj Adjuster Assigned  [None] -> MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID g
KWAN
Registratio m
8 i&‘a‘;‘ e mm " Pol No:->PNFYV2018-00012706. L?LT
[A]HE
i
9 fiae " AdyRat Initiated L
KHANG
MIN
mﬁnr
10 3335 %% cim ot Modified 1) Reg. Date: -> 2012/04/12. LEE
KHANG
MIN
mi".‘..'.-.s
11 51385 cim Details Notified LEE
KHANG
MIN
23 3ul 2019 CurReq:2763.00:LIABILITY: 100% B:28 3VEH CC OID ZND QUANTUM: (a) COR w/GST: ﬂiﬂr
12 1546 Ad] Mandate Request  $2.461.00 + (b) LOU: $300,00 (5days x $60) + (c) LTA :$2.00 Total: a+b+e = §2,763,
: 00 PLEASE REVERT WITH YOUR APPROVAL / MANDATE / INSTRUCTIONS, IF ANY, . 5"““
Date From 4| »| pateTo 4|7 »| Audit Type Nore v| 6o |
ACTIVITY o B
|No record -
'Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History
| L ] Biil Date Ace Type Aoz Mama '_l:'__lil'_'_.r_.:" Rel 1 Raf 2 Amoumn
22/07/2019 LKK Auts LKK Auto
2219813 ! Matar Consultants Pte | Consultants Pte |  SKEB784L SME248Y 11.77
e Ltd L (HQ) | L -

https://singapore meriman. comclalms/index. cimusebox=MTRadjusterAfuseaction=dsp_viewhistoryScaseid=7732028extid=200504ACF ID=564 .
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Lirdriat] Marimen &-Claims

Print Received Message

This mall s associated with ;

*SKESTBAL (1201800014871)
[SME248Y]
TP
THAM YN YENG
MNov 12 2018 7:00PM

[Lea Boon Chan)
Woon Meng Motor Pte Lid

From FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) (FWD_S§G), sent on 24/07/2019 18:46 PM.
To LKK_HG
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (55§2763.00) - SKE&784L - Claim Handler: Lionel Tan

Approved:2763.00.

hitps:/isingapore. meriman.com/caima/index.cim Musebox=SVCmaill&fuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=565T99808 CFTOKEN=282c3dbEEE20a3-88C00... 1N
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m Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50 Bukd Batox Street 23 #01-06 Midview Bullding. Singapore 858578
Tel! +8552181131 / +8583161151 FAX +B5831670560

mu" ME“G Workshap 42, Sungsd Kadul Ave Singapors 720858 Tel «B58362852]

Emall woormang@singrat com sg)

Co Reg No.20080368TEM QST Reg Mo, 20-D60J5TAM

FWD Singapore Pte Ltd 4 May 2018
B Temassk Boulevard

# 18- 01 Suntec Tower Four

Singapore 038886

Attn.  Motor Claim Dept.
Dear Sirs

DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR REPAIR OF KIA CERATO 1.6A - SKES784L

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKEB784L, SME248Y AND SGKB14BP
ALONG PIE ON 12/11/2018

We have been given the full autherity to act on behalf of Tham Yin Yeng,
registerad owner of motor vehicle no: SKE8784L, which was involved and
damaged in the above accident.

We were told that the said accident was caused solely due to the negligence
of your insured driver. Therafore, we are compelled to claim against you

for the losses as follows:-

1) Cost of repair § 2.481.00
2) Loss of use for Sdays @$80perday. $ 40000
3) LTA search. 5 2.00

TOTAL AMOUNT - $ 2883.00

We have told our client that this matter is strictly on a DIRECT SETTLEMENT

basis. If you do not dispute liability, please arrange to let us have your payment

for the sum of S/D : TWO THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED AND SIXTY THREE ONLY
in full and final settlement for our client's claim.

We enclose herewith the GIA report, Surveyor's report and the invoices for your
attention.

We Iofk forward to your sarly favourable reply.

Yours fa

Chong Han Woon



LETTER OF A TY

To: 7{(/0 @Vyﬂ/f //;_/;e" M

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GLEL I y/ _, &l ?ﬂ(fyafﬁ[ffﬂf/b
oN / zy/f ALONG /&

| TAAN] Vﬂ }/,(f NRIC SHUF L7

OF LI > Th W) vl A1 % )L >

Owner of Motor Registration No /.da hereby

Authorise M/S WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD as my agent

and representative to correspond in, negotiate and settle, on my
behalf, my claim against the parties involved in the above-mentioned
accident. In the event of final settlement, we agreed that payment be

make payable to M/S WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD.

- Date & signature

LIS




RELEASE

Claim Reference: 1201800014871 B
Surveyor's Reference: | CC4/FWD1B022580/T1ead
TP Reference: SKE B784L

We, WOON MENG MOTOR PTE LTD {“ Workshop"| hereby agres and confirm that we are authorized

by the owner (“Claimant”) of motor vehicle SKE 8784L (“Vehicle”] to accept the sum of $2,763.00, being the
amount claimed for $2,461.00 (repair costs), $300.00 {loss of esatatiuse), $ - (loss of income), $2.00
(disbursement) as compensation for the loss of or damage to the Vehicle, as a result of 3n accident

("Accident”) which accurred on 12/11/2018 (date of accident) at / along PIE (location) involving vehicle na/s.
SKE B784L and SME 248Y.

This Is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 22/01/2019 {date) at the Workshop.

We confirm that this acceptance Is in full and final settlement of all claims arising from the damage to
the Vehicle (whether now or hereafter to become manifest), to the intent that FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. and
all other persons, in particular the driver of SME 248Y be absolutely and finally exonerated and discharged
from all claims of every nature and kind whatsoever which have been made or which may be made in respect

of this Accident.

We also declare that we are authorized by the Claimant to receive the above compensation and we
have full authority to make the claim as set out above and to settle the matter an behalf of the Claimant in

any manner we deam fit,

This settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis. As such, this
Release is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part of FWD Singapore Pte Ltd, their
policyholder and / or authorised driver and shall not be used as evidence in any claims and / or action which
may be lodged by any of them.

Dated this d\ day of M"lt':'! 2me

S __*Tai“/ ‘MQ\

[Signed by the "Wurfuhm Co. Stamp] [FWD's appointed surveyor with Co. Stamp]
For and on behalf of the “Claimant® For and on behalf of FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd,




m Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50 Bukit Bahok Sirest 23 001-06 Midview Building. Singspore BE35TE
Tek +6553 161131 / +&583161151 FAX. +E58318T050

wunH MEHG Vioranap 41, Sungei Kadut Ave Singapors T208E8 Tel: +656362852]

Email woonmengB sngnet com.sg)

Co Reg No 200603578BM G5T Reg No, 20-06036TEM

TAX INVOICE NO: WM2019/C04282/may/TP
Date : 04 May 2018

FWD Singapore Pte Ltd

& Temasek Boulevard

# 18- 01 Sunt=c Tower Four

Singapore 038986

Attn  Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs

RE : REPAIR COST FOR kia cerato 1.6A - SKES784L

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKES8784L, SME248Y & SGK8148P ON 12.11.2018
ITEM DESCRIFTION PRICE
1  Lump sum repair cost 3 2.300.00
R
ADD GST 7% 3 161.00
TOTAL AMOUNTS$ § 2,461.00

S/D : Two Thousand Four Hundred And Sixty One Only

This Is a computer-generated document. No signature is required.



12143018

GENERAL
INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Inveeca

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapora 048560
Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am ta Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-193122

Date of Request: 141212018 Yaour Rel No: Online Purchase
Woon Meng Motor Pie Lid

50 Bukit Batok Strest 23,
#01-06 Midview Building
Singapore 659578

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Data 141272018

Enquiry By Heng Saw Sow

TP Vehicle No. SME248Y

Accidaent Date 1211172018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Ingurer Tel. No.
SMEz248Y FWD Singapore Pta. Lid. 23/09/2018-28/08/2018 B6727 5700
Thank You

The images provided lo you are taken from the ariginal reparts lerwarded (o the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of

Singapora and we take na responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no llability whatsaaver for any loss or damage arising out of
or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is @ computer genarated documant and requires no signature,

hitps singapore marimen.com/calimaindax. ctm Mussbox=MTRsas&lussaclion=gsp_geninviplrefid=2003107ACFID=45404438CFTOKEN={a].

12



1214018 Imvoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENEML RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singepore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax. +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday 9am o Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration Na: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Qur Ref No GR-18-183122

Date of Request: 14/12/2018 Your Ref Na; Online Purchase

Woon Meng Molor Pte Lid

50 Bukit Batok Street 23,

#01-06 Midview Building

Singapore 658578

Dear SiriMadam,

Enguiry Dale 14/12/2018

Enguiry By Heng Sew Sow

TP Vehicls No, SME248Y

Accident Date 1211172018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (58§)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due {GST Inclusiva) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated documant and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:

Data:
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CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Iresured:

|Lee Boon Chen, 1D STS7687EL

Main
Clakimant:

THAM YIN YENG, 1D: SO0056706Z

Vehicie Reg
(N

SKEB7B4L

|Claim Type: | TP/ 1201800014871

D= ofLoss' |79 Manths From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Policy Covas
Note No.:

. [12)11/2018 15:00 - :50

PNRVZ018-00012706 (Comprehendive)

SMETABY
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Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd (Bukit Batok) 50 Bukit Batok Strest 23,, #01-06 Midview Bullding, 659578 Buke Batok - Tel; £316

Aduwer 197/12/2018]

F‘u Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel 62245813

1
]
FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd, (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5700 ., [Handied by Lionel Tan) |
[
|
|

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei 6256-3561 . [Handied by MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] __ [Final Rpt due

i === .__..,L" =
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Claim Documents

*SKEB7B4L (1201800014871)
[SH‘!TI:I‘I‘]

THAM YIN YENG
Nov 12 2018 7:00PM
[Lee Boon Chen)
Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|'u"thil:lt No: SME248Y (Insd veh) Model: 1A CERATO FORTE 1.6 5X
SKEBT784L (TP veh) A)
| Date of Accident: |12/11/2018
Global Sum Settlement | [ [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate 5 4 513,80
Final Repair Cost -1 2.461.00
Loss of Use $ 300.00 5,00 days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 0.00 days
LTA { GIA Search Fes - 2.00
Others; 5 0.00
4
Final Settlement Sum 5 2,763.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
bealow)

.""'] For Non GIA Registored Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%]
BOLA Applicable: Yes!/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability. (%) Assessed Lighility (%) 0 (%)
* Assessed Liabilily to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Woon Meng Molor Pie Ltd 5 2,763.00
2] A
3) 5

13 Aug
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Ploase attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Madical
Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 13/8/2019



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd o reg e tessoriser;

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6258-3561 Fax: 6844-BB05 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page | of 4

QOur Flle No: CC4/FPWD1B022580VT1EAIQ2
13/08/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: FWD Singapore Ple_ Lid  Policy No: PNPYV2018-00012708
Ny ot Vehlole giEpaaL Insured Vehicle No:  SME248Y
Date of Loss: 12/11/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 1201800014871
D RIFTI 1
Reg No: SKEBTBAL
Make & Model: KiIA CERATO FORTE, 1.6 5X {A) Engine No: GAFCCHZI0402
Reg. Date 12/04/2012 (Man. Year: 2012) Chassis No: KNAFW411MC5808137
Colour: While Odometer: BO526 km
Engine Capacity: 1591 cc
Market Valua/New Car Price: N/A,
Sum Insured (53%). Market Value/New Car Price
NDITION OF I T THE TIM F VEY
Genaral Conditlon: Steering (Serviceable), Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Pre-accident Conditiorr
CONDITION OF TYRES
Frant Tyre Size: 215/45 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/45 R17
Front Left Side: Roadstone 6 mm Rear Lsfi Side: Roadstone 6 mm
Front Right Side: Roadsione 6 mm Rear Right Side: Roadstone 6 mm
The abeve valued reprasen) the remaining lyre reads depih
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Paris 2,238 50 1,667.90 570.60 25490
Miscallaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,880.00 1,230.00 750.00 3788
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 4,218.50 2,897.90 1,320.60 31.30
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 2,300.00
(s$) 4,218.50 2,300.00 1,.918.50 4548
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 285,30 161.00 134.30 4548
Nett Amount (S$) 4,513.80 2,461.00 2,052.80 45.48
+ Loss of Use (5.0 x S560.00/day) (55) 300.00
+ Doc/Search Fes (S8) 2.00
Nett Liability (S5) 2,763.00
INSP
Date of Assignment: 1412:2018
Dale Inspected: 221012019 Inspected Al Woon Meng Molor Ple Lid (Bukit Batok)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ...

50 Bukit Batok Stree| 23,, #01-068 Midview
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Adjuster Repon Page 2ol 4

Building
Singapare 659578
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: Asher Sng Rong i

NOTE Thiv meport epresents our findings af the fime and place of ngpechon shated harem. Such inspection has Bean carmed out fo the Best of our
krwipdge and abiily but any other kabiily under any other circumstances is homaby exgrassly excivded,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 13/8/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference |
Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 22 Jul 2018)

Parts: 143 KIA CERATO FORTE 1.6 SX (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0) |
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code for SKEB784L)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the prinl code (above) on all estimate pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are pru_ﬂxgl:l with an aa!uriuk .

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 598.00FN “598.00FN
2 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER Mecessary TO.00FN *TOO0FN
3 2 *REAR SENSOR Not Working 452.00FS *200.00FS
4 1 ‘REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH Deformed 187.00FN “187.00FN
5 1 *REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Cracked 579.00FN *5T9.00FN
6 1 *REAR END PANEL Repair 354.00FN “FN
T 1 *REAR BUMPER SPONGE Cracked 187.00 FN “1897.00FN

FaFranchise parl. S=Spcatl. N=NatthemDisc

Sub Total (S§) 2,437.00 1,831.00

= Nett Iltem Discount on N ltems 10.00/10.00% (S§) 188.50 163.10

Total Parts (S%) 2.238.50 1,667.90

[ Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 13/8/2019



Adjuster Report Paged4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellsneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab,Type Repairer's Amount

Labour llems

1 TO REMOVE.REPAIR ,REPLACE & INSTALL DAMAGED New 800.00 800.00
PARTS

Z TO RA&R SENSOR WIRING New BO.0O 30.00

3 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING New 1,000.00 B00.00

Gross Labour Cost {55) 1,980.00 1,230.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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