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AdA BA R Pie Lid Company Registration No. 199607T19ER

2 UBEAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX : (065) A2584315

Your ref” SNMI18D0O5828/CO2
Our ref: CC6/CTIIR022577/Afa3 Date: 05.03.2019

The Motor Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

Dear Sirs,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SMD 8050C
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 14/12/2018
at the premises of M/s Hiap Hong Motor Repair and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 13,073.50

Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 5,800.00

"Check" Items Amount : 5% -

Market Value : 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 8% -

Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage: e — - -
The vehicle sustained damages at the @

Rear Portion arfsice

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 6.0 days

Y ours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING
Licensed Appraiser



Annex

Transaction ref 20180904 163430802690

Please check that the owner and vehicle details are correcr:

[t

!._,ﬂ:.l_-:.,...l

0.

9.

i

13.
4,
15.
10,

15,
19.
20.

21

13

s

23.
24,
23
26.
27.
28
29,
3.
3l
32.

Namc

ldentification No, Type
Identification No,
Country/Region
Registered Address

Mailing Address
Vehicle Registration No,
Effective Date of Ownership

Original Registration Date

. First Registration Date

Ll

Viehicle Type

Vehicle Scheme
Attachment |
Attachment 2
Attachment 3
Vehicle Make
WVehicle Model

Year of Manufacture
Primary Colour
Secondary Colour

- Passenger Capacity

Chassis/Trailer Chassis No.
Propellant/Emission Standard
Engine No./Motor No.

Engine Capacity(ce)/Power Rating(kW)
Maximum Power Output(kW/bhp)
Unladen Weight(kg)

Maximum Laden Weight(kg)
Open Market Value

PARF Eligibility

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
Minimum PARF Benefit

: TAN TION HUA

: Singapore NRIC
:S1315016H

: APT BLK 401 JURONG WEST
STREET 42

#11-537

SINGAPORE 640401

- SMD8050C
: 04 Sep 2018
: 04 Sep 2018
: 04 Sep 2018

: Z11 - Private Hire (Chaulfeur) Station
Wagon/Jeep/Land Rover

: Normal

: No Attachment

: HONDA

: FREED HYBRID 1.5G AUTO
12018

: Grey

16

:GB71072488 / -

: Petrol-Electric / Euro VI

: LEBS606963 / H14087 196
21496/ 22.0

:101.0/ 135

: 1430

: 1815

: $24,745.00

: Yes

: 03 Sep 2028

: $8,321.00
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LKK Aulo Consultants hence notify '
the Repairer of the following: S &

» To resurvey beforelafter spray painting

« To display damaged partis) during resurvey
-Pﬂprmmsummmmnfmm g .
+ Third parly survey i on a"Without Prejudice’ bass D G-\/r\

« No legal modification(s) is aliowed

ntary Hemis) must e resurveyed and
sumwlmﬁmmalmmsummm

Acknowledged by Repairer \H}ﬁ‘ﬁj
Signature:
Date:




Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

=_——a= =— == s
From: Lucas Lee <lucaslee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Friday, 21 December, 2018 1:32 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Cc: Irene Tay
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL246Z (O1: CTI - SNM18D05828C02)
AND SMDBOS0C (TP ; LKK REF - CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3) on 14/12/2018
Attachments: MSNH18162120-YL246Z pdf
Categories: HMEK

Dear Sir,

Case Handler ; Irene Tay

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 073303
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (B65)E6222 7175/6224 7478

Email; lucas.lee@sg.cntalping.com

Website: www.sg.cnlaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
Iuﬂwlilnfi"

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd, except
where provided for in a written agreement berween you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. Any unanthorized
disclosure. use ar dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediarely.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

sent: Monday, 17 December, 2018 3:13 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Lucas Lee; Poh Kin (LKKAuto); C5 A Team; Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL246Z (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SMD8050C (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3) on 14/12/2018

CTI ref: TBA
LKK REF: CC6/CTI18022577 /Afa3

Dear Sir / Madam,



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 3:48 PM

To: ‘hiap.hong.motor@gmail.com’

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. YL 2467 AND SMD 8050C

ALONG UPPER CHANGI ROAD EAST ON 14.12.2018

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS
Our Ref: CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3
Your Ref: SMD 8050C

Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. YL 246Z AND SMD 8050C ALONG UPPER CHANGI
ROAD EAST ON 14.12.2018

We refer to the above matter.

Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have
instruction from our Principal to offer settlement as below:

1. Cost of Repair S5 5,800.00
2. Loss of Use (560.00 x 8days) SS  480.00
S$ 6,280.00

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Hest Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

B 74 P

RERER WU Spue the Farthe Print only when necessary:



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

ﬂ

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuta)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 7:35 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: irene tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL246Z (Ol : CTI - SNM18D05828C02)
AND SMDB050C (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3) on 14/12/2018

Attachments: LKK Survey Photo.pdf; Preliminary Advice dated 05.03.2019.pdf; TP Estimate-
Marked.pdf

Importance: High

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SMD B0O50C
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LFES ol
SR RIR wmm Saue the Earth- Frimt only when recessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in eror, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof, Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 3:13 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com; Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
<pohkin@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com=>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL246Z (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SMDB050C (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTII8022577/Afad) on 14/12/2018

CTI ref: TBA



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
e e P, LIS Ml - M TR | s S R T e e e el e e e e T T TR

From: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 17 April 2019 3:50 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL 246Z (Ol
SNM18D05828C02/6) and SJZ 3192D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118022577/Afa3) on
14/12/2018

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3
CTl REF -5NM18D05828C02/6 (YL2462)

Dear Poh Kin

We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $6,600.00 (all in)

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: & FE¥i# Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafler.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@Ikkauto.com)]

Sent: Thursday, 11 April, 2019 3:15 PM

To: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving YL 2462 (Ol: SNM18D05828C02/6)
and SJZ 3192D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3) on 14/12/2018

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC6/CT118022577/Afa3
Your Ref:  SNM18D05828C02

Dear Mr Alfred,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. YL 246Z (Ol) AND SMD 8050C (TP) ALONG UPPER CHANGI
ROAD EAST ON 14/12/2018

We refer to the above matter and your mandate approval dated 22" March 2019.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
LT iR ST e e e e e e e B e B B o et R e

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 3:15 PM

To: ‘Alfred Toh'

Cc: 'irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com’; Admin A

Subject: FW: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL 246Z (Ol

: CTI - SNM18D05828C02) and SJZ 3192D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118022577/Afa3)
on 14/12/2018

Attachments: LKK Adjustment report.pdf; LKK Inspection report.pdf; LKK resurvey photo- after
repair.pdf; LKK resurvey Photo.pdf; LKK Survey Photo,pdf; TP LOD_ SMD 8050C.pdf;
RE: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL 2462 (Ol
: CTl - SNM18D05828C02) and SJZ 3192D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3)
on 14/12/2018; TP GIA.pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CCe/CTI18022577/Afa3
Your Ref: SNM18D05828C02

Dear Mr Alfred,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. YL 246Z (Ol) AND SMD 8050C (TP) ALONG UPPER CHANGI
ROAD EAST ON 14/12/2018

We refer to the above matter and your mandate approval dated 22" March 2019.

We hereby re-seek mandate as TP counter proposal for loss of use + Income for $100.00 per day, given a
point of view that the vehicle is used for Private Hire.

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised TP counter propo
1. Cost of Repair $13,203.50 S 5,800.00 5 5,800.00
2. Loss of Use $ 1,200.00 ($150.00 x 8 days) S 480.00 (560.00x8days) [ 800.00(5100.
Total | 514,403.50 S 6,280.00 6,600.00

We here by re-seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Hiap Hong Motor Repair" at $ 6,600.00
(all-in).

**6 days recommendation for repair + PRI/downtime + weekends = 8 days

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 2:38 PM

Teo: Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow

Subject: RE: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL 246Z (Ol

- CTI - SNM18D05828C02) and SJZ 3192D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT118022577 /Afa3)

on 14/12/2018

Attachments: image001.jpg

Dear Poh Kin

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter,

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at @6,280.00.

We await your payment advice to enable Irene to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, March 22, 2019 2:06 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Admin A

Subject: RE: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL 246Z (O1:CTI-S5NM18D05828C02)
and SJZ 3192D (TP : LKK REF - CCH/CTI18022577/Afa3) on 14/12/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CCB/CTI1BD22577/Afa3

Your Ref: SNM18D0O5828C02



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March 2015 4:15 PM

To: ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’

Cc: 'irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com’; 'Alfred Toh'; Admin A

Subject: <Urgent> <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YL 2462 (Ol :
CTI - SNM18D05828C02) and SJZ 3192D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3) on
14/12/2018

Attachments: LKK Adjustment report.pdf; LKK Inspection report.pdf; LKK resurvey photo- after

repair.pdf; LKK resurvey Photo.pdf; LKK Survey Photo.pdf; TP LOD_ SMD 8050C pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3
Your Ref: SNM18D05828C02

Dear Sir/madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING NOS. YL 2462 (Ol) AND SMD 8050C (TP) ALONG UPPER CHANGI
ROAD EAST ON 14/12/2018

We refer to the above matter.
Liability: Insured Driver collided into the rear of third party vehicle. Liability is down against our insured.

We did clarify with Insured(PIC) the nature of the accident and They agree to settle and aware that NCD (if
any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Hiap Hong Motor Repair" at $ 6,280.00 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $13,203.50 S 5,800.00
2. Loss of Rental $ 1,200.00 (5150.00 x 8 days) S 480.00 (560.00 x 8 days)
Total | $14,403.50 S 6,280.00

**6 days recommendation for repair + PRI/downtime + weekends = 8 days
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.
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-8V 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref . CC&/CTI18022577/Afa3n2
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 Date: 16-04-2019 ” mmumnmm
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YL 2462 Veh. Inspected SMD 8050C
Policy No. DMCWVSN1826541800 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18005828C02 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 14/12/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA FREED HYBRID c.c 1456
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. GBT1072488 Colour GREY
Odometer 31101 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOO0D
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/85R15 YOKOHAMA, B mm
L/H Front Tyre 185/65 R15 YOROHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/65 R15 YOROHAMA, & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTICN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
o General Information
Accident Date  14/12/2018 Inspection Date 14/12/2018
Survey held at 51 UBI AVE 1 #01-25 PAYA UBI IND PARK S (408933)
Repairer HIAP HONG MOTOR REPAIR
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDAMNCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Ne, 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMD B0S0C

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408533

Page No.:1 of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::::E?::?;}] 2Ll 1;’}““"

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 1,180.20 1,180.20
1|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER @$53.80 NECESSARY 107.60 107.60
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR @3$163.40 NOT NECESSARY 326.80 &
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE B23.20 -

LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 115.60 115.60
2| TAILLAMP @3494 10 CRACKED 988.20 08820
1|TAILGATE DISTORTED 1,207.80 1,207.90
1| TAILGATE LOCK DAMAGED 242.30 242 .30
1|TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIPE cuT 198.20 188.20
1|TAILGATE CHROME MOULDING CRACKED 247 .80 247 .80
2| TAILGATE REFLECTCR @%380.50 CRACKED 761.00 T61.00
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CRACEKED 345.00 345.00
1|TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|TAILGATE ROCKET HANDLE DEFORMED 35.40 3540
1|TAILGATE WIPER MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 264.90 -
1|TAILGATE GLASS MOULDING NECESSARY 124.60 124.60
1|HONDA LOGOD MECESSARY 35.60 35.60
1|FREED EMBLEM NECESSARY 45.80 45,90
1|HYBRID EMBLEM NECESSARY 50.40 50.40
2|REAR FENDER INMER TRIM BOARD @%345.00 NOT NECESSARY 690.00 -
1|REAR FENDER INMER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 880.10 -
1|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING NOT MECESSARY 36.40 -
2|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP @533.20 NOT NECESSARY B66.40 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -1,148.14
8,693.50 4 5096 .56
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

1|REVERSE SENSOR (3SN) DAMAGED 280.00 200.00
1|REAR END PAMNEL SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -

Report Ref No. CCB/CTI18022577/Afa3n2
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

Page No.-2 of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition WE:rT:;::?g}] our #i:jjmm
1| TAILGATE GLASS SEALANT (SN} MECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1|REAR CAMERA (SN) CRACKED 680.00 550.00

1,080.00 810.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,200.00 750.00
END PANEL .
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,200.00 700.00
WIRING. 50.00 30.00
TO UNDERSEAL. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 :
TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR 100.00 50.00
TO REMOVE CAMERA. 100.00 50.00
TO REMOVE UPHOLSTERY. 150.00 60.00
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE FITTINGS. 150.00 80.00
TO REMOVE TAILGATE GLASS, 180.00 120.00
TO REMOVE EXHAUST PIPE. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -

3,430.00 1,840.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,203.50 7,246.56
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CCB/CTI18022577/Afa3n2

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser
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AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No; 199607138R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R
TAX INVOICE
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD INV No. AC1903345
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWER IoixiEnle  UAENIY
SINGAPORE 079909 Reference = CC6/CTI18022577/Afa3n2
Code LT
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE FEE H”NI"I"“'““"[I
Vehicle No. SMD B050C
Insured Veh. YL 246Z
Claim No. SNMI18D0OS828C02
Policy MNo. DMCVSN1826541800
Accident Date 14/12/2018
Inspection Date 14/12/2018
Description Total
Third Party Express Settlement 400.00
Subtotal 400.00
GST (7%) 28.00
Grand Total 428.00

We shall be glad if you could forward the payment at your early convenience.

Cheque should be crossed and made payable to 'LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd'

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

HYN




