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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Cwner I0:

Vehicle Details

WVehicle Mo

Wehicle to be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maxirum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF E.ighhi.t'r Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Tatal Rebate Amount:

The Information contained herein is correct as at 18 Dec 2018

PARFINNF Rahate Frmiine

Company
95240

GBD7545D

No

18 Dec 2018

NV350 PANEL VAN 2.5 SMT SDREURO V
White

2014

YD25362805A
INIMC2E2620004157
$23612.00

23 Apr 2015

23Apr 2015

0

$1,181.00

No

$0.00

22 Apr2025

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$38.51000
$24.432.00
$24,432.00

DSV B GOV. BE/AVTVCTION eNGUINe MEDSIE oy FUDICOSTONELSTBGINPUT (F UNIL | IUN_ILFFruIusuug i i

i
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Used Nissan Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMarn

- -
A {5018 Togs: 2015 Memnn MGIE0. 2015 mssen ). Nemtan NYIS0, mogmn na¥S0, Misaan, WIS, PeEST, e

HMissan NVI50 1.5A - Ha 10-Dex- 2018 1,488 o . Van SOLD
Fuel Type: Dicsel
100% Lzars Avallable, 1 Dvwner, Warranty Dy Ten Chang Till December 2018, High Trade Jn.
Famer Ao Tradng
Posued: [3-Nov=-018 L.:r 2005 Hisman WVISN, HILT rigsar rec N0, messn RV, naman e E50, Wiesn, 3, e 150, Ll
Nissan HY350 2.5M 44,800 6,530 fyr 17-5ep-2015 14E8 ec 146,300 &m Van Awailabla

Funl Typa: Misasi
Lowest Price In Tha Market. Mo Further Discounts. Sencus Buyers Ane Wekoma!

Thimk O Autampteie & Trading

" -t L/
Podiee: HE-0c-3000 Tage; J01% bimsan NVISE, J00 % maen re3E0, bty NVFRSD, spmam w000, Missan, MVIS0, 5, Used

Missan NVISO 2.5M 144000 §7,040 fyr I8-Ape-2015 1488 106,345 km an Available
Fuel Typa: e

wmlimswmmlmmmmmmummummwmhmmh
Further Discount. Sericus Buver Are Weicome|

Thirk Cre Autornabile & Tradeg
Pe 2502018 Lﬁ;im Foimsar WVYS0 F00S mesar nv 350, fissan SIS, o e AL Apann, WVISD, medL Lined

That's a fine looking car intesior

mmmmemwmmMMmﬁmmmuwmuuumm
svsilabio, Exch with merchant information, ranking and reviews to heip you make the best decsion,

Find out mone!

Nissan NV350 1.5M = H.A 26 Jun-2015 L1488 cx - Varn SOLD
Fuirl Typa: [esel
mummmm.u—mwmwmmm;mm.ﬂummmmﬂm.m
Financng Up To 100% Loan, High Trade 1n Value. One OF T —=rs
Car (5] P Led

pastar: TRCchImE TP 3015 Mg NVISE. J015 minsan we S0, Messan NVESD, rian rud50, Nissen, WVIS0, redS0, Ul

b T e
Miszan NV350 1.5M - A I-Aor-2015 2488 cc - ‘an SOLD

Fuel Typa: Dasal
mmlmwumlunm.mumum.mmummFuWWI
AEWIN [1994) M= Lid

Pomud: 11001010 Tags: N5 Messan W30, 1015 nese red50, bean WVISE, msmn e 50, Pemman, NVISE, e, Lsed

Hissan NVI50 2.5M - WA 10-Mar-3015 2488 e - an SOLD
Fuel Typa: Dlassl
imm.mmmmmw.mwmmmthIMuummm
Fute Avsilable, Super High Trade In, Call Nowd [ onaim 15
ABWIN Bus Pz Ltz

T | Toge: ZOLS Nisan VISR, 2015 nisan pv 50, Mesan NV, nessn o S50, e, WNIRG, o 15, Unemd)

Missan RY350 2,54 . HA 20-0ct-2015 1488 * Bus. SoLD
Fusl Type: Diesel
lm,mmmﬁnumnmmmm.wmmwm.hwmmm.vwwﬂw oI
Apdt Aepuisr Servicing Just Done. Call Us Now For Viewin..

Pemiad 4giagrp TS 2013 Mesaan WIS, 201 mssae mu3S0 i VST, s (e V50, My, VI, o350, Lsed

Hraigai
MNissan NVIS50 Z.5M - WA 24-Jul-201% L4 = - Wan SOLD
Fual Type: Diessl
Piezsa Call To Arrange For Viewing, Thenks
Pt G4-Oosiitl Lﬁnmls Bl WV ESE, 1 s o0, Minmae VS0, rimen na 190, Meinde. WIS, w150, Lsod
I Compare [ 11 Nissan NV350 2.5M . A 10-5ep-2015 o . van sOLD
sl T Miessl
Sgiact used cars in Compars or Add To Akt Shartilst [ 1 |
1 Aad to Uharthist
Famsan NVIS0 2.5 Ta COrTaEre CBE, Ta compara car, To comjuars Car,
salect from tha salect from (he select frinm the Camgare Mow
IE-Ap-01S search resuite search resilz. smareh resdte,
1 Dasr &
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' Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto

From: daryl tan <daryltankc@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 12:02 PM
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Ce: SUR

Subject: Re: GBD 7545D OD (EQI)

Yes, confirmed.
On Tue, 7 May 2019, 11:48 Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto), <ShirleyHiew(@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Daryl.

Please confirm final fig $11,650.00 (lump sum) @ S days of repairs before excess § 500/- & GST.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Libi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: daryl tan [mailto:daryltankc@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 2:17 PM

To: Shirley Hiew {LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: GBD 7545D OD (EQ)

We have submitted all documents to vour surveyor. We also tried to contact your office but couldn't reach
you. Please contact us at 68580019 for any further questions.

Also, the repairs have been completed.



* Regards

Wee hoe auto

On Thu, 18 Apr 2019, 14:03 Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto), <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com™> wrote:
Dear Mr. Kiat/Mr. Chuan,

Please finalize with us if vehicle has been repaired.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkautg.com | fax; 62564315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHi Ikkauto.com
Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 11:31 AM
To: 'daryl tan' <daryitankc@gmai >

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBD 7545D 0D (EQU)

Dear Chuan,

As instructed by our client, please proceed at repair cost not exceeding $15,000.00 (inclusive
supplementary) to repair the insured vehicle GBD 7545D (Excess $ 500/-) on lump Sum basis.

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 10 arrange our surveyor for inspection.



 Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 11:24 AM

To: "Janet Tan'

Cc SUR: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Subject: RE: our ref DM18HO03355/JT: OD SURVEY FOR GBD7545D (DM18HO03355-IT)
Dear lanet,

Repairer agreed to undertake the repair cost not exceeding $ 15,000.00 en lump sum basis.

We have authorise repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Higw | Case Handier

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
ik 51, Pava Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Janet Tan [mailmrjaneLtan@eqinsumnce.cnmisg]

sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 10:44 AM

To: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: our ref: DM18HO03355/JT: OD SURVEY FOR GBD7545D (DM18HO03355-1T)

Dear Shirley
Please proceed to authorise repairs up to $15,000.00

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

i
eqnsuronce
LY D J'rr % Trtonls
EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 £223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
Www eginsurance.com.sg

A A Menber of Citystate @—_‘
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, piease notify t

1



' Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 18 December 2018 5:57 PM

To: ‘Joel Goh'

Ce: ‘Janet Tan': SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments
Subject: RE: OD SURVEY FOR GBD7545D (DM18HO03355-1T)
Attachments: GBD 7545D - Preli Advise pdf

Dear loel,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBD 7545D
Date of survey: 17/12/2018
Number of days : 5 days

We have Not authorise repair. Kindly let us have your approval please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@Ikkauto com | fax: 6256-4315
BIK 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #0235 | 5{a08933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 9:10 AM

To: 'Joel Goh' <joel goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Janet Tan' <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD SURVEY FOR GBD7545D {DM18HO03355-IT)

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.
A

i
BEST REGARDS, LY

G.Nivitha | Admin

LLKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 68411972 | email: gssignments@ | kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408053)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel. goch@eginsurance.com.sg)
Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 5:11 PM

To: assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: OD SURVEY FOR GBD7545D (DM18HO03355-IT)

Dear LKK



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

N From: Joel Goh <joel goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 5:11 PM

To: assignmenits

Cc: Janet Tan

Subject: OD SURVEY FOR GBD7545D (DM18HO03355-IT)
Attachments: 14122018170855-0001.pdf; GBD7545D.PDF
Dear LKK

Please assist to attend to this OD survey.
Excess: $500.00 (No waiver)
Best Regards,

loel Goh

Executive | Claimse

egnsurance

e Gt Tl
EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Blaock MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
www eqinsurance.com 7

<
W\ A Mernber of Cinystate »—

Privileged/Canfidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tt
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19 KIM CHUAN TERRACE
SINGAPORE 537041

RE: LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION AND AGREEMENT,

' DEAR SIRMDM,

1] )zen 3‘?,’91"715( P//{ owmmm\rmorvmu;zmg D A4 &D

HEREBY AUTHORIZED WEE HOE AUTO mwmmmmmvmmmm
Amm{mrmnmsummmﬂmmrmnn

PMEPHR (B o wbo AS OWN DAMAGE\ TEERE-PARTY CLAIM ] AM AWARE

INSURANCE COMPANY REJECTS OR DISAGREE TO PAY FOR WHATEVER REASONS .

- THANK YOU FOR YOUR XIND ATTENTION AND NECESSARY ARBANGEMENT,

YOURS FAITHFULLY

il

-

:i 12 [72 5 ;’?

FASE 1B/12



Shh‘lﬂ Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shitley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 11:31 AM

To: ‘daryl tan'

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: GBD 7545D OD (EQI)

Dear Chuan,

As instructed by our client, please proceed at repair cost not exceeding $15,000.00 (inclusive
supplementary) to repair the insured vehicle GBD 7545D (Excess § 500/-) on lump Sum basis.

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 1o arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their right_not to pav if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Aegards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | emaill: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)

From: daryl tan [mailto:daryltankc@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 19 December 2018 11:18 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBD 75450 OD (EQI)

Dear Shirley.

We will proceed with repairs based on lump sum not exceeding $15000.00

Regards
Chuan

On Wed, 19 Dec 2018, 11:13 Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew(@lkkauto.com wrote:

Dear Mr. Kiat/Mr. Chuan,

As spoken, kindly check the repair cost limit whether you are able to repair the vehicle not exceeding $
15,000.00 on lump sum basis.



Ihank yvou.

Besi Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Hondler
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

hone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkoutocom | fox: H236-1315

Ak 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ui Avenue |, 802-25 | S(408933)



S Piw L Company Regiatration Mo, 155607 150R

S1LURLAYE L #2-25 PAYA UINL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408953 TEL 1 (065) 62563561 FAX 1 (65) 62561015

Your Ref: DM18HO03355-JT Date: 18 December 2018
Our Ref: CS/EQI18022565/Bsd3

The Motor Claims Department

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __GBD 7545D .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 17/12/2018 at the premises of M/s Wee Hoe Auto Service and have the following to

report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :88 2074679 .
Revised Estimate Amount :S8  11397.75 .
“Check” Items Amount : 58 5.726.52 i
Total 58 1712427 ;
Market Value : 8§58 43.000.00 :
LTA Reimbursement Value ¢SS 2443200 .
Nett Value ¢SS 18.568.00
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
al the front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:

Dumages Consistent.

Repair cost economical, we have not authorise repair
Repair days: 5 Days

Yours faithfully,
Lim Teow Guan
Automotive Assessor
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Anmnex D

NOTICE OF REPORTING
¥

This is to confirm that Leow Hock Seng . NRIC: $8139424E has reported

Thomson Road ¢ junction near the Shell and S trol station.
Dr 04/12/2018 between 1720pm involving the foillowing vehicles:

1 GBD7545D (Complainant’s vehicle)
21 GBC3373P (Other party)

2 If this accident was reported to the P:nlice within 24 hours of

e the Police a Enn-hljhl}* traffic accident which occurred along Upper

its

accurrence, then he/she has complied with Sec B4(2) of the Road Traffic Act,

Cap 276.

RankName of Issuing Officer:Sgt Lim Brandon !
Date:05/12:2018 i Time: 1220hrs
5D Ref: 65

Police Post/Unat - Aljunied NPP / Tanglin Police Division

Miginul - to be issued 1o infarmant
Duplicztc - to be submitied 1o Traffie Police
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1 CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE
ADAD TRANSPORT ACT 1857 (MALAYSIA)
. THE HI'.?"(-‘R VEMICLES [THIRD-PARTY RISKS] RULES 1559 [FEDERATION OF MALATSIA]
[P MICTTOR VERICL ES(THRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION] ACT (CAP, 188 OF THE REVISED EQITION)
‘ TREPUSLIC OF SINGAPORE]
THE L TOA LTI EE[THMIRD PASTY RISKS AND COMPENEATION] RULES 1958 EDIMIONRETUSLIC OF SMGASCORE]
OF AHY AMENDMENT, ACT OR ACTS *ASSED N SUBSTITUTION THEREGE
2 COMMERCIAL VEHICLE PRIVATE (SCH 1)
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Cerificaiz o, . DMCPHQ18-007560
- Fonn  LDWVP
Encmi
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e
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Wee Hoe Auto Service '
19, Kim Chuan Terrace, Singapore 537041
Tel: 9668 4774 Fax: 6B58 6470

Vehlele Na. : GBD7545D DATE : 14/12/2018
Make/Model : Missan NV3IS0
Year : 2015
Chassis No. INIMC2E26Z20004197
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS TO VEHICLE GRD7545D,
PARTS LIST

1 1 pc  Fri windscreen S v 1,02560

2 1 pc  Frt windscreen moulding $ . 62.70

3 1 pc  Friwiper garnish 5 . 18450

4 1 pc  Wiper blade RH S sp 00 #2508

5 1 pc  Wiper arm RH 5 461 |

[ l pc  Wiper blade LH S 4407200

i 1 pc  Wiperarm LH - ) - 16588 | .

8 1 pc  Frtwiper linkage - phoS ¢ ! 1 <54 L s ./'fh?ﬂ -

9 1 pc  Friwiper motor 54 43160

10 1l pc  Frtpanel & 1086090 T

11 1 pc  Frtpanel inner member BSeN f—;‘Tp (B3 SN0 Ll beh laae SO 20650 -

12 | Zpcs FricomerpanelRAL LW -0 5 B M o T e 33720 77 8 L dedel N D
13 2 pes  Headlamp R/L 5 348.80 S JE9760

14 1 pc  Frtgrille assy 5 486.10

15 1 pc  Frtgrilie emblem (Logo) s 73.00

16 6 pes Frigrilleclip 5 3.20 5 19.20

17 1lpc  Frt bumper 5 J652.40

18 8 pcs  Frt bumper clip 5 320 5 25.60

19 2 pcs  Frt bumper retainer R/L 5 3280 5 65.60

200 1pc Frt bumper taw cover - . 5 3260 L AN
21 2 pcs  Frt bumper fog lamp R/L 2 I I :r” ST 31180 395360 1/
22 2pces Frebumper fog lamp gille RAL .y <o / ':‘f:_" SA 10780 SiT RO21500 s o
23 2'pes  Frt bumper bracket R/L . ,*I S. 10470 $104 120940 -~
24 1pc  Fribumper reinforcement ) 393 s 630.00- A

25 1pc  Alcblower assy _ 54 68040 [

26 1pc  Afccoaling coll assy e . ' S » 2,181.50

27 1pc  Afesuction pipe _ VW 5% 313, i S .. 17600

28 1pc Alcdischargepipe ™ ot $ . 176.00 St

29 1pc  Acliquid pipe — . ~a . 5 .~ 10860

30 1pc Alcrecewerdrer © S _" N8, 500,60, - fe5 $ % 14030

31  1pc  Airiniet duct ) = J ) o § & 13240

32 lpc Fridoorpillarty — @7 2T P EJ "'_-‘ ~275,5919,5%80, bex ¢ o 958.20

33 1pc FridoorLH %037 § 123290

34 2 pcs  Frtdoor hinge LH 5 49.00 s _ 9800

35 1 pc Friwindscreen moulding s 8320 "

36 1pc Fatwipergarnish of L § Ay -
37 lpc  FristepgamishiH gra=D - ) g 18080 -

38  Lpc  Frtdoar rear pillar LH | — o i _ s «“013320 @: 2
39 1pc Dashboard — %' V% - VINIGE TR 132008 S 345720 1 fF
40 1 pc Dashboard frame o e r'uq T S 79530 TpT

41 1 pc  Dashboard console cover LH shifig ™ e Do 5 375.10

Total Nett Parts: §  18,123.10

less 10% S 181231

$ 1631079



Wee Hoe Auto Service

19, Kim Chuan Terrace, Singapore 537041
Tel: 9668 4774 Fax: G853 6470

1 1 pc  Frtwindscreen sealant SN 5 50.00
2 1 pc  Friwindscreen solar film S/N ] 256-60
3 1pc Frtwindscreen |.U. bracket S/N s 26.00
4 1 pc  Fripanel S/N & 5000
5 1 pc  Frtdoor pillar LH S/N ] -50:08
6 1 pc  Frodoor sticker (Co Reg) LH 5/N 5 20,00
Total Parts: 5 16,756.79
Labour:

1 Tocheck electrical system, repair wire harness and focus headlamp. 5 66-00
2 Toremove, replace and reinstall front windscreen. 5 4600
3 Toremove, replace and remnstall dashboard 5 356-00

4 Toremove, replace and reinstall a/c blower and a/c evaporator
{Include vacuum & recharge a/e gas) 5 14000
5 Toremove & reinstall interior trims, garnishes, seats, etc for necessary repairs. 5 s000
& Totransfer LHF door component parts to new door. 5 100:00
7 Tostraighten, repair, realign on affected area and replace damaged parts. S 150000
g Toconduct chassis alignments 5 IS0
9 Tospray panting on affected area S 20800

g

Total labour: §  3,990.00

Total Estimated: g Iﬂ'i?iﬁ.?‘!
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y L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sdn B B 59 Ut Ave 1 #01-25 Pays Ubl Industrial Park, Singapote 408533
d"’_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No 189607198R GST Reg No. 19-0607198-R
Affillatod to Fedaration internationale Des Experis En Automobile
EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CS/EQI1B022565/Bsd3e2
TR o |VETERNR
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date 21-05-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 089110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Vah. Veh. Inspected GBD T545D
Policy No. DMCPHQ18-001580 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM1B8HO03355-JT Excess ($) 500.00
Assign From JOEL GOH Assign Date 1411272018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN NV35S0 PANEL VAN c.C 2488
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. JNIMCZE28Z0004187 Colour WHITE
Odometer 143849 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General POOR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195 R15C BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Front Tyre |185R15C BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195 R15C BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185 R15C BRIDGESTONE & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
Accident Date  04/12/2018 |inspection Date 17/1212018
Survey held at WEE HOE AUTO SERVICE
19 KIM CHUAN TERRACE
SINGAPORE 537041
AJTHE MARKET VALUE IS 5%43,000.00(EST. AVERAGE)
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 5§ Working Days




Jy L

,QLQ

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusinal Fark, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607188R GST Reg, No. 18-9607108-R Page No1of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBD 7545D
—n R T )
aty Description of Parts ooniissie
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|FRT WINDSCREEN BROKEN 1,025 860 1,025.80
1|FRT WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 86270 62.70
1|FRT WIPER GARMNISH BROKEN 184 50 184 50
1|WIPER BLADE RH CuTt T2 50 40.00
1|WIPER ARM RH NOT NECESSARY 146810 -
1|WAPER BLADE LH CuT 7200 40 .00

1|WIPER ARM LH NOT NECESSARY 165.80
1|FRT WIPER LINKAGE BENT 317.20 317.20
1|FRT WIPER MOTOR SHORT CIRCUIT 431680 431 80
11FRT PANEL DENTED 1,086.80 1,086.90
1|FRT PANEL INNER MEMBER DENTED 206850 206 50
2|FRT CORNER PANEL R/L @$387 .20 NS DISTORTED / T74.40 387 20

oS NOT
MNECESSARY

2|HEADLAMP R/L @5348.80 BROKEN BaT7 60 687.60
1|FRT GRILLE ASSY BROKEN 48610 486 10
1|FRT GRILLE EMBLEM (LOGO) NECESSARY 73.00 73.00
BIFRT GRILLE CLIP @53.20 NECESSARY 18.20 1820
1|IFRT BUMPER DENTED 652 40 652 40
BIFRT BUMPER CLIP @%3.20 MECESSARY 25860 2560
Z|FRT BUMPER RETAINER R/L @532.80 MNECESSARY 6560 B65.60

1|FRT BUMPER TOW COVER MNOT NECESSARY a2 60
2|FRT BUMPER FOG LAMP R/L @5311.80 NS BROKEN 623.60 311.80
2|FRT BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE R/L @3%107.80 MIS BROKEN 21580 10780
2|FRT BUMPER BERACKET R/L @‘HB{TD WIS BROKEN 209 .40 104 70
1IFRT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT MNOT NECESSARY B30.00 -
1]1A/C BLOWER ASSY DENTED GB0 .40 680 40
118/C COOLING COIL ASSY DENTED 2,181.50 2.181.50
11A/C SUCTION RIPE BENT 176.00 176.00
1]A/C DISCHARGE PIPE BENT 176.00 176.00
11A/C LIQUID PIPE BENT 108 .60 108.60

Report Ref No. CS/EQI18022565/Bsd3e2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industnal Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 31561 FAX: 256 4315
Reg. No: 10660T198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8607188-R

Paga No 2 of 3

aty DescripionofParts |  Condiion | "simas BY, | Our/
1]A/C RECEIVER DRIER BENT 140.30
1|AIR INLET DUCT BROKEN 132 40
1|FRT DOOR PILLAR LH BENT 958.20
1|FRT DOOR LH TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR
2|FRT DOOR HINGE LH @3%49.00 BENT 88.00 98.00
1|FRT WINDSCREEN MOULDING REPEATED B3 20
1|FRT WIPER GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 147.70
1|FRT STEP GARNISH LH NOT NECESSARY 180.60 -
1|FRT DOOR REAR PILLAR LH TO REPAIR SEE 813.20 -
LABOUR
1|DASHBOARD DISTORTED 1.457.20 132468
1|DASHEOQARD FRAME BENT 78530 795.30
1|DASHEOARD CONSOLE COVER LH DISTORTED 375.10 ars.1o
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -1,812.31 -1,348.25
16.310.78 1213423
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRT WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 50.00
1|FRT WINDSCREEN SOLAR FILM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 250.00
1|FRT WINDSCREEN 1.U. BRACKET (SN} NECESSARY 26.00 26.00
1|FRT PANEL [SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|/FRT DOOCR PILLAR LH {SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|FRT DOOR STICKER (CO REG) LH (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
446.00 88.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM, REPAIR WIRE 60.00 40.00
HARNESS AND FOCLUS HEADLAMP
TO REMOVE, REPLACE AND REINSTALL FRONT 140.00 100.00
WINDSCREEM,
TO REMOVE, REPLACE AND REINSTALL DASHBOARD 350.00 20000
TO REMOVE, REPLACE AND REINSTALL A/C BLOWER 140,00 120.00
AND A/C EVAPORATOR. (INCLUDE VACUUM &
RECHARGE A/C GAS)
TO REMOVE & REINSTALL INTERIOR TRIMS, NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
GARNISHES. SEATS, ETC. FOR NECESSARY REPAIRS

Reporl Ref No. CS/EQI18022565/Bsd3e?




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6258 35681 FAX 5258 4115
Reg Mo 188607198R (ST Reg. Mo, 18-8807188-R

Qty Description of Parts |  Cendition

TO TRANSFER LHF DDOR COMPONENT PARTS TO NEW |NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -

DOOR

TO STRAIGHTEN, REPAIR, REALIGN ON AFFECTED 1.500.00 1,100.00

AREA AND REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS. INCLUSIVE OF

THE REPAIR OF FRONT DOOR LH AND FRT DODR REAR

PILLAR LH

TO CONDUCT CHASSIS ALIGNMENTS NOT NECESSARY 350.00 2

TO SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREA 1,200.00 800.00
3,880.00 2,360.00

GRAND TOTAL 20,746.79 14,690.23

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS ~ 11,650.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)' I eeinass
LESS EXCESS | -500,00
NETT LIABILITY ‘ | I'_ 11,150.00

$

LiM TE

OW GUAN

Automotive Assessor

Report Ref No. CS/EQI18022565/Bsd3e2
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HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Aspar in mads ssisly lor the uss snd benafit of the Cliant nemed an ithe front page of (his Report.

i acempied to any thind party whe o

Bepor. in whitle of in oerl. does 89 8l his or hee own sk




