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!‘ UU Auto

- - o Consultants
s dm Ba = Pre Lt Company Reglstration No_ 198807 158R

S1URIAVE 1, #012-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315
Your ref: TBA Date: 17.12.2018
Our ref: CC3/CTI1R0D22528/Tha3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHB 16387

We refer 1o the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 13/12/2018

at the premises of M/s SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount : 5§ 2,159.37

Revised Estimate Amount 1 8§ 1,134.63

"Check"” Iterns Amount : S8 346.32

Total (Including Check Items) : S§ 1,480.95

Market Value ] - f{est)

LTA Reimbursement Value - 55 - [est)

Neu Value : S§ - [est.)

Description of Damage: —
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Front Portion

Comments/Present Siatus:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2.0 days

Yours faithfully,

ONG HWEE JIE
Licensed Appraiser
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Company Type |SMRT Tas Fis Lid
Maka TOYOIA
Madel PRIUG
Nama of Driver CHIN CHIA SI1ANG DEREX
Type of Accidend Rear To Hesd
(Azcsdan! Daie &nd Time 1212718 B30 AM
|Accigent Aeperod Dste and 12712718 12234 PM
%_mfwm Yeu
Survey by
Vehicia is Towed Back? You
Towed Back Dabe and Time 1228 B:58 AM
[Regacement Vehicie waued?  |No
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Special instruchion 1o ARG, any | TOWED 580
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Milwage
Work Shog
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Time
Quotalion lram ARC Adjusted by Surveyar, T applizable
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Tatal Gpare Par Cont 5985 85 8563.70
Tatal Oiher Ceal §324.00 530,00
TOTAL COST 52,206.55 §1,083.70
Lump Sum Total $2,200.00 $1,050.00 (L5S)
Number of Riepar Oays 30 20
Progared / Agjustad By | Kirm Niing Chin Hwen jis (LKR) | China Taiping
ART | Surveyor Sign Of Date [13/12/2018 4:18 PM 13122018 154 PM
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—— MIDSvacEwah smn com sg/Estimation aspx

Y RO Vive

Case Details

Cane Areference Number : R Insurance Compapy Name : China Taping insurance (Sirgapore)
TANA 2 A05L Company Type : SMAT Tasis Pis Lid Bie Lig

Type of Repair : Ascigen Flepai Estimalion ID : EST-4846.0 Accident Date ard Time : 1211272018 12

Vehicle Reglsiration Number ; Assigned By : Tasl Ciaimas Manags: el

EHB15387 Tuam Vehicle Age{in flamhe)

Documents / Photographs

View Documants / Pholographs | Tatal Dacuments |

Estimation Details
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One  Main BUMPER FRT 1 dazo0 4200 00 10 Reglace 361.50 Pepince  *
Tirres
Key
tn
One  Main BUMPER GRILLE ne M0 3s00 33333 Ropiace 1333 Replaze =
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2012 2:10 AM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Ce: Vic (LKKAuto); Alfred Toh

Su-hject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBF3445A (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHB1638Z
(TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT118022528/Jha3) on 12/12/2018

Dear lia Le,

We refer to your email of 12.06.19.

QOur claim reference number is SNM18D0S775C02/5.

Moving forward, kindly just quote our insured’s vehicle number instead of sending email requesting for our claim

reference number.

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motor Claims)
Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Sprngleaf Tower

Singapore 072909

Co. Reg. No. 2002083B4E

DID: 6389 6530

Fax: 6224 7478 / 6224 7175

Emall. elgine cheona@sg.cntaiping com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

From: Alfred Toh
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June, 2019 7:17 PM

To: Jia Le [LKK Auto) <liale@lkkauto.com>; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBF3445A (Ol : CT1 - TBA) and SHB1638Z (TP : LKK REF -

CC3/CTI118022528/1ha3) on 12/12/2018
Dear Elaine

Please assist on the matter.

Best Regards

Alfred

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <Jiale@lk >
Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2019 5:29:32 PM
To: Claims Dept of CT1; Alfred Toh

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)



Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBF3445A (Ol : CTI - TBA) and SHB1638Z (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18022528/1ha3) on 12/12/2018

Dear Alfred,
Please let us have your reference no. for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jinle@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 19 December, 2018 11:53 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Elaine Cheong; Lucas Lee; Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBF3445A (01 : CT1 - TBA) and SHB1638Z (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI18022528/1ha3) on 12/12/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHB 1638Z at M /s SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) on a WP
basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

* TP GIA report
e TP estimated cost of repair
¢  Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 ooss | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le [LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 9:24 AM

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & |A/Claims & |A/Taxis)’

Cc Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 12/12/2018 involving SHB 1638Z & GBF
3445A (China Taiping's insured) Our Ref; TAX/12/18/2054/1g LKK REF
CC3/CTIN8022528/ ha3

Attachments: MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER - SHB163BZ pdf; AUTHORIZATION TO
ACT_SMRT pdf

without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please ignore the DV from previous emall, we re-attached the DV and ATA for you to sign.
Thank you.

Hest Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 8B:46 AM

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/ Taxis)

Ce: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 12/12/2018 involving SHB 1638Z & GBF 3445A
(China Taiping's insured) Our Ref: TAX/12/18/2054/1g LKK REF CC3/CTI18022528/JTha3

without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We confimm setlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 1.050.00
2. Loss of Rental [3days x $133.75) 3 401.25
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 7.00

TOTAL | § 1.458.25

Kindly retum the original DV fo us.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

|



Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkknuto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March, 2019 2:35 PM

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A/Taxis)

Ce: Admin A; Vie (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 12/12/2018 involving SHB 16387 & GBF 3445A
(China Taiping's insured) Our Ref: TAX/12/18/2054/lg LKK REF CC3/CTI118022528/Jha3

Without Prejudice

Dear Lee Gek,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are still pending for our Insured’s GIA report.
We will follow up and will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

RECSIS T2 o0 use lrsi vt oo ke pacissory

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipiant, Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachmants and any coples thereofl. Thank you.

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & [A/Claims & 1A/Taxis) [mailto:Lee

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March, 2019 2:26 PM

To: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: URGENT / REMINDER Re: Accident on 12/12/2018 involving SHB 16387 & GBF 3445A
(China Taiping's insured) Our Ref: TAX/12/18/2054/1g

URGENT
REMINDER

Dear All,



We refer to our LOD of 4/1/2019 and note that there is no response and not even an acknowledgement.
Please let us have your offer by 4™ April 2019. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

& SmRT

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims)

Sent: 04/01/2019 14:39

To: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 12/12/2018 involving SHB 1638Z & GBF 3445A (China Taiping's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/12/18/2054/lg

Dear All

We quantify our own losses as follows:-

Cost of Repair 51050.00
Loss of Rental 540125 | 3 daysx 513375 )
LTA Search Fee 57.00
Total $1458.25

We enclose the following documents:
1} Repair invoice
2} Proof of renial rate
3) GIA report
4)  Accident vehicle laid-up repornt
5} LTA search
6) Hirer's Letter of Authorisation

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

& SmRT

AUTOMOTIVE



¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

) 51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
> i TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6255 4315

Reg. No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-0607188-R

TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD T CCA/CTI18022528/Jdadn2

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00 |
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 078908 Tem: DBOr2me I"III|I||III|||"I
Code: CTI

TVeh. Inspected  SHB 16382

Insured Veh.
Policy No. DMCVSN1060851800 Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18DO5T75C02/5 Excess (§) 0.00

Assign From Assign Date 13/12/2018

Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS e 1798

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JTDKN3BU405748145 Colour MAROON
Odometer 672336 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

General GOOoD

Size "~ [Make Balance

R/H Front Tyre |195/85 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm

L/H Front Tyre |[195/65R15 YOKOHAMA & mm

R/H Rear Tyre |185/85 R15 YOKOHAMA |8 mm
YOKOHAMA

VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Accident Date 1211272018
Survey held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHGUTF’RCEJUDIGE' BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: I\\'brldng Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 6258 35681 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No: 109607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page Mo./1 ol 1

1|BUMPER FRT (DISC 25%) DENTED 462.00 361.50
1|BUMPER GRILLE SUB-ASSY LOWER (DISC 25%) cut 311.10 23233
1|BRACKET ,FR BUMPER (DISC 25%) CRACKED 110.40 82.80
1|NUMBER PLATE (SN) DEFORMED 15.00 15.00
1|NUMBER FLATE FRAME (SN} DEFORMED 12.00 12.00
1|BUMPER ENERGY ABSORBER FRT NOT NECESSARY 78.80
1|BUMPER REINFORCEMENT FRT NOT NECESSARY 488.40 -
1|BUMPER FRT ABSORBER LOWER NOT NECESSARY 127.70
1.635.40 T04.63
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK. 338.00 200.00
SPRAY PAINT 558.00 200.00
TOWING CHARGE. 84.00 60.00
TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION, B0.00 30.00
TO REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS. MOT NECESSARY 100,00 .
TO WASH AND VACUUM . NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
1,220.00 490.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,855.40 1,194.63

& e

DOMNG HWEE JIE
Automative Assessor

HO LEONG CHUAN

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THID PARTIES:- Thin Rapart is made solsiy for the uas snd benefit of ihe Chant nemed an ihe front pege of Bis Report.

Hezol in whole o in garl. goss 2o af his of her own risk.



