Auto

Consultants
Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R
51 UBI AVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315
To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Date: 17/07/2020
THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT
. GBH 2010S (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DMCPHQ18-001668
Vehicle No.
YP 2962E (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No. : CC6/EQI18022500/Aga3s2
Date of Accident 10/12/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost . $ 6,000.00
Loss of Use :$ days
Rental (If any) ' $ 1,284.00 12 days
Others: . $
:$
7,284.00
Final Settlement Sum  |: $ 7,250.00 | (GLOBAL SUM)
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |HO BENG TRADING ' $ 7,250.00

NUR SHAQILAH
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 29 May, 2020 1:10 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: YP2962E LOD *** LKK REF: CC6/EQI18022500/Aja3

Enclosed is the invoice , GIA ,LOA, Ita .

As request following :

1. RC 5 6000- AS AGREED )
2. loss of RENTALS2707.10 (5230 + 7% G5ST X 11 DAYS - 3000 cc ) 9 days recommend + 1 day waiting
PRS +2 DAYS weekend - TOTAL 12 DAYS

@ 100% [ direct from behind )

Total 5 B707.10

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick ¥Yuen

HO BENG TRADING

Hp:92712214



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 1 June 2020 3:52 PM

To: STLIM5719@ICLOUD.COM

Subject: <STANDARD LETTER> OUR REF: CC6/EQI18022500/Aga3 *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING

GBH 2010S & YP 2962E ON 10/12/2018 ***

Our Ref: CC6/EQI18022500/Aga3
01 JUNE 2020

KOSIN STRUCTURE PTE LTD
DRIVER: LIM SIONG TAT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 2010S & YP 2962E ON 10/12/2018

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer (EQ
INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance
policy taken up with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from YP 2962E.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.C. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Motor Claims Dept)

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlement sum.”



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
N EFRF; U5

EeERER WU Suve the Larth Print only when necessary




LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

HO BENG TRADING
Blk 3020A £01-3 3
Ubi Road

Singapore 408714

Dear Sir,

o[ 12| 13 @ (KPS

Accident oin _

Involving Vehic:ie'Nos TP M 626 gZ (ﬂ%\/\ 7/()\ OS

Along, QLE T('U’llg (IE .

| /We the registered owner /driver of vehicle registration no: | P 2 q [3’2 6
have involved in the above accident. )

/We hereby authorize M/S HO BENG TRADING  to commence repairs of the said vehicle
forthwith.

I/ We wzree 1o assign the whole proceeds of my/our comprehensive/third party claim to you and our
soliciters . to act on my/our behalf in respect of the above
matter. And if applicable,my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevocable authority to pay
the amount as deemed compensated direct to you after deduction of their costs on a Solicitor and
client basis.

I/We ucrdertake to co-operate fully with you and our solicitors to ensure that claim is successful.

[/We aiso authorize you to sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary papers in
relation with the above claim in my/our absence.

Your kind co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.
Thank you.

Youes truly.

“Owner’s Signature
(Comoam's stamp if applicable)

Name: ENG SOON HENG TRADING PTE LTD

NRIC No: 2XXXXX604C

Date:  06/1172019




2017

HO BENG TRADING

Block 3020A Ubi Road 1 # 01-33 Singapore 408714
Tel : ( 65) 69664526 HP: 92712214 Fax: (65) 69664526
Email :chris chanbebe@hotmail.com

INVOICE

ENG SOON HENG TRADING PTE LTD Date: 11" JUNE 20
Blk 3020A #01-33

Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408714

Accident date :10" DEC 2018 |
Final Bill For Vehicle No: YP2962E ISUZU LORRY

~Descriptions AMOUNT

Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by $6,000.00

LKK-AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Totai $6,000.00

Surveyor : Mr Adrian

S/DLRS: SIX THOUSAND ONLY

Page 559
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335 JOYSEL XY
Chiang Kang Enterprises Co. (Pte.) Ltd. &7xama

{4 e

1995 - 2003

TAX INVOICE -

RENTAL OF CARS, VANS, PICK-UPS & LORRIES
GST Reg.No. 19-8304039-K

I/'We

No. 4 Petain Road, Petain Court Singapore 208086 Tel: 6298 1936, 6294 0246 Fax: 6298 3864

AR - S S DPREENRE

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

If Different From
Section |

}Df

S Tel:

hereinafter called "the Hirer" hereby confirm haviné agreed to hire this day from CHIANG KANG ENTERPRISES CO. (PTE.) LTD. hereinafter
called "the Owner" the undermentioned Vehicle at the rental fees as shown below and I further agree that I shall be held responsible for:-

a) THIRD PARTY ONLY MOTOR VEHICLE COVERAGE
the Excess which is the maximum amount of $1500/= to cover for any
to the hired Vehicle resulting from any single accident including loss
destruction of the Vehicle.

b) COMPREHENSIVE MOTOR VEHICLE COVERAGE
the Excess which is the maximum amount of$2000/= for any damage caused to
party damage claim, injury claim, theft or destruction of the Vehicle.

¢) Only persons above 24 years of age with more than 2 years driving experience,

%

third party damage or injury claims and also bear the full cost of any damage caused
from inability to let the same Vehicle out on hire or loss resulting from theft and

the hired Vehicle from any single accident or any loss resulting from third

authorised licensed and signing this agreement may drive the vehicle.

whether or not such damage or loss 1s by person/persons known or unknown to me or by negligence or any breach by me of the lerms and Londitions of

Hire, hereinafter mentioned and printed at the back hereof:

Vehicle Regn No. S#E AN "f P’}%Z Iﬁ

Rental Agreement SEHIE No. A

AEERERDEE K
HIRER HUST NOT CARRY SAND AND CEMENT ON THE

BHA
Date:

H/BMERUEREEHEENTFIIOERERY
1/We have read and hereby agree to the terms gy

HEEED

Signature of Hirer:

Section | Hirer's And/Or Driver's Particulars 5% /MBS B AR RBYOBRERESE e
ot p— A BUGEENE /2-12-2018 (21 g
w2, QUAD YGUAN Fenséy | ZEOmRRE ke
i : » L Date& TmeIN 22~ |1
Address: _BIK 550 &} P(Dm ) YA l Y ‘d— ﬁ ") é = Q Chargeable ] Rates  Amount
/ X
S| 731360 I! Days @5 220 w$.2£30
EEE/EERR REBEST T
I/C No:/Passport No: Driving Licence No: Weeks @$
ERE/ARESR Pass BHA B
Type of I/C:/Passport: Pass Date: Montt . @$s
HEBR Bitith
Date of Birth: Place of Issue: ADD 7% GST Q [ 77 of
=HIRBES $1500/= —HRERBBIES $2000/= XH /R
2 ) Third Party Only Policy Excess $1500/= b ) Comprehensive Policy Excess $2000/= | Delivery Fees
Pyl T EIS ot
Vehicle Must Be Returned To Owner's Office By: ; Total Charge 1‘7 09 -
fT BRI RRECER BE
Remarks & Payment Records Security Deposit
BT
Total Payable
Amount Paid
IS
Collection Fees/Misc.
IMPORTANT! For Singapore Use only! R as
e A AEAA AT (E[[ %[ R%PAT 4 F | mmraEss e
Fuel Tank OUT Fuel Tank IN Rates Do Not Include Fuel | Refuelling
T D o z
Vehicle No: From: To:
B 2) i ES
Vehicle No: From: To:
IR #ifis A& DOEEERF
Tools Spare Tyre Accessories Total Additional Charges
BEWEEA EWEILLA
Vehicle Issued By: Vehicle Collected By:
NOTE: &
HEEZA IR ANFERERERBEASE—OEE -
HIRER AND/OR DRIVER IS LIABLE FOR ALL PARKING AND TRAFFIC WEt
VIOLATIONS. Grand Tofd




