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Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

From: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 15 July 2019 3:46 PM

To: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHC8391H Our ref: SMA7238B DOA: 08/12/2018 (MAZDA) *** LKK REF 

: CC4/III18022470/Upa3 

Dear Jimmy, 

 

Thanks for your offer. Please let us have your DV for signatory. 

 

Thanks you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Jen 

Insurance Claims Dept 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

27A Tanjong Penjuru 

Singapore 609042 

T: (65) 6331 0698 F: (65) 6331 0690 

E: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg 

  

 

 

From: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto) <jimmychen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: 15 July 2019 3:33 PM 

To: Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg> 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Insurance Claims 

Common <insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHC8391H Our ref: SMA7238B DOA: 08/12/2018 (MAZDA) *** LKK REF : 

CC4/III18022470/Upa3  

 
Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We propose settlement as follows: - 

 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $                                                            3,770.16 

2. Loss of Use (5days X $60.00) $                                                               300.00 

TOTAL $                                                           4,070.16 

 

Please confirm acceptance, thank you. 

 

 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Jimmy Chen| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jimmychen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 9:48 AM 

To: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) 

<pohkin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Your ref: SHC8391H Our ref: SMA7238B DOA: 08/12/2018 (MAZDA) *** LKK REF : 

CC4/III18022470/Upa3  

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Please note that: - 

 

LKK ref Officer in charge 

CC4/III18022470/Upa3  Hsiao Tong  - 6742 3197 

 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 4 July, 2019 3:48 PM 

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: insuranceclaims@eurokars.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Your ref: SHC8391H Our ref: SMA7238B DOA: 08/12/2018 (MAZDA) 

 

“Without Prejudice” 

 

Dear Poh Kin, 

 

Attached is the covering letter, Repair Tax Invoice, GIA Search, Letter of Authority & Discharge voucher signed by 

client for your perusal.  
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Await to hear from you with your offer of settlement as soon as possible. 

 

Thank you very much. 

 

Note : Documents send by email only. 

 

Best Regards, 

Jen 

Insurance Claims Dept 

TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD 

27A Tanjong Penjuru 

Singapore 609042 

T: (65) 6331 0698 F: (65) 6331 0690 

E: jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg 

  

 

 


