Khanchna (LKK Auto)
e ———————————————— |

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 8:55 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: SEEK MAMNDATE [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIW 2677U
(OLLPC:18/18/18/VPO5/0212117) & SGG 3956C (TP) ON 11/12/2018] [External
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Khanchna,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TeL:_ (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: 6296 2706

- i : The all ¢ ¥ew ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 8 August, 2019 3:32 PM

To: MT_Claim_5SG

Cc: Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJW 2677U (OL:LPC:18/18/18/VP05/021211) & 5GG 3956C (TP) ON
11/12/2018]

Lonpac Ref: 18/18/18/VP05/021211
LKk Ref: CC4/LPC18022438/kKka3qg?
Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 13/12/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is three vehicle chain collision, our Insured vehicle is the second vehicle. We opine that BOLA 28 s
applicable.



summary to offer to third party repairer “CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair 3 4,840.56 $ 3,584.50
2. Loss of Rental (& days x $80) $ 480.00 3 480 |6 days x $80.00)
3. LTA/ GlA Search Fee $ 800 $ 800
Total | $ 5.328.54 $4.072.50

**04days recommendation for repair + 1 Sunday + 1 PRS = & days.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360 email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD

H_.—:t' _:
{ ;:_]’ E:-*T Blk 1019, Yishun Industrial Park A, #01-374/382, Singapore 768761
Tel : 67556142 Fax : 67557719
Email: chmotori@singnet.com.sg

Date:

Lonpac Insurance Berhad
C/O LKK Auto Consultants

Attn : THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SGG3956C & SJW2677U ON 11/12/2018
FROM MSIA JB TWDS WOODLANDS CHECKPOINT.

We are authorized by SGG3956C for their above matter.

Record reveals that you are the insurer of SJW2677U. We therefore wish to seek
compensation from you as below:-

1. Cost of Repairs S$ 3584.50
2. LossofUse |&571[A7 [/ S$  480.00
3. Hire of Vehicle S% 0.00
4. LTA Search Fee/GIA Reports S$ 8.00

TOTAL S$ 4072.50

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.
Thank you.

Yours faithfully




Re:

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

Motor Insurance Claim 56G3956C

in respect of the traffic accidenton _ 11/12/2018
at/along from Malaysia JB towards Woodlands Checkpoint

I/'We, Ishak Bin Mohali

NRIC $6933032J  of Blk 180B Rivervale Crescent #08-365

Singapore 542180

owner of motor vehicle SGG3956C  , insured by NTUC Income Insurance

Cﬂ"ﬂgﬁrﬂ-tive Ltd _L under pﬂhc}r no. Slm&DS?SS

hereby authorise M/s CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD of Blk 1019 Yishun
Industrial Park A #01-374 Singapore 768761, to act as my/our representative in

my/our claim against the owner/driver of motor vehicle SJW2677U in respect of

the above-mentioned accident.

| further authorise that any payment due to me/us from the aforesaid claim 1s to be

directed to my/our abovenamed representative.

And 1/We hereby indemnify my/our abovenamed representative against any claim

and/or damage which may arise from any action taken on my/our behalf.

[/'We affirm all the above by my/our signature below.

Yo
Signed : | "
Date : I.\J \'}\\?\"\%




CLAIMNO :18/18/18/VP05/021211
DATE : 03 SEPTEMBER 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We. ISHAK BIN MOHALI confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of SIW2677U the sum of Singapore Dollar Four
Thousand Seventy-Two and Fifty Cents Only ($4.072.50) in full and final
satisfaction. liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving SJW2677U and
SGG3956C on 11 December 2018 along Malaysia JB towards Woodlands
Checkpaoint.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ NG MENG KOON) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by
any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize vou to pay the above settlement sum directly to CHENG HOE
MOTOR PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

Lshak Bin Mohali  7/10/2019

Mame of vehicle owner /Date

CN



Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

BIk 1019, Yishun Industrial Park A #01-374/382, Singapore Thy 76|
TEL: 67356142 (YIS) FAX: 67557719(Y18) Email: chmotori@singnet.com.sg
GST201001 158 ROB NO:2201001 158E

TAX INVOICE
M/S: LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD

300 BEACH ROAD NO: CLR190336
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE Date: 15 Apr 2019
SINGAPORE 199555 Policy No: 5100405753
TEL: 62507388 FAX: 62963767 Veh Reg No: SGG3956C
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model: TOYOTAWISH 1.8 A
WS Ref: TP/LONPAC/YS Job No: JC1599548

Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date:  11/12/2018
TP Veh Reg No: STW2677U

Description |  Quantity | List Price
]
To Supply all replaced parts, all necessary and agreed labour & 1 PC S% 3,350.00

miscellaneous charges.
{ As recommended by your appointed surveyor)

Total
Add G8T (@ 7%
Total Amount payable

For Cheng Hoe Motor Pre Lid

e

gl
e S
[

E. && O.E. AUTHORISED SIGNATURE

PAGE:]
Amount

58
5% 3.350.00

55 3,350.00
234.50
88 3,584.50



A.C. SYED & PARTNERS

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
COMMISSIONER FOR OATHS

101A UPPER CROSS STREET, #13-23 PEOPLE'S PARK CENTRE, SINGAPORE 058358

TEL : 6538 7411 & FAX ; 6534 1011

TO : CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD BILL NO: B03S/ 2012
YOUR REF:
OUR REF : ACS.CH.LTA.2019 (MAR 2018) DATE : 16.4.19
TO OUR PROFESSIONAL CHARGES for acting for you in the above matter including where necessary perusals,
raunnﬂanoa preparation examination of documents relating thereto; comespondence, attendance, perusals, lelephone
calle. searches and all other incidental works not specifically mentioned herain lo enable us o carry oul the wark
entrusted to us inclusive of all advice
TA RCHES FOR THE MONTH MARCH 2018
SIND TP NO. CHM DOA
1 3/3/2019 GBD8449S SKU4B58A 3/3/72019
2 5/32019 SMI2989C  SIWO5S0E 1/3/2019
3 B/3/2019 SIV6282D  SJG3A30Y 7/3/2019
4 12/372019 SIM4739P  SLT7553C 7/10/2018
5 12/3/2019 XE3776P SKHI743K 12/3/2019
6 13/3/2019 GY2384P SMD8389B 12/3/2019
7 15/3/2018 SFX9929P SME9074Y 8/3/2019
B 15/3/2019 SLL7975K SLB4217TM 2/1/2019
9 15/3/2019 SKX5895U GBGHES83E 13/3/2019
10 20/3/2019 YN30IID GBG6911X 15/3/2019
11 20/3/2019 SIK9785H  SIN2924D 15/3/2019
12 20/3/2019 SLS830D  SLKI1308G 20/3/2019
13 20/3/2019 S5LS47365 SKTH951E 20/3/2019
14 21/3/2019 XE1839E SLDI1363H 19/3/2019
13 25/3/2019 SLC4191Y SKQ3787Z 25/32019
16 26/3/2019 SIWS065R  SIP3779P 25/3/2019
17 10/12/2018 GU99TE GBE56248 T/12/2018
18 12/12/2018 SIW2677U SGG3956C  11/12/2018
19 18/2/2019 XD2993R  GBC5412Y 16/2/2019
20 21/2/2019 EP4889H  SGAI188Y 17/2/2019
21 25/2/2019 SKE9633H SKC6097H  23/2/2019
22 1/3/2019 FL1728T GBHA4719T 27/2/2019
23 4/3/2019 GBE4203E  SGL9724P 43,2019
24 11/3/2019 SJK9331]  SLB9605T 7/3/2019
25 12/3/2019 GBB7225M SGP3280X 12/3/2019
26 22/3/2019 SKA44767  SLN5947U 21/3/2019
27 3/2019 SKA451X SFCl1221K 21/3/2019
28 ]9 SKB940Y  SDQ3993C 28/3/2019 § 224.00
28 searches (@%$8.00 per search b 224.00
M/s. % C SYED & PARTNERS
ADVAESATES & SOLICITORS
SINGAPORE
We reserved the right to forward a subsequent bill for any
disbursements omitted herein.
E. & O.E.
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Vehicle Hub Page 1 of 1

Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. SJW2677U As At 11 Dec 2018 / 16:30:00)

Law Firm Search Details

Search Reason: Insurance claim in relation to traffic accident
Law Firm Case No.: CHM-S5GGI954

Current Owner Details

Crwner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
COwner 1D 574131188
Owner Name:; NG MENG KOOMN

Registered Address Type: HDB/ HUDC
Registered Block/House Mo 154

Registered Street Mame:  RIVERVALE CRESCENT
Registered Unit Mo.; #15-124

Registered Building Mame:

Registered Postal Code: 540154

Current Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo.: SIW267TU
Make Description/Model:  MAZDA / MAZDAZ 1.6L 50N
Insurance Company Mame: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/lawFirmDetail ?FUNCTION _ID=F1801071ET 12/12/2018



