Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 1:29 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: REQUEST BOOK VALUE AND DOCUMENTS SUPPORT OF SHD 9886K (DOA:
11/12/2018) -- AAD1812-094

Attachments: image009.wmz; image014.emz; image001.emz; image002.wmz; image006.emz;

image008.wmz; image010.emz; SHD9886K.pdf

Hi Shiau Chan
Below email for your action.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/""'"C ﬁg -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: weichunkong [mailto:weichunkong@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 December, 2018 1:20 PM

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST BOOK VALUE AND DOCUMENTS SUPPORT OF SHD 9886K (DOA: 11/12/2018) -- AAD1812-094

Hi Wai Yin,
SHD9886K net book value is $50,326.19 & attached vehicle invoice. Please refer below working

Calculation for net book value of Motor vehicle on 10/12/2018
SHD9886K

Reg
on 9/5/2014

(A) MV Cost 5,621,564.00
52 $ 108,107.00

(B) PAFR Value 12,498.00
06 $ 7,498.80

(C) Depreciation value=A - B



MV Cost $ 108,107.00
Less PARF Value $ 7,498.80 _$ 100,608.20

(D) Acc depreciate = C*days/2556

Depreciate value 100,608.20
Days 9/5/2014 10/12/2018 1677 2920
Acc dep*(Value/days) 57,780.81

(E) NBV=A-D
- MV Cost $ 108,107.00
Less-Acc Depreciate $ 57,780.81 _$ 50,326.19

Thanks
Best regards

CK

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/“'Cﬂg -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 December, 2018 11:55 AM

To: 'weichunkong' <weichunkong@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST BOOK VALUE AND DOCUMENTS SUPPORT OF SHD 9886K (DOA: 11/12/2018) -- AAD1812-094

Hi CK
Case AAD1812-094

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/“'Cﬂg -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message



or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 17 December, 2018 11:50 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: 'weichunkong' <weichunkong@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST BOOK VALUE AND DOCUMENTS SUPPORT OF SHD 9886K (DOA: 11/12/2018)

Dear Wai Yin,

Yes. DOA: 10/12/18. The third party vehicle no. is SHA 3630L.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 December 2018 11:41 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'weichunkong' <weichunkong@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST BOOK VALUE AND DOCUMENTS SUPPORT OF SHD 9886K (DOA: 11/12/2018)

Hi Shiau Chan
Can we confirm the DOA, our system is 10.12.18 and please provide us the 3%° party vehicle number.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/""""Cﬂg -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: weichunkong [mailto:weichunkong@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 December, 2018 11:30 AM

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST BOOK VALUE AND DOCUMENTS SUPPORT OF SHD 9886K (DOA: 11/12/2018)

Hi Wai Yin,

Please confirm date of accident. Our system DOA is 10.12.18
3



Thanks

CK

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/"‘"Cﬁg -

Website: www .tfranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto:waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 December, 2018 11:16 AM

To: 'weichunkong' <weichunkong@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST BOOK VALUE AND DOCUMENTS SUPPORT OF SHD 9886K (DOA: 11/12/2018)

Hi CK
FYA.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

/._-..,Cag Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Website: www.iranscab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 17 December, 2018 10:48 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST BOOK VALUE AND DOCUMENTS SUPPORT OF SHD 9886K (DOA: 11/12/2018)

Dear Wai Yin,

Kindly provide us the book value and supporting documents of above vehicle.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
4



This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com



